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INTRODUCTION 

Bulfinch’s own delight and skill in the retelling 
of a good story immediately won him an audi¬ 
ence in 1855, when The Age of Fable first ap¬ 
peared. The Age of Chivalry followed in 1858, 
and in 1862 his Legends of Charlemagne; after 
which edition after edition continued in such 
popularity that his writings—known collectively 
as “Bulfinch’s Mythology”—remain to this day 
unchallenged as the best known, as well as ac¬ 
tually most readable and generally useful, intro¬ 
duction in English to the classics of our mytho¬ 
logical heritage. This richly illustrated edition 
of The Age of Fable adds to the author’s poeti¬ 
cal citations a complementary selection of myth¬ 
ologically inspired works of art, and from the 
ensemble a magnificent revelation emerges of a 
specifically European strain of humanized theol¬ 
ogy and theologized humanity, continuous from 
Homer’s day to our own. 

For the gods and goddesses of Antiquity that 
in the period of Theodosius were scoured from 
their public altars did not die. They passed into 
the minds and became manifest in the works of 
the great secular artists of later centuries. Apollo 
and the nine Muses were invoked, not only by 
Dante to give power to his pen in the rendering 
of his great vision, but also, a century earlier, 
by Gottfried of Strassburg at the opening of his 
Tristan and Isolt. Virgil’s Aeneid and Ovid’s 
Metamorphoses, which Bulfinch in his Preface 
cites as sources, were the models also for the 
poets of Arthurian romance. Moreover, in the 
context of Christian medieval worship, the fea¬ 
tures of Artemis, Aphrodite, Demeter, and Kore 
(the Virgin), as well as of Egyptian Isis and 
Babylonian Ishtar, can be recognized in the 
imagery and legends of the Virgin Mother of 
God. And in the great mystery of the death and 
resurrection of her son, analogies have been 
noted (as by Frazer in The Golden Bough) to 
the deaths and resurrections, among others, of 
Attis, Adonis, Osiris, and Tammuz. 

The supreme moment in the long history of 
the return of the deities of the “Age of Fable” to 
full public view in such masterworks of the 
Renaissance as those here reproduced of Leo¬ 
nardo, Botticelli, Michelangelo, and Titian, fol¬ 
lowed directly upon the publication in 1471 of 
Marsilio Ficino’s translation into Latin of a body 
of Greek gnostic writings now known collec¬ 
tively as the Corpus Hermeticum. The transla¬ 
tion had been ordered by Cosimo de’ Medici, 

from a manuscript brought to him from Mace¬ 
donia by a monk; and the stunning realization 
that immediately struck Ficino and all who read 
his Latin was of an evident relationship to Chris¬ 
tian Platonic and Neoplatonic thought and sym¬ 
bol. The writings were attributed to a legendary 
figure known as Hermes Trismegistus, Hermes 
Thrice Greatest, who was supposed to have been 
an Egyptian contemporary of Moses. He was 
represented as having received instruction di¬ 
rectly from the Divine Mind (personified in 
these writings as the “Father”), the light and 
sound of whose Word (the “Son”), reflected 
in the glass of Trismegistus’ own unclouded 
Mind, had revealed to him the truth of himself, 
and of all mankind, as of one Mind with the 
Father. Moreover, in the features of Nature 
(Botticelli’s Spring) the radiance was to be rec¬ 
ognized of that Mind, which cleaves in love to 
the beauty there reflected of Its own radiance. 
And the planetary Powers by which Nature is 
moved in her seasons are informed by the Light 
and Will of that same radiance. It followed, or 
at least seemed to follow, that the classical deities 
personifying those powers (Diana, Adercury, 
Venus, Phoebus, Apollo, Mars, Jupiter, and Sat¬ 
urn) must have been revelations from the same 
divine source as the laws and signs delivered on 
Sinai to Moses. 

Indeed, in the view of Ficino and his Renais¬ 
sance Christian contemporaries, the revelation 
of Thrice Greatest Hermes even surpassed that 
of his supposed contemporary, Moses, in that it 
already recognized the world-creating and -illum¬ 
inating Word of God as Films Dei, “God’s 
Son.” Further, Trismegistus’ revelation was in¬ 
formed with a sense rather of joy and rapture in 
Nature than of sin, exile, and corruption. Nature 
was not fallen, but the very image of the Son, 
and full of grace. There was nothing in the 
world that was not radiant of God. And Adan 
was not cut off from God, but himself—though 
unknowing—of the very substance of Divine 
Mind and, when awakened to a true knowledge 
of himself, fully one with the Word. 

How much, if any, of this heady learning was 
known to Thomas Bulfinch it is difficult to say; 
for there is nothing in his renditions of the tales 

Primavera (detail: Head of Flora). Sandro Botti¬ 
celli. (Ufftzi Gallery, Florence.) 
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to suggest that he shared the High Renaissance 
awakening to the symbology, as well as to the 
beauty, of the mythological revelation. Leonardo 
da Vinci’s Leda and the Swan (p. 128), for ex¬ 
ample, and Correggio’s Danae and the Shower 
of Gold (p. 129), are hardly matched by our 
author’s swiftly passing notice of two figures in 
Arachne’s web. Interpreted hermetically, in the 
way of the Renaissance masters, Zeus approach¬ 
ing his beloved either as a swan or as a shower of 
gold was equivalent, by analogy, to the Holy 
Spirit descending as a dove or beam of light to 
the Virgin. And continuing by analogy: the sons 
and daughters of such miraculous mythological 
births were to be understood—in the way of a 
European, humanized theology and theologized 
humanity—as incarnations of the Divine Creating 
Mind in the field of Its creation. 

In Leonardo’s vision, the four children issuing 
pairwise from the broken eggs are the progeny 
of Leda and the Swan, i.e., of Nature and the 
informing Spirit of all things. They are, first, 
Castor and Pollux, who represent “concord,” 
and then, Helen of Troy and Clytemnestra, who 
brought “discord.” Love and Strife, “concord 
and discord,” in the ancient teaching of Empedo¬ 
cles (fifth century b.c.), are the forces, function¬ 
ing in alternation, that unite and separate the 
four elements in a universal process of forms 
coming into being and dissolving. Leonardo’s 
painting is thus an image of the mystic genera¬ 
tion of the universe. And in Veronese’s Mars and 
Venus (p. 27) we have an equivalent allegory of 
the union of Strife and Love—as though in delib¬ 
erate illustration of an argument by Pico della 
Mirandola, “On the General Nature of Beauty.” 

“In the constitution of created things it is 
necessary,” wrote Pico, “that union should over¬ 
come strife . . . and for this reason it is said by 
the poets that Venus loves Mars, since Beauty, 
which we call Venus, cannot subsist without 
contrariety; and that Venus tames and mitigates 
Mars, because the tempering power restrains 
and overcomes the strife and hate which persist 
between the contrary elements.” 

The works of the Renaissance masters are, al¬ 
most without exception, inspired by such allu¬ 
sions. They fix in timeless frames of space the 
topic moments of the legends, opening within 
and through them intimations of Neoplatonic 
mysteries; whereas in Bulfinch the same legends 
appear simply and plainly as good stories, pre¬ 
sented, as the author humbly states in his Preface, 
“in such a manner as to make them a source of 
amusement . . . not as a study, but as a relaxa¬ 

tion from study . . . [with] the charm of a 
story-book, yet by means of it to impart a 
knowledge of an important branch of educa¬ 
tion.” 

Born in Newton, Massachusetts, in 1796, 
Thomas Bulfinch came of age in that high period 
of nineteenth-century American letters which 
has been termed by Francis Matthiesson the 
American Renaissance. He was one of eleven 
children of the eminent architect Charles Bul¬ 
finch (1763-1844), by whom the Massachusetts 
State House on Beacon Hill was designed, and 
who, from 1817 to 1830, served as architect of 
the Capitol in Washington. Thomas never mar¬ 
ried, and after graduation from Harvard in 1814, 
taught school for a year, failed in various busi¬ 
ness ventures, and at last, from 1837, held a clerk¬ 
ship in the Merchant’s Bank of Boston. For six 
years he was Secretary of the Boston Society of 
Natural History, and throughout his career as¬ 
sociated with the literary figures of his time. He 
dedicated The Age of Fable to Henry Wads¬ 
worth Longfellow. The historian W. H. Prescott 
had been one of his classmates at Harvard. James 
Russell Lowell (whom he quotes frequently in 
his poetic citations), Oliver Wendell Holmes, 
and John Greenleaf Whittier were members of 
the circle in which he moved. And in nearby 
Concord were Ralph Waldo Emerson and 
Henry David Thoreau. 

In 1850 Hawthorne’s Scarlet Letter appeared; 
in 1851 Melville’s Moby Dick; in 1852 Harriet 
Beecher Stowe’s Uncle Tom's Cabin; in 1854 
Thoreau’s Walden; and in the year of The Age 
of Fable Walt Whitman’s Leaves of Grass. Half 
a decade of towering performances! And it was 
to the seasoned audience of such works as these 
that Bulfinch, at the age of fifty-nine, addressed 
the first volume of his “attempt,” as he described 
the project in his dedication to Longfellow, “to 
popularize mythology, and extend the enjoyment 
of elegant literature.” “Having chosen mythol¬ 
ogy as connected with literature for our prov¬ 
ince,” he declared in his Preface, “we have en¬ 
deavored to omit nothing which the reader of 
elegant literature is likely to find occasion for.” 
His two succeeding volumes completed the en¬ 
deavor, and in 1867, at the age of seventy-one, 
the humble clerk of thirty years in the Mer¬ 
chant’s Bank of Boston passed away with a per¬ 
manent place assured, even among the great of 
what some would say was the greatest half-dec¬ 
ade of American letters. 

In this presentation of his classic myths the 
last chapters of The Age of Fable are omitted, 



since they treat of other matters: theories (now 
discarded) of the origins of mythology; Egyp- 
tion, Persian, Hindu, Buddhist, Germanic, and 
Celtic myths; the medieval legend of Prester 
John; and superstitions touching such imaginary 
creatures as the phoenix, basilisk, unicorn, and 
salamander. Little was known of any of these 
matters in Bulfinch’s day. The whole great reve¬ 
lation of modern archaeology, from Crete and 
the Aegean to Mesopotamia and Egypt, was yet 
to come to light. Schliemann had not yet un¬ 
earthed Troy. The reading of the Rosetta Stone 
had been accomplished only in 1822, and the 
entire history of Egypt remained to be unfolded. 
Sumer was unknown, Knossos not yet found. 
Celtic and Germanic studies were in their in¬ 
fancy, and knowledge of the great religious sys¬ 
tems of the Orient was just dawning. Thoreau 
and Emerson had already been overwhelmed by 
an early translation of the Bhagavad Gita, but the 
epochal work of Max Muller in editing in Eng¬ 
lish fifty-one volumes of the sacred books of the 

East would not be undertaken for another 
twenty years. Bulfinch’s treatment of these mat¬ 
ters, therefore, while adequate to the knowledge 
of his time, would be for the modern reader mis¬ 
leading. The charm and value of his work lie, 
rather, in his skillful and swift retelling of the 
stories of our classical heritage. And since myths 
are alive and ever ready to be told anew, ever 
revealing more and more of the truths that they 
hold in keep for all, they are best heard when 
presented this way, unexplained. They may then 
speak to each in his own language—as once they 
spoke to the ancients, later to the Christian Mid¬ 
dle Ages, brilliantly to the artists of the Renais¬ 
sance, academically to Bulfinch’s generation. 
They are recollected here to the accompaniment 
of a gallery of art from Pericles’s time to our own 
—delicious fables for the waking of whatever 
slumbering memories of concord may be await¬ 
ing them, in this century of discord, in our hearts. 

—Joseph Campbell 

Apollo with the Lapiths and Centaurs. Greek. (Olympia Museum.) 



PREFACE 

If no other knowledge deserves to be called use¬ 
ful but that which helps to enlarge our posses¬ 
sions or to raise our station in society, then 
mythology has no claim to the appellation. But 
if that which tends to make us happier and better 
can be called useful, then we claim that epithet 
for our subject. For mythology is the handmaid 
of literature; and literature is one of the best al¬ 
lies of virtue and promoters of happiness. 

Without a knowledge of mythology much of 
the elegant literature of our own language can¬ 
not be understood and appreciated. When Byron 
calls Rome “the Niobe of nations,” or says of 
Venice, “She looks a Sea-Cybele fresh from 
ocean,” he calls up to the mind of one familiar 
with our subject illustrations more vivid and strik¬ 
ing than the pencil could furnish, but which are 
lost to the reader ignorant of mythology. Mil- 
ton abounds in similar allusions. The short poem 
Comus contains more than thirty such, and the 
ode “On the Morning of the Nativity” half as 
many. Through Paradise Lost they are scattered 
profusely. This is one reason why we often hear 
persons by no means illiterate say that they can¬ 
not enjoy Milton. But were these persons to add 
to their more solid acquirements the easy learn¬ 
ing of this little volume, much of the poetry of 
Milton which has appeared to them “harsh and 
crabbed” would be found “musical as is Apollo’s 
lute.” Our citations, taken from more than 
twenty-five poets, from Spenser to Longfellow, 
will show how general has been the practice of 
borrowing illustrations from mythology. 

The prose writers also avail themselves of the 
same source of elegant and suggestive illustra¬ 
tion. One can hardly take up a number of the 
Edinburgh or Quarterly Review without meet¬ 
ing with instances. In Macaulay’s article on Mil- 
ton there are twenty such. 

But how is mythology to be taught to one 
who does not learn it through the medium of the 
languages of Greece and Rome? To devote study 
to a species of learning which relates wholly to 
false marvels and obsolete faiths is not to be ex¬ 
pected of the general reader in a practical age 
like this. The time even of the young is claimed 
by so many sciences of facts and things that little 
can be spared for set treatises on a science of 
mere fancy. 

But may not the requisite knowledge of the 

subject be acquired by reading the ancient poets 
in translations? We reply, the field is too exten¬ 
sive for a preparatory course; and these very 
translations require some previous knowledge of 
the subject to make them intelligible. Let any 
one who doubts it read the first page of the 
Aeneid, and see what he can make of “the hatred 
of Juno,” the “decree of the Parcae,” the “judg¬ 
ment of Paris,” and the “honors of Ganymede,” 
without this knowledge. 

Shall we be told that answers to such queries 
may be found in notes, or by a reference to The 
Classical Dictionary? We reply, the interruption 
of one’s reading by either process is so annoying 
that most readers prefer to let an allusion pass 
unapprehended rather than submit to it. More¬ 
over, such sources give us only the dry facts 
without any of the charm of the original narra¬ 
tive; and what is a poetical myth when stripped 
of its poetry? The story of Ceyx and Halcyone, 
which fills a chapter in our book, occupies but 
eight lines in the best (Smith’s) Classical Dic¬ 
tionary; and so of others. 

Our book is an attempt to solve this problem 
by telling the stories of mythology in such a 
manner as to make them a source of amusement. 
We have endeavored to tell them correctly, ac¬ 
cording to the ancient authorities, so that when 
the reader finds them referred to, he may not be 
at a loss to recognize the reference. Thus we 
hope to teach mythology not as a study, but as a 
relaxation from study; to give our work the 
charm of a storybook, yet by means of it to 
impart a knowledge of an important branch of 
education. The index at the end will adapt it to 
the purposes of reference and make it a classical 
dictionary for the parlor. 

Most of the classical legends in this book are 
derived from Ovid and Virgil. They are not 
literally translated, for, in the author’s opinion, 
poetry translated into literal prose is very unat¬ 
tractive reading. Neither are they in verse, as 
well for other reasons as from a conviction that 
to translate faithfully under all the embarrass¬ 
ments of rhyme and measure is impossible. The 
attempt has been made to tell the stories in prose, 
preserving so much of the poetry as resides in the 
thoughts and is separable from the language it¬ 
self, and omitting those amplifications which are 
not suited to the altered form. 

io 



The poetical citations so freely introduced are 
expected to answer several valuable purposes. 
They will tend to fix in memory the leading fact 
of each story, they will help to the attainment of 
a correct pronunciation of the proper names, and 
they will enrich the memory with many gems of 
poetry, some of them such as are most frequently 
quoted or alluded to in reading and conversation. 

Having chosen mythology as connected with 
literature for our province, we have endeavored 
to omit nothing which the reader of elegant 
literature is likely to find occasion for. Such 
stories and parts of stories as are offensive to pure 
taste and good morals are not given. But such 
stories are not often referred to, and if they oc¬ 
casionally should be, the English reader need 
feel no mortification in confessing his ignorance 
of them. 

Our book is not for the learned, nor for the 
theologian, nor for the philosopher, but for the 
reader of English literature, of either sex, who 
wishes to comprehend the allusions so frequently 
made by public speakers, lecturers, essayists, and 
poets, and those which occur in polite conversa¬ 
tion. 

We trust our young readers will find it a 

Cupid and the Graces. Frangois Boucher. 
(.National Gallery of Art, Washington, D.C.) 

source of entertainment; those more advanced, 
a useful companion in their reading; those who 
travel, and visit museums and galleries of art, an 
interpreter of paintings and sculptures; those 
who mingle in cultivated society, a key to allu¬ 
sions which are occasionally made; and last of 
all, those in advanced life, pleasure in retracing a 
path of literature which leads them back to the 
days of their childhood and revives at every step 
the associations of the morning of life. 

The permanency of those associations is beau¬ 
tifully expressed in the well-known lines of Cole¬ 
ridge, in The Piccolomini, Act ii, Scene 4. 

The intelligible forms of ancient poets, 
The fair humanities of old religion, 
The Power, the Beauty, and the Majesty 
That had their haunts in dale or piny mountain, 
Or forest, by slow stream, or pebbly spring, 
Or chasms and watery depths; all these have vanished; 
They live no longer in the faith of reason; 
But still the heart doth need a language; still 
Doth the old instinct bring back the old names; 
Spirits or gods that used to share this earth 
With man as with their friend; and at this day 
’Tis Jupiter who brings whate’er is great, 
And Venus who brings every thing that’s fair. 

11 





CHAPTER I 

STORIES OF GODS AND HEROES 

The religions of ancient Greece and Rome are 
extinct. The so-called divinities of Olympus have 
not a single worshipper among living men. They 
belong now not to the department of theology, 
but to those of literature and taste. There they 
still hold their place, and will continue to hold it, 
for they are too closely connected with the finest 
productions of poetry and art, both ancient and 
modern, to pass into oblivion. 

We propose to tell the stories relating to them 
which have come down to us from the ancients 
and which are alluded to by modern poets, essay¬ 
ists, and orators. Our readers may thus, at the 
same time, be entertained by the most charming 
fictions which fancy has ever created and put in 
possession of information indispensable to every 
one who would read with intelligence the elegant 
literature of his own day. 

In order to understand these stories, it will be 
necessary to acquaint ourselves with the ideas of 
the structure of the universe which prevailed 
among the Greeks—the people from whom the 
Romans, and other nations through them, re¬ 
ceived their science and religion. 

The Greeks believed the earth to be flat and 
circular, their own country occupying the mid¬ 
dle of it, the central point being either Mount 
Olympus, the abode of the gods, or Delphi, so 
famous for its oracle. 

The circular disk of the earth was crossed 
from west to east, and divided into two equal 
parts by the Sea, as they called the Mediter¬ 
ranean, and its continuation the Euxine, the only 
seas with which they were acquainted. 

Around the earth flowed the River Ocean, its 
course being from south to north on the western 
side of the earth, and in a contrary direction on 
the eastern side. It flowed in a steady, equable 
current, unvexed by storm or tempest. The sea, 
and all the rivers on earth, received their waters 
from it. 

The northern portion of the earth was sup¬ 
posed to be inhabited by a happy race named the 
Hyperboreans, dwelling in everlasting bliss and 
spring beyond the lofty mountains whose cav¬ 
erns were supposed to send forth the piercing 
blasts of the north wind, which chilled the peo¬ 
ple of Hellas (Greece). Their country was inac¬ 
cessible by land or sea. They lived exempt from 
disease or old age, from toils and warfare. Moore 

has given us the “Song of a Hyperborean,” be¬ 
ginning 

I come from a land in the sun-bright deep, 
Where golden gardens glow, 

Where the winds of the north, becalmed in sleep, 
Their conch shells never blow. 

On the south side of the earth, close to the 
stream of Ocean, dwelt a people happy and vir¬ 
tuous as the Hyperboreans. They were named 
the Ethiopians. The gods favored them so highly 
that they were wont to leave at times their 
Olympian abodes and go to share their sacrifices 
and banquets. 

On the western margin of the earth, by the 
stream of Ocean, lay a happy place named the 
Elysian Plain, whither mortals favored by the 
gods were transported, without tasting of death, 
to enjoy an immortality of bliss. This happy re¬ 
gion was also called the “Fortunate Fields” and 
the “Isles of the Blessed.” 

We thus see that the Greeks of the early ages 
knew little of any real people except those to the 
east and south of their own country, or near the 
coast of the Mediterranean. Their imagination 
meantime peopled the western portion of this sea 
with giants, monsters, and enchantresses, while 
they placed around the disk of the earth, which 
they probably regarded as of no great width, na¬ 
tions enjoying the peculiar favor of the gods and 
blessed with happiness and longevity. 

The Dawn, the Sun, and the iMoon were sup¬ 
posed to rise out of the Ocean, on the eastern 
side, and to drive through the air, giving light to 
gods and men. The stars also, except those form¬ 
ing the Wain or Bear, and others near them, rose 
out of and sank into the stream of Ocean. There 
the sun-god embarked in a winged boat, which 
conveyed him round by the northern part of the 
earth back to his place of rising in the east. Mil- 
ton alludes to this in his Comus. 

Now the gilded car of day 
His golden axle doth allay 
In the steep Atlantic stream, 
And the slope Sun his upward beam 
Shoots against the dusky pole, 
Pacing towards the other goal 
Of his chamber in the east. 

Venus de Milo. Greek. (Louvre, Paris.) 



Parnassus. Claude 
Lorrain. (Museum 
of Fine Arts, Boston.) 





The abode of the gods was on the summit of 
Mount Olympus, in Thessaly. A gate of clouds, 
kept by the goddesses named the Seasons, opened 
to permit the passage of the celestials to earth 
and to receive them on their return. The gods 
had their separate dwellings; but all, when sum¬ 
moned, repaired to the palace of Jupiter, as did 
also those deities whose usual abode was the 
earth, the waters, or the underworld. It was also 
in the great hall of the palace of the Olympian 
king that the gods feasted each day on ambrosia 
and nectar, their food and drink, the latter being 
handed round by the lovely goddess Hebe. Here 
they conversed of the affairs of heaven and earth; 
and as they quaffed their nectar, Apollo, the god 
of music, delighted them with the tones of his 
lyre7Tb which the Muses sang in responsive 

Zeus (Jupiter). From a Greek vase. 

strains. When the sun was set, the gods retired to 
sleep in their respective dwellings. 

The following lines from The Odyssey will 
show how Homer conceived of Olympus: 

The robes and other parts of the dress of the 
goddesses were woven by Minerva and the 
Graces, and everything of a more solid nature 
was formed of the various metals. Vulcan was 
architect, smith, armorer, chariot builder, and 

> * _ ’ 

artist of all work in Olympus. He built of brass 
the houses of the gods; he made for them the 
golden shoes with which they trod the air or the 
water, and moved from place to place with the 
speed of the wind, or even of thought. He also 
shod with brass the celestial steeds which whirled 
the chariots of the gods through the air, or along 
the surface of the sea. He was able to bestow on 
his workmanship self-motion, so that the tripods 
(chairs and tables) could move of themselves in 
and out of the celestial hall. He even endowed 
with intelligence the golden handmaidens whom 
he made to wait on himself. 

Jupiter, or Jove (Zeus*), though called the 
father of gods and men, Tiad himself a beginning. 
Saturn (Cronos) was his father, and Rhea (Ops) 
his mothei. Saturn and Rhea were of the race of 
Titans, who were the children of Earth and 
Heaven, which sprang from Chaos, of which we 
shall give a further account in our next chapter. 

There is another cosmogony, or account of 
the creation, according to which Earth, Erebus, 
and Love were the first of beings. Love (Eros) 
issued from the egg of Night, whichTfioated~bn 
Chaos. By his arrows and torch he pierced and 
vivified all things, producing life and joy. 

Saturn and Rhea were not the only Titans. 
There were others, whose names were Oceanus, 
Hyperion, Iapetus, and Ophion, males; and 
Themis, Mnemosyne, Eurynome, females. They 
are spoken of as the elder gods, whose dominion 

afterwards transferred to others. Saturn was 
yielded to Jupiter, Oceanus to Neptune, Hyper¬ 
ion to Apollo. Hyperion was the father of the 
Sun, Moon, and Dawn. He is therefore the origi¬ 
nal sun-god, and is painted with the splendor and 
beauty which were afterwards bestowed 
Apollo. 

on 

Hyperion’s curls, the front of Jove himself. 
Shakespeare 

So saying, Minerva, goddess azure-eyed, 
Rose to Olympus, the reputed seat 
Eternal of the gods, which never storms 
Disturb, rains drench, or snow invades, but calm 
The expanse and cloudless shines with purest day. 
There the inhabitants divine rejoice 
Forever. 

Co vu per 

* The names included in parentheses are the 
Greek, the others being the Roman or Latin names. 

Opposite: Hermes (Mercury). Greek. (National 
Archaeological Museum, A thens.) 
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Parnassus. Andrea Mantegna. 
(Louvre, Paris.) 
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Ophion and Eurynome ruled over Olympus till 
they were dethroned by Saturn and Rhea. Milton 
alludes to them in Paradise Lost. He says the 
heathens seem to have had some knowledge of 
the temptation and fall of man, 

And fabled how the serpent, whom they called 
Ophion, with Eurynome, (the wide- 
Encroaching Eve perhaps,) had first the rule 
Of high Olympus, thence by Saturn driven. 

The representations given of Saturn are not 
very consistent; for on the one hand his reign is 
said to have been the golden age of innocence 
and purity, and on the other he is described as 
a monster who devoured his own children.* 
Jupiter, however, escaped this fate, and when 
grown up espoused Metis (Prudence), who ad¬ 
ministered a draught to Saturn which caused 
him to disgorge his children. Jupiter, with his 
brothers and sisters, now rebelled against their 
fatheFSaturn, and his brothers the Titans; vam 
quislied them, and imprisoned some of them in 
^TafHrus,1nfliCring~otlTerpgnalfies~"oh~ofhers. At- 
faVwAscondcl^ the heavens on his 
shoulders. 

On the dethronement of Saturn, Jupiter with 
his brothers Neptune (Poseidon) and Pluto (Dis) 

"divided hfs dommionsr JupiteFsportion was the~ 
heavens, Neptune’s~ThT^TceanFandTHutoTs the 
realms of~tRe~dead. EarFTTnd^Olympus were 
c omirion property. Jupiter was king of gods, 
men.,The thunder wasTiis weapon, and he bore 
a shield called Aegis, made for him by Vulcan. 
The eagle was his favorite bird, and bore his 
t hund erfrofeA” 

Juno (Hera) was the wife of Jupiter, and 
queenToFtEe gods. Iris, the goddess of the rain¬ 
bow, was her attendairtTnd rnessenger. The pea- 

cock was herTavorite bird. 

* This inconsistency arises from considering the 
Saturn of the Romans the same with the Grecian 
deity Cronos (Time), which, as it brings an end to 
all things which have had a beginning, may be said 
to devour its own offspring. 

Opposite: Pallas Athene (Minerva). Greek. (Na¬ 
tional Archaeological Museum, Athens.) 

Right: Apollo. Etruscan. (Villa Giulia, Rome.) 
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Vulcan (Hephaestos). the celestial artist, was 
the~son of Jupiter andjtino. JHe was born lame, 
and his mother was so displeased at the sight of 
FmCt-hat she-flung him out o£Heaven.. Other ac¬ 
counts say that Jupiter kicked him out for taking 
part, with his mother, in a quarrel which oc¬ 
curred between them. Vulcan’s lameness, ac¬ 
cording to this account, was the consequence of 
his fall. Hegwas a whole day falling, and at last 
alighted in the Island of Lemnos, which was 
thenceforth sacrecfto him. Milton alludes to this 
story in Paradise Lost, Book I. 

From morn 
To noon he fell, from noon to dewy eve, 
A summer’s day; and with the setting sun 
Dropped from the zenith, like a falling star, 
On Lemnos, the Aegean isle. 

Mars (Ares), the god of war, was the son of 
Jupiter and Juno. 

PhoebusApoTio, the god of archery, prophecy, 
and music, was the son of Jupiter and Latona, 
afkTbrother of DTanrXA'rtem^ god of 
the sun, as Diana, his sister, was the goddess of 
the moon. 

Venus (Aphrodite), the goddess of love and 
beauty, was the daughter of Jupiter and T3Iohe. 
Others'say that Venus sprang from the foam of 
the sea. The zephyr wafted her along the waves 
to the Isle of Cyprus, where she was received and 
attired by the Seasons and then led to the assem¬ 
bly of the gods. All^were _charmed with her 
beauty, and each one demanded her faFTITwife. 
Jupiter gave her to Vulcan, in gratitude for the 
service he had rendered in forging thunderbolts. 
So the most beautiful of the goddesses became 
the wife of the most ill-favored of the gods. 
Venus possessed an embroidered girdle called 
Cestus, which had the power of inspiring love. 
Her favorite birds were swans and doves, and the 
plants sacred to her were the rose and the myrtle. 

Cupid (Eros), the god of love, was the son of, 
Venus. Re’wTs’lfeFVoilstanF~companion; and, 
armed" with bow and arrows, he shot the darts of 
desire into the bosoms of both gods and men. 
There was a deity named Anteros, who was 
sometimes represented as the avenger of slighted 
love, and sometimes as the symbol of reciprocal 

Peace Halting the Horses of Mars. Benigne Gag- 
neranx. (Museum of Art and History, Geneva.) 
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The Birth of Venus. 
Sandro Botticelli. 
(Uffizi Gallery, 
Florence.) 
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Eros (Cupid) Sleeping. Greek. {Metropolitan Museum of Art, New York.) 

affection. The following legend is told of him: 
Venus, complaining to Themis that her son 

Eros continued always a child, was told by her 
that it was because he was solitary, and that if 
he had a brother he would grow apace. Anteros 
was soon afterwards born, and Eros immediately 
was seen to increase rapidly in size and strength. 

Minerva (Pallas Athene), the goddess of wis¬ 
dom, was offspnng^of Jupiter, without a 
motherT She sprangTorth from his head, com¬ 
pletely armed. Her favorite bird was the owl, 
and the plant sacred to her the olive. 

Byron, in Childe Harold, alludes to the birth 
of Minerva, thus: 

Can tyrants but by tyrants conquered be, 
And Freedom find no champion and no child, 
Such as Columbia saw arise, when she 
Sprang forth a Pallas, armed and undefiled? 
Or must such minds be nourished in the wild, 
Deep in the unpruned forest, ’midst the roar 
Of cataracts, where nursing Nature smiled 
On infant Washington? Has earth no more 
Such seeds within her breast, or Europe no such 

shore? 

Mars and Venus United by Love (Cupid.) Paolo 
Veronese. (Metropolitan Museum of Art, New 
York.) 
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Mercury (Hermes) was the son of Jupiter and 
Maia. He presided over commerce, wrestling, 
and other gymnastic exercises, even over thiev¬ 
ing, and every thing, in short, which required 
skill and dexterity. He was the messenger of 
Jupiter, and wore a winged cap and winged 
shoes. He bore in his hand a rod entwined with 
two serpents, called the Caduceus. 

Mercury is said to have invented the lyre. He 
found, one day a tortoise, of which he took the 
shell, made holes in the opposite edges of it, and 
drew cords of linen through them, and the in¬ 
strument was complete. The cords were nine, in 
honor of the nine Muses. Mercury gave the lyre 
to Apollo, and received from him in exchange 
the caduceus.* 

Ceres (Demeter) was the daughter of Saturn 
and Rhea. She had a daughter named Proserpine 
(Persephone), who became the wife of Pluto, 
and queen of the realms of the dead. Ceres pre¬ 
sided over agriculture. 

* From this origin of the instrument, the word 
shell is often used as synonymous with lyre, and 
figuratively for music and poetry. Thus Gray, in his 
ode on the “Progress of Poesy,” says— 

“O Sovereign of the willing soul, 
Parent of sweet and solemn-breathing airs, 
Enchanting shell! the sullen Cares 
And frantic Passions hear thy soft control.” 

Opposite: Jupiter. From a German engraving. 
(From The Studio magazine.) 

Right: Mercury in Flight. Giambologna. (Kunst- 
historisches Museum, Vienna.) 

Overleaf: Banquet of the Gods. Abraham Bloe- 
maert. (Alte Pinakothek, Munich.) 
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Dionysus (Bacchus) Riding a Panther. Greek. (Fella Museum.) 

Bacchus (Dionysus), the god of wine, was the 
son~~of Jupiter”and Semele. He represents not 
onlylhe TntdxlcatTng poweTof wine, but its so¬ 
cial and beneficent influences likewise, so that he 
is viewed as the promoter of civilization, and a 
lawgiver andlover of peace. 

The Muses were the daughters of Jupiter and 
Mnemosyne (McmoryT"MTic}^^ 
song, and prompted TfreHmremory. They were 
ninTirHnumbH^ to each of whom was assigned 
the presidency over some particular department 
of literature, art, or science. Calliope was the 
muse of epic poetry. Clio of history, Euterpe of 
lyric poetry, Melpomene of tragedy, Terpsi¬ 
chore of choral dance and song, Erato of love 
poetry, Polyhymnia of sacred poetry, Urania of 
astronomy, Thalia of comedy. 

The Graces were goddesses presiding over the 
banquet, theMance, and all soclal enjoyments and 
eleganUartsT They" were three in riumEer. Their 
names were Euphrosyne, Aglaia, and Thalia. 

Spenser describes the office of the Graces thus: 

These three on men all gracious gifts bestow 
Which deck the body or adorn the mind, 
To make them lovely or well-favored show; 
As comely carriage, entertainment kind, 
Sweet semblance, friendly offices that bind, 
And all the complements of courtesy; 
They teach us how to each degree and kind 
We should ourselves demean, to low, to high, 

To friends, to foes; which skill men call Civility. 

Opposite: Three Graces. Pablo Picasso. (Photo: 
Museum of Modern Art, New York.) 
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The Fates were also three—Clotho, Lachesis, 
and Atropos. Their office was to spin the. thread 
of human destiny, and they were armed with 
shearsr witTTvHich they cutTt~~off when they 
pleased? 'They were the daughters of Themis 
(Eaw), who sits by Jove on his throne to give 
him counsel. 

A Fury. Drawing from a Greek vase. 

The Erinnyes^or Furies^were three_goddesses_ 
who punished by their secret stings the crimes of 
those who escaped or defied public justice. The 
heads of the Furies were wreathed with serpents1 
arid their wlioTe ippearance was terrific and ap¬ 
palling^. Their names were ATecto, Tisiphone, 
and Megaera. They were also called Eumenides. 

Nemesis was also an avenging goddess. She 
represents the righteous anger of the gods, par¬ 
ticularly towards the proud and insolent. 

Pan was the god of flocks and shepherds. His 
favorite residence was in Arcadia. 

The Satyrs were deities of the woods and 
fields. They were conceived to be covered with 
bristly hair, their heads decorated with short, 
sprouting horns, and their feet like goats’ feet. 

Momus was the gocTof laughter, and Plutus the 
god of wealth. 

ROMAN DIVINITIES 

The preceding are Grecian divinities, though re¬ 
ceived also by the Romans. Those which follow 
are peculiar to Roman mythology. 

Saturn was an ancient Italian deity. It was at- 
tcnipted to identify him wfthThe-Grecian god 
Cronos, ancTfabled ThaEafter his dethronement 
bv Juj5Ttei?*“tre fled to Italy, where he reigned 
during what was called the Golden Age. In 
memory of his beneficent dominion, the feast of 
Saturnalia was held every year in thewinter sea¬ 
son. Then all public"business^ was suspended, 
declarations of war and criminal executions were 
postponed7?ffiends made presents to one another, 
and the slaves were indulged with great liberties. 
A feast was given them at which they sat at table, 
while their masters served them, to show the 

k> natural equality "of men, and that "all things be¬ 
longed equally to all, in the reign af Saturn. 

Faunus,* the grandson of Saturn, was wor¬ 
shipped as the god of fields and shepherds, and 
also as a prophetic god. His name in the plural, 
Fauns, expressed a class of gamesome deities, like 
the Satyrs of the Greeks. 

y Quirinus was a war god, said to be no other 
than'ITo fnlilus. thhTFmnder" of Rome? exalted 
after his death to a place amongthe “go ds! . 

Bellona, a war goddess. " 
Terminus, the god of landmarks. His statue 

was a rude stone or post, set in the ground to 
mark the boundaries of fields. 

Pales, the goddess presiding over cattle and 
pastures. 

Pomona presided over fruit trees. 
Flora, the goddess of flowers. 
Lucina, the goddess of childbirth. 
Ye_sta (the Hestia of thedTreeks) was a deity 

presiding over the public and private hearth, A 
sacred fire, tended bv~ six virgin priestesses called 
Vestals, flamed in her temple. As the safetyjof 
thejfitv was held to be connected with its conser¬ 
vation, the neglect oFthe virgins, if they let it go 
out, was severely punished, andfthe fire was re¬ 
kindled from the rays of the sun. 

* There was also a goddess called Fauna, or Bona 
Dea. 

Opposite: Flora. Pompeiian wall painting. (Na¬ 
tional Museum, Naples.) 
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Liber is the Latin name of Bacchus; and Mulci- 
ber of Vulcan. 

Janus was the porter of heaven. He opens the 
year, the first month being named after him. He 
isTKe'guardian deity of gates, on which account 
hejs_commonl^yrepresented with two heads, be- 
cause every dooy looLs two ways. His temples at 
TTome were numerous. TrVw¥ftime the gates of 
the principal one were always open. In peace 
they were closed; but they were shut only once 
between the reign of Numa and that of Augustus. 

Then Penates were the gods who were sup¬ 
posed to attend to the welfare and prosperity of 
the family. Their name is derived from Penus, 
the pantry, which was sacred to them. Every 
master of a family was the priest to the Penates 
of his own house. 

The Lares, or Lars, were also household gods, 
but differed from the Penates in being regarded 
as the deified spirits of mortals. The family Lar<y 
were held to be the souls of the ancestors, who 
watched_o_ver and protected their^l^<^antir 
The words Lemur and Larva more nearly corre¬ 
spond to our word Ghost. 

Tiie Jlpynans believed that every man had his 
Genius, and everVwoman her'Ju no; that is', a 
spirit who had. given, ihem being, and was re¬ 
garded as their protector through life? 
birthdays men_made off^Ingsto~their Genius, 
women todieirjumx 

A modern poet thus alludes to some of the 
Roman gods: 

Pomona loves the orchard, 
And Liber loves the vine, 

And Pales loves the straw-built shed 
Warm with the breath of kine; 

And Venus loves the whisper 

Of plighted youth and maid, 
In April’s ivory moonlight, 

Beneath the chestnut shade. 

Macaulay, “Prophecy of Capys” 

N.B. It is to be observed that in proper names 
the final e and es are to be sounded. Thus Cybele 
and Penates are words of three syllables. But 
Proserpine and Thebes are exceptions, and to be 
pronounced as English words. 

Venus at the Forge of Vulcan. Jan Brueghel. 
(Courtesy John Woodman Higgins Armory.) 





CHAPTER II 

O 

oOjT' PROMETHEUS AND PANDORA 

The creation of the world is a problem naturally 
fitted to excite the liveliest interest of man, its 
inhabitant. The ancient pagans, not having the 
information on the subject which we derive from 
the pages of Scripture, had their own way of 
telling the story, which is as follows: 

Before earth, and sea, and heaven were created,, 
airtlungyjy^e one" ispect, to which we give thg. 
name of Chaos—a confused and shapeless mass, 
nothing but~Tead weight, in which, however, 
slumbered the seeds of things. Earth, sea, and 
air were all mixed up together; so the earth was 
not solid, the sea was not fluid, and the air was 
not transparent. God and Nature at last inter¬ 
posed and put an end to this discord, separating 
earth from sea, and heaven from both. The fiery 
part, being the lightest, sprang up and formed the 
skies; the air was next in weight and place. The 
earth, being heavier, sank below, and the water 
took the lowest place, and buoyed up the earth. 

Here, some god—it is not known which—gave 
his good offices in arranging and disposing the 
earth. He appointed rivers and bays their places, 
raised mountains, scooped out valleys, distrib¬ 
uted woods, fountains, fertile fields, and stony 
plains. The air being cleared, the stars began to 
appear, fishes took possession of the sea, birds of 
the air, and four-footed beasts of the land. 

But a nobler animal was wanted, and Man was 
made. It is not known whether the Creator made 
him of divine materials, or whether in the earth, 
so lately separated from heaven, there lurked 
still some heavenly seeds. Prometheus took some 
of this earth, and kneading it up with water, 
made man in the image of the gods. He gave him 
an upright stature, so that while all other ani¬ 
mals turn their faces downward and look to the 
earth, he raises his to heaven and gazes on the 
stars. 

Prometheus was_omyof the Titans, a gigantic 
race who inhabited the earth before tfuTcreation 
of man. To him and his brother Epimetheus was 
committed the office of making man, and pro¬ 
viding him and all other animals with the facul¬ 
ties necessary for their preservation. Epimetheus 
undertook to do this, and Prometheus was to 
overlook his work, when it was done. Epime¬ 
theus accordingly proceeded to bestow upon the 
different animals the various gifts of courage, 

strength, swiftness, sagacity; wings to one, claws 
to another, a shelly covering to a third, etc. But 
when man came to be provided for, who was to 
be superior to all other animals, Epimetheus had 
been so prodigal of his resources that he had 
nothing left to bestow upon him. In his per¬ 
plexity he resorted to his brother Prometheus, 
who, with the aid of Minerva, went up to heaven, 
and lighted his torch at the chariot of the sun, 
and brought down fire to man. With this gift 
man was more than a match for all other ani¬ 
mals. It enabled him to make weapons wherewith 
to subdue them; tools with which to cultivate 
the earth; to warm his dwelling, so as to be com¬ 
paratively independent of climate; and finally to 
introduce the arts and to coin money, the means 
of trade and commerce. 

Woman was not yet made. The story (absurd 
enough!) is that Jupiter made her and sent her to 
Prometheus and his brother, to punish them for 
their presumption in stealing fire from heaven; 
and man, for accepting the gift. The first woman 
was named Pandora. She was rnadETiTheayerT 
every god contributTno- something to perfect her. 
Venus gave hex beFufG 'Mercury persuasion, 
Apollo music, etc. Thus equipped, she was con¬ 
veyed to earth and presented to Epimetheus, who 
gladly accepted her, though cautioned by his 
brother to beware of JupiteF And his gifts. 
Epimetheus had in his house a jar, in which were 
kept certain noxious articles^ for which. In fitting 
man for his new abode, he had had no occasion. 
Pandora was seized with an eager'curiosity to 
know what this jaL^contained; and one day she 
slipped off the cover and looked in. Forthwith 
thgrejsscaped a multitudeof plagues for hapless 
man—such as pout, rheumatism, and colic for his 
body, and cnvv,^pTteTand~revenge for’ his mind 
—and scattered themselves far and wide. Pandora 
hastened to replace the lid; but, alas! the whole 
contents ofjhe iar hacTescaped, one thingTnly 
excepteoL which lay at the bottom, and that was 
hope. So we see at this day, whatever evils are 
abroad, hope never entirely leaves us; and while 
we have that, no amount of other ills can make 
us completely wretched. 

Opposite: Pandora. Odilon Redon. (Metropoli¬ 
tan Museum of Art, New York.) 





Another story is that Pandora was sent in good 
faith, by Jupiter, to bless man; that she was fur¬ 
nished with a box, containing her marriage 
blessing. She opened the box incautiously, and the 
blessings all escaped, hope only excepted. This 
story seems more probable than the former; for 
how could hope, so precious a jewel as it is, have 
been kept in a jar full of all manner of evils, as in 
the former statement? 

The world being thus furnished with inhabi¬ 
tants, the first age was an age of innocence and 
happiness, called the Golden Age. Truth and 
right prevailed, though not enforced by law, nor 
was there any magistrate to threaten or punish. 
The forest had not yet been robbed of its trees 
to furnish timbers for vessels, nor had men built 
fortifications round their towns. There were no 
such things as swords, spears, or helmets. The 
earth brought forth all things necessary for man, 
without his labor in ploughing or sowing. Per¬ 
petual spring reigned, flowers sprang up without 
seed, the rivers flowed with milk and wine, and 
yellow honey distilled from the oaks. 

Then succeeded the Silver Age, inferior to the 
golden, but better than that of brass. Jupiter 
shortened the spring and divided the year into 
seasons. Then, first, men had to endure the ex¬ 
tremes of heat and cold, and houses became 
necessary. Caves were the first dwellings, and 
leafy coverts of the woods, and huts woven of 
twigs. Crops would no longer grow without 
planting. The farmer was obliged to sow the 
seed, and the toiling ox to draw the plough. 

Next came the Brazen Age, more savage of 
temper and readier to the strife of arms yet not 
altogether wicked. The hardest and worst was 
the Iron Age. Crime burst in like a flood; mod¬ 
esty, truth, and honor fled. In their places came 
fraud and cunning, violence, and the wicked 
love of gain. Then seamen spread sails to the 
wind, and the trees were torn from the moun¬ 
tains to serve for keels to ships, and vex the face 
of ocean. The earth, which till now had been cul¬ 
tivated in common, began to be divided off into 
possessions. Men were not satisfied with what the 
surface produced, but must dig into its bowels, 
and draw forth from thence the ores of metals. 
Mischievous iron, and more mischievous gold, 
were produced. War sprang up, using both as 
weapons; the guest was not safe in his friend’s 
house; and sons-in-law and fathers-in-law, broth¬ 
ers and sisters, husbands and wives, could not 
trust one another. Sons wished their fathers 
dead, that they might come to the inheritance; 
family love lay prostrate. The earth was wet 

with slaughter, and the gods abandoned it, one 

by one, till Astraea* alone was left, and finally 
she also took her departure. 

Jupiter, seeing this state of things, burned with 
anger. He summoned the gods to council. They 
obeyed the call and took the road to the palace 
of heaven. The road, which any one may see in 
a clear night, stretches across the face of the 
sky and is called the Milky Way. Along the road 
stand the palaces of the illustrious gods; the com¬ 
mon people of the skies live apart, on either side. 
Jupiter addressed the assembly. He set forth the 
frightful condition of things on the earth and 
closed by announcing his intention to destroy the 
whole of its inhabitants, and provide a new race, 
unlike the first, who would be more worthy of 
life and much better worshippers of the gods. So 
saying he took a thunderbolt, and was about to 
launch it at the world, and destroy it by burning; 
but recollecting the danger that such a confla¬ 
gration might set heaven itself on fire, he 
changed his plan and resolved to drown it. The 
north wind, which scatters the clouds, was 
chained up; the south was sent out, and soon 
covered all the face of heaven with a cloak of 
pitchy darkness. The clouds, driven together, 
resound with a crash; torrents of rain fall; the 
crops are laid low; the year’s labor of the hus¬ 
bandman perishes in an hour. Jupiter, not satis¬ 
fied with his own waters, calls on his brother 
Neptune to aid him with his. He lets loose the 
rivers and pours them over the land. At the same 
time, he heaves the land with an earthquake and 
brings in the reflux of the ocean over the shores. 
Flocks, herds, men, and houses are swept away, 
and temples, with their sacred enclosures, pro¬ 
faned. If any edifice remained standing, it was 
overwhelmed, and its turrets lay hid beneath the 

* The goddess of innocence and purity. After 
leaving earth, she was placed among the stars, where 
she became the constellation Virgo—the Virgin. 
Themis (Justice) was the mother of Astraea. She 
is represented as holding aloft a pair of scales, in 
which she weighs the claims of opposing parties. 

It was a favorite idea of the old poets that these 
goddesses would one day return and bring back the 
Golden Age. Even in a Christian hymn, “The 
Messiah” of Pope, this idea occurs. 

All crimes shall cease, and ancient fraud shall fail, 
Returning Justice lift aloft her scale, 
Peace o’er the world her olive wand extend, 
And white-robed Innocence from heaven descend. 

See also Milton’s “Hymn to the Nativity,” stanzas 
xiv and xv. 
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Pandora Opens the Box. Walter Crane. 

waves. Now all was sea, sea without shore. Here 
and there an individual remained on a projecting 
hilltop, and a few, in boats, pulled the oar where 
they had lately driven the plough. The fishes 
swim among the treetops; the anchor is let down 
into a garden. Where the graceful lambs played 
but now unwieldy sea calves gambol. The wolf 
swims among the sheep, the yellow lions and 
tigers struggle in the water. The strength of the 
wild boar serves him not, nor his swiftness the 

stag. The birds fall with weary wing into the 
water, having found no land for a resting place. 
These living beings whom the water spared fell a 
prey to hunger. 

Parnassus alone, of all the mountains, over¬ 
topped the waves; and there Deucalion, and his 
wife Pyrrha, of the race of Prometheus, found 
refuge—he a just man, and she a faithful wor¬ 
shipper of the gods. Jupiter, when he saw none 
left alive but this pair, and remembered their 



harmless lives and pious demeanor, ordered the 
north winds to drive away the clouds, and dis¬ 
close the skies to earth, and earth to the skies. 
Neptune also directed Triton to blow on his shell 
and sound a retreat to the waters. The waters 
obeyed, and the sea returned to its shores, and 
the rivers to their channels. Then Deucalion 
thus addressed Pyrrha: “Oh, wife, only surviving 
woman, joined to me first by the ties of kindred 
and marriage, and now by a common danger, 
would that we possessed the power of our ances¬ 
tor Prometheus, and could renew the race as he 
at first made it. But as we cannot, let us seek 
yonder temple, and inquire of the gods what re¬ 
mains for us to do.” They entered the temple, 
deformed as it was with slime, and approached 
the altar, where no fire burned. There they fell 
prostrate on the earth and prayed the goddess to 
inform them how they might retrieve their 
miserable affairs. The oracle answered, “Depart 
from the temple with head veiled and garments 
unbound, and cast behind you the bones of your 
mother.” They heard the words with astonish¬ 
ment. Pyrrha first broke silence: “We cannot 
obey; we dare not profane the remains of our 
parents.” They sought the thickest shades of the 
wood, and revolved the oracle in their minds. At 
length Deucalion spoke: “Either my sagacity de¬ 
ceives me, or the command is one we may obey 
without impiety. The earth is the great parent of 
all; the stones are her bones; these we may cast 
behind us; and I think this is what the oracle 
means. At least, it will do no harm to try.” They 
veiled their faces, unbound their garments, and 
picked up stones, and cast them behind them. 
The stones (wonderful to relate) began to grow 
soft, and assume shape. By degrees, they put on 
a rude resemblance to human form, like a block 
half finished in the hands of the sculptor. The 
moisture and slime that were about them became 
flesh; the stony part became bones; the veins re¬ 
mained veins, retaining their name, only chang¬ 
ing their use. Those thrown by the hand of the 
man became men, and those bv the woman be- 
came women. It was a hard race, and well 
adapted to labor, as we find ourselves to be at this 
day, giving plain indications of our origin. 

The comparison of Eve to Pandora is too ob¬ 
vious to have escaped Milton, who introduces it 
in Book IV of Paradise Lost: 

More lovely than Pandora, whom the gods 
Endowed with all their gifts; and O, too like 
In sad event, when to the unwiser son 
Of Japhet brought by Hermes, she insnared 

Mankind with her fair looks, to be avenged 
On him who had stole Jove’s authentic fire. 

Prometheus and Epimetheus were sons of Iape- 
tus, which Milton changes to Japhet. 

Prometheus has been a favorite subject with 
the poets. He is represented as the friend of man¬ 
kind, who interposed in their behalf when Jove 
was incensed against them and who taught them 
civilization and the arts. But as, in so doing, he 
transgressed the will of Jupiter, he drew down 
on himself the anger of the ruler of gods and 
men. Jupiter had him chained to a rock on 
Mount Caucasus, where a vulture preyed on his 
liver, which was renewed as fast as devoured. 
This state of torment might have been brought 
to an end at any time by Prometheus, if he had 
been willing to submit to his oppressor; for he 
possessed a secret which involved the stability of 
Jove’s throne, and if he would have revealed it, 
he might have been at once taken into favor. But 
that he disdained to do. He has therefore become 
the symbol of magnanimous endurance of un¬ 
merited suffering, and strength of will resisting 
oppression. 

Byron and Shelley have both treated this 
theme. The following are Byron’s lines: 

Titan! to whose immortal eyes 
The sufferings of mortality, 
Seen in their sad reality, 

Were not as things that gods despise, 
What was thy pity’s recompense? 
A silent suffering, and intense; 
The rock, the vulture, and the chain; 
All that the proud can feel of pain; 
The agony they do not show, 
The suffocating sense of woe. 

Thy godlike crime was to be kind; 
To render with thy precepts less 
The sum of human wretchedness, 

And strengthen man with his own mind 
And, baffled as thou wert from high. 
Still, in thy patient energy 

In the endurance and repulse 
Of thine impenetrable spirit, 

Which earth and heaven could not convulse, 
A mighty lesson we inherit. 

Byron also employs the same allusion, in his 
ode to Napoleon Bonaparte: 

Or, like the thief of fire from heaven, 
Wilt thou withstand the shock? 

And share with him—the unforgiven— 
His vulture and his rock? 
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CHAPTER III 

APOLLO AND DAPHNE-PYRAMUS AND THISBE— 
CEPHALUS AND PROCRIS 

The slime with which the earth was covered by 
the waters of the flood produced an excessive 
fertility, which called forth every variety of 
production, both bad and good. Among the rest, 
Python, an enormous serpent, crept forth, the 
terror of the people, and lurked in the caves of 
Mount Parnassus. Apollo slew him with his ar¬ 
rows—weapons which he had not before used 
against any but feeble animals, hares, wild goats, 
and such game. In commemoration of this illus¬ 
trious conquest he instituted the Pythian games, 
in which the victor in feats of strength, swiftness 
of foot, or in the chariot race, was crowned 
with a wreath of beech leaves; for the laurel was 
not yet adopted by Apollo as his own tree. 

The famous statue of Apollo called the Belve¬ 
dere (p. 96) represents the god after this victory 
over the serpent Python. To this Byron alludes 
in his Childe Harold, iv, 161: 

The lord of the unerring bow, 
The god of life, and poetry, and light, 
The Sun, in human limbs arrayed, and brow 
All radiant from his triumph in the fight. 
The shaft has just been shot; the arrow bright 
With an immortal’s vengeance; in his eye 
And nostril, beautiful disdain, and might, 
And majesty flash their full lightnings by, 
Developing in that one glance the Deity. 

APOLLO AND DAPHNE 

Daphne was Apollo’s firsts love. It was not 
SFought"about by accident, but by the malice of 
Cupid. Apollo saw the boy playing withTIs Bow 
and arrows, and being himself elated with his 
recent victory over Python, he said to him, 
“What have you to do with warlike weapons, 
saucy boy? Leave them for hands worthy of 
them. Behold the conquest I have won by means 
of them over the vast serpent who stretched his 
poisonous body over acres of the plain! Be con¬ 
tent with your torch, child, and kindle up your 
flames, as you call them, where you will, but 
presume not to meddle with my weapons.” 

Venus’s boy heard these words and rejoined, 
“Your arrows may strike all things else, Apollo, 
but mine shall strike you.” So saying, he took 
his stand on a rock of Parnassus and drew from 
his quiver two arrows of different workmanship, 
one to excite love, the other to repel it. The 

former was of gold and sharp pointed, the latter 
blunt and tipped with lead. With the leaden shaft 
he struck the nymph Daphne, the BTaugTitef^oT 
the river-god Peneus, and 'with the”golden'”ohF 
Apollo, tKrough_the heart. Forthwith the god 
was seized with love foF the maiden, and she 
abhorred the thought of loving. Her delight was 
in woodland sports and in the spoils of the chase. 
Many lovers sought her, but she spurned them all, 
ranging the woods, and taking no thought of 
Cupid nor of Hymen. Her father often said to 
her, “Daughter, you owe me a son-in-law; you 
owe me grandchildren.” She, hating the thought 
of marriage as a crime, with her beautiful face 
tinged all over with blushes, threw her arms 
around her father’s neck and said, “Dearest 
father, grant me this favor, that I may always 
remain unmarried, like Diana.” He consented, 
but at the same time said, “Your own face will 
forbid it.” 

Apollo loved her and longed to obtain her; and 
he who gives oracles to all the world was not 
wise enough to look into his own fortunes. He 
saw her hair flung loose over her shoulders and 
said, “If so charming in disorder, what would it 
be if arranged?” He saw her eyes bright as stars; 
he saw her lips, and was not satisfied with only 
seeing them. He admired her hands and arms, 
naked to the shoulder, and whatever was hidden 
from view he imagined more beautiful still. He 
followed her; she fled, swifter than the wind, and 
delayed not a moment at his entreaties. “Stay,” 
said he, “daughter of Peneus; I am not a foe. Do 
not fly me as a lamb flies the wolf, or a dove the 
hawk. It is for love I pursue you. You make me 
miserable, for fear you should fall and hurt your¬ 
self on these stones, and I should be the cause. 
Pray run slower, and I will follow slower. I am 
no clown, no rude peasant. Jupiter is my father, 
and I am lord of Delphos and Tenedos, and 
know all things, present and future. I am the god 
of song and the lyre. My arrows fly true to the 
mark; but alas! an arrow more fatal than mine 
has pierced my heart! I am the god of medicine, 
and know the virtues of all healing plants. Alas! 
I suffer a malady that no balm can cure!” 

The nymph continued her flight and left his 

Overleaf: Apollo Killing the Python. /. M. W. 
Turner. (Tate Gallery, London.) 
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plea half uttered. And even as she fled she 
charmed him. The wind blew her garments, and 
her unbound hair streamed loose behind her. The 
god grew impatient to find his wooings thrown 
away; and, sped by Cupid, gained upon her in 
the race. It was like a hound pursuing a hare, 
with open jaws ready to seize, while the feebler 
animal darts forward, slipping from the very 
grasp. So flew the god and the virgin—he on the 
wings of love and she on those of fear. The pur¬ 
suer is the more rapid, however, and gains upon 
her, and his panting breath blows upon her hair. 
Her strength begins to fail, and, ready to sink, 
she calls upon her father, the river-god: “Help 
me, Peneus! open the earth to enclose me, or 
change my form, which has brought me into this 
danger!” Scarcely had she spoken, when a stiff¬ 
ness seized all her limbs; her bosom began to be 
enclosed in a tender bark; her hair became leaves; 
her arms became branches; her foot stuck fast in 
the ground, as a root; her face became a treetop, 
retaining nothing of its former self but its beauty. 
Apollo stood amazed. He touched the stem, and 
felt the flesh tremble under the new bark. He 
embraced the branches and lavished kisses on the 
wood. The branches shrank from his lips. “Since 
you cannot be my wife,” said he, “you shall as¬ 
suredly be my tree. I will wear you for my 
crown. I will decorate with you my harp and my 
quiver; and when the great Roman conquerors 
lead up the triumphal pomp to the Capitol, you 
shall be woven into wreaths for their brows. 
And, as eternal youth is mine, you also shall be 
always green, and your leaf know no decay.” 
The nymph, now changed into a laurel tree, 
bowed its head in grateful acknowledgment. 

That Apollo should be the god both of music 
and poetry will not appear strange, but that 
medicine should also be assigned to his province, 
may. The poet Armstrong, himself a physician, 
thus accounts for it: 

Music exalts each joy, allays each grief, 
Expels diseases, softens every pain; 
And hence the wise of ancient days adored 
One power of physic, melody, and song. 

Apollo and Daphne. Gian Lorenzo Bernini. (Villa 
Borghese, Rome.) 
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The story of Apollo and Daphne is often al¬ 
luded to by the poets. Waller applies it to the 
case of one whose amatory verses, though they 
did not soften the heart of his mistress, yet won 
for the poet widespread fame. 

Yet what he sung in his immortal strain, 
Though unsuccessful, was not sung in vain. 
All but the nymph that should redress his wrong, 
Attend his passion and approve his song. 
Like Phoebus thus, acquiring unsought praise, 
He caught at love and filled his arms with bays. 

The following stanza from Shelley’s “Adonais” 
alludes to Byron’s early quarrel with the re¬ 
viewers: 

The herded wolves, bold only to pursue; 
The obscene ravens, clamorous o’er the dead; 
The vultures, to the conqueror’s banner true, 
Who feed where Desolation first has fed. 

And whose wings rain contagion; how they fled, 
When like Apollo, from his golden bow, 
The Pythian of the age one arrow sped 
And smiled! The spoilers tempt no second blow; 

They fawn on the proud feet that spurn them as 
they go. 

PYRAMUS AND THISBE 

Pyramus was the handsomest youth, and Thisbe 
the fairest maiden, in all Babylonia, where Se- 
miramis reigned^ Their parents occupied adjoin¬ 
ing houses; and neighborhood brought the young 
people together, and acquaintance ripened into 
love. They would gladly have married, but their 
parents forbade. One thing, however, they could 
not forbid—that love should glow with equal ar¬ 
dor in the bosoms of both. They conversed by 
signs and glances, and the fire burned more in¬ 
tensely for being covered up. In the wall that 
parted the two houses there was a crack, caused 
by some fault in the structure. No one had re¬ 
marked it before, but the lovers discovered it. 
What will not love discover! It afforded a pas¬ 
sage to the voice; and tender messages used to 
pass backward and forward through the gap. As 
they stood, Pyramus on this side, Thisbe on that, 
their breaths would mingle. “Cruel wall,” they 
said, “why do you keep two lovers apart? But 
we will not be ungrateful. We owe you, we con¬ 
fess, the privilege of transmitting loving words to 
willing ears.” Such words they uttered on differ¬ 
ent sides of the wall; and when night came and 
they must say farewell, they pressed their lips 

upon the wall, she on her side, he on his, as they 
could come no nearer. 

Next morning, when Aurora had put out the 
stars and the sun had melted the frost from the 
grass, they met at the accustomed spot. Then, 
after lamenting their hard fate, they agreed that 
next night, when all was still, they would slip 
away from watchful eyes, leave their dwellings, 
and walk out into the fields; and to insure a meet¬ 
ing, repair to a well-known edifice, standing 
without the city’s bounds, called the Tomb of 
Ninus, and that the one who came first should 
await the other at the foot of a certain tree. It 
was a white mulberry tree, and stood near a cool 
spring. All was agreed on, and they waited im¬ 
patiently for the sun to go down beneath the 
waters and night to rise up from them. Then 
cautiously Thisbe stole forth, unobserved by the 
family, her head covered with a veil, made her 
way to the monument, and sat down under the 
tree. As she sat alone in the dim light of the eve¬ 
ning she descried a lioness, her jaws reeking with 
recent slaughter, approaching the fountain to 
slake her thirst. Thisbe fled at the sight and 
sought refuge in the hollow of a rock. As she 
fled she dropped her veil. The lioness, after 
drinking at the spring, turned to retreat to the 
woods, and seeing the veil on the ground, tossed 
and rent it with her bloody mouth. 

Pyramus, having been delayed, now ap¬ 
proached the place of meeting. He saw in the 
sand the footsteps of the lion, and the color fled 
from his cheeks at the sight. Presently he found 
the veil all rent and bloody. “Oh, hapless girl,” 
said he, “I have been the cause of thy death! 
Thou, more worthy of life than I, hast fallen the 
first victim. I will follow. I am the guilty cause, 
in tempting thee forth to a place of such peril, 
and not being myself on the spot to guard thee. 
Come forth, ye lions, from the rocks, and tear 
this guilty body with your teeth.” He took up 
the veil, carried it with him to the appointed 
tree, and covered it with kisses and with tears. 
“My blood also shall stain your texture,” said he 
and, drawing his sword, plunged it into his heart. 
The blood spurted from the wound and tinged 
the white mulberries of the tree all red; and sink¬ 
ing into the earth, reached the roots, so that the 
red color mounted through the trunk to the 
fruit. 

By this time, Thisbe, still trembling with fear, 
yet wishing not to disappoint her lover, stepped 
cautiously forth, looking anxiously for the youth, 
eager to tell him the danger she had escaped. 
When she came to the spot and saw the changed 



color of the mulberries, she doubted whether it 
was the same place. While she hesitated, she saw 
the form of one struggling in the agonies of death. 
She started back, a shudder ran through her 
frame as a ripple on the face of the still water 
when a sudden breeze sweeps over it. But as 
soon as she recognized her lover, she screamed 
and beat her breast; embracing the lifeless body, 
pouring tears into its wounds, and imprinting 
kisses on the cold lips. “Oh, Pyramus,” she cried, 
“what has done this? Answer me, Pyramus; it is 
your own Thisbe that speaks. Hear me, dearest, 
and lift that drooping head!” At the name of 
Thisbe, Pyramus opened his eyes, then closed 
them again. She saw her veil stained with blood 
and the scabbard empty of its sword. “Thy own 
hand has slain thee, and for my sake,” she said. 
“I too can be brave for once, and my love is as 
strong as thine. I will follow thee in death, for I 
have been the cause; and death, which alone 
could part us, shall not prevent my joining thee. 
And ye, unhappy parents of us both, deny us 
not our united request. As love and death have 
joined us, let one tomb contain us. And thou, tree, 
retain the marks of slaughter. Let thy berries 
still serve for memorials of our blood.” So saying, 
she plunged the sword into her breast. Her par¬ 
ents ratified her wish, the gods also ratified it. 
The two bodies were buried in one sepulchre, 
and the tree ever after brought forth purple 
berries, as it does to this day. 

Moore, in “The Sylph’s Ball,” speaking of 
Davy’s Safety Lamp, is reminded of the wall that 
separated Thisbe and her lover: 

O for that Lamp’s metallic gauze, 
That curtain of protecting wire, 

Which Davy delicately draws 
Around illicit, dangerous fire! 

The wall he sets ’twixt Flame and Air, 
(Like that which barred young Thisbe’s bliss,) 

Through whose small holes this dangerous pair 
May see each other, but not kiss. 

In Mickle s translation of The Lusiad occurs 
the following allusion to the story of Pyramus 
and Thisbe, and the metamorphosis of the mul¬ 
berries. The poet is describing the Island of Love. 

. . . here each gift Pomona’s hand bestows 
In cultured garden, free uncultured flows, 
The flavor sweeter and the hue more fair 
Than e’er was fostered by the hand of care. 
The cherry here in shining crimson glows, 
And stained with lovers’ blood, in pendent rows 
The mulberries o’erload the bending boughs. 

If any of our young readers can be so hard¬ 
hearted as to enjoy a laugh at the expense of poor 
Pyramus and Thisbe, they may find an oppor¬ 
tunity by turning to Shakespeare’s play, A Mid¬ 
summer Night's Dream, where it is most amus¬ 
ingly burlesqued. 



Cephalus and Aurora. Nicolas Poussin. (National Gallery, London.) 

CEPHALUS AND PROCRIS 

Cephalus was a beautiful youth and fond of 
manly sports. He would rise before the dawn to 
pursue the chase. Aurora saw him when she first 
looked forth, fell in love with him, and stole him 

away. But Cephalus was just married to a charm¬ 
ing wife whom he devotedly loved. Her name 
was Procris. She was a favorite of Diana, the 
goddess of hunting, who had given her a dog 
which could outrun every rival and a javelin 
which would never fail of its mark; and Procris 





gave these presents to her husband. Cephalus was 
so happy in his wife that he resisted all the en¬ 
treaties of Aurora, and she finally dismissed him 
in displeasure, saying, “Go, ungrateful mortal, 
keep your wife, whom, if I am not much mis¬ 
taken, you will one day be very sorry you ever 
saw again.” 

Cephalus returned, and was as happy as ever 
in his wife and his woodland sports. Now it hap¬ 
pened some angry deity had sent a ravenous fox 
to annoy the country; and the hunters turned out 
in great strength to capture it. Their efforts were 
all in vain; no dog could run it down; and at last 
they came to Cephalus to borrow his famous dog, 
whose name was Lelaps. No sooner was the dog 
let loose than he darted off, quicker than their 
eye could follow him. If they had not seen his 
footprints in the sand they would have thought 
he flew. Cephalus and others stood on a hill and 
saw the race. The fox tried every art; he ran in a 
circle and turned on his track, the dog close upon 
him, with open jaws, snapping at his heels, but bit¬ 
ing only the air. Cephalus was about to use his 
javelin when, suddenly, he saw both dog and 
game stop instantly. The heavenly powers, who 
had given both, were not willing that either 
should conquer. In the very attitude of life and 
action they were turned into stone. So lifelike 
and natural did they look, you would have 
thought, as you looked at them, that one was go¬ 
ing to bark, the other to leap forward. 

Cephalus, though he had lost his dog, still con¬ 
tinued to take delight in the chase. He would go 
out at early morning, ranging the woods and hills 
unaccompanied by any one, needing no help, for 
his javelin was a sure weapon in all cases. Fa¬ 
tigued with hunting, when the sun got high he 
would seek a shady nook where a cool stream 
flowed, and, stretched on the grass, with his gar¬ 
ments thrown aside, would enjoy the breeze. 
Sometimes he would say aloud, “Come, sweet 
breeze, come and fan my breast, come and allay 
the heat that burns me.” Someone passing by one 
day heard him talking in this way to the air, and, 
foolishly believing that he was talking to some 
maiden, went and told the secret to Procris, 
Cephalus’s wife. Love is credulous. Procris, at 
the sudden shock, fainted away. Presently re¬ 
covering, she said, “It cannot be true; I will not 
believe it unless I myself am a witness to it.” So 
she waited, with anxious heart, till the next 

Cephalus and Procris. Claude Lorrain. (National 
Gallery, London.) 
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morning, when Cephalus went to hunt as usual. 
Then she stole out after him and concealed her¬ 
self in the place where the informer directed 
her. Cephalus came, as he was wont when tired 
with sport, and stretched himself on the green 
bank, saying, “Come, sweet breeze, come and fan 
me; you know how I love you! You make the 
groves and my solitary rambles delightful.” He 
was running on in this way when he heard, or 
thought he heard, a sound as of a sob in the 
bushes. Supposing it some wild animal, he threw 
his javelin at the spot. A cry from his beloved 
Procris told him that the weapon had too surely 
met its mark. He rushed to the place and found 
her bleeding and, with sinking strength, endeav¬ 
oring to draw forth from the wound the javelin, 
her own gift. Cephalus raised her from the earth, 
strove to stanch the blood, and called her to re¬ 
vive and not to leave him miserable, to reproach 
himself with her death. She opened her feeble 

eyes and forced herself to utter these few words: 
“I implore you, if you have ever loved me, if I 
have ever deserved kindness at your hands, my 
husband, grant me this last request; do not marry 
that odious Breeze!” This disclosed the whole 
mystery: but alas! what advantage to disclose it 
now? She died; but her face wore a calm expres¬ 
sion, and she looked pityingly and forgivingly 
on her husband when he made her understand 
the truth. 

Moore, in his Legendary Ballads, has one on 
Cephalus and Procris, beginning thus: 

A hunter once in a grove reclined, 
To shun the noon’s bright eye, 

And oft he wooed the wandering wind 
To cool his brow with its sigh. 

While mute lay even the wild bee’s hum, 
Nor breath could stir the aspen’s hair, 

His song was still, “Sweet Air, O come!” 
While Echo answered, “Come, sweet Air!” 

Daphne and Apollo. Antonio Pollaiuolo. (Na¬ 
tional Gallery, London.) See text on page 46. 
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The Death of Procris. Piero di Cosimo. 
(National Gallery, London.) See text on page 52. 
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CHAPTER IV 

JUNO AND HER RIVALS, IO AND CALLISTO- 
DIANA AND ACTAEON-LATONA AND 

THE RUSTICS 

Juno one day perceived it suddenly grow dark 
and immediately suspected that her husband had 
raised a cloud to hide some of his doings that 
would not bear the light. She brushed away the 
cloud and saw her husband, on the banks of a 
glassy river, with a beautiful heifer standing near 
him. Juno suspected the heifer’s form concealed 
some fair nymph of mortal mould—as was, in¬ 
deed, the case; for it was Io, the daughter of the 
river-god Inachus, whom Jupiter had been flirt¬ 
ing with and, when he became aware of the ap¬ 
proach of his wife, had changed into that form. 

Juno joined her husband, and noticing the 
heifer, praised its beauty, and asked whose it was, 
and of what herd. Jupiter, to stop questions, re¬ 
plied that it was a fresh creation from the earth. 
Juno asked to have it as a gift. What could Jupi¬ 
ter do? He was loath to give his mistress to his 
wife; yet how refuse so trifling a present as a 
simple heifer? He could not, without exciting 
suspicion; so he consented. The goddess was not 
yet relieved of her suspicions; so she delivered 
the heifer to Argus, to be strictly watched. 

Now Argus had a hundred eyes in his head and 
never went to sleep with more than two at a 
time, so that he kept watch of Io constantly. He 
suffered her to feed through the day and at night 
tied her up with a vile rope round her neck. She 
would have stretched out her arms to implore 
freedom of Argus, but she had no arms to stretch 
out, and her voice was a bellow that frightened 
even herself. She saw her father and her sisters, 
went near them, and suffered them to pat her 
back, and heard them admire her beauty. Her 
father reached her a tuft of grass, and she licked 
the outstretched hand. She longed to make her¬ 
self known to him, and would have uttered her 
wish; but, alas! words were wanting. At length 
she bethought herself of writing, and inscribed 
her name—it was a short one—with her hoof on 
the sand. Inachus recognized it, and discovering 

Diana, the Huntress. School of Fontainebleau. 
(Louvre, Paris.) 

Overleaf: Juno Discovers Jupiter with Io. Pieter 
Lastman. (National Gallery, London.) 

that his daughter, whom he had long sought in 
vain, was hidden under this disguise, mourned 
over her, and, embracing her white neck, ex¬ 
claimed, “Alas! my daughter, it would have been 
a less grief to have lost you altogether!” While 
he thus lamented, Argus, observing, came and 
drove her away, and took his seat on a high bank, 
from whence he could see all round in every di¬ 
rection. 

Jupiter was troubled at beholding the suffer¬ 
ings of his mistress and, calling Mercury, told 
him to go and despatch Argus. Mercury made 
haste, put his winged slippers on his feet, and 
cap on his head, took his sleep-producing wand, 
and leaped down from the heavenly towers to 
the earth. There he laid aside his wings and kept 
only his wand, with which he presented himself 
as a shepherd driving his flock. As he strolled on, 
he blew upon his pipes. These were what are 
called the Syrinx or Pandean pipes. Argus lis¬ 
tened with delight, for he had never seen the 
instrument before. “Young man,” said he, “come 
and take a seat by me on this stone. There is no 
better place for your flock to graze in than here¬ 
abouts, and here is a pleasant shade such as shep¬ 
herds love.” Mercury sat down, talked, and told 
stories till it grew late, and played upon his pipes 
his most soothing strains, hoping to lull the 
watchful eyes to sleep, but all in vain; for Argus 
still contrived to keep some of his eyes open 
though he shut the rest. 

Among other stories, Mercury told him how 
the instrument on which he played was invented. 
“There was a certain nymph, whose name was 
Syrinx, who was much beloved by the satyrs and 
spirits of the wood; but she would have none of 
them, but was a faithful worshipper of Diana and 
followed the chase. You would have thought it 
was Diana herself, had you seen her in her hunt¬ 
ing dress, only that her bow was of horn and 
Diana’s of silver. One day, as she was returning 
from the chase, Pan met her, told her just this, 
and added more of the same sort. She ran away, 
without stopping to hear his compliments, and 
he pursued till she came to the bank of the river, 
where he overtook her, and she had only time to 
call for help on her friends the water nymphs. 
They heard and consented. Pan threw his arms 
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around what he supposed to be the form of the 
nymph and found he embraced only a tuft of 
reeds! As he breathed a sigh, the air sounded 
through the reeds and produced a plaintive 
melody. The god, charmed with the novelty and 
with the sweetness of the music, said, ‘Thus, then, 
at least, you shall be mine.’ And he took some of 
the reeds, and placing them together, of un¬ 
equal lengths, side by side, made an instrument 
which he called Syrinx, in honor of the nymph.” 
Before Mercury had finished his story he saw 
Argus’s eyes all asleep. As his head nodded for¬ 
ward on his breast, Mercury with one stroke cut 
his neck through, and tumbled his head down the 
rocks. Oh, hapless Argus! the light of your hun¬ 
dred eyes is quenched at once! Juno took them 
and put them as ornaments on the tail of her 
peacock, where they remain to this day. 

But the vengeance of Juno was not yet sa¬ 
tiated. She sent a gadfly to torment Io, who fled 
over the whole world from its pursuit. She swam 
through the Ionian Sea, which derived its name 
from her, then roamed over the plains of Illyria, 
ascended Mount Haemus, and crossed the 
Thracian strait, thence named the Bosphorus 
(cowford), rambled on through Scythia and the 
country of the Cimmerians, and arrived at last 
on the banks of the Nile. At length, Jupiter in¬ 
terceded for her, and upon his promising not to 
pay her any more attentions Juno consented to 
restore her to her form. It was curious to see her 

gradually recover her former self. The coarse 
hairs fell from her body, her horns shrank up, 
her eyes grew narrower, her mouth shorter; 
hands and fingers came instead of hoofs to her 
fore feet; in fine there was nothing left of the 
heifer, except her beauty. At first she was afraid 
to speak for fear she should low, but gradually 
she recovered her confidence, and was restored 
to her father and sisters. 

In a poem dedicated to Leigh Hunt, by Keats, 
the following allusion to the story of Pan and 
Syrinx occurs: 

So did he feel who pulled the boughs aside, 
That we might look into a forest wide, 

Telling us how fair trembling Syrinx fled 
Arcadian Pan, with such a fearful dread. 
Poor nymph—poor Pan-how he did weep to find 
Nought but a lovely sighing of the wind 
Along the reedy stream; a half-heard strain, 
Full of sweet desolation, balmy pain. 

CALLISTO 

Callisto was another maiden who excited the 
jealousy of Juno, and the goddess changed her 
into a bear. “I will take away,” said she, “that 
beauty with which you have captivated my hus¬ 
band.” Down fell Callisto on her hands and 
knees; she tried to stretch out her arms in sup- 



Left: Diana and Her Nymphs Surprised by Fauns. 
Peter Paul Rubens. (Prado, Madrid.) 

Below: Pan and Syrinx. Frangois Boucher. (Na¬ 
tional Gallery, London.) 
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plication—they were already beginning to be cov¬ 
ered with black hair. Her hands grew rounded, 
became armed with crooked claws, and served 
for feet; her mouth, which Jove used to praise 
for its beauty, became a horrid pair of jaws; her 
voice, which if unchanged would have moved 
the heart to pity, became a growl, more fit to 
inspire terror. Yet her former disposition re¬ 
mained, and with continual groaning, she be¬ 
moaned her fate, and stood upright as well as 
she could, lifting up her paws to beg for mercy; 
and felt that Jove was unkind, though she could 
not tell him so. Ah, how often, afraid to stay in 
the woods all night alone, she wandered about 
the neighborhood of her former haunts; how of¬ 
ten, frightened by the dogs, did she, so lately a 
huntress, fly in terror from the hunters! Often 
she fled from the wild beasts, forgetting that she 
was now a wild beast herself; and, bear as she 
was, was afraid of the bears. 

One day a youth espied her as he was hunting. 
She saw him and recognized him as her own 
son, now grown a young man. She stopped and 
felt inclined to embrace him. As she was about 
to approach, he, alarmed, raised his hunting 
spear, and was on the point of transfixing her, 
when Jupiter, beholding, arrested the crime, and 
snatching away both of them, placed them in the 
heavens as the Great and Little Bear. 

Juno was in a rage to see her rival so set in 
honor, and hastened to ancient Tethys and 
Oceanus, the powers of ocean, and in answer to 
their inquiries, thus told the cause of her coming. 
“Do you ask why I, the queen of the gods, have 
left the heavenly plains and sought your depths. 
Learn that I am supplanted in heaven—my place 
is given to another. You will hardly believe me; 
but look when night darkens the world, and you 
shall see the two of whom I have so much reason 
to complain exalted to the heavens, in that part 
where the circle is the smallest, in the neighbor¬ 
hood of the pole. Why should anyone hereafter 
tremble at the thought of offending Juno, when 
such rewards are the consequence of my dis¬ 
pleasure! See what I have been able to effect! I 
forbade her to wear the human form—she is 
placed among the stars! So do my punishments 
result—such is the extent of my power! Better 
that she should have resumed her former shape, 
as I permitted Io to do. Perhaps he means to 
marry her, and put me away! But you, my 
foster-parents, if you feel for me, and see with 
displeasure this unworthy treatment of me, show 
it, I beseech you, by forbidding this guilty 
couple from coming into your waters.” The 

powers of the ocean assented, and consequently 
the two constellations of the Great and Little 
Bear move round and round in heaven, but never 
sink, as the other stars do, beneath the ocean. 

Milton alludes to the fact that the constellation 
of the Bear never sets, when he says— 

Let my lamp at midnight hour 
Be seen in some high lonely tower, 
Where I may oft outwatch the Bear, 

&c. 

And Prometheus, in J. R. Lowell’s poem, 
says— 

One after one the stars have risen and set, 
Sparkling upon the hoar frost of my chain; 
The Bear that prowled all night about the fold 
Of the North-star, hath shrunk into his den, 
Scared by the blithesome footsteps of the Dawn. 

The last star in the tail of the Little Bear is the 
Polestar, called also the Cynosure. Milton says— 

Straight mine eye hath caught new pleasures 
While the landscape round it measures. 

*###### 

Towers and battlements it sees 
Bosomed high in tufted trees, 
Where perhaps some beauty lies 
The Cynosure of neighboring eyes. 

A 

The reference here is both to the Polestar as 
the guide of mariners, and to the magnetic at¬ 
traction of the North. He calls it also the “Star 
of Arcady,” because Callisto’s boy was named 
Areas, and they lived in Arcadia. In Comus, the 
brother, benighted in the woods, says— 

. . . Some gentle taper! 
Though a rush candle, from the wicker hole 
Of some clay habitation, visit us 
With thy long levelled rule of streaming light, 
And thou shalt be our star of Arcady, 

Or Tyrian Cynosure. ftjjtfo/ 

4 q 
DIANA AND ACTAEON 0 ^ 

Thus, in two instances, we have seen Juno’s 
severity to her rivals; now let us learn how a 
virgin goddess punished an invader of her pri¬ 
vacy. 

It was midday, and the sun stood equally dis¬ 
tant from either goal, when young Actaeon, son 
of King Cadmus, thus addressed the youths who 
with him were hunting the stag in the mountains: 



Diana Leaving the Bath. Frangois Boucher. (Louvre, Paris.) 

Friends, our nets and our weapons are wet 
with the blood of our victims; we have had sport 
enough for one day, and tomorrow we can re¬ 
new our labors. Now, while Phoebus parches the 
earth, let us put by our implements and indulge 

ourselves with rest.” 
There was a valley thick enclosed with cy¬ 

presses and pines, sacred to the huntress queen, 
Diana. In the extremity of the valley was a cave, 
not adorned with art, but nature had counter¬ 
feited art in its construction, for she had turned 
the arch of its roof with stones as delicately fitted 
as if by the hand of man. A fountain burst out 
from one side, whose open basin was bounded by 
a grassy rim. Here the goddess of the woods used 

to come when weary with hunting and lave her 
virgin limbs in the sparkling water. 

One day, having repaired thither with her 
nymphs, she handed her javelin, her quiver, and 
her bow to one, her robe to another, while a 
third unbound the sandals from her feet. Then 
Crocale, the most skillful of them, arranged her 
hair, and Nephele, Hyale, and the rest drew 
water in capacious urns. While the goddess was 
thus employed in the labors of the toilet, behold 
Actaeon, having quitted his companions and 
rambling without any especial object, came to 
the place, led thither by his destiny. As he pre¬ 
sented himself at the entrance of the cave, the 
nymphs, seeing a man, screamed and rushed to- 



Diana and Actaeon. From the 
painting by Friedrich Preller. 
(From The Studio magazine.) 
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wards the goddess to hide her with their bodies. 
But she was taller than the rest and overtopped 
them all by a head. Such a color as tinges the 
clouds at sunset or at dawn came over the coun¬ 
tenance of Diana thus taken by surprise. Sur¬ 
rounded as she was by her nymphs, she yet 
turned half away and sought with a sudden im¬ 
pulse for her arrows. As they were not at hand, 
she dashed the water into the face of the intruder, 
adding these words: “Now go and tell, if you 
can, that you have seen Diana unapparelled.” Im¬ 
mediately, a pair of branching stag’s horns grew 
out of his head, his neck gained in length, his ears 
grew sharp-pointed, his hands became feet, his 
arms long legs, his body was covered with a 
hairy spotted hide. Fear took the place of his 
former boldness, and the hero fled. He could not 
but admire his own speed; but when he saw his 
horns in the water, “Ah, wretched me!” he 
would have said, but no sound followed the 
effort. He groaned, and tears flowed down the 
face which had taken the place of his own. Yet 
his consciousness remained. What shall he do? — 
go home to seek the palace, or lie hid in the 
woods? The latter he was afraid, the former he 
was ashamed to do. While he hesitated the dogs 
saw him. First Melampus, a Spartan dog, gave 
the signal with his bark, then Pamphagus, Dor- 
ceus, Lelaps, Theron, Nape, Tigris, and all the 
rest rushed after him swifter than the wind. Over 

rocks and cliffs, through mountain gorges that 
seemed impracticable, he fled and they followed. 
Where he had often chased the stag and cheered 
on his pack, his pack now chased him, cheered 
on by his huntsmen. He longed to cry out, “I am 
Actaeon; recognize your master!” but the words 
came not at his will. The air resounded with the 
bark of the dogs. Presently one fastened on his 
back, another seized his shoulder. While they 
held their master, the rest of the pack came up 
and buried their teeth in his flesh. He groaned— 
not in a human voice, yet certainly not in a 
stag’s—and falling on his knees, raised his eyes, 
and would have raised his arms in supplication, 
if he had had them. His friends and fellow-hunts¬ 
men cheered on the dogs, and looked everywhere 
for Actaeon, calling on him to join the sport. At 
the sound of his name, he turned his head, and 
heard them regret that he should be away. He 
earnestly wished he was. He would have been 
well pleased to see the exploits of his dogs, but to 
feel them was too much. They were all around 
him, rending and tearing; and it was not till they 
had torn his life out that the anger of Diana was 
satisfied. 

In Shelley’s poem “Adonais” is the following 
allusion to the story of Actaeon: 

’Midst others of less note came one frail form, 
A phantom among men: companionless 
As the last cloud of an expiring storm, 

Diana Killing Actaeon. The Pan Painter. (Museum of Fme Arts, Boston.) 



Whose thunder is its knell; he, as I guess, 
Had gazed on Nature’s naked loveliness, 
Actaeon-like, and now he fled astray 
With feeble steps o’er the world’s wilderness; 
And his own Thoughts, along that rugged way, 

Pursued like raging hounds their father and their 
prey. 

Stanza 31 

The allusion is probably to Shelley himself. 

LATONA AND THE RUSTICS 

Some thought the goddess in this instance more 
severe than was just, while others praised her 
conduct as strictly consistent with her virgin dig¬ 
nity. As usual, the recent event brought older 
ones to mind, and one of the bystanders told this 
story. “Some countrymen of Lycia once insulted 
the goddess Latona, but not with impunity. 
When I was young, my father, who had grown 
too old for active labors, sent me to Lycia to 
drive thence some choice oxen, and there I saw 
the very pond and marsh where the wonder hap¬ 
pened. Near by stood an ancient altar, black with 
the smoke of sacrifice and almost buried among 
the reeds. I inquired whose altar it might be, 
whether of Faunus or the Naiads or some god of 
the neighboring mountain, and one of the coun¬ 
try people replied, ‘No mountain or river god 
possesses this altar but she whom royal Juno in 
her jealousy drove from land to land, denying 
her any spot of earth whereon to rear her twins. 
Bearing in her arms the infant deities, Latona 
reached this land, weary with her burden and 
parched with thirst. By chance she espied in the 
bottom of the valley this pond of clear water, 
where the country people were at work gather¬ 
ing willows and osiers. The goddess approached, 
and kneeling on the bank, would have slaked her 
thirst in the cool stream, but the rustics forbade 
her. ‘Why do you refuse me water?’ said she; 
‘water is free to all. Nature allows no one to 
claim as property the sunshine, the air, or the 
water. I come to take my share of the common 
blessing. Yet I ask it of you as a favor. I have no 
intention of washing my limbs in it, weary 
though they be, but only to quench my thirst. 
My mouth is so dry that I can hardly speak. A 
draught of water would be nectar to me; it would 
revive me, and I would own myself indebted to 
you for life itself. Let these infants move your 
pity, who stretch out their little arms as if to 
plead for me’; and the children, as it happened, 

were stretching out their arms. 
“Who would not have been moved with these 

gentle words of the goddess? But these clowns 
persisted in their rudeness; they even added jeers 
and threats of violence if she did not leave the 
place. Nor was this all. They waded into the 
pond and stirred up the mud with their feet, so 
as to make the water unfit to drink. Latona was 
so angry that she ceased to mind her thirst. She 
no longer supplicated the clowns, but lifting her 
hands to heaven exclaimed, ‘May they never quit 
that pool, but pass their lives there!’ And it came 
to pass accordingly. They now live in the water, 
sometimes totally submerged, then raising their 
heads above the surface or swimming upon it. 
Sometimes they come out upon the bank, but 
soon leap back again into the water. They still 
use their base voices in railing, and though they 
have the water all to themselves, are not ashamed 
to croak in the midst of it. Their voices are harsh, 
their throats bloated, their mouths have become 
stretched by constant railing, their necks have 
shrunk up and disappeared, and their heads are 
joined to their bodies. Their backs are green, their 
disproportioned bellies white, and in short they 
are now frogs and dwell in the slimy pool.” 

This story explains the allusion in one of Mil¬ 
ton’s sonnets, “On the detraction which followed 
upon his writing certain treatises.” 

I did but prompt the age to quit their clogs 
By the known laws of ancient liberty, 
When straight a barbarous noise environs me 

Of owls and cuckoos, asses, apes and dogs. 
As when those hinds that were transformed to frogs 

Railed at Latona’s twin-born progeny, 
Which after held the sun and moon in fee. 

The persecution which Latona experienced 
from Juno is alluded to in the story. The tradi¬ 
tion was that the future mother of Apollo and 
Diana, flying from the wrath of Juno, besought 
all the islands of the Aegean to afford her a place 
of rest, but all feared too much the potent queen 
of heaven to assist her rival. Delos alone con¬ 
sented to become the birthplace of the future 
deities. Delos was then a floating island; but 
when Latona arrived there, Jupiter fastened it 
with adamantine chains to the bottom of the sea, 
that it might be a secure resting-place for his 
beloved. Byron alludes to Delos in his Don Juan: 

The isles of Greece! the isles of Greece! 
Where burning Sappho loved and sung, 

Where grew the arts of war and peace, 
Where Delos rose and Phoebus sprung! 



The Feast of the Gods. Giovanni Bellini. 
(National Gallery of Art, Washington, D.C.) 
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CHAPTER V 

PHAETON 

Phaeton was the son of Apollo,and the nymph 
Clymene. Une day a schoolfellow laughed at the 
idea of his being the son of the god, and Phaeton 
went in rage and shame and reported it to his 
mother. “If,” said he, “I am indeed of heavenly 
birth, give me, Mother, some proof of it and 
establish my claim to the honor.” Clymene 
stretched forth her hands towards the skies and 
said, “I call to witness the Sun which looks down 
upon us that I have told you the truth. If I speak 
falsely, let this be the last time I behold his light. 
But it needs not much labor to go and inquire 
for yourself; the land whence the Sun rises lies 
next to ours. Go and demand of him whether he 
will own you as a son.” Phaeton heard with de¬ 
light. He travelled to India, which lies directly 
in the regions of sunrise; and, full of hope and 
pride, approached the goal whence his parent 
begins his course. 

The palace of the Sun stood reared aloft on 
columns, glittering with gold and precious stones, 
while polished ivory formed the ceilings, and 
silver the doors. The workmanship surpassed 
the material; for upon the walls Vulcan had rep¬ 
resented earth, sea and skies, with their inhabi¬ 
tants. In the sea were the nymphs, some sporting 
in the waves, some riding on the backs of fishes, 
while others sat upon the rocks and dried their 
sea-green hair. Their faces were not all alike, nor 
yet unlike—but such as sisters’ ought to be. The 
earth had its towns and forests and rivers and 
rustic divinities. Over all was carved the likeness 
of the glorious heaven; and on the silver doors 
the twelve signs of the zodiac, six on each side. 

Clymene’s son advanced up the steep ascent 
and entered the halls of his disputed father. He 
approached the paternal presence, but stopped at 
a distance, for the light was more than he could 
bear. Phoebus, arrayed in a purple vesture, sat 
on a throne which glittered as with diamonds. 
On his right hand and his left stood the Day, the 
Month, and the Year, and, at regular intervals, 
the Hours. Spring stood with her head crowned 
with flowers, and Summer, with garment cast 
aside and a garland formed of spears of ripened 
grain, and Autumn, with his feet stained with 
grape juice, and icy Winter, with his hair stiff¬ 
ened with hoar frost. Surrounded by these at¬ 
tendants, the Sun, with the eye that sees every¬ 

thing, beheld the youth dazzled with the novelty 
and splendor of the scene, and inquired the pur¬ 
pose of his errand. The youth replied, “O light of 
the boundless world, Phoebus, my father—if you 
permit me to use that name—give me some proof, 
I beseech you, by which I may be known as 
yours.” He ceased; and his father, laying aside 
the beams that shone all around his head, bade 
him approach, and embracing him, said, “My 
son, you deserve not to be disowned, and I con¬ 
firm what your mother has told you. To put an 
end to your doubts, ask what you will, the gift 
shall be yours. I call to witness that dreadful 
lake, which I never saw, but which we gods 
swear by in our most solemn engagements.” 
Phaeton immediately asked to be permitted for 
one day to drive the chariot of the sun. The 
father repented of his promise; thrice and four 
times he shook his radiant head in warning. “I 
have spoken rashly,” said he; “this only request 
I would fain deny. I beg you to withdraw it. It 
is not a safe boon, nor one, my Phaeton, suited to 
your youth and strength. Your lot is mortal, and 
you ask what is beyond a mortal’s power. In 
your ignorance you aspire to do that which not 
even the gods themselves may do. None but 
myself may drive the flaming car of day. Not 
even Jupiter, whose terrible right arm hurls the 
thunderbolts. The first part of the way is steep 
and such as the horses when fresh in the morning 
can hardly climb; the middle is high up in the 
heavens, whence I myself can scarcely, without 
alarm, look down and behold the earth and sea 
stretched beneath me. The last part of the road 
descends rapidly and requires most careful driv¬ 
ing. Tethys, who is waiting to receive me, often 
trembles for me lest I should fall headlong. Add 
to all this, the heaven is all the time turning round 
and carrying the stars with it. I have to be per¬ 
petually on my guard lest that movement, which 
sweeps everything else along, should hurry me 
also away. Suppose I should lend you the chariot, 
what would you do? Could you keep your 
course while the sphere was revolving under 
you? Perhaps you think that there are forests 
and cities, the abodes of gods, and palaces and 
temples on the way. On the contrary, the road 
is through the midst of frightful monsters. You 
pass by the horns of the Bull, in front of the 



Archer, and near the Lion’s jaws, and where the 
Scorpion stretches its arms in one direction and 
the Crab in another. Nor will you find it easy to 
guide those horses, with their breasts full of fire 
that they breathe forth from their mouths and 
nostrils. I can scarcely govern them myself, when 
they are unruly and resist the reins. Beware, my 
son, lest I be the donor of a fatal gift; recall your 
request while yet you may. Do you ask me for a 
proof that you are sprung from my blood? I give 
you a proof in my fears for you. Look at my 
face—I would that you could look into my breast, 
you would see all a father’s anxiety. Finally,” he 
continued, “look round the world and choose 
whatever you will of what earth or sea contains 
most precious—ask it and fear no refusal. This 
only I pray you not to urge. It is not honor, but 
destruction you seek. Why do you hang round 
my neck and still entreat me? You shall have it if 
you persist—the oath is sworn and must be kept 
—but I beg you to choose more wisely.” 

He ended; but the youth rejected all admoni¬ 
tion and held to his demand. So, having resisted 
as long as he could, Phoebus at last led the way 
to where stood the lofty chariot. 

It was of gold, the gift of Vulcan; the axle was 
of gold, the pole and wheels of gold, the spokes 
of silver. Along the seats were rows of chryso¬ 
lites and diamonds, which reflected all around 
the brightness of the sun. While the daring 
youth gazed in admiration, the early Dawn threw 
open the purple doors of the east and showed 
the pathway strewn with roses. The stars with¬ 
drew, marshalled by the Daystar, which last of 
all retired also. The father, when he saw the 
earth beginning to glow and the Moon preparing 
to retire, ordered the Hours to harness up the 
horses. They obeyed, and led forth from the 
lofty stalls the steeds full fed with ambrosia, and 
attached the reins. Then the father bathed the 
face of his son with a powerful unguent, and 
made him capable of enduring the brightness of 
the flame. He set the rays on his head and, with 
a foreboding sigh, said, “If, my son, you will in 
this at least heed my advice, spare the whip and 
hold tight the reins. They go fast enough of their 
own accord; the labor is to hold them in. You are 
not to take the straight road directly between 
the five circles, but turn off to the left. Keep 
within the limit of the middle zone, and avoid 
the northern and the southern alike. You will see 
the marks of the wheels, and they will serve to 
guide you. And, that the skies and the earth may 
each receive their due share of heat, go not too 
high, or you will burn the heavenly dwellings, 

nor too low, or you will set the earth on fire; the 
middle course is safest and best. And now I leave 
you to your chance, which I hope will plan bet¬ 
ter for you than you have done for yourself. 
Night is passing out of the western gates and we 
can delay no longer. Take the reins; but if at last 
your heart fails you, and you will benefit by my 
advice, stay where you are in safety, and suffer 
me to light and warm the earth.” The agile 
youth sprang into the chariot, stood erect and 
grasped the reins with delight, pouring out 
thanks to his reluctant parent. 

Meanwhile, the horses fill the air with their 
snortings and fiery breath and stamp the ground 
impatient. Now the bars are let down, and the 
boundless plain of the universe lies open before 
them. They dart forward and cleave the oppos¬ 
ing clouds, and outrun the morning breezes 
which started from the same eastern goal. The 
steeds soon perceived that the load they drew was 
lighter than usual; and as a ship without ballast is 
tossed hither and thither on the sea, so the chariot, 
without its accustomed weight, was dashed about 
as if empty. They rush headlong and leave the 
travelled road. He is alarmed, and knows not 
how to guide them; nor, if he knew, has he the 
power. Then, for the first time, the Great and 
Little Bear were scorched with heat, and would 
fain, if it were possible, have plunged into the 
water; and the Serpent which lies coiled up 
round the north pole, torpid and harmless, grew 
warm, and with warmth felt its rage revive. 
Bootes, they say, fled away, though encumbered 
with his plough, and all unused to rapid motion. 

When hapless Phaeton looked down upon the 
earth, now spreading in vast extent beneath him, 
he grew pale and his knees shook with terror. In 
spite of the glare all around him, the sight of his 
eyes grew dim. He wished he had never touched 
his father’s horses, never learned his parentage, 
never prevailed in his request. He is borne along 
like a vessel that flies before a tempest, when the 
pilot can do no more and betakes himself to his 
prayers. What shall he do? Much of the heavenly 
road is left behind, but more remains before. He 
turns his eyes from one direction to the other; 
now to the goal whence he began his course, 
now to the realms of sunset which he is not des¬ 
tined to reach. He loses his self-command, and 
knows not what to do—whether to draw tight 
the reins or throw them loose; he forgets the 
names of the horses. He sees with terror the mon¬ 
strous forms scattered over the surface of heaven. 
Here the Scorpion extended his two great arms, 
with his tail and crooked claws stretching over 

Phaeton. Odilon Redon. (Private collection.) 





two signs of the zodiac. When the boy beheld 
him, reeking with poison and menacing with his 
fangs, his courage failed, and the reins fell from 
his hands. The horses, when they felt them loose 
on their backs, dashed headlong, and unrestrained 
went off into unknown regions of the sky, in 
among the stars, hurling the chariot over pathless 
places, now up in high heaven, now down almost 
to the earth. The moon saw with astonishment 
her brother’s chariot running beneath her own. 
The clouds begin to smoke, and the mountain 
tops take fire; the fields are parched with heat, 
the plants wither, the trees with their leafy 
branches burn, the harvest is ablaze! But these are 
small things. Great cities perished, with their 
walls and towers; whole nations with their people 
were consumed to ashes! The forest-clad moun¬ 
tains burned, Athos and Taurus and Tmolus and 
Oete; Ida, once celebrated for fountains, but now 
all dry; the Muses’ mountain Helicon, and 
Haemus; Aetna, with fires within and without, 
and Parnassus, with his two peaks, and Rhodope, 
forced at last to part with his snowy crown. Her 
cold climate was no protection to Scythia, Cau¬ 
casus burned, and Ossa and Pindus, and, greater 
than both, Olympus; the Alps high in air, and the 
Apennines crowned with clouds. 

Then Phaeton beheld the world on fire, and 
felt the heat intolerable. The air he breathed was 
like the air of a furnace and full of burning ashes, 
and the smoke was of a pitchy darkness. He 
dashed forward he knew not whither. Then, it is 
believed, the people of Ethiopia became black by 
the blood being forced so suddenly to the sur¬ 
face, and the Libyan desert was dried up to the 
condition in which it remains to this day. The 
Nymphs of the fountains, with dishevelled hair, 
mourned their waters, nor were the rivers safe 
beneath their banks; Tanais smoked, and Caicus, 
Xanthus and Meander. Babylonian Euphrates and 
Ganges, Tagus with golden sands, and Cayster 
where the swans resort. Nile fled away and hid 
his head in the desert, and there it still remains 
concealed. Where he used to discharge his waters 
through seven mouths into the sea, there seven 
dry channels alone remained. The earth cracked 
open, and through the chinks light broke into 
Tartarus and frightened the king of shadows and 
his queen. The sea shrank up. Where before was 
water it became a dry plain; and the mountains 
that lie beneath the waves lifted up their heads 
and became islands. The fishes sought the lowest 
depths, and the dolphins ventured as usual to 
sport on the surface. Even Nereus, and his wife 
Doris, with the Nereids, their daughters, sought 

the deepest caves for refuge. Thrice Neptune 
essayed to raise his head above the surface, and 
thrice was driven back by the heat. Earth, sur¬ 
rounded as she was by waters, yet with head and 
shoulders bare, screening her face with her hand, 
looked up to heaven, and with a husky voice 

called on Jupiter. 
“O ruler of the gods, if I have deserved this 

treatment, and it is your will that I perish with 
fire, why withhold your thunderbolts? Let me 
at least fall by your hand. Is this the reward of 
my fertility, of my obedient service? Is it for this 
that I have supplied herbage for cattle, and fruits 
for men, and frankincense for your altars? But 
if I am unworthy of regard, what has my brother 
Ocean done to deserve such a fate? If neither of 
us can excite your pity, think, I pray you, of 
your own heaven, and behold how both the poles 
are smoking which sustain your palace, which 
must fall if they be destroyed. Atlas faints, and 
scarce holds up his burden. If sea, earth, and 
heaven perish, we fall into ancient Chaos. Save 
what yet remains to us from the devouring 
flame. Oh, take thought for our deliverance in 
this awful moment!” 

Thus spoke Earth, and overcome with heat 
and thirst, could say no more. Then Jupiter om¬ 
nipotent, calling to witness all the gods, including 
him who had lent the chariot, and showing them 
that all was lost unless some speedy remedy were 
applied, mounted the lofty tower from whence 
he diffuses clouds over the earth, and hurls the 
forked lightnings. But at that time not a cloud 
was to be found to interpose for a screen to 
earth, nor was a shower remaining unexhausted. 
He thundered, and brandishing a lightning bolt 
in his right hand launched it against the chariot¬ 
eer, and struck him at the same moment from his 
seat and from existence! Phaeton, with his hair 
on fire, fell headlong, like a shooting star which 
marks the heavens with its brightness as it falls, 
and Eridanus, the great river, received him and 
cooled his burning frame. The Italian Naiads 
reared a tomb for him and inscribed these words 
upon the stone: 

Driver of Phoebus’ chariot, Phaeton. 
Struck by Jove’s thunder, rests beneath this stone. 
He could not rule his father’s car of fire, 
Yet was it much so nobly to aspire. 

His sisters, the Heliades, as they lamented his 
fate were turned into poplar trees on the banks 
of the river, and their tears, which continued to 
flow, became amber as they dropped into the 
stream. 
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The Fall of Phaeton. 
Engraving after Cornells Cornelisz by Hendrik Goltzius. 

(Metropolitan Museum of Art, Nevo York.) 

Milman, in his poem, “Samor,” makes the fol¬ 
lowing allusion to Phaeton’s story: 

As when the palsied universe aghast 
Lay , . . mute and still, 
When drove, so poets sing, the Sun-born youth 
Devious through Heaven’s affrighted signs his sire’s 
Ill-granted chariot. Him the Thunderer hurled 
From th’ empyrean headlong to the gulf 
Of the half-parched Eridanus, where weep 
Even now the sister trees their amber tears 
O’er Phaeton untimely dead. 

In the beautiful lines of Walter Savage Lan- 

dor, descriptive of the Sea-shell, there is an allu¬ 
sion to the Sun’s palace and chariot. The water- 
nymph says— 

... I have sinuous shells of pearly hue 
Within, and things that lustre have imbibed 
In the sun’s palace porch, where when unyoked 
His chariot wheel stands midway in the wave. 
Shake one and it awakens; then apply 
Its polished lip to your attentive ear, 
And it remembers its august abodes, 
And murmurs as the ocean murmurs there. 

Gebir, Book I 
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CHAPTER VI 

MIDAS-BAUCIS AND PHILEMON 

Bacchus, on a certain occasion, found his old 
sc!io^masteF~au3~Toster-father, Silenusfln^ing. 
The old man had been drinking, and Jiythat state 
wandered away, and was Toun3^b£^^some j^as- 
antsTwho carried him toTTTeir king, Midas. Adidas 
recognized him and treated him hospitably,, en¬ 
tertaining him for ten^d^s_jnd ^ughts_^vjthan 
unceasing round oFloIlity. On. the eleventbLdAy 
lie ^brought SilcriulTbackand restored him in 
safety to his pupil. Whereupon Bacchus offered 
Midas his choice of a reward, whatever he might 
wisK He asked that whatever he might touch 
shodd~be~changed into void' Bacchus consented^ 
though sorry that he had not made a better 
choice. Midas went his way, reioicing in his new- 
acquired power, which he hastened to put tojTe 
test. He XouldTcafceTjelieve his eyes when he 
fniinTTTwig oTTh^ak. which he plucked from 
the branch, become gold in Jus hand. He took up 
a stone-if <Shanged~to goIB^THe touched a sod; it 
Hid the same. He took an apple from the tree; you 
would have~thought heTtaarobbecTthegarden of 
the Hesperides. His joy knew no bounds, and as 
soon_as~he got home, he ordered theservantsTo 
set a splendid repast on the table. Then he tound 
to his dismay-that whether he touched bread, it 
hardened in His Ranch; or put a morsel to his lips, 
it defied his feethTTTe todk arglass jf wine, but it 
flowed down his throat like melted gold. 

In consternation at the unprecedented afflic¬ 
tion, he strove to divest himself of his power; he 
hated the gift he had lately coveted. But all in 
vain; starvation seemed to await him. He raised 
his arms all shining with gold, in prayer to Bac¬ 
chus, begging to be delivered from his glittering 
destruction. Bacchus, merciful deity, heard and 
consented. “Go,” said he, “to the River Pactolus, 
trace the stream to its fountain-head, there 
plunge your head and body in and wash away 
your fault and its punishment.” He did so, and 
scarce had he touched the waters before the gold- 
creating power passed into them, and the river 
sands became changed into gold, as they remain 

to this day. 
Thenceforth Midas, hating wealth and splen¬ 

dor, dwelt in the country, and became a worship¬ 
per of Pan, the god of the fields. On a certain oc¬ 
casion Pan had the temerity to compare his music 
with that of Apollo and to challenge the god of 

the lyre to a trial of skill. The challenge was ac¬ 
cepted, and Tmolus, the mountain god, was 
chosen umpire. The senior took his seat and 
cleared away the trees from his ears to listen. At 
a given signal Pan blew on his pipes, and with his 
rustic melody gave great satisfaction to himself 
and his faithful follower Midas, who happened 
to be present. Then Tmolus turned his head to¬ 
ward the sun-god, and all his trees turned with 
him. Apollo rose; his brow wreathed with Par¬ 
nassian laurel, while his robe of Tyrian purple 
swept the ground. In his left hand he held the 
lyre, and with his right hand struck the strings. 
Ravished with the harmony, Tmolus at once 
awarded the victory to the god of the lyre, and 
all but Midas acquiesced in the judgment. He dis¬ 
sented and questioned the justice of the award. 
Apollo would not suffer such a depraved pair of 
ears any longer to wear the human form, but 
caused them to increase in length, grow hairy, 
within and without, and movable on their roots; 
in short, to be on the perfect pattern of those of 

an ass. 
Mortified enough was King Midas at this mis¬ 

hap; but he consoled himself with the thought 
that it was possible to hide his misfortune, which 
he attempted to do by means of an ample turban 
or head-dress. But his hairdresser of course knew 
the secret. He was charged not to mention it and 
threatened with dire punishment if he presumed 
to disobey. But he found it too much for his dis¬ 
cretion to keep such a secret; so he went out into 
the meadow, dug a hole in the ground, and stoop¬ 
ing down, whispered the story and covered it up. 
Before long a thick bed of reeds sprang up in the 
meadow, and as soon as it had gained its growth, 
began whispering the story and has continued to 
do so, from that day to this, every time a breeze 
passes over the place. 

The story of King Midas has been told by 
others with some variations. Dryden, in “The 
Wife of Bath’s Tale,” makes Midas’s queen the 
betrayer of the secret. 

Opposite: Midas Washing at the River Pactolus. 
Nicolas Poussin. (Metropolitan Museum of Art, 
New York.) 

Overleaf: The Judgement of Midas. Gillis van 
Coninxloo. (Dresden Museum.) 
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This Midas knew, and durst communicate 
To none but to his wife his ears of state. 

Midas was king of Phrygia. He was the son of 
Gordius, a poor countryman, who was taken by 
the people and made king, in obedience to the 
command of the oracle, which had said that their 
future king should come in a wagon. While the 
people were deliberating, Gordius with his wife 
and son came driving his wagon into the public 
square. 

Gordius, being made king, dedicated his wagon 
to the deity of the oracle, and tied it up in its 
place with a fast knot. This was the celebrated 
Gordian knot, which, in after times it was said, 
whoever should untie should become lord of all 
Asia. Many tried to untie it, but none succeeded, 
till Alexander the Great, in his career of con¬ 
quest, came to Phrygia. He tried his skill with as 
ill success as others, till growing impatient he 
drew his sword and cut the knot. When he after¬ 
wards succeeded in subjecting all Asia to his 
sway, people began to think that he had com¬ 
plied with the terms of the oracle according to 
its true meaning. 

BAUCIS AND PHILEMON 

On a certain hill in Phrygia stand a linden tree 
and an oak, enclosed by a low wall. Not far from 
the spot is a marsh, formerly good habitable land, 
but now indented with pools, the resort of fen- 
birds and cormorants. Once on a time, Jupiter, in 
human shape, visited this country, and with him 
his son Mercury (he of the caduceus), without 
his wings. They presented themselves as weary 
travellers, at many a door, seeking rest and shelter, 
but found all closed, for it was late, and the in¬ 
hospitable inhabitants would not rouse themselves 
to open for their reception. At last a humble 

mansion received them, a small thatched cottage 
where Baucis, a pious old dame, and her husband 
Philemon, united when young, had grown old 
together. Not ashamed of their poverty, they 
made it endurable by moderate desires and kind 
dispositions. One need not look there for master 
or for servant; they two were the whole house¬ 
hold, master and servant alike. When the two 
heavenly guests crossed the humble threshold 
and bowed their heads to pass under the low 
door, the old man placed a seat, on which Baucis, 
bustling and attentive, spread a cloth, and begged 
them to sit down. Then she raked out the coals 
from the ashes, and kindled up a fire, fed it with 
leaves and dry bark, and with her scanty breath 
blew it into a flame. She brought out of a corner 
split sticks and dry branches, broke them up, and 
placed them under the small kettle. Her husband 
collected some pot-herbs in the garden, and she 
shred them from the stalks and prepared them 
for the pot. He reached down with a forked stick 
a flitch of bacon hanging in the chimney, cut a 
small piece, and put it in the pot to boil with the 
herbs, setting away the rest for another time. A 
beechen bowl was filled with warm water, that 
their guests might wash. While all was doing they 
beguiled the time with conversation. 

On the bench designed for the guests was laid 
a cushion stuffed with seaweed; and a cloth, only 
produced on great occasions, but ancient and 
coarse enough, was spread over that. The old 
lady, with her apron on, with trembling hand set 
the table. One leg was shorter than the rest, but 
a piece of slate put under restored the level. 
When fixed, she rubbed the table down with 
some sweet-smelling herbs. Upon it she set some 
of chaste Minerva’s olives, some cornel berries 
preserved in vinegar, and added radishes and 
cheese, with eggs lightly cooked in the ashes. All 
were served in earthen dishes, and an earthenware 
pitcher, with wooden cups, stood beside them. 
When all was ready, the stew, smoking hot, was 
set on the table. Some wine, not of the oldest, was 
added; and for dessert, apples and wild honey; 
and over and above all, friendly faces and simple 
but hearty welcome. 

Now while the repast proceeded, the old folks 
were astonished to see that the wine, as fast as it 
was poured out, renewed itself in the pitcher, of 
its own accord. Struck with terror, Baucis and 
Philemon recognized their heavenly guests, fell 
on their kneeS, and with clasped hands implored 
forgiveness for their poor entertainment. There 
was an old goose, which they kept as the guard¬ 
ian of their humble cottage; and they bethought 



them to make this a sacrifice in honor of their 
guests. But the goose, too nimble, with the aid of 
feet and wings, for the old folks, eluded their 
pursuit and at last took shelter between the gods 
themselves. They forbade it to be slain; and spoke 
in these words: “We are gods. This inhospitable 
village shall pay the penalty of its impiety; you 
alone shall go free from the chastisement. Quit 
your house and come with us to the top of yon¬ 
der hill.” They hastened to obey, and, staff in 
hand, labored up the steep ascent. They had 
reached to within an arrow’s flight of the top, 
when turning their eyes below, they beheld all 
the country sunk in a lake, only their own house 
left standing. While they gazed with wonder at 
the sight, and lamented the fate of their neigh¬ 
bors, that old house of theirs was changed into a 
temple. Columns took the place of the corner 
posts, the thatch grew yellow and appeared a 
gilded roof, the floors became marble, the doors 
were enriched with carving and ornaments of 
gold. Then spoke Jupiter in benignant accents: 
“Excellent old man, and woman worthy of such 
a husband, speak, tell us your wishes; what favor 
have you to ask of us?” Philemon took counsel 
with Baucis a few moments, then declared to the 
gods their united wish. “We ask to be priests and 
guardians of this your temple; and since here we 
have passed our lives in love and concord, we 
wish that one and the same hour may take us 
both from life, that I may not live to see her 
grave, nor be laid in my own by her.” Their 
prayer was granted. They were the keepers of 
the temple as long as they lived. When grown 
very old, as they stood one day before the steps 
of the sacred edifice, and were telling the story 
of the place, Baucis saw Philemon begin to put 
forth leaves, and old Philemon saw Baucis chang¬ 
ing in like manner. And now a leafy crown had 
grown over their heads, while exchanging part¬ 
ing words, as long as they could speak. “Farewell, 
dear spouse,” they said, together, and at the same 
moment the bark closed over their mouths. The 
Tyanean shepherd still shows the two trees, stand¬ 
ing side by side, made out of the two good old 
people. 

The story of Baucis and Philemon has been 
imitated by Swift, in a burlesque style, the actors 
in the change being two wandering saints, and 
the house being changed into a church, of which 
Philemon is made the parson. The following may 
serve as a specimen: 

They scarce had spoke, when, fair and soft, 
The roof began to mount aloft; 
Aloft rose every beam and rafter; 
The heavy wall climbed slowly after. 
The chimney widened and grew higher, 
Became a steeple with a spire. 
The kettle to the top was hoist, 
And there stood fastened to a joist, 
But with the upside down, to show 
Its inclination for below; 
In vain, for a superior force, 
Applied at bottom, stops its course; 
Doomed ever in suspense to dwell, 
’Tis now no kettle, but a bell. 
A wooden jack, which had almost 
Lost by disuse the art to roast, 
A sudden alteration feels, 
Increased by new intestine wheels; 
And, what exalts the wonder more, 
The number made the motion slower; 
The flier, though’t had leaden feet, 
Turned round so quick you scarce could see’t; 
But slackened by some secret power, 
Now hardly moves an inch an hour. 
The jack and chimney, near allied, 
Had never left each other’s side. 
The chimney to a steeple grown, 
The jack would not be left alone; 
But up against the steeple reared, 
Became a clock, and still adhered; 
And still its love to household cares 
By a shrill voice at noon declares. 
Warning the cook-maid not to burn 
That roast meat which it cannot turn 
The groaning chair began to crawl, 
Like a huge snail, along the wall; 
There stuck aloft in public view, 
And with small change, a pulpit grew. 
A bedstand of the antique mode, 
Compact of timber many a load, 
Such as our ancestors did use, 
Was metamorphosed into pews, 
Which still their ancient nature keep 
By lodging folks disposed to sleep. 

79 





CHAPTER VII 

PROSERPINE-GLAUCUS AND SCYLLA 

When Jupiter and his brothers had defeated the 
Titans and banished them to Tartarus, a new 
enemy rose up against the gods. They were the 
giants Typhon, Briareus, Enceladus, and others. 
Some of them had a hundred arms, others 
breathed out fire. They were finally subdued and 
buried alive under Mount Aetna, where they still 
sometimes struggle to get loose and shake the 
whole island with earthquakes. Their breath 
comes up through the mountain and is what men 
call the eruption of the volcano. 

The fall of these monsters shook the earth, so 
that Pluto was alarmed, and feared that his king¬ 
dom would be laid open to the light of day. Un¬ 
der this apprehension, he mounted his chariot, 
drawn by black horses, and took a circuit of in¬ 
spection to satisfy himself of the extent of the 
damage. While he was thus engaged, Venus, who 
was sitting on Mount Eryx playing with her boy 
Cupid, espied him and said, “My son, take your 
darts with which you conquer all, even Jove him¬ 
self, and send one into the breast of yonder dark 
monarch, who rules the realm of Tartarus. Why 
should he alone escape? Seize the opportunity to 
extend your empire and mine. Do you not see 
that even in heaven some despise our power? 
Minerva the wise, and Diana the huntress, defy 
us; and there is that daughter of Ceres, who 
threatens to follow their example. Now do you, 
if you have any regard for your own interest or 
mine, join these two in one.” The boy unbound 
his quiver and selected his sharpest and truest 
arrow; then, straining the bow against his knee, 
he attached the string and, having made ready, 
shot the arrow with its barbed point right into 

the heart of Pluto. 
In the vale of Enna there is a lake embowered 

in woods, which screen it from the fervid rays 
of the sun, while the moist ground is covered 
with flowers, and Spring reigns perpetual. Here 
Proserpine was playing with her companions, 
gathering lilies and violets, and filling her basket 
and her apron with them, when Pluto saw her, 
loved her, and carried her off. She screamed for 
help to her mother and her companions; and 
when in her fright she dropped the corner of her 

Opposite: Toilet of Venus. Frangois Boucher. 
(.Metropolitan Museum of Art, New York.) 

apron and let the flowers fall, childlike she felt 
the loss of them as an addition to her grief. The 
ravisher urged on his steeds, calling them each by 
name and throwing loose over their heads and 
necks his iron-colored reins. When he reached 
the River Cyane, and it opposed his passage, he 
struck the riverbank with his trident, and the 
earth opened and gave him a passage to Tartarus. 

Ceres sought her daughter all the world over. 
Bright-haired Aurora, when she came forth in 
the morning, and Hesperus, when he led out the 
stars in the evening, found her still busy in the 
search. But it was all unavailing. At length weary 
and sad, she sat down upon a stone, and con¬ 
tinued sitting nine days and nights, in the open 
air, under the sunlight and moonlight and falling 
showers. It was where now stands the city of 
Eleusis, then the home of an old man named 
Celeus. He was out in the field, gathering acorns 
and blackberries, and sticks for his fire. His little 
girl was driving home their two goats, and as she 
passed the goddess, who appeared in the guise 
of an old woman, she said to her, “Mother”—and 
the name was sweet to the ears of Ceres—“why 
do you sit here alone upon the rocks?” The old 
man also stopped, though his load was heavy, 
and begged her to come into his cottage, such as 
it was. She declined, and he urged her. “Go in 
peace,” she replied, “and be happy in your 
daughter; I have lost mine.” As she spoke, tears— 
or something like tears, for the gods never weep 
—fell down her cheeks upon her bosom. The 
compassionate old man and his child wept with 
her. Then said he, “Come with us, and despise 
not our humble roof; so may your daughter be 
restored to you in safety.” “Lead on,” said she, 
“I cannot resist that appeal!” So she rose from 
the stone and went with them. As they walked 
he told her that his only son, a little boy, lay 
very sick, feverish and sleepless. She stooped and 
gathered some poppies. As they entered the cot¬ 
tage, they found all in great distress, for the boy 
seemed past hope of recovery. Metanira, his 
mother, received her kindly, and the goddess 
stooped and kissed the lips of the sick child. 
Instantly the paleness left his face, and healthy 
vigor returned to his body. The whole family 
were delighted—that is, the father, mother, and 
little girl, for they were all; they had no ser- 
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The Rape of Proserpine. Charles 
de Lafosse. (Ecole des Beaux- 
Arts, Paris.) 



vants. They spread the table and put upon it 
curds and cream, apples, and honey in the comb. 
While they ate, Ceres mingled poppy juice in the 
milk of the boy. When night came and all was 
still, she arose, and taking the sleeping boy, 
moulded his limbs with her hands, and uttered 
over him three times a solemn charm, then went 
and laid him in the ashes. His mother, who had 
been watching what her guest was doing, sprang 
forward with a cry and snatched the child from 
the fire. Then Ceres assumed her own form, and 
a divine splendor shone all around. While they 
were overcome with astonishment, she said, 
“Mother, you have been cruel in your fondness 
to your son. I would have made him immortal, 
but you have frustrated my attempt. Neverthe¬ 
less, he shall be great and useful. He shall teach 
men the use of the plough, and the rewards 
which labor can win from the cultivated soil.” 
So saying, she wrapped a cloud about her and, 
mounting her chariot, rode away. 

Ceres continued her search for her daughter, 
passing from land to land, and across seas and 
rivers, till at length she returned to Sicily, 
whence she at first set out, and stood by the 
banks of the River Cyane, where Pluto made 
himself a passage with his prize to his own do¬ 
minions. The river nymph would have told the 
goddess all she had witnessed, but dared not, for 
fear of Pluto; so she only ventured to take up the 
girdle which Proserpine had dropped in her flight, 
and waft it to the feet of the mother. Ceres, see¬ 
ing this, was no longer in doubt of her loss, but 
she did not yet know the cause and laid the blame 
on the innocent land. “Ungrateful soil,” said she, 
“which I have endowed with fertility and clothed 
with herbage and nourishing grain, no more shall 
you enjoy my favors.” Then the cattle died, the 
plough broke in the furrow, the seed failed to 
come up; there was too much sun, there was too 
much rain; the birds stole the seeds—thistles and 
brambles were the only growth. Seeing this, the 
fountain Arethusa interceded for the land. “God¬ 
dess,” said she, “blame not the land; it opened 
unwillingly to yield a passage to your daughter. 
I can tell you of her fate, for I have seen her. 
This is not my native country; I came hither 
from Elis. I was a woodland nymph, and de¬ 
lighted in the chase. They praised my beauty, 
but I cared nothing for it, and rather boasted of 
my hunting exploits. One day I was returning 
from the wood, heated with exercise, when I 
came to a stream silently flowing, so clear that 
you might count the pebbles on the bottom. The 
willows shaded it, and the grassy bank sloped 

down to the water’s edge. I approached, I 
touched the water with my foot. I stepped in 
knee-deep, and not content with that, I laid my 
garments on the willows and went in. While I 
sported in the water, I heard an indistinct mur¬ 
mur coming up as out of the depths of the stream; 
and made haste to escape to the nearest bank. The 
voice said, ‘Why do you fly, Arethusa? I am 
Alpheus, the god of this stream.’ I ran, he pur¬ 
sued; he was not more swift than I, but he was 
stronger, and gained upon me, as my strength 
failed. At last, exhausted, I cried for help to 
Diana. ‘Help me, goddess! Help your votary!’ 
The goddess heard and wrapped me suddenly 
in a thick cloud. The river god looked now this 
way and now that, and twice came close to me, 
but could not find me. ‘Arethusa! Arethusa!’ he 
cried. O, how I trembled—like a lamb that hears 
the wolf growling outside the fold. A cold sweat 
came over me, my hair flowed down in streams; 
where my foot stood there was a pool. In short, 
in less time than it takes to tell it I became a 
fountain. But in this form Alpheus knew me, and 
attempted to mingle his stream with mine. Diana 
cleft the ground, and I, endeavoring to escape 
him, plunged into the cavern, and through the 
bowels of the earth came out here in Sicily. 
While I passed through the lower parts of the 
earth, I saw your Proserpine. She was sad, but no 
longer showing alarm in her countenance. Her 
look was such as became a queen—the queen of 
Erebus; the powerful bride of the monarch of the 
realms of the dead.” 

When Ceres heard this, she stood for a while 
like one stupefied; then turned her chariot to¬ 
wards heaven and hastened to present herself be¬ 
fore the throne of Jove. She told the story of her 
bereavement, and implored Jupiter to interfere 
to procure the restitution of her daughter. Jupiter 
consented on one condition, namely, that Proser¬ 
pine should not during her stay in the lower 
world have taken any food; otherwise, the Fates 
forbade her release. Accordingly, Mercury was 
sent, accompanied by Spring, to demand Proser¬ 
pine of Pluto. The wily monarch consented; but 
alas! the maiden had taken a pomegranate which 
Pluto offered her, and had sucked the sweet pulp 
from a few of the seeds. This was enough to pre¬ 
vent her complete release; but a compromise was 
made, by which she was to pass half the time 
with her mother, and the rest with her husband 
Pluto. 

Ceres allowed herself to be pacified with this 
arrangement and restored the earth to her favor. 
Now she remembered Celeus and his family, and 



her promise to his infant son Triptolemus. When 
the boy grew up, she taught him the use of the 
plough, and how to sow the seed. She took 
him in her chariot, drawn by winged dragons, 
through all the countries of the earth, imparting 
to mankind valuable grains, and the knowledge 
of agriculture. After his return, Triptolemus 
built a magnificent temple to Ceres in Eleusis, 
and established the worship of the goddess, under 
the name of the Eleusinian mysteries, which, in 
the splendor and solemnity of their observance, 
surpassed all other religious celebrations among 
the Greeks. 

There can be little doubt of this story of Ceres 
and Proserpine being an allegory. Proserpine 
signifies the seed-corn which, when cast into the 
ground, lies there concealed—that is, she is car¬ 
ried off by the god of the underworld; it re¬ 
appears—that is, Proserpine is restored to her 
mother. Spring leads her back to the light of 
day. 

Milton alludes to the story of Proserpine in 
Paradise Lost, Book IV. 

Not that fair field 
Of Enna where Proserpine gathering flowers, 
Herself a fairer flower, by gloomy Dis 
Was gathered, which cost Ceres all that pain 
To seek her through the world,. 
.might with this Paradise 
Of Eden strive. 

Hood, in his “Ode to Melancholy,” uses the 
same allusion very beautifully: 

Forgive, if somewhile I forget, 
In woe to come the present bliss; 

As frighted Proserpine let fall 
Her flowers at the sight of Dis. 

The River Alpheus does in fact disappear 
under ground, in part of its course, finding its 
way through subterranean channels, till it again 
appears on the surface. It was said that the Sicilian 
fountain Arethusa was the same stream, which, 
after passing under the sea, came up again in 
Sicily. Hence the story ran that a cup thrown 
into the Alpheus appeared again in Arethusa. It 
is this fable of the underground course of Alpheus 
that Coleridge alludes to in his poem about Kubla 

Khan: 

In Xanadu did Kubla Khan 
A stately pleasure-dome decree, 

Where Alph, the sacred river, ran 
Through caverns measureless to man, 

Down to a sunless sea. 

Demeter (Ceres), Triptolemus, and Prosperine. 
Greek. (National Archaeological Museum, Ath¬ 
ens.) 

In one of Moore’s juvenile poems, he thus al¬ 
ludes to the same story, and to the practice of 
throwing garlands or other light objects on his 
stream to be carried downward by it, and after¬ 
wards reproduced at its emerging: 

O my beloved, how divinely sweet 
Is the pure joy when kindred spirits meet! 
Like him the river god, whose waters flow, 
With love their only light, through caves below, 
Wafting in triumph all the flowery braids 
And festal rings, with which Olympic maids 
Have decked his current, as an offering meet 
To lay at Arethusa’s shining feet. 
Think, when he meets at last his fountain bride, 
What perfect love must thrill the blended tide! 
Each lost in each, till mingling into one, 
Their lot the same for shadow or for sun, 
A type of true love, to the deep they run. 

The following extract from Moore’s Rhymes 
on the Road gives an account of a celebrated pic¬ 
ture by Albano at Milan, called a “Dance of 
Loves”: 
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’Tis for the theft of Enna’s flower from earth 
These urchins celebrate their dance of mirth, 

Round the green tree, like fays upon a heath— 
Those that are nearest linked in order bright, 

Cheek after cheek, like rosebuds in a wreath; 
And those more distant showing from beneath 

The others’ wings their little eyes of light. 
While see! among the clouds, their eldest brother, 

But just flown up, tells with a smile of bliss, 
This prank of Pluto to his charmed mother, 

Who turns to greet the tidings with a kiss. 

Scylla. 

GLAUCUS AND SCYLLA 

Glaucus was a fisherman. One day he had drawn 
his nets to land and had taken a great many fishes 
of various kinds. So he emptied his net and pro¬ 
ceeded to sort the fishes on the grass. The place 
where he stood was a beautiful island in the river, 
a solitary spot, uninhabited, and not used for 
pasturage of cattle, nor ever visited by any but 
himself. On a sudden, the fishes, which had been 
laid on the grass, began to revive and move their 
fins as if they were in the water; and while he 
looked on astonished, they one and all moved off 
to the water, plunged in, and swam away. He did 
not know what to make of this, whether some 
god had done it, or some secret power in the 
herbage. “What herb has such a power?” he ex¬ 
claimed; and gathering some of it, he tasted it. 
Scarce had the juices of the plant reached his 
palate when he found himself agitated with a 
longing desire for the water. He could no longer 
restrain himself, but bidding farewell to earth, he 

plunged into the stream. The gods of the water 
received him graciously and admitted him to the 
honor of their society. They obtained the con¬ 
sent of Oceanus and Tethys, the sovereigns of 
the sea, that all that was mortal in him should be 
washed away. A hundred rivers poured their 
waters over him. Then he lost all sense of his 
former nature and all consciousness. When he re¬ 
covered, he found himself changed in form and 
mind. His hair was sea-green, and trailed behind 
him on the water; his shoulders grew broad, and 
what had been thighs and legs assumed the form 
of a fish’s tail. The sea-gods complimented him 
on the change of his appearance, and he fancied 
himself rather a good-looking personage. 

One day Glaucus saw the beautiful maiden 
Scylla, the favorite of the water-nymphs, ram¬ 
bling on the shore, and when she had found a 
sheltered nook, laving her limbs in the clear 
water. He fell in love with her, and showing 
himself on the surface, spoke to her, saying such 
things as he thought most likely to win her to 
stay; for she turned to run immediately on the 
sight of him, and ran till she had gained a cliff 
overlooking the sea. Here she stopped and turned 
round to see whether it was a god or a sea ani¬ 
mal, and observed with wonder his shape and 
color. Glaucus, partly emerging from the water 
and supporting himself against a rock, said, 
“Maiden, I am no monster, nor a sea animal, but 
a god; and neither Proteus nor Triton ranks 
higher than I. Once I was a mortal, and followed 
the sea for a living; but now I belong wholly to 
it.” Then he told the story of his metamorphosis, 
and how he had been promoted to his present 
dignity, and added, “But what avails all this if it 
fails to move your heart?” He was going on in 
this strain, but Scylla turned and hastened away. 

Glaucus was in despair, but it occurred to him 
to consult the enchantress, Circe. Accordingly he 
repaired to her island—the same where afterwards 
Ulysses landed, as we shall see in one of our later 
stories. After mutual salutations, he said, “God¬ 
dess, I entreat your pity; you alone can relieve 
the pain I suffer. The power of herbs I know as 
well as any one, for it is to them I owe my change 
of form. I love Scylla. I am ashamed to tell you 
how I have sued and promised to her, and how 
scornfully she has treated me. I beseech you to 
use your incantations, or potent herbs, if they are 
more prevailing, not to cure me of my love—for 
that I do not wish—but to make her share it and 
yield me a like return.” To which Circe replied, 
for she was not insensible to the attractions of the 
sea-green deity, “You had better pursue a willing 



Circe. Parmigianino. (Albertina, Vienna.) 

object; you are worthy to be sought, instead of 
having to seek in vain. Be not diffident, know 
your own worth. I protest to you that even I, 
goddess though I be, and learned in the virtues of 
plants and spells, should not know how to refuse 
you. If she scorns you, scorn her; meet one who 
is ready to meet you half way, and thus make a 
due return to both at once.” To these words 
Glaucus replied, “Sooner shall trees grow at the 
bottom of the ocean, and seaweed on the top of 
the mountains, than I will cease to love Scylla, 

and her alone.” 
The goddess was indignant, but she could not 

punish him, neither did she wish to do so, for 
she liked him too well; so she turned all her 
wrath against her rival, poor Scylla. She took 
plants of poisonous powers and mixed them to¬ 
gether, with incantations and charms. Then she 
passed through the crowd of gambolling beasts, 
the victims of her art, and proceeded to the coast 

of Sicily, where Scylla lived. There was a little 
bay on the shore to which Scylla used to resort, 
in the heat of the day, to breathe the air of the 
sea and to bathe in its waters. Here the goddess 
poured her poisonous mixture, and muttered over 
it incantations of mighty power. Scylla came as 
usual and plunged into the water up to her waist. 
What was her horror to perceive a brood of ser¬ 
pents and barking monsters surrounding her! At 
first she could not imagine they were a part of 
herself, and tried to run from them and to drive 
them away; but as she ran she carried them with 
her, and when she tried to touch her limbs, she 
found her hands touch only the yawning jaws of 
monsters. Scylla remained rooted to the spot. 
Her temper grew as ugly as her form, and she 
took pleasure in devouring hapless mariners who 
came within her grasp. Thus she destroyed six of 
the companions of Ulysses, and tried to wreck 
the ships of Aeneas, till at last she was turned 
into a rock, and as such still continues to be a 
terror to mariners. 

Keats in his Endymion, has given a new ver¬ 
sion of the ending of “Glaucus and Scylla”— 
Glaucus consents to Circe’s blandishments, till 
he by chance is witness to her transactions with 
her beasts. Disgusted with her treachery and 
cruelty, he tries to escape from her, but is taken 
and brought back, when with reproaches she 
banishes him, sentencing him to pass a thousand 
years in decrepitude and pain. He returns to the 
sea, and there finds the body of Scylla, whom 
the goddess has not transformed but drowned. 
Glaucus learns that his destiny is that, if he passes 
his thousand years in collecting all the bodies of 
drowned lovers, a youth beloved of the gods will 
appear and help him. Endymion fulfills this 
prophecy and aids in restoring Glaucus to youth, 
and Scylla and all the drowned lovers to life. 

The following is Glaucus’s account of his feel¬ 
ings after his “sea-change”: 

I plunged for life or death. To interknit 
One’s senses with so dense a breathing stuff 
Might seem a work of pain, so not enough 
Can I admire how crystal-smooth it felt, 
And buoyant round my limbs. At first I dwelt 
Whole days and days in sheer astonishment; 
Forgetful utterly of self-intent, 
Moving but with the mighty ebb and flow. 
Then like a new-fledged bird that first doth show 
His spreaded feathers to the morrow chill, 
I tried in fear the pinions of my will. 
’Twas freedom! and at once I visited 
The ceaseless wonders of this ocean-bed, . . . 

&c. Keats 
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CHAPTER VIII 

PYGMALION—DRYOPE—VENUS AND ADONIS— 
APOLLO AND HYACINTHUS 

•* V \ \ \ 

Pygmalion saw so much to blame in women that 
he came at last to abhor the sex, and resolved to 
live unmarried. He was a sculptor, and had made 
with wonderful skill a statue of ivory, so beauti¬ 
ful that no living woman came anywhere near it. 
It was indeed the perfect semblance of a maiden 
that seemed to be alive, and only prevented from 
moving by modesty. His art was so perfect that 
it concealed itself, and its product looked like 
the workmanship of nature. Pygmalion admired 
his own work and at last fell in love with the 
counterfeit creation. Oftentimes he laid his hand 
upon it as if to assure himself whether it were 
living or not, and could not even then believe 
that it was only ivory. He caressed it and gave it 
presents such as young girls love—bright shells 
and polished stones, little birds and flowers of 
various hues, beads and amber. He put raiment 
on its limbs, and jewels on its fingers, and a neck¬ 
lace about its neck. To the ears he hung earrings, 
and strings of pearls upon the breast. Her dress 
became her, and she looked not less charming 
than when unattired. He laid her on a couch 
spread with cloths of Tyrian dye, and called her 
his wife, and put her head upon a pillow of the 
softest feathers, as if she could enjoy their soft¬ 

ness. 
The festival of Venus was at hand—a festival 

celebrated with great pomp at Cyprus. Victims 
were offered, the altars smoked, and the odor of 
incense filled the air. When Pygmalion had per¬ 
formed his part in the solemnities, he stood be¬ 
fore the altar and timidly said, “Ye gods, who 
can do all things, give me, I pray you, for my 
wife”—he dared not say “my ivory virgin,” but 
said instead—“one like my ivory virgin.” Venus, 
who was present at the festival, heard him and 
knew the thought he would have uttered; and as 
an omen of her favor, caused the flame on the 
altar to shoot up thrice in a fiery point into the 
air. When he returned home, he went to see his 
statue, and leaning over the couch, gave a kiss to 
the mouth. It seemed to be warm. He pressed its 
lips again, he laid his hand upon the limbs; the 
ivory felt soft to his touch and yielded to his 
fingers like the wax of Hymettus. While he 
stands astonished and glad, though doubting, and 
fears he may be mistaken, again and again with a 

lover’s ardor, he touches the object of his hopes. 
It was indeed alive! The veins when pressed 
yielded to the finger and again resumed their 
roundness. Then at last the votary of Venus 
found words to thank the goddess, and pressed 
his lips upon lips as real as his own. The virgin 
felt the kisses and blushed, and opening her timid 
eyes to the light, fixed them at the same moment 
on her lover. Venus blessed the nuptials she had 
formed, and from this union Paphos was born, 
from whom the city, sacred to Venus, received 

its name. 
Schiller, in his poem The Ideal and the Life, ap¬ 

plies this tale of Pygmalion to the love of nature 
in a youthful heart. The following translation is 

furnished by a friend: 

As once with prayers in passion flowing, 
Pygmalion embraced the stone, 

Till from the frozen marble glowing, 
The light of feeling o’er him shone, 

So did I clasp with young devotion 
Bright nature to a poet’s heart; 

Till breath and warmth and vital motion 
Seemed through the statue form to dart. 

And then, in all my ardor sharing, 
The silent form expression found; 

Returned my kiss of youthful daring, 
And understood my heart’s quick sound. 

Then lived for me the bright creation, 
The silver rill with song was rife; 

The trees, the roses shared sensation, 
An echo of my boundless life. 

S.G.B. 

DRYOPE 

Dryope and Iole were sisters. The former was 
the wife of Andraemon, beloved by her husband, 
and happy in the birth of her first child. One 
day the sisters strolled to the bank of a stream 
that sloped gradually down to the water’s edge, 
while the upland was overgrown with myrtles. 
They were intending to gather flowers for form¬ 
ing garlands for the altars of the nymphs, and 
Dryope carried her child at her bosom, a precious 

Opposite: Pygmalion and Galatea. /. L. F. La- 
grenee. (Detroit Institute of Arts.) 





burden, and nursed him as she walked. Near the 
water grew a lotus plant, full of purple flowers. 
Dryope gathered some and offered them to the 
baby, and lole was about to do the same, when 
she perceived blood dropping from the places 
where her sister had broken them off the stem. 
The plant was no other than the Nymph Lotis, 
who, running from a base pursuer, had been 
changed into this form. This they learned from 
the country people when it was too late. 

Dryope, horror-struck when she perceived 
what she had done, would gladly have hastened 
from the spot, but found her feet rooted to the 
ground. She tried to pull them away, but moved 
nothing but her upper limbs. The woodiness 
crept upward, and by degrees invested her body. 
In anguish she attempted to tear her hair, but 
found her hands filled with leaves. The infant 
felt his mother’s bosom begin to harden and the 
milk cease to flow. Iole looked on at the sad fate 
of her sister and could render no assistance. She 
embraced the growing trunk, as if she would 
hold back the advancing wood, and would gladly 
have been enveloped in the same bark. At this 
moment, Andraemon, the husband of Dryope, 
with her father, approached; and when they 
asked for Dryope, Iole pointed them to the new- 
formed lotus. They embraced the trunk of the 
yet warm tree and showered their kisses on its 
leaves. 

Now there was nothing left of Dryope but 
her face. Her tears still flowed and fell on her 
leaves, and while she could she spoke. “I am not 
guilty. I deserve not this fate. I have injured no 
one. If I speak falsely, may my foliage perish 
with drought and my trunk be cut down and 
burned. Take this infant and give it to a nurse. 
Let it often be brought and nursed under my 
branches, and play in my shade; and when he is 
old enough to talk, let him be taught to call me 
mother, and to say with sadness. ‘My mother lies 
hid under this bark.’ But bid him be careful of 
riverbanks, and beware how he plucks flowers, 
remembering that every bush he sees may be a 
goddess in disguise. Farewell, dear husband, and 
sister, and father. If you retain any love for me, 
let not the axe wound me, nor the flocks bite and 
tear my branches. Since I cannot stoop to you, 
climb up hither and kiss me, and while my lips 
continue to feel, lift up my child that I may kiss 
him. I can speak no more, for already the bark 
advances up my neck, and will soon shoot over 
me. You need not close my eyes, the bark will 
close them without your aid.” Then the lips 
ceased to move, and life was extinct; but the 

branches retained for some time longer the vital 

heat. 
Keats, in Endymion, alludes to Dryope, thus: 

She took a lute from which there pulsing came 
A lively prelude, fashioning the way 
In which her voice should wander. ’Twas a lay 
More subtle-cadenced, more forest-wild 
Then Dryope’s lone lulling of her child; 

&c. 

VENUS AND ADONIS 

Venus, playing one day with her boy Cupid, 
wounded her bosom with one of his arrows. She 
pushed him away, but the wound was deeper 
than she thought. Before it healed she beheld 
Adonis, and was captivated with him. She no 
longer took any interest in her favorite resorts— 
Paphos, and Cnidos, and Amathos, rich in metals. 
She absented herself even from heaven, for 
Adonis was dearer to her than heaven. Him she 
followed and bore him company. She who used 
to love to recline in the shade, with no care but 
to cultivate her charms, now rambles through the 
woods and over the hills, dressed like the huntress 
Diana; and calls her dogs, and chases hares and 
stags, or other game that it is safe to hunt, but 
keeps clear of the wolves and bears, reeking with 
the slaughter of the herd. She charged Adonis, 
too, to beware of such dangerous animals. “Be 
brave towards the timid,” said she; “courage 
against the courageous is not safe. Beware how 
you expose yourself to danger and put my hap¬ 
piness to risk. Attack not the beasts that Nature 
has armed with weapons. I do not value your 
glory so high as to consent to purchase it by such 
exposure. Your youth, and the beauty that charms 
Venus, will not touch the hearts of lions and 
bristly boars. Think of their terrible claws and 
prodigious strength! I hate the whole race of 
them. Do you ask me why?” Then she told him 
the story of Atalanta and Hippomenes, who were 
changed into lions for their ingratitude to her. 

Having given him this warning, she mounted 
her chariot drawn by swans and drove away 
through the air. But Adonis was too noble to 
heed such counsels. The dogs had roused a wild 
boar from his lair, and the youth threw his spear 
and wounded the animal with a sidelong stroke. 
The beast drew out the weapon with his jaws 
and rushed after Adonis, who turned and ran; 
but the boar overtook him, and buried his tusks 
in his side, and stretched him dying upon the 
plain. 
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Venus and Adonis. Peter Paul Rubens. 
(.Metropolitan Museum of Art, New York.) 

Venus, in her swan-drawn chariot, had not yet 
reached Cyprus, when she heard coming up 
through mid air the groans of her beloved, and 
turned her white-winged coursers back to earth. 
As she drew near and saw from on high his life¬ 
less body bathed in blood, she alighted, and 
bending over it beat her breast and tore her hair. 
Reproaching the Fates, she said, “Yet theirs shall 
be but a partial triumph; memorials of my grief 
shall endure, and the spectacle of your death, my 
Adonis, and of my lamentation shall be annually 
renewed. Your blood shall be changed into a 
flower; that consolation none can envy me.” Thus 
speaking, she sprinkled nectar on the blood; and 
as they mingled, bubbles rose as in a pool, on 
which raindrops fall, and in an hour’s time there 
sprang up a flower of bloody hue like that of the 

pomegranate. But it is short-lived. It is said the 
wind blows the blossoms open, and afterwards 
blows the petals away; so it is called Anemone, or 
Wind Flower, from the cause which assists 
equally in its production and its decay. 

Milton alludes to the story of Venus and 
Adonis in his Comus: 

Beds of hyacinth and roses 
Where young Adonis oft reposes, 
Waxing well of his deep wound 
In slumber soft, and on the ground 
Sadly sits th’ Assyrian queen; 

&c. 

Overleaf: Venus and Adonis (detail). Titian. 
(National Gallery, London.) 







APOLLO AND HYACINTHUS 

Apollo was passionately fond of a youth jramecj 
Hyacmthus^ He accompanleTTnm in his sports, 
carried the nets when he went fishing, led the 
dogs when he went to hunt, followed him in his 
excursions in the mountains, and neglected for 
him his lyre and his arrows. One day they played 
a game of quoits together, and Apollo, heaving 
aloft the discus, with strength mingled with skill, 
sent it high and far. Hyacinthus watched it as it 
flew, and excited with the sport ran forward to 
seize it, eager to make his throw, when the quoit 
bounded from the earth and struck him in the 
forehead. He fainted and fell. The god, as pale as 
himself, raised him and tried all his art to stanch 
the wound and retain the flitting life, but all in 
vain; the hurt was past the power of medicine. 
As when one has broken the stem of a lily in the 
garden it hangs its head and turns its flowers to 
the earth, so the head of the dying boy, as if too 
heavy for his neck, fell over on his shoulder. 
“Thou diest, Hyacinth,” so spoke Phoebus, 
“robbed of thy youth by me. Thine is the suffer¬ 
ing, mine the crime. Would that I could die for 
thee! But since that may not be, thou shalt live 
with me in memory and in song. My lyre shall 
celebrate thee, my song shall tell thy fate, and 
thou shalt become a flower inscribed with my 
regrets.” Wfiile Apollo spoke, behold the blood 
which had flowed on the ground and stained the 
herbage ceased to be blood; but a flower of hue 
more beautiful than the Tyrian sprang up, re¬ 

sembling the lily, if it were not that this is purple 
and that silvery white.* And this was not enough 
for Phoebus; but to confer still greater honor, he 
marked the petals with his sorrow and inscribed 
“Ah! ah!” upon them, as we see to this day. The 
flower bears the name of Hyacinthus, and with 
every returning spring revives the memory of his 

fate. 
It was said that Zephyrus (the West-wind), 

who was also fond of Hyacinthus and jealous of 
his preference of Apollo, blew the quoit out of 
its course to make it strike Hyacinthus. Keats al¬ 
ludes to this in his Endymion, where he describes 
the lookers-on at the game of quoits: 

Or they might watch the quoit-pitchers, intent 
On either side, pitying the sad death 
Of Hyacinthus, when the cruel breath 

Of Zephyr slew him; Zephyr penitent, 
Who now ere Phoebus mounts the firmament, 
Fondles the flower amid the sobbing rain. 

An allusion to Hyacinthus will also be recog¬ 

nized in Milton’s “Lycidas”: 

Like to that sanguine flower inscribed with woe. 

* It is evidently not our modern hyacinth that is 
here described. It is perhaps some species of iris, or 
perhaps of larkspur, or of pansy. 
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CHAPTER IX 

CEYX AND HALCYONE: OR, THE HALCYON BIRDS 

Ceyx was king of Thessaly, where he reigned in 
peace, without violence or wrong. He was son of 
Hesperus, the Day-star, and the glow of his 
beauty reminded one of his father. Halcyone the 
daughter of Aeolus was his wife, and devotedly 
attached to him. Now Ceyx was in deep afflic¬ 
tion for the loss of his brother, and direful prodi¬ 
gies following his brother’s death made him feel 
as if the gods were hostile to him. He thought 
best, therefore, to make a voyage to Claros in 
Ionia, to consult the oracle of Apollo. But as 
soon as he disclosed his intention to his wife 
Halcyone, a shudder ran through her frame, and 
her face grew deadly pale. “What fault of mine, 
dearest husband, has turned your affection from 
me? Where is that love of me that used to be 
uppermost in your thoughts? Have you learned 
to feel easy in the absence of Halcyone? Would 
you rather have me away?” She also endeavored 
to discourage him, by describing the violence of 
the winds, which she had known familiarly when 
she lived at home in her father’s house, Aeolus 
being the god of the winds, and having as much 
as he could do to restrain them. “They rush to¬ 
gether,” said she, “with such fury that fire flashes 
from the conflict. But if you must go,” she added, 
“dear husband, let nie go with you, otherwise I 
shall suffer, not only the real evils which you 
must encounter, but those also which my fears 
suggest.” 

These words weighed heavily on the mind of 
King Ceyx, and it was no less his own wish than 
hers to take her with him, but he could not bear 
to expose her to the dangers of the sea. He an¬ 
swered, therefore, consoling her as well as he 
could, and finished with these words: “I promise, 
by the rays of my father the Day-star, that if 
fate permits I will return before the moon shall 
have twice rounded her orb.” When he had thus 
spoken, he ordered the vessel to be drawn out of 
the shiphouse and the oars and sails to be put 
aboard. When Halcyone saw these preparations, 
she shuddered, as if with a presentiment of evil. 
With tears and sobs she said farewell, and then 
fell senseless to the ground. 

Opposite: Apollo Belvedere. Roman copy. (Vat¬ 
ican Museum, Rome.) 

Ceyx would still have lingered, but now the 
young men grasped their oars and pulled vigor¬ 
ously through the waves, with long and measured 
strokes. Halcyone raised her streaming eyes and 
saw her husband standing on the deck, waving 
his hand to her. She answered his signal till the 
vessel had receded so far that she could no longer 
distinguish his form from the rest. When the 
vessel itself could no more be seen, she strained 
her eyes to catch the last glimmer of the sail, 
till that too disappeared. Then, retiring to her 
chamber, she threw herself on her solitary couch. 

Meanwhile they glide out of the harbor, and 
the breeze plays among the ropes. The seamen 
draw in their oars and hoist their sails. When half 
or less of their course was passed, as night drew 
on, the sea began to whiten with swelling waves, 
and the east wind to blow a gale. The master gave 
the word to take in sail, but the storm forbade 
obedience, for such is the roar of the winds and 
waves his orders are unheard. The men, of their 
own accord, busy themselves to secure the oars, 
to strengthen the ship, to reef the sail. While they 
thus do what to each one seems best, the storm 
increases. The shouting of the men, the rattling 
of the shrouds, and the dashing of the waves 
mingle with the roar of the thunder. The swell¬ 
ing sea seems lifted up to the heavens, to scatter 
its foam among the clouds; then sinking away to 
the bottom assumes the color of the shoal—a 
Stygian blackness. 

The vessel shares all these changes. It seems 
like a wild beast that rushes on the spears of the 
hunters. Rain falls in torrents, as if the skies were 
coming down to unite with the sea. When the 
lightning ceases for a moment, the night seems 
to add its own darkness to that of the storm; then 
comes the flash, rending the darkness asunder and 
lighting up all with a glare. Skill fails, courage 
sinks, and death seems to come on every wave. 
The men are stupefied with terror. The thought 
of parents, and kindred, and pledges left at home, 
comes over their minds. Ceyx thinks of Halcyone. 
No name but hers is on his lips, and while he 
yearns for her, he yet rejoices in her absence. 
Presently the mast is shattered by a stroke of 
lightning, the rudder broken, and the trium¬ 
phant surge curling over looks down upon the 
wreck, then falls, and crushes it to fragments. 
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Some of the seamen, stunned by the stroke, sink, 
and rise no more; others cling to fragments of 
the wreck. Ceyx, with the hand that used to 
grasp the sceptre, holds fast to a plank, calling 
for help—alas, in vain—upon his father and his 
father-in-law. But oftenest on his lips was the 
name of Halcyone. To her his thoughts cling. He 
prays that the waves may bear his body to her 
sight and that it may receive burial at her hands. 
At length the waters overwhelm him, and he 
sinks. The Day-star looked dim that night. Since 
it could not leave the heavens, it shrouded its 
face with clouds. 

In the meanwhile Halcyone, ignorant of all 
these horrors, counted the days till her husband s 
promised return. Now she gets ready the gar¬ 
ments which he shall put on, and now what she 
shall wear when he arrives. To all the gods she 
offers frequent incense, but more than all to 
Juno. For her husband, who was no more, she 
prayed incessantly; that he might be safe; that he 
might come home; that he might not, in his ab¬ 
sence, see any one that he would love better than 

her. But of all these prayers, the last was the only 
one destined to be granted. The goddess, at 
length, could not bear any longer to be pleaded 
with for one already dead, and to have hands 
raised to her altars that ought rather to be offer¬ 
ing funeral rites. So, calling Iris, she said, Iris, 
my faithful messenger, go to the drowsy dwelling 
of Somnus and tell him to send a vision to Hal¬ 
cyone, in the form of Ceyx, to make known to 

her the event.” 
Iris puts on her robe of many colors, and ting 

ing the sky with her bow, seeks the palace of the 
King of Sleep. Near the Cimmerian country, a 
mountain cave is the abode of the dull god, Som¬ 
nus. Here Phoebus dares not come, either rising, 
at midday, or setting. Clouds and shadows are 
exhaled from the ground, and the light glimmers 
faintly. The bird of dawning, with crested head, 
never there calls aloud to Aurora, nor watchful 
dog, nor more sagacious goose disturbs the si¬ 
lence. No wild beast, nor cattle, nor branch 
moved with the wind, nor sound of human con¬ 
versation, breaks the stillness. Silence reigns there, 

Hypnos (Sleep). Roman copy. (British Museum, London.) 

Opposite: Iris and Morpheus. Pierre-Narcisse 
Guerin. (State Hermitage Museum, Leningrad.) 
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but from the bottom of the rock the River Lethe 
flows, and by its murmur invites to sleep. Poppies 
grow abundantly before the door of the cave, 
and other herbs, from whose juices Night collects 
slumbers, which she scatters over the darkened 
earth. There is no gate to the mansion, to creak 
on its hinges, nor any watchman; but in the 
midst, a couch of black ebony, adorned with 
black plumes and black curtains. There the god 
reclines, his limbs relaxed with sleep. Around 
him lie dreams, resembling all various forms, as 
many as the harvest bears stalks, or the forest 
leaves, or the seashore sand grains. 

As soon as the goddess entered and brushed 
away the dreams that hovered around her, her 
brightness lit up all the cave. The god, scarce 
opening his eyes and ever and anon dropping his 
beard upon his breast, at last shook himself free 
from himself, and leaning on his arm, enquired 
her errand—for he knew who she was. She an¬ 
swered, “Somnus, gentlest of the gods, tran¬ 
quillizer of minds and soother of care-worn 
hearts, Juno sends you her commands that you 
despatch a dream to Halcyone, in the city of 
Trachine, representing her lost husband and all 
the events of the wreck.” 

Having delivered her message, Iris hasted away, 
for she could not longer endure the stagnant air, 
and as she felt drowsiness creeping over her, she 
made her escape and returned by her bow the 
way she came. Then Somnus called one of his 
numerous sons—Morpheus—the most expert in 
counterfeiting forms and in imitating the walk, 
the countenance, and mode of speaking, even the 
clothes and attitudes most characteristic of each. 
But he only imitates men, leaving it to another 
to personate birds, beasts, and serpents. Him they 
call Icelos; and Phantasos is a third, who turns 
himself into rocks, waters, woods, and other 
things without life. These wait upon kings and 
great personages in their sleeping hours, while 
others move among the common people. Somnus 
chose, from all the brothers, Morpheus, to per¬ 
form the command of Iris; then laid his head on 
his pillow and yielded himself to grateful repose. 

Morpheus flew, making no noise with his 
wings, and soon came to the Haemonian city, 
where, laying aside his wings, he assumed the 
form of Ceyx. Under that form, but pale like 
a dead man, naked, he stood before the couch of 
the wretched wife. His beard seemed soaked 
with water, and water trickled from his drowned 
locks. Leaning over the bed, tears streaming from 
his eyes, he said, “Do you recognize your Ceyx, 
unhappy wife, or has death too much changed 

my visage? Behold me, know me, your husband’s 
shade, instead of himself. Your prayers, Hal¬ 
cyone, availed me nothing. I am dead. No more 
deceive yourself with vain hopes of my return. 
The stormy winds sunk my ship in the Aegean 
Sea, waves filled my mouth while it called aloud 
on you. No uncertain messenger tells you this, 
no vague rumor brings it to your ears. I come in 
person, a shipwrecked man, to tell you my fate. 
Arise! Give me tears, give me lamentations, let 
me not go down to Tartarus unwept.” To these 
words Morpheus added the voice which seemed 
to be that of her husband; he seemed to pour 
forth genuine tears; his hands had the gestures of 
Ceyx. 

Halcyone, weeping, groaned and stretched out 
her arms in her sleep, striving to embrace his 
body, but grasping only the air. “Stay!” she 
cried; “whither do you fly? Let us go together.” 
Her own voice awakened her. Starting up, she 
gazed eagerly around, to see if he was still pres¬ 
ent, for the servants, alarmed by her cries, had 
brought a light. When she found him not, she 
smote her breast and rent her garments. She cares 
not to unbind her hair, but tears it wildly. Her 
nurse asks what is the cause of her grief. “Hal¬ 
cyone is no more,” she answers, “she perished 
with her Ceyx. Utter not words of comfort, he is 
shipwrecked and dead. I have seen him, I have 
recognized him. I stretched out my hands to seize 
him and detain him. His shade vanished, but it 
was the true shade of my husband. Not with the 
accustomed features, not with the beauty that 
was his, but pale, naked, and with his hair wet 
with sea-water, he appeared to wretched me. 
Here, in this very spot, the sad vision stood”— 
and she looked to find the mark of his footsteps. 
“This it was, this that my presaging mind fore¬ 
boded, when I implored him not to leave me, to 
trust himself to the waves. Oh, how I wish, since 
thou wouldst go, thou hadst taken me with thee! 
It would have been far better. Then I should 
have had no remnant of life to spend without 
thee, nor a separate death to die. If I could bear 
to live and struggle to endure, I should be more 
cruel to myself than the sea has been to me. But 
I will not struggle, I will not be separated from 
thee, unhappy husband. This time, at least, I will 
keep thee company. In death, if one tomb may 
not include us, one epitaph shall; if I may not lay 
my ashes with thine, my name, at least, shall not 
be separated.0’ Her grief forbade more words, 
and these were broken with tears and sobs. 

It was now morning. She went to the seashore 
and sought the spot where she last saw him, on 
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his departure. “While he lingered here, and cast 
off his tacklings, he gave me his last kiss.” While 

ishe reviews every object and strives to recall 
every incident, looking out over the sea, she 
descries an indistinct object floating in the 
water. At first she was in doubt what it was, but 
by degrees the waves bore it nearer, and it was 

i plainly the body of a man. Though unknowing 
of whom, yet as it was of some shipwrecked one, 

: she was deeply moved, and gave it her tears, say¬ 
ing, “Alas! Unhappy one, and unhappy, if such 
there be, thy wife!” Borne by the waves, it came 
nearer. As she more and more nearly views it, 
she trembles more and more. Now, now it ap¬ 
proaches the shore. Now marks that she recog¬ 
nizes appear. It is her husband! Stretching out her 

: trembling hands towards it, she exclaims, “O, 
dearest husband, is it thus you return to me?” 

There was built out from the shore a mole, 
constructed to break the assaults of the sea and 

j stem its violent ingress. She leaped upon this 
barrier and (it was wonderful she could do so) 

i she flew, and striking the air with wings pro¬ 
duced on the instant, skimmed along the surface 
of the water, an unhappy bird. As she flew, her 
throat poured forth sounds full of grief, and like 

! the voice of one lamenting. When she touched 
(the mute and bloodless body, she enfolded its be- 
! loved limbs with her new-formed wings and tried 
to give kisses with her horny beak. Whether 

: Ceyx felt it, or whether it was only the action of 
the waves, those who looked on doubted, but the 
(body seemed to raise its head. But indeed he did 
| feel it, and by the pitying gods both of them were 
i changed into birds. They mate and have their 

young ones. For seven placid days, in winter¬ 
time, Halcyone broods over her nest, which 
floats upon the sea. Then the way is safe to sea¬ 
men. Aeolus guards the winds and keeps them 
from disturbing the deep. The sea is given up, for 
the time, to his grandchildren. 

The following lines from Byron’s “The Bride 
of Abydos” might seem borrowed from the con¬ 
cluding part of this description, if it were not 
stated that the author derived the suggestion 
from observing the motion of a floating corpse. 

As shaken on his restless pillow, 
His head heaves with the heaving billow; 
That hand, whose motion is nor life. 
Yet feebly seems to menace strife, 
Flung by the tossing tide on high, 
Then levelled with the wave . . . 

Milton in his “Hymn to the Nativity” thus al¬ 
ludes to the fable of the Halcyon: 

But peaceful was the night 
Wherein the Prince of light 

His reign of peace upon the earth began; 
The winds with wonder whist 
Smoothly the waters kist 

Whispering new joys to the mild ocean, 
Who now hath quite forgot to rave 
While birds of calm sit brooding on the charmed 

wave. 

Keats also in Endymion says— 

O magic sleep! O comfortable bird 
That broodest o’er the troubled sea of the mind 
Till it is hushed and smooth. 

Sleeping Nymph. Roman copy. (Museo Nationale delle Terme, Rome.) 
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CHAPTER X 

VERTUMNUS AND POMONA 

The Hamadryads were wood-nymphs. Pomona 
was of this class, and no one excelled her in love 
of the garden and the culture of fruit. She cared 
not for the forests and rivers, but loved the cul¬ 
tivated country and trees that bear delicious 
apples. Her right hand bore for its weapon not a 
javelin, but a pruning knife. Armed with this, she 
busied herself at one time to repress the too 
luxuriant growths, and curtail the branches that 
straggled out of place; at another, to split the 
twig and insert therein a graft, making the 
branch adopt a nursling not its own. She took 

possessed to win her, and so would old Sylvanus, 
who looks young for his years, and Pan, who 
wears a garland of pine leaves around his head. 
But Vertumnus loved her best of all; yet he sped 
no better than the rest. Oh, how often, in the 
disguise of a reaper, did he bring her corn in a 
basket, and looked the very image of a reaper! 
With a hay band tied round him, one would 
think he had just come from turning over the 
grass. Sometimes he would have an ox-goad in his 
hand, and you would have said he had just un¬ 
yoked his weary oxen. Now he bore a pruning 

Satyr Swinging a Nymph. The Penelope Painter. (National Museum, Berlin.) 

care, too, that her favorites should not suffer 
from drought, and led streams of water by them 
that the thirsty roots might drink. This occupa¬ 
tion was her pursuit, her passion; and she was 
free from that which Venus inspires. She was not 
without fear of the country people, and kept her 
orchard locked, and allowed not men to enter. 
The Fauns and Satyrs would have given all they 

hook and personated a vine-dresser; and again, 
with a ladder on his shoulder, he seemed as if he 
was going to gather apples. Sometimes he 
trudged along as a discharged soldier, and again 
he bore a fishing rod as if going to fish. In this 
way, he gained admission to her, again and again, 
and fed his passion with the sight of her. 

One day he came in the guise of an old 

Opposite: The Barberini Faun. (Glyptothek, Munich.) 
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woman, her gray hair surmounted with a cap and 
a staff in her hand. She entered the garden and 
admired the fruit. “It does you credit, my dear,” 
she said and kissed her, not exactly with an old 
woman’s kiss. She sat down on a bank and looked 
up at the branches laden with fruit which hung 
over her. Opposite was an elm entwined with a 
vine loaded with swelling grapes. She praised the 
tree and its associated vine equally. “But,” said she, 
“if the tree stood alone, and had no vine clinging 
to it, it would have nothing to attract or offer us 
but its useless leaves. And equally the vine, if it 
were not twined round the elm, would lie pros¬ 
trate on the ground. Why will you not take a les¬ 
son from the tree and the vine and consent to 
unite yourself with some one? I wish you would. 
Helen herself had not more numerous suitors, nor 
Penelope, the wife of shrewd Ulysses. Even 

while you spurn them, they court you—rural 
deities and others of every kind that frequent 
these mountains. But if you are prudent and 
want to make a good alliance, and will let an old 
woman advise you—who loves you better than 
you have any idea of—dismiss all the rest and ac¬ 
cept Vertumnus, on my recommendation. I 

know him as well as he knows himself. He is not 
a wandering deity, but belongs to these moun¬ 
tains. Nor is he like too many of the lovers now¬ 
adays, who love any one they happen to see; he 
loves you and you only. Add to this, he is young 
and handsome, and has the art of assuming any 
shape he pleases, and can make himself just what 
you command him. Moreover, he loves the same 
things that you do, delights in gardening, and 
handles your apples with admiration. But now 
he cares nothing for fruits, nor flowers, nor any 

Sleeping Nymph Surprised by 
Satyrs. After Nicolas Poussin. 
(National Gallery, London.) 



thing else, but only yourself. Take pity on him 
and fancy him speaking now with my mouth. 
Remember that the gods punish cruelty, and that 
Venus hates a hard heart, and will visit such of¬ 
fences sooner or later. To prove this, let me tell 
you a story, which is well known in Cyprus to be 
a fact; and I hope it will have the effect to make 
you more merciful. 

‘Tphis was a young man of humble parentage, 
who saw and loved Anaxarete, a noble lady of 
the ancient family of Teucer. He struggled long 
with his passion, but when he found he could not 
subdue it, he came a suppliant to her mansion. 
First he told his passion to her nurse and begged 
her as she loved her foster-child to favor his suit. 
And then he tried to win her domestics to his 
side. Sometimes he committed his vows to writ¬ 
ten tablets, and often hung at her door garlands 
which he had moistened with his tears. He 
stretched himself on her threshold and uttered 
his complaints to the cruel bolts and bars. She 
was deafer than the surges which rise in the No¬ 
vember gale; harder than steel from the German 
forges, or a rock that still clings to its native 
cliff. She mocked and laughed at him, adding 
cruel words to her ungentle treatment, and gave 
not the slightest gleam of hope. 

“Iphis could not any longer endure the tor¬ 
ments of hopeless love, and, standing before her 
doors, he spake these last words: ‘Anaxarete, you 
have conquered, and shall no longer have to bear 
my importunities. Enjoy your triumph! Sing 
songs of joy, and bind your forehead with laurel 
—you have conquered! I die; stony heart, rejoice! 
This at least I can do to gratify you, and force 
you to praise me; and thus shall I prove that the 
love of you left me but with life. Nor will I leave 
it to rumor to tell you of my death. I will come 
myself, and you shall see me die, and feast your 
eyes on the spectacle. Yet, O ye gods, who look 
down on mortal woes, observe my fate! I ask 
but this: let me be remembered in coming ages, 
and add those years to my fame which you have 
reft from my life.’ Thus he said, and, turning his 
pale face and weeping eyes towards her mansion, 
he fastened a rope to the gatepost, on which he 
had often hung garlands, and putting his head 
into the noose, he murmured, ‘This garland at 
least will please you, cruel girl!’ and falling, hung 
suspended with his neck broken. As he fell he 
struck against the gate, and the sound was as the 
sound of a groan. The servants opened the door 
and found him dead, and with exclamations of 
pity raised him and carried him home to his 
mother, for his father was not living. She re- 
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ceived the dead body of her son and folded the 
cold form to her bosom; while she poured forth 
the sad words which bereaved mothers utter. 
The mournful funeral passed through the town, 
and the pale corpse was borne on a bier to the 
place of the funeral pile. By chance the home of 
Anaxarete was on the street where the procession 
passed, and the lamentations of the mourners met 
the ears of her whom the avenging deity had al¬ 
ready marked for punishment. 

“ ‘Let us see this sad procession,’ said she, and 
mounted to a turret, whence through an open 
window she looked upon the funeral. Scarce 
had her eyes rested upon the form of Iphis 
stretched on the bier, when they began to stiffen, 
and the warm blood in her body to become cold. 
Endeavoring to step back, she found she could 
not move her feet; trying to turn away her face, 
she tried in vain; and by degrees all her limbs be¬ 
came stony like her heart. That you may not 
doubt the fact, the statue still remains, and stands 
in the temple of Venus at Salamis, in the exact 
form of the lady. Now think of these things, my 
dear, and lay aside your scorn and your delays, 
and accept a lover. So may neither the vernal 
frosts blight your young fruits, nor furious winds 
scatter your blossoms!” 

When Vertumnus had spoken thus, he dropped 
the disguise of an old woman, and stood before 
her in his proper person, as a comely youth. It 
appeared to her like the sun bursting through a 
cloud. He would have renewed his entreaties, but 
there was no need; his arguments and the sight 
of his true form prevailed, and the Nymph no 
longer resisted, but owned a mutual flame. 

Pomona was the especial patroness of the 
apple-orchard, and as such she was invoked by 
Phillips, the author of a poem on Cider, in blank 
verse. Thomson in The Seasons alludes to him: 

Phillips, Pomona’s bard, the second thou 
Who nobly durst, in rhyme-unfettered verse, 
With British freedom, sing the British song. 

But Pomona was also regarded as presiding 
over other fruits, and as such is invoked by 
Thomson: 

Bear me, Pomona, to thy citron groves, 
To where the lemon and the piercing lime, 
With the deep orange, glowing through the green, 
Their lighter glories blend. Lay me reclined 
Beneath the spreading tamarind, that shakes, 
Fanned by the breeze, its fever-cooling fruit. 



CHAPTER XI 

CUPID AND PSYCHE 

A certain king and queen had three daughters. 
The charms of the two elder were more than 
common, but the beauty of the youngest was so 
wonderful that the poverty of language is un¬ 
able to express its due praise. The fame of her 
beauty was so great that strangers from neigh¬ 
boring countries came in crowds to enjoy the 
sight, and looked on her with amazement, paying 
her that homage which is due only to Venus her¬ 
self. In fact Venus found her altars deserted, 
while men turned their devotion to this young 
virgin. As she passed along, the people sang her 
praises and strewed her way with chaplets and 
flowers. 

This perversion of homage due only to the im¬ 
mortal powers to the exaltation of a mortal gave 
great offence to the real Venus. Shaking her 
ambrosial locks with indignation, she exclaimed, 
“Am I then to be eclipsed in my honors by a 
mortal girl? In vain then did that royal shepherd, 
whose judgment was approved by Jove himself, 
give me the palm of beauty over my illustrious 
rivals, Pallas and Juno. But she shall not so quietly 
usurp my honors. I will give her cause to repent 
of so unlawful a beauty.” 

Thereupon she calls her winged son Cupid, 
mischievous enough in his own nature, and 
rouses and provokes him yet more by her com¬ 
plaints. She points out Psyche to him and says, 
“My dear son, punish that contumacious beauty; 
give thy mother a revenge as sweet as her in¬ 
juries are great; infuse into the bosom of that 
haughty girl a passion for some low, mean, un¬ 
worthy being, so that she may reap a mortifica¬ 
tion as great as her present exultation and 
triumph.” 

Cupid prepared to obey the commands of his 
mother. There are two fountains in Venus’s gar¬ 
den, one of sweet waters, the other of bitter. 
Cupid filled two amber vases, one from each 
fountain, and suspending them from the top of 
his quiver, hastened to the chamber of Psyche, 
whom he found asleep. He shed a few drops 
from the bitter fountain over her lips, though the 
sight of her almost moved him to pity; then 
touched her side with the point of his arrow. At 
the touch she awoke, and opened eyes upon 
Cupid (himself invisible), which so startled him 
that in his confusion he wounded himself with 

his own arrow. Heedless of his wound his whole 
thought was to repair the mischief he had done, 
and he poured the balmy drops of joy over all 
her silken ringlets. 

Psyche, henceforth frowned upon by Venus, 
derived no benefit from all her charms. True, all 
eyes were cast eagerly upon her, and every 
mouth spoke her praises; but neither king, royal 
youth, nor plebeian presented himself to demand 
her in marriage. Her two elder sisters of moder¬ 
ate charms had now long been married to two 
royal princes; but Psyche, in her lonely apart¬ 
ment, deplored her solitude, sick of that beauty 
which, while it procured abundance of flattery, 
had failed to awaken love. 

Her parents, afraid that they had unwittingly 
incurred the anger of the gods, consulted the 
oracle of Apollo and received this answer: “The 
virgin is destined for the bride of no mortal lover. 

Venus Ordering Cupid to Shoot at Psyche. 
School of Raphael. (Famesina Palace, Rome.) 



Her future husband awaits her on the top of the 
mountain. He is a monster whom neither gods 
nor men can resist.” 

This dreadful decree of the oracle filled all the 
people with dismay, and her parents abandoned 
themselves to grief. But Psyche said, “Why, my 
dear parents, do you now lament me? You 
should rather have grieved when the people 
showered upon me undeserved honors and with 
one voice called me a YTenus. I now perceive that 
I am a victim to that name. I submit. Lead me to 
that rock to which my unhappy fate has destined 
me.” Accordingly, all things being prepared, the 
royal maid took her place in the procession, 
which more resembled a funeral than a nuptial 
pomp, and with her parents, amid the lamenta¬ 
tions of the people, ascended the mountain, on 
the summit of which they left her alone, and 
with sorrowful hearts returned home. 

While Psyche stood on the ridge of the moun¬ 
tain, panting with fear and with eyes full of tears, 
the gentle Zephyr raised her from the earth and 
bore her with an easy motion into a flowery dale. 
By degrees her mind became composed, and she 
laid herself down on the grassy bank to sleep. 
When she awoke refreshed with sleep, she 
looked round and beheld near by a pleasant grove 
of tall and stately trees. She entered it, and in 
the midst discovered a fountain, sending forth 
clear and crystal waters, and fast by, a magnifi¬ 
cent palace whose august front impressed the 
spectator that it was not the work of mortal 
hands, but the happy retreat of some god. Drawn 
by admiration and wonder, she approached the 
building and ventured to enter. Every object she 
met filled her with pleasure and amazement. 
Golden pillars supported the vaulted roof, and 
the walls were enriched with carvings and paint¬ 
ings representing beasts of the chase and rural 
scenes, adapted to delight the eye of the beholder. 
Proceeding onward, she perceived that besides 
the apartments of state there were others filled 
with all manner of treasures, and beautiful and 
precious productions of nature and art. 

While her eyes were thus occupied, a voice ad¬ 
dressed her, though she saw no one, uttering 
these words: “Sovereign lady, all that you see is 
yours. We whose voices you hear are your ser¬ 
vants and shall obey all your commands with our 
utmost care and diligence. Retire therefore to 
your chamber and repose on your bed of down, 
and when you see fit, repair to the bath. Supper 
awaits you in the adjoining alcove when it pleases 
you to take your seat there.” 

Psyche gave ear to the admonitions of her 
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vocal attendants, and after repose and the re¬ 
freshment of the bath, seated herself in the al¬ 
cove, where a table immediately presented itself, 
without any visible aid from waiters or servants, 
and covered with the greatest delicacies of food 
and the most nectareous wines. Her ears too were 
feasted with music from invisible performers; of 
whom one sang, another played on the lute, and 
all closed in the wonderful harmony of a full 
chorus. 

She had not yet seen her destined husband. 
He came only in the hours of darkness and fled 
before the dawn of morning, but his accents 
were full of love and inspired a like passion in 
her. She often begged him to stay and let her 
behold him, but he would not consent. On the 
contrary he charged her to make no attempt to 
see him, for it was his pleasure, for the best of 
reasons, to keep concealed. “Why should you 
wish to behold me?” he said; “have you any 
doubt of my love? Have you any wish ungrati¬ 
fied? If you saw me, perhaps you would fear me, 
perhaps adore me, but all I ask of you is to love 
me. I would rather you would love me as an 
equal than adore me as a god.” 

This reasoning somewhat quieted Psyche for a 
time, and while the novelty lasted she felt quite 
happy. But at length the thought of her parents, 
left in ignorance of her fate, and of her sisters, 
precluded from sharing with her the delights of 
her situation, preyed on her mind and made her 
begin to feel her palace as but a spendid prison. 
When her husband came one night, she told him 
her distress, and at last drew from him an unwill¬ 
ing consent that her sisters should be brought to 
see her. 

So calling Zephyr, she acquainted him with her 
husband’s commands, and he, promptly obedient, 
soon brought them across the mountain down to 
their sister’s valley. They embraced her and she 
returned their caresses. “Come,” said Psyche, “en¬ 
ter with me my house and refresh yourselves 
with whatever your sister has to offer.” Then 
taking their hands she led them into her golden 
palace, and committed them to the care of her 
numerous train of attendant voices, to refresh 
them in her baths and at her table and to show 
them all her treasures. The view of these celes¬ 
tial delights caused envy to enter their bosoms, 
at seeing their young sister possessed of such state 
and splendor, so much exceeding their own. 

They asked her numberless questions, among 
others what sort of person her husband was. 
Psyche replied that he was a beautiful youth, 
who generally spent the daytime in hunting upon 



the mountains. The sisters, not satisfied with this 
reply, soon made her confess that she had never 
seen him. Then they proceeded to fill her bosom 
with dark suspicions. “Call to mind, ’ they said, 
“the Pythian oracles that declared you destined 
to marry a direful and tremendous monster. The 
inhabitants of this valley say that your husband 
is a terrible and monstrous serpent, who nourishes 
you for a while with dainties that he may by and 
by devour you. Take our advice. Provide your¬ 
self with a lamp and a sharp knife; put them in 
concealment that your husband may not discover 
them, and when he is sound asleep, slip out of 
bed, bring forth your lamp and see for yourself 
whether what they say is true or not. If it is, 
hesitate not to cut off the monster’s head and 
thereby recover your liberty.” 

Psyche resisted these persuasions as well as she 
could, but they did not fail to have their effect 
on her mind, and when her sisters were gone, 
their words and her own curiosity were too 
strong for her to resist. So she prepared her lamp 
and a sharp knife and hid them out of sight of her 
husband. When he had fallen into his first sleep, 
she silently rose and uncovering her lamp beheld 
not a hideous monster, but the most beautiful and 
charming of the gods, with his golden ringlets 
wandering over his snowy neck and crimson 
cheek, with two dewy wings on his shoulders, 
whiter than snow, and with shining feathers like 
the tender blossoms of spring. As she leaned the 
lamp over to have a nearer view of his face a 
drop of burning oil fell on the shoulder of the 
god, startled with which he opened his eyes and 
fixed them full upon her; then, without saying 
one word, he spread his white wings and flew 
out of the window. Psyche, in vain endeavoring 
to follow him, fell from the window to the 
ground. Cupid, beholding her as she lay in the 
dust, stopped his flight for an instant and said, 
“O foolish Psyche, is it thus you repay my love? 
After having disobeyed my mother s commands 
and made you my wife, will you think me a 
monster and cut off my head? But go; return to 
your sisters, whose advice you seem to think 
preferable to mine. I inflict no other punishment 
on you than to leave you forever. Love cannot 
dwell with suspicion.” So saying, he fled away, 
leaving poor Psyche prostrate on the ground, 
filling the place with mournful lamentations. 

When she had recovered some degree of com¬ 
posure she looked around her, but the palace and 
gardens had vanished, and she found herself in 
the open field not far from the city where her 
sisters dwelt. She repaired thither and told them 

the whole story of her misfortunes, at which, 
pretending to grieve, those spiteful creatures in¬ 
wardly rejoiced; “For now,” said they, “he will 
perhaps choose one of us. With this idea, with¬ 
out saying a word of her intentions, each of them 
rose early the next morning and ascended the 
mountain, and having reached the top, called 
upon Zephyr to receive her and bear her to his 
lord; then leaping up, and not being sustained 
by Zephyr, fell down the precipice and was 

dashed to pieces. 
Psyche, meanwhile, wandered day and night, 

without food or repose, in search of her husband. 
Casting her eyes on a lofty mountain having on 
its brow a magnificent temple, she sighed and 
said to herself, “Perhaps my love, my lord, in¬ 
habits there,” and directed her steps thither. 

She had no sooner entered than she saw heaps 
of corn, some in loose ears and some in sheaves, 
with mingled ears of barley. Scattered about lay 
sickles and rakes and all the instruments of har¬ 
vest, without order, as if thrown carelessly out 
of the weary reapers’ hands in the sultry hours of 

the day. 
This unseemly confusion the pious Psyche put 

an end to, by separating and sorting every thing 
to its proper place and kind, believing that she 
ought to neglect none of the gods, but endeavor 
by her piety to engage them all in her behalf. 
The holy Ceres, whose temple it was, finding her 
so religiously employed, thus spoke to her: “Oh 
Psyche, truly worthy of our pity, though I can¬ 
not shield you from the frowns of Venus, yet I 
can teach you how best to allay her displeasure. 
Go then and voluntarily surrender yourself to 
your lady and sovereign, and try by modesty and 
submission to win her forgiveness, and perhaps 
her favor will restore you the husband you have 

lost.” 
Psyche obeyed the commands of Ceres and 

took her way to the temple of Venus, endeavor¬ 
ing to fortify her mind and ruminating on what 
she should say and how best propitiate the angry 
goddess, feeling that the issue was doubtful and 

perhaps fatal. 
Venus received her with angry countenance. 

“Most undutiful and faithless of servants,” said 
she, “do you at last remember that you really 
have a mistress? Or have you rather come to see 
your sick husband, yet laid up of the wound 
given him by his loving wife? You are so ill fa¬ 
vored and disagreeable that the only way you 

Opposite: The Marriage of Cupid and Psyche. 
Edmund Dulac. (Courtesy Heritage Press.) 
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can merit your lover must be by dint of industry 
and diligence. I will make trial of your house- 
wifery.,, Then she ordered Psyche to be led to 
the storehouse of her temple, where was laid up 
a great quantity of wheat, barley, millet, vetches, 
beans, and lentils prepared for food for her 
pigeons, and said, “Take and separate all these 
grains, putting all of the same kind in a parcel by 
themselves, and see that you get it done before 
evening.” Then Venus departed and left her to 
her task. 

But Psyche, in a perfect consternation at the 
enormous work, sat stupid and silent, without 
moving a finger to the inextricable heap. 

While she sat despairing Cupid stirred up the 
little ant, a native of the fields, to take compas¬ 
sion on her. The leader of the ant hill, followed 
by whole hosts of his six-legged subjects, ap¬ 
proached the heap, and with the utmost diligence 
taking grain by grain, they separated the pile, 
sorting each kind to its parcel; and when it was 
all done, they vanished out of sight in a moment. 

Venus at the approach of twilight returned 
from the banquet of the gods, breathing odors 
and crowned with roses. Seeing the task done, 
she exclaimed, “This is no work of yours, wicked 
one, but his, whom to your own and his misfor¬ 
tune you have enticed.” So saying, she threw her 
a piece of black bread for her supper and went 
away. 

Next morning Venus ordered Psyche to be 
called and said to her, “Behold yonder grove 
which stretches along the margin of the water. 
There you will find sheep feeding without a 
shepherd, with golden-shining fleeces on their 
backs. Go, fetch me a sample of that precious 
wool gathered from every one of their fleeces.” 

Psyche obediently went to the riverside, pre¬ 
pared to do her best to execute the command. 
But the river god inspired the reeds with har¬ 
monious murmurs, which seemed to say, “Oh, 
maiden, severely tried, tempt not the dangerous 
flood, nor venture among the formidable rams 
on the other side, for as long as they are under 
the influence of the rising sun, they burn with a 
cruel rage to destroy mortals with their sharp 
horns or rude teeth. But when the noontide sun 
has driven the cattle to the shade, and the serene 
spirit of the flood has lulled them to rest, you 
may then cross in safety, and you will find the 
woolly gold sticking to the bushes and the trunks 
of the trees.” 

Cupid and Psyche. Anthony Van Dyck. (Buck¬ 
ingham Palace, London.) 



Thus the compassionate river god gave Psyche 
instructions how to accomplish her task, and by 
observing his directions she soon returned to 
Venus with her arms full of the golden fleece, 
but she received not the approbation of her im¬ 
placable mistress, who said, “I know very well 
it is by none of your own doings that you have 
succeeded in this task, and I am not satisfied yet 
that you have any capacity to make yourself use¬ 
ful. But I have another task for you. Here, take 
this box, and go your way to the infernal shades, 
and give this box to Proserpine and say, ‘My mis¬ 
tress Venus desires you to send her a little of 
your beauty, for in tending her sick son she has 
lost some of her own.’ Be not too long on your 
errand, for I must paint myself with it to appear 
at the circle of the gods and goddesses this eve¬ 

ning.” 
Psyche was now satisfied that her destruction 

was at hand, being obliged to go with her own 
feet directly down to Erebus. Wherefore, to 
make no delay of what was not to be avoided, 
she goes to the top of a high tower to precipitate 
herself headlong, thus to descend the shortest 
way to the shades below. But a voice from the 
tower said to her, “Why, poor unlucky girl, dost 
thou design to put an end to thy days in so dread¬ 
ful a manner? And what cowardice makes thee 
sink under this last danger who hast been so 
miraculously supported in all thy former?” Then 
the voice told her how by a certain cave she 
might reach the realms of Pluto, and how to 
avoid all the dangers of the road, to pass by Cer¬ 
berus, the three-headed dog, and prevail on 
Charon, the ferryman, to take her across the 
black river and bring her back again. But the 
voice added, “When Proserpine has given you 
the box, filled with her beauty, of all things this 
is chiefly to be observed by you, that you never 
once open or look into the box nor allow your 
curiosity to pry into the treasure of the beauty 

of the goddesses.” 
Psyche encouraged by this advice obeyed it in 

all things, and taking heed to her ways travelled 
safely to the kingdom of Pluto. She was admitted 
to the palace of Proserpine, and without accept¬ 
ing the delicate seat or delicious banquet that was 
offered her, but contented with coarse bread for 
her food, she delivered her message from Venus. 
Presently the box was returned to her, shut and 
filled with the precious commodity. Then she 
returned the way she came, and glad was she 
to come out once more into the light of day. 

But having got so far successfully through her 
dangerous task a longing desire seized her to ex¬ 

amine the contents of the box. “What, said she, 
“shall I, the carrier of this divine beauty, not take 
the least bit to put on my cheeks to appear to 
more advantage in the eyes of my beloved hus¬ 
band!” So she carefully opened the box, but found 
nothing there of any beauty at all, but an infernal 
and truly Stygian sleep, which being thus set 
free from its prison, took possession of her, and 
she fell down in the midst of the road, a sleepy 
corpse without sense or motion. 

But Cupid, being now recovered from his 
wound, and not able longer to bear the absence 
of his beloved Psyche, slipping through the 
smallest crack of the window of his chamber 
which happened to be left open, flew to the spot 
where Psyche lay, and gathering up the sleep 
from her body closed it again in the box, and 
waked Psyche with a light touch of one of his 
arrows. “Again,” said he, “hast thou almost per¬ 
ished by the same curiosity. But now perform 
exactly the task imposed on you by my mother, 

and I will take care of the rest.” 
Then Cupid, as swift as lightning penetrating 

the heights of heaven, presented himself before 
Jupiter with his supplication. Jupiter lent a fa¬ 
voring ear and pleaded the cause of the lovers so 
earnestly with Venus that he won her consent. 
On this he sent Mercury to bring Psyche up to 
the heavenly assembly, and when she arrived, 
handing her a cup of ambrosia, he said, “Drink 
this, Psyche, and be immortal; nor shall Cupid 
ever break away from the knot in which he is 
tied, but these nuptials shall be perpetual.” 

Thus Psyche became at last united to Cupid, 
and in due time they had a daughter born to 
them whose name was Pleasure. 

The fable of Cupid and Psyche is usually con¬ 
sidered allegorical. The Greek name for a butter¬ 
fly is Psyche, and the same word means the soul. 
There is no illustration of the immortality of the 
soul so striking and beautiful as the butterfly, 
bursting on brilliant wings from the tomb in 
which it has lain, after a dull, grovelling, cater¬ 
pillar existence, to flutter in the blaze of day and 
feed on the most fragrant and delicate produc¬ 
tions of the spring. Psyche, then, is the human 
soul, which is purified by sufferings and misfor¬ 
tunes and is thus prepared for the enjoyment of 

true and pure happiness. 
In works of art Psyche is represented as a 

maiden with the wings of a butterfly, along with 
Cupid, in the different situations described in the 

allegory. 
Milton alludes to the story of Cupid and 

Psyche in the conclusion of his Comus: 
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Celestial Cupid, her famed son, advanced, 
Holds his dear Psyche, sweet entranced, 
After her wandering labors long, 
Till free consent the gods among 
Make her his eternal bride; 
And from her fair unspotted side 
Two blissful twins are to be born, 
Youth and Joy; so Jove hath sworn. 

The allegory of the story of Cupid and Psyche 
is well presented in the beautiful lines of T. K. 
Harvey: 

They wove bright fables in the days of old, 
When reason borrowed fancy’s painted wings; 

When truth’s clear river flowed o’er sands of gold, 
And told in song its high and mystic things! 

And such the sweet and solemn tale of her 
The pilgrim-heart, to whom a dream was given, 

That led her through the world,—Love’s worship¬ 
per,- 

To seek on earth for him whose home was heaven! 
In the full city,—by the haunted fount,— 

Through the dim grotto’s tracery of spars,— 
’Mid the pine temples, on the moon-lit mount, 

Where silence sits to listen to the stars; 
In the deep glade where dwells the brooding dove, 

The painted valley, and the scented air, 
She heard far echoes of the voice of Love, 

And found his footsteps’ traces every where. 

But never more they met! since doubts and fears, 
Those phantom-shapes that haunt and blight the 

earth, 
Had come ’twixt her, a child of sin and tears, 

And that bright spirit of immortal birth; 
Until her pining soul and weeping eyes 
Had learned to seek him only in the skies; 
Till wings unto the weary heart were given, 
And she became Love’s angel bride in heaven! 

The story of Cupid and Psyche first appears 
in the works of Apuleius, a writer of the second 
century of our era. It is therefore of much more 
recent date than most of the legends of the Age 
of Fable. It is this that Keats alludes to in his 
“Ode to Psyche.” 

O latest-born and loveliest vision far 
Of all Olympus’ faded hierarchy! 

Fairer than Phoebe’s sapphire-regioned star 
Or Vesper, amorous glow-worm of the sky; 

Fairer than these, though temple thou hast none, 
Nor altar heaped with flowers; 

Nor virgin-choir to make delicious moan 
Upon the midnight hours; 

No voice, no lute, no pipe, no incense sweet, 
From chain-swung censer teeming; 

No shrine, no grove, no oracle, no heat 
Of pale-mouthed prophet dreaming. 

In Moore’s “Summer Fete” a fancy ball is de 
scribed, in which one of the characters person 
ated is Psyche. 

. . . not in dark disguise to-night 
Hath our young heroine veiled her light;— 
For see, she walks the earth, Love’s own. 

His Wedded bride, by holiest vow 
Pledged in Olympus, and made known 

To mortals by the type which now 
Hangs glittering on her snowy brow, 

That butterfly, mysterious trinket, 
Which means the soul, (though few would think it) 
And sparkling thus on brow so white 
Tells us we’ve Psyche here to-night. 

The Ravishment of Psyche. Pierre Prud’ho?i. 
(Louvre, Paris.) 
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The Rape of Europa. Titian. 
(Isabella Stewart Gardner Museum, Boston.) 
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CHAPTER XII 

CADMUS-THE MYRMIDONS 

Jupiter, under the disguise of a bull, had carried 
away Europa, the daughter of Agenor, King of 
Phoenicia. Agenor commanded his son Cadmus 
to go in search of his sister, and not to return 
without her. Cadmus went and sought long and 
far for his sister, but could not find her, and not 
daring to return unsuccessful, consulted the 
oracle of Apollo to know what country he 
should settle in. The oracle informed him that he 
should find a cow in the field, and should follow 
her wherever she might wander, and where she 
stopped, should build a city and call it Thebes. 
Cadmus had hardly left the Castalian cave, from 
which the oracle was delivered, when he saw a 
young cow slowly walking before him. He fol¬ 
lowed her close, offering at the same time his 
prayers to Phoebus. The cow went on till she 
passed the shallow channel of Cephisus and came 
out into the plain of Panope. There she stood still, 
and raising her broad forehead to the sky, filled 
the air with her lowings. Cadmus gave thanks 
and, stooping down, kissed the foreign soil, then 
lifting his eyes, greeted the surrounding moun¬ 
tains. Wishing to offer a sacrifice to Jupiter, he 
sent his servants to seek pure water for a libation. 
Near by there stood an ancient grove which had 
never been profaned by the axe, in the midst of 
which was a cave, thick covered with the growth 
of bushes, its roof forming a low arch, from be¬ 
neath which burst forth a fountain of purest 
water. In the cave lurked a horrid serpent with 
a crested head and scales glittering like gold. His 
eyes shone like fire, his body was swollen with 
venom, he vibrated a triple tongue, and showed a 
triple row of teeth. No sooner had the Tyrians 
dipped their pitchers in the fountain, and the in- 
gushing waters made a sound, than the glittering 
serpent raised his head out of the cave and ut¬ 
tered a fearful hiss. The vessels fell from their 
hands, the blood left their cheeks, they trembled 
in every limb. The serpent, twisting his scaly 
body in a huge coil, raised his head so as to over¬ 
top the tallest trees, and while the Tyrians from 
terror could neither fight nor fly, slew some with 
his fangs, others in his folds, and others with his 
poisonous breath. 

Cadmus, having waited for the return of his 
men till midday, went in search of them. His 
covering was a lion’s hide, and besides his javelin 

he carried in his hand a lance, and in his breast a 
bold heart, a surer reliance than either. When he 
entered the wood, and saw the lifeless bodies of 
his men and the monster with his bloody jaws, 
he exclaimed, “Oh, faithful friends, I will avenge 
you, or share your death.” So saying he lifted a 
huge stone and threw it with all his force at the 
serpent. Such a block would have shaken the wall 
of a fortress, but it made no impression on the 
monster. Cadmus next threw his javelin, which 
met with better success, for it penetrated the ser¬ 
pent’s scales and pierced through to his entrails. 
Fierce with pain the monster turned back his 

The Rape of Europa. Francesco di Giorgio. 
(Louvre, Paris.) 

head to view the wound, and attempted to draw 
out the weapon with his mouth, but broke it off, 
leaving the iron point rankling in his flesh. His 
neck swelled with rage, bloody foam covered 
his jaws, and the breath of his nostrils poisoned 
the air around. Now he twisted himself into a 
circle, then stretched himself out on the ground 
like the trunk of a fallen tree. As he moved on¬ 
ward, Cadmus retreated before him, holding his 
spear opposite to the monster’s opened jaws. The 
serpent snapped at the weapon and attempted to 
bite its iron point. At last Cadmus, watching his 
chance, thrust the spear at a moment when the 
animal’s head thrown back came against the 
trunk of a tree, and so succeeded in pinning him 
to its side. His weight bent the tree as he strug¬ 
gled in the agonies of death. 
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While Cadmus stood over his conquered foe, 
contemplating its vast size, a voice was heard 
(from whence he knew not, but he heard it dis¬ 
tinctly) commanding him to take the dragon’s 
teeth and sow them in the earth. He obeyed. He 
made a furrow in the ground, and planted the 
teeth, destined to produce a crop of men. Scarce 
had he done so when the clods began to move, 
and the points of spears to appear above the sur¬ 
face. Next helmets with their nodding plumes 
came up, and next the shoulders and breasts and 
limbs of men with weapons, and in time a harvest 
of armed warriors. Cadmus, alarmed, prepared to 
encounter a new enemy, but one of them said to 
him, “Meddle not with our civil war.” With that 
he who had spoken smote one of his earth-born 
brothers with a sword, and he himself fell pierced 
with an arrow from another. The latter fell vic¬ 
tim to a fourth, and in like manner the whole 
crowd dealt with each other till all fell slain with 
mutual wounds, except five survivors. One of 
these cast away his weapons and said, “Brothers, 
let us live in peace!” These five joined with Cad¬ 
mus in building his city, to which they gave the 

name of Thebes. 
Cadmus obtained in marriage Harmonia, the 

daughter of Venus. The gods left Olympus to 
honor the occasion with their presence, and Vul¬ 
can presented the bride with a necklace of sur¬ 
passing brilliancy, his own workmanship. But a 
fatality hung over the family of Cadmus in 
consequence of his killing the serpent sacred to 
Mars. Semele and Ino, his daughters, and Ac- 
taeon and Pentheus, his grandchildren, all per¬ 
ished unhappily, and Cadmus and Harmonia 
quitted Thebes, now grown odious to them, and 
emigrated to the country of the Enchelians, who 
received them with honor and made Cadmus 
their king. But the misfortunes of their children 
still weighed upon their minds; and one day Cad¬ 
mus exclaimed, “If a serpent’s life is so dear to the 
gods, I would I were myself a serpent.” No 
sooner had he uttered the words than he began to 
change his form. Harmonia beheld it and prayed 
to the gods to let her share his fate. Both became 
serpents. They live in the woods, but mindful of 
their origin, they neither avoid the presence of 
man, nor do they ever injure any one. 

There is a tradition that Cadmus introduced 
into Greece the letters of the alphabet which 
were invented by the Phoenicians. This is alluded 
to by Byron where, addressing the modern 
Greeks, he says— 

You have the letters Cadmus gave, 
Think you he meant them for a slave? 

Milton, describing the serpent which tempted 
Eve, is reminded of the serpents of the classical 

stories, and says— 

. . . pleasing was his shape, 
And lovely: never since of serpent kind 
Lovelier; not those that in Illyria changed 
Hermione and Cadmus, nor the god 
In Epidaurus. 

THE MYRMIDONS 

The Myrmidons were the soldiers of Achilles, in 
the Trojan war. From them, all zealous and un¬ 
scrupulous followers of a political chief are called 
by that name, down to this day. But the origin 
of the Myrmidons would not give one the idea 
of a fierce and bloody race, but rather of a la¬ 
borious and peaceful one. 

Cephalus, King of Athens, arrived in the island 
of Aegina to seek assistance of his old friend and 
ally Aeacus, the king, in his war with Minos, 
King of Crete. Cephalus was most kindly re¬ 
ceived, and the desired assistance readily prom¬ 
ised. “I have people enough,” said Aeacus, “to 
protect myself and spare you such a force as you 
need.” “I rejoice to see it,” replied Cephalus, “and 
my wonder has been raised, I confess, to find 
such a host of youths as I see around me, all ap¬ 
parently of about the same age. Yet there are 
many individuals whom I previously knew that 
I look for now in vain. What has become of 
them?” Aeacus groaned and replied with a voice 
of sadness, “I have been intending to tell you, 
and will now do so, without more delay, that 
you may see how from the saddest beginning a 
happy result sometimes flows. Those whom you 
formerly knew are now dust and ashes! A plague 
sent by angry Juno devastated the land. She 
hated it because it bore the name of one of her 
husband’s female favorites. While the disease ap¬ 
peared to spring from natural causes we resisted 
it as we best might, by natural remedies; but it 
soon appeared that the pestilence was too power¬ 
ful for our efforts, and we yielded. At the begin¬ 
ning the sky seemed to settle down upon the 
earth, and thick clouds shut in the heated air. For 
four months together a deadly south wind pre¬ 
vailed. The disorder affected the wells and 
springs; thousands of snakes crept over the land 
and shed their poison in the fountains. The force 
of the disease was first spent on the lower animals, 
dogs, cattle, sheep, and birds. The luckless 
ploughman wondered to see his oxen fall in the 
midst of their work and lie helpless in the un- 
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finished furrow. The wool fell from the bleating 
sheep, and their bodies pined away. The horse 
once foremost in the race contested the palm no 
more, but groaned at his stall and died an in¬ 
glorious death. The wild boar forgot his rage, the 
stag his swiftness, the bears no longer attacked 
the herds. Everything languished; dead bodies 
lay in the roads, the fields, and the woods; the air 
was poisoned by them. I tell you what is hardly 
credible, but neither dogs nor birds would touch 
them, nor starving wolves. Their decay spread 
the infection. Next the disease attacked the coun¬ 
try people, and then the dwellers in the city. At 
first the cheek was flushed and the breath drawn 
with difficulty. The tongue grew rough and 
swelled, and the dry mouth stood open with its 
veins enlarged and gasped for the air. Men could 
not bear the heat of their clothes or their beds, 
but preferred to lie on the bare ground; and the 
ground did not cool them, but on the contrary, 
they heated the spot where they lay. Nor could 
the physicians help, for the disease attacked them 
also, and the contact of the sick gave them infec¬ 
tion, so that the most faithful were the first vic¬ 
tims. At last all hope of relief vanished, and men 
learned to look upon death as the only deliverer 
from disease. Then they gave way to every in¬ 
clination and cared not to ask what was expedi¬ 
ent, for nothing was expedient, All restraint laid 
aside, they crowded around the wells and foun¬ 
tains and drank till they died, without quenching 
thirst. Many had not strength to get away from 
the water, but died in the midst of the stream, 
and others would drink of it notwithstanding. 
Such was their weariness of their sick beds that 
some would creep forth, and if not strong 
enough to stand, would die on the ground. They 
seemed to hate their friends, and got away from 
their homes, as if, not knowing the cause of their 
sickness, they charged it on the place of their 
abode. Some were seen tottering along the road, 
as long as they could stand, while others sank on 
the earth and turned their dying eyes around to 
take a last look, then closed them in death. 

“What heart had I left me, during all this, or 
what ought I to have had, except to hate life and 
wish to be with my dead subjects? On all sides 
lay my people, strewn like over-ripened apples 
beneath the tree, or acorns under the storm- 
shaken oak. You see yonder a temple on the 
height. It is sacred to Jupiter. Oh, how many of¬ 
fered prayers there, husbands for wives, fathers 
for sons, and died in the very act of supplication! 
How often, while the priest made ready for 
sacrifice, the victim fell, struck down by disease 
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without waiting for the blow. At length all 
reverence for sacred things was lost. Bodies were 
thrown out unburied, wood was wanting for 
funeral piles, men fought with one another for 
the possession of them. Finally there were none 
left to mourn; sons and husbands, old men and 
youths, perished alike unlamented. 

“Standing before the altar I raised my eyes to 
heaven. ‘O Jupiter,’ I said, ‘if thou art indeed my 
father, and art not ashamed of thy offspring, give 
me back my people, or take me also away!” At 
these words a clap of thunder was heard. ‘I ac¬ 
cept the omen,’ I cried; ‘oh, may it be a sign of 
a favorable disposition towards me!’ By chance 
there grew by the place where I stood an oak 
with wide-spreading branches, sacred to Jupiter. 
I observed a troop of ants busy with their labor, 
carrying minute grains in their mouths and fol¬ 
lowing one another in a line up the trunk of the 
tree. Observing their numbers with admiration 
I said, ‘Give me, O father, citizens as numerous as 
these, and replenish my empty city.’ The tree 
shook and gave a rustling sound with its 
branches though no wind agitated them. I 
trembled in every limb, yet I kissed the earth and 
the tree. I would not confess to myself that I 
hoped, yet I did hope. Night came on and sleep 
took possession of my frame oppressed with 
cares. The tree stood before me in my dreams, 
with its numerous branches all covered with liv¬ 
ing, moving creatures. It seemed to shake its 
limbs and throw down over the ground a multi¬ 
tude of those industrious grain-gathering animals, 
which appeared to gain in size, and grow larger 
and larger, and by-and-by to stand erect, lay 
aside their superfluous legs and their black color, 
and finally to assume the human form. Then I 
awoke, and my first impulse was to chide the 
gods who had robbed me of a sweet vision and 
given me no reality in its place. Being still in the 
temple my attention was caught by the sound 
of many voices without; a sound of late unusual 
to my ears. While I began to think I was yet 
dreaming, Telamon, my son, throwing open the 
temple gates, exclaimed, ‘Father, approach, and 
behold things surpassing even your hopes!’ I 
went forth; I saw a multitude of men, such as I 
had seen in my dream, and they were passing in 
procession in the same manner. While I gazed 
with wonder and delight they approached and, 
kneeling, hailed me as their king. I paid my vows 
to Jove and proceeded to allot the vacant city to 
the new-born race and to parcel out the fields 
among them. I called them Myrmidons from the 
ant (myrmex) from which they sprang. You 



have seen these persons; their dispositions resem¬ 
ble those which they had in their former shape. 
They are a diligent and industrious race, eager 
to gain, and tenacious of their gains. Among 
them you may recruit your forces. They will 
follow you to the war, young in years and bold 

in heart.” 

This description of the plague is copied by 
Ovid from the account which Thucydides, the 
Greek historian, gives of the plague of Athens. 
The historian drew from life, and all the poets 
and writers of fiction since his day, when they 
have had occasion to describe a similar scene, 
have borrowed their details from him. 

Mercury with Jupiter, Juno, and Apollo. 
Vincenzo Pacetti. (Villa Borghese, Rome.) 



CHAPTER XIII 

NISUS AND SCYLLA-ECHO AND NARCISSUS- 
CLYTIE—HERO AND LEANDER 

NISUS AND SCYLLA 

Minos, King of Crete, made war upon Megara. 
Nisus was king of Megara, and Scylla was his 
daughter. The siege had now lasted six months, 
and the city still held out, for it was decreed by 
fate that it should not be taken so long as a cer¬ 
tain purple lock, which glittered among the hair 
of King Nisus, remained on his head. There was 
a tower on the city walls, which overlooked the 
plain where Minos and his army were encamped. 
To this tower Scylla used to repair, and look 
abroad over the tents of the hostile army. The 
siege had lasted so long that she had learned to 
distinguish the persons of the leaders. Minos, in 
particular, excited her admiration. Arrayed in his 
helmet, and bearing his shield, she admired his 
graceful deportment; if he threw his javelin, skill 
seemed combined with force in the discharge; if 
he drew his bow, Apollo himself could not have 
done it more gracefully. But when he laid aside 
his helmet, and in his purple robes bestrode his 
white horse with its gay caparisons, and reined 
in its foaming mouth, the daughter of Nisus was 
hardly mistress of herself; she was almost frantic 
with admiration. She envied the weapon that he 
grasped, the reins that he held. She felt as if she 
could, if it were possible, go to him through the 
hostile ranks; she felt an impulse to cast herself 

down from the tower into the midst of his camp, 
or to open the gates to him, or to do any thing 
else, so only it might gratify Minos. As she sat in 
the tower, she talked thus with herself: “I know 
not whether to rejoice or grieve at this sad war. I 
grieve that Minos is our enemy; but I rejoice at 
any cause that brings him to my sight. Perhaps 
he would be willing to grant us peace and receive 
me as a hostage. I would fly down, if I could, and 
alight in his camp, and tell him that we yield our¬ 
selves to his mercy. But, then, to betray my 
father! No! Rather would I never see Minos 
again. And yet no doubt it is sometimes the best 
thing for a city to be conquered, when the con¬ 
queror is clement and generous. Minos certainly 
has right on his side. I think we shall be con¬ 
quered; and if that must be the end of it, why 
should not love unbar the gates to him, instead of 
leaving it to be done by war? Better spare delay 
and slaughter if we can. And oh, if any one 
should wound or kill Minos! No one surely 
would have the heart to do it; yet ignorantly, not 
knowing him, one might. I will, I will surrender 
myself to him, with my country as a dowry, and 
so put an end to the war. But how? The gates 
are guarded, and my father keeps the keys; he 
only stands in my way. Oh, that it might please 
the gods to take him away! But why ask the 
gods to do it? Another woman, loving as I do, 

Scylla. From a Greek vase. (From The Studio magazine.) 



would remove with her own hands whatever 
stood in the way of her love. And can any other 
woman dare more than I? I would encounter fire 
and sword to gain my object; but here there is 
no need of fire and sword. I only need my 
father’s purple lock. More precious than gold to 
me, that will give me all I wish.” 

While she thus reasoned night came on, and 
soon the whole palace was buried in sleep. She 
entered her father’s bedchamber and cut off the 
fatal lock; then passed out of the city and entered 
the enemy’s camp. She demanded to be led to the 
king, and thus addressed him: “I am Scylla, the 
daughter of Nisus. I surrender to you my coun¬ 
try and my father’s house. I ask no reward but 
yourself; for love of you I have done it. See here 
the purple lock! With this I give you my father 
and his kingdom.” She held out her hand with 
the fatal spoil. Minos shrunk back and refused 
to touch it. “The gods destroy thee, infamous 
woman,” he exclaimed; “disgrace of our time! 
May neither earth nor sea yield thee a resting- 
place! Surely, my Crete, where Jove himself was 
cradled, shall not be polluted with such a mon¬ 
ster!” Thus he said, and gave orders that equi¬ 
table terms should be allowed to the conquered 
city, and that the fleet should immediately sail 
from the island. 

Scylla was frantic. “Ungrateful man,” she ex¬ 
claimed, “is it thus you leave me?—me who have 
given you victory,—who have sacrificed for you 
parent and country! I am guilty, I confess, and 
deserve to die, but not by your hand.” As the 
ships left the shore, she leaped into the water, 
and seizing the rudder of the one which carried 
Minos, she was borne along, an unwelcome com¬ 
panion of their course. A sea-eagle soaring aloft— 
it was her father who had been changed into that 
form—seeing her, pounced down upon her and 
struck her with his beak and claws. In terror she 
let go the ship, and would have fallen into the 
water, but some pitying deity changed her into 
a bird. The sea-eagle still cherishes the old ani¬ 
mosity; and whenever he espies her in his lofty 
flight, you may see him dart down upon her, 
with beak and claws, to take vengeance for the 
ancient crime. 

ECHO AND NARCISSUS 

Echo was a beautiful nymph, fond of the woods 
and hills, where she devoted herself to woodland 
sports. She was a favorite of Diana, and attended 
her in the chase. But Echo had one failing: she 
was fond of talking, and whether in chat or 
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argument, would have the last word. One day 
Juno was seeking her husband, who, she had 
reason to fear, was amusing himself among the 
nymphs. Echo by her talk contrived to detain 
the goddess till the nymphs made their escape. 
When Juno discovered it, she passed sentence 
upon Echo in these words: “You shall forfeit the 
use of that tongue with which you have cheated 
me, except for that one purpose you are so fond 
of—reply. You shall still have the last word, but 
no power to speak first.” 

This nymph saw Narcissus, a beautiful youth, 
as he pursued the chase upon the mountains. She 
loved him and followed his footsteps. Oh, how 
she longed to address him in the softest accents, 
and win him to converse! But it was not in her 
power. She waited with impatience for him to 
speak first, and had her answer ready. One day 
the youth, being separated from his companions, 
shouted aloud, “Who’s here?” Echo replied, 
“Here.” Narcissus looked around, but seeing no 
one, called out, “Come.” Echo answered, 
“Come.” As no one came, Narcissus called again, 
“Why do you shun me?” Echo asked the same 
question. “Let us join one another,” said the 
youth. The maid answered with all her heart in 
the same words, and hastened to the spot, ready to 
throw her arms about his neck. He started back, 
exclaiming, “Hands off! I would rather die than 
you should have me!” “Have me,” said she; but 
it was all in vain. He left her, and she went to 
hide her blushes in the recesses of the woods. 
From that time forth she lived in caves and 
among mountain cliffs. Her form faded with 
grief, till at last all her flesh shrank away. Her 
bones were changed into rocks, and there was 
nothing left of her but her voice. With that she 
is still ready to reply to any one who calls her, 
and keeps up her old habit of having the last 
word. 

Narcissus’s cruelty in this case was not the 
only instance. He shunned all the rest of the 
nymphs, as he had done poor Echo. One day a 
maiden, who had in vain endeavored to attract 
him, uttered a prayer that he might some time or 
other feel what it was to love and meet no re¬ 
turn of affection. The avenging goddess heard 
and granted the prayer. 

There was a clear fountain, with water like 
silver, to which the shepherds never drove their 
flocks, nor the monutain goats resorted, nor any 
of the beasts of the; forest; neither was it defaced 
with fallen leaves or branches; but the grass grew 
fresh around it, and the rocks sheltered it from 
the sun. Hither came one day the youth fatigued 



Echo and Narcissus. Nicolas Poussin. (Louvre, Paris.) 

with hunting, heated and thirsty. He stooped 
down to drink, and saw his own image in the 
water; he thought it was some beautiful water- 
spirit living in the fountain. He stood gazing 
with admiration at those bright eyes, those locks 
curled like the locks of Bacchus or Apollo, the 
rounded cheeks, the ivory neck, the parted lips, 
and the glow of health and exercise over all. He 
fell in love with himself. He brought his lips near 
to take a kiss; he plunged his arms in to embrace 
the beloved object. It fled at the touch, but re¬ 
turned again after a moment and renewed the 
fascination. He could not tear himself away; he 
lost all thought of food or rest, while he hovered 
over the brink of the fountain gazing upon his 
own image. He talked with the supposed spirit: 
“Why, beautiful being, do you shun me? Surely, 
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my face is not one to repel you. The nymphs 
love me, and you yourself look not indifferent 
upon me. When I stretch forth my arms you do 
the same; and you smile upon me and answer my 
beckonings with the like.” His tears fell into the 
water and disturbed the image. As he saw it de¬ 
part, he exclaimed, “Stay, I entreat you! Let me 
at least gaze upon you, if I may not touch you.” 
With this, and much more of the same kind, he 
cherished the flame that consumed him, so that 
by degrees he lost his color, his vigor, and the 
beauty which formerly had so charmed the 
nymph Echo. She kept near him, however, and 
when he exclaimed, “Alas! alas!” she answered 
him with the same words. He pined away and 
died; and when his shade passed the Stygian 
river, it leaned over the boat to catch a look of 



itself in the waters. The nymphs mourned for 
him, especially the water-nymphs; and when 
they smote their breasts, Echo smote hers also. 
They prepared a funeral pile, and would have 
burned the body, but it was nowhere to be 
found; but in its place a flower, purple within, 
and surrounded with white leaves, which bears 
the name and preserves the memory of Narcissus. 

Milton alludes to the story of Echo and Nar¬ 
cissus in the Lady’s song in Comus. She is seek¬ 
ing her brothers in the forest and sings to attract 
their attention. 

Sweet Echo, sweetest nymph, that liv’st unseen 
Within thy aery shell 

By slow Meander’s margent green, 
And in the violet-embroidered vale, 

Where the love-lorn nightingale 
Nightly to thee her sad song mourneth well; 
Canst thou not tell me of a gentle pair 

That likest thy Narcissus are? 
O, if thou have 

Hid them in some flowery cave, 
Tell me but where, 

Sweet queen of parly, daughter of the sphere, 
So may’st thou be translated to the skies, 

And give resounding grace to all heaven’s harmonies. 

Milton has imitated the story of Narcissus in 
the account which he makes Eve give of the first 
sight of herself reflected in the fountain: 

That day I oft remember when from sleep 
I first awaked, and found myself reposed 
Under a shade on flowers, much wondering where 
And what I was, whence thither brought, and how. 
Not distant far from thence a murmuring sound 
Of waters issued from a cave, and spread 
Into a liquid plain, then stood unmoved 
Pure as the expanse of heaven; I thither went 
With unexperienced thought, and laid me down 
On the green bank, to look into the clear 
Smooth lake that to me seemed another sky. 
As I bent down to look, just opposite 
A shape within the watery gleam appeared, 
Bending to look on me. I started back; 
It started back; but pleased I soon returned, 
Pleased it returned as soon with answering looks 
Of sympathy and love. There had I fixed 
Mine eyes till now, and pined with vain desire, 
Had not a voice thus warned me: “What thou seest, 
What there thou seest, fair creature, is thyself;” 

&c. Paradise Lost, Book IV 

No one of the fables of antiquity has been 
oftener alluded to by the poets than that of Nar¬ 
cissus. Here are two epigrams which treat it in 
different ways. The first is by Goldsmith: 

On a beautiful Youth, 

STRUCK BLIND BY LIGHTNING 

Sure ’twas by Providence designed, 
Rather in pity than in hate, 

That he should be like Cupid blind, 
To save him from Narcissus’ fate. 

The other is by Cowper: 

On an Ugly Fellow 

Beware, my friend, of crystal brook 
Or fountain, lest that hideous hook, 

Thy nose, thou chance to see; 
Narcissus’ fate would then be thine, 
And self-detested thou would’st pine 

As self-enamoured he. 

CLYTIE 

Clyde was a water-nymph and in love with 
Apollo, who made her no return. So she pined 
away, sitting all day long upon the cold ground, 
with her unbound tresses streaming over her 
shoulders. Nine days she sat and tasted neither 
food nor drink, her own tears and the chilly dew 
her only food. She gazed on the sun when he 
rose and as he passed through his daily course to 
his setting; she saw no other object, her face 
turned constantly on him. At last, they say, her 
limbs rooted in the ground, her face became a 
flower,* which turns on its stem so as always to 
face the sun throughout its daily course; for it 
retains to that extent the feeling of the nymph 
from whom it sprang. 

Hood in his “Flowers” thus alludes to Clytie: 

I will not have the mad Clytie, 
Whose head is turned by the sun; 

The tulip is a courtly quean, 
Whom therefore I will shun; 

The cowslip is a country wench, 
The violet is a nun;— 

But I will woo the dainty rose, 
The queen of every one. 

The sunflower is a favorite emblem of con¬ 
stancy. Thus Moore uses it: 

The heart that has truly loved never forgets, 
But as truly loves on to the close; 

As the sunflower turns on her god when he sets 
The same look that she turned when he rose. 

* The sunflower. 
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The Parting of Hero and Leander. /. M. W. Turner. 
(.National Gallery, London.) 

HERO AND LEANDER On a Picture of Leander 

Leander was a youth of Abydos, a town of the 
Asian side of the strait which separates Asia and 
Europe. On the opposite shore in the town of 
Sestos lived the maiden Hero, a priestess of 
Venus. Leander loved her, and used to swim the 
strait nightly to enjoy the company of his mis¬ 
tress, guided by a torch which she reared upon 
the tower, for the purpose. But one night a 
tempest arose and the sea was rough; his strength 
failed, and he was drowned. The waves bore his 
body to the European shore, where Hero became 
aware of his death, and in her despair cast herself 
down from the tower into the sea and perished. 

The following sonnet is by Keats: 

Come hither all sweet maidens soberly, 
Down looking aye, and with a chasten’d light, 
Hid in the fringes of your eyelids white, 

And meekly let your fair hands joined be, 
As if so gentle that ye could not see, 

Untouch’d, a victim of your beauty bright, 
Sinking away to his young spirit’s night, 

Sinking bewilder’d ’mid the dreary sea. 
’Tis young Leander toiling to his death. 

Nigh swooning he doth purse his weary lips 
For Hero’s cheek, and smiles against her smile. 

O horrid dream! see how his body dips 
Dead-heavy; arms and shoulders gleam awhile; 
He’s gone; up bubbles all his amorous breath! 
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The story of Leander’s swimming the Hel¬ 
lespont was looked upon as fabulous, and the feat 
considered impossible, till Lord Byron proved its 
possibility by performing it himself. In the “Bride 
of Abydos” he says, 

These limbs that buoyant wave hath borne. 

The distance in the narrowest part is almost a 
mile, and there is a constant current setting out 
from the Sea of Marmora into the Archipelago. 
Since Byron’s time the feat has been achieved by 
others; but it yet remains a test of strength and 
skill in the art of swimming sufficient to give a 
wide and lasting celebrity to any one of our 
readers who may dare to make the attempt and 
succeed in accomplishing it. 

In the beginning of the second canto of the 
same poem, Byron thus alludes to this story: 

The winds are high on Helle’s wave, 
As on that night of stormiest water, 

When Love, who sent, forgot to save 
The young, the beautiful, the brave, 

The lonely hope of Sestos’ daughter. 
O, when alone along the sky 
The turret-torch was blazing high, 
Though rising gale and breaking foam, 
And shrieking sea-birds warned him home; 
And clouds aloft and tides below, 
With signs and sounds forbade to go, 
He could not see, he would not hear 
Or sound or sight foreboding fear. 
His eye but saw that light of love, 
The only star it hailed above; 
His ear but rang with Hero’s song, 
“Ye waves, divide not lovers long.” 
That tale is old, but love anew 
May nerve young hearts to prove as true. 

Hero and Leander. Jean-Joseph Taillasson. (Mu- 
see dhistoire dart, Blaye.) 
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CHAPTER XIV 

MINERVA—NIOBE 

MINERVA 

Minerva, the goddess of wisdom, was the daugh¬ 
ter oi Jupiter. ~Nie"was said to have leaped forth 
from his brain, mature and in complete armor. _ 
She presidecTbver the useful and ornamental arts, 
both those of men—such as agriculture and navi¬ 
gation—and those of women—spinning, weaving, 
and needlework. She was also a warlike divinity; 
but it was defensive war only that she patronized, 
and she had no sympathy with Mars’s savage love 
of violence and bloodshed. Athens was her chosen 
seat, her own city, awarded to her as the prize of 
a contest with Neptune, who also aspired to it. 
The tale ran that in the reign of Cecrops, the 
first king of Athens, the two deities contended 
for the possession of the city. The gods decreed 
that it should be awarded to that one who pro¬ 
duced the gift most useful to mortals. Neptune 
gave the horse; Minerva produced the olive. The 
gods gave judgment that the olive was the more 
useful of the two, and awarded the city to the 
goddess; and it was named after her, Athens, her 
name in Greek being Athene. 

There was another contest, in which a mortal 
dared to come in competition with Minerva. That 
mortal was Arachne, a maiden who had attained 
such skill in the arts of weaving and embroidery 
that the nymphs themselves would leave their 
groves and fountains to come and gaze upon her 
work. It was not only beautiful when it was done, 
but beautiful also in the doing. To watch her, as 
she took the wool in its rude state and formed it 
into rolls, or separated it with her fingers and 
carded it till it looked as light and soft as a cloud, 
or twirled the spindle with skilful touch, or wove 
the web, or, after it was woven, adorned it with 
her needle, one would have said that Minerva 
herself had taught her. But this she denied, and 
could not bear to be thought a pupil even of a 
goddess. “Let Minerva try her skill with mine,” 
said she; “if beaten, I will pay the penalty.” 
Minerva heard this and was displeased. She as¬ 
sumed the form of an old woman and went and 
gave Arachne some friendly advice. “I have had 
much experience,” said she, “and I hope you will 
not despise my counsel. Challenge your fellow- 
mortals as you will, but do not compete with a 
goddess. On the contrary, I advise you to ask 

her forgiveness for what you have said, and as 
she is merciful, perhaps she will pardon you.” 
Arachne stopped her spinning and looked at the 
old dame with anger in her countenance. “Keep 
your counsel,” said she, “for your daughters or 
handmaids; for my part, I know what I say, and 
I stand to it. I am not afraid of the goddess; 
let her try her skill, if she dare venture.” “She 
comes,” said Minerva; and dropping her disguise, 
stood confessed. The nymphs bent low in hom¬ 
age, and all the bystanders paid reverence. 
Arachne alone was unterrified. She blushed, in¬ 
deed; a sudden color dyed her cheek, and then 
she grew pale. But she stood to her resolve, and 
with a foolish conceit of her own skill rushed on 
her fate. Minerva forbore no longer, nor inter¬ 
posed any further advice. They proceed to the 
contest. Each takes her station and attaches the 
web to the beam. Then the slender shuttle is 
passed in and out among the threads. The reed 
with its fine teeth strikes up the woof into its 
place and compacts the web. Both work with 
speed; their skilful hands move rapidly, and the 
excitement of the contest makes the labor light. 
Wool of Tyrian dye is contrasted with that of 
other colors, shaded off into one another so 
adroitly that the joining deceives the eye. Like 
the bow, whose long arch tinges the heavens, 
formed by sunbeams reflected from the shower,* 
in which, where the colors meet they seem as 
one, but at a little distance from the point of con¬ 
tact are wholly different. 

Minerva wrought on her web the scene of her 
contest with Neptune. Twelve of the heavenly 
powers are represented, Jupiter, with august grav¬ 
ity, sitting in the midst. Neptune, the ruler of the 
sea, holds his trident, and appears to have just 
smitten the earth, from which a horse has leaped 
forth. Minerva depicted herself with helmed 
head, her Aegis covering her breast. Such was the 
central circle; and in the four corners were repre¬ 
sented incidents illustrating the displeasure of the 
gods at such presumptuous mortals as had dared 

* This correct description of the rainbow is liter¬ 
ally translated frorh Ovid. 

Opposite: Neptune and Pallas Athene (Minerva). 
Garafolo. (Dresden Gallery.) 
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to contend with them. These were meant as 
warnings to her rival to give up the contest be¬ 
fore it was too late. 

Arachne filled her web with subjects de¬ 
signedly chosen to exhibit the failings and errors 
of the gods. One scene represented Leda caress¬ 
ing the swan, under which form Jupiter had dis¬ 
guised himself; and another, Danae, in the brazen 
tower in which her father had imprisoned her, 
but where the god effected his entrance in the 
form of a golden shower. Still another depicted 
Europa deceived by Jupiter under the disguise of 
a bull. Encouraged by the tameness of the animal, 
Europa ventured to mount his back, whereupon 
Jupiter advanced into the sea and swam with her 
to Crete. You would have thought it was a real 
bull, so naturally was it wrought and so natural 
the water in which it swam. She seemed to look 
wdth longing eyes back upon the shore she was 
leaving, and to call to her companions for help. 
She appeared to shudder with terror at the sight 
of the heaving waves, and to draw back her feet 
from the water. 

Arachne filled her canvas with similar subjects, 
wonderfully well done, but strongly marking her 
presumption and impiety. Minerva could not for¬ 
bear to admire, yet felt indignant at the insult. 
She struck the web with her shuttle and rent it 
in pieces; she then touched the forehead of 
Arachne and made her feel her guilt and shame. 
She could not endure it, and went and hanged 
herself. Minerva pitied her as she saw her sus¬ 
pended by a rope. “Live,” she said, “guilty 
woman—and that you may preserve the memory 
of this lesson continue to hang, both you and 
your descendants, to all future times.” She 
sprinkled her with the juices of aconite, and im¬ 
mediately her hair came off, and her nose and 
ears likewise. Her form shrank up, and her head 
grew smaller yet; her fingers cleaved to her side 
and served for legs. All the rest of her is body, 
out of which she spins her thread, often hanging 
suspended by it, in the same attitude as when 
Minerva touched her and transformed her into a 
spider. 

Spenser tells the story of Arachne in his Muio- 
potmos, adhering very closely to his master Ovid, 
but improving upon him in the conclusion of the 
story. The two stanzas which follow tell what 
was done after the goddess had depicted her 
creation of the olive tree: 

Opposite: Leda and the Swan. Leonardo da 
Vinci. (Borghese Gallery, Rome.) 

Amongst these leaves she made a Butterfly, 
With excellent device and wondrous slight, 
Fluttering among the olives wantonly, 
That seemed to live, so like it was in sight; 
The velvet nap which on his wings doth lie, 
The silken down with which his back is dight, 
His broad outstretched horns, his hairy thighs, 
His glorious colors, and his glistening eyes.* 

Which when Arachne saw, as overlaid 
And mastered with workmanship so rare, 
She stood astonied long, ne aught gainsaid; 
And with fast-fixed eyes on her did stare, 
And by her silence, sign of one dismayed, 
The victory did yield her as her share; 
Yet did she inly fret and felly burn, 
And all her blood to poisonous rancor turn. 

Danae. Correggio. (Borghese Gallery, Rome.) 
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And so the metamorphosis is caused by 

Arachne’s own mortification and vexation, and 
not by any direct act of the goddess. 

The following specimen of old-fashioned gal¬ 
lantry is by Garrick: 

Upon a Lady’s Embroidery 

Arachne once, as poets tell, 
A goddess at her art defied, 

* Sir James Mackintosh says of this, “Do you think 
that even a Chinese could paint the gay colors of a 
butterfly with more minute exactness than the fol¬ 
lowing lines—‘The velvet nap, &c.’?”—Life, Vol. II, 
246. 
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And soon the daring mortal fell 
The hapless victim of her pride. 

O, then beware Arachne’s fate; 
Be prudent, Chloe, and submit, 

For you’ll most surely meet her hate, 
Who rival both her art and wit. 

Tennyson, in “The Palace of Art,” describing 
the works of art with which the palace was 
adorned, thus alludes to Europa: 

. . . sweet Europa’s mantle blew unclasped 
From off her shoulder, backward borne, 

From one hand drooped a crocus, one hand grasped 
The mild bull’s golden horn. 

In his “Princess” there is this allusion to Danae: 

Now lies the earth all Danae to the stars, 
And all thy heart lies open unto me. 

NIOBE 

The fate of Arachne was noised abroad through 
all the country, and served as a warning to all 
presumptuous mortals not to compare themselves 
with the divinities. But one, and she a matron, 
too, failed to learn the lesson of humility. It was 
Niobe, the queen of Thebes. She had indeed 
much to be proud of; but it was not her husband’s 
fame, nor her own beauty, nor their great de¬ 
scent, nor the power of their kingdom that elated 
her. It was her children; and truly the happiest 
of mothers would Niobe have been, if only she 
had not claimed to be so. It was on occasion of 
the annual celebration in honor of Latona and 
her offspring, Apollo and Diana-when the people 
of Thebes were assembled, their brows crowned 
with laurel, bearing frankincense to the altars and 
paying their vows—that Niobe appeared among 
the crowd. Tier attire was splendid with gold and 
gems, and her aspect beautiful as the face of an 
angry woman can be. She stood and surveyed the 
people with haughty looks. “What folly,” said 
she, “is this!—to prefer beings whom you never 
saw to those who stand before your eyes! Why 
should Latona be honored with worship, and none 
be paid to me? My father was Tantalus, who was 
received as a guest at the table of the gods; my 
mother was a goddess. My husband built and 
rules this city, Thebes, and Phrygia is my pa¬ 
ternal inheritance. Wherever I turn my eyes I 
survey the elements of my power; nor is my 
form and presence unworthy of a goddess. To 
all this let me add, I have seven sons and seven 

Niobe and Her Youngest Daughter. Roman 
copy. (Uffizi Gallery, Florence.) 

daughters, and look for sons-in-law and daugh¬ 
ters-in-law of pretensions worthy of my alliance. 
Have I not cause for pride? Will you prefer to 
me this Latona, the Titan’s daughter, with her 
two children? I have seven times as many. For¬ 
tunate indeed am I, and fortunate I shall remain! 
Will any one deny this? My abundance is my 
security. I feel myself too strong for Fortune to 
subdue. She may take from me much; I shall still 
have much left. Were I to lose some of my chil¬ 
dren, I should hardly be left as poor as Latona 
with her two only. Away with you from these 
solemnities—put off the laurel from your brows— 
have done with this worship!” The people obeyed 
and left the sacred services uncompleted. 

The goddess was indignant. On the Cynthian 
mountain-top where she dwelt, she thus ad¬ 
dressed her son and daughter: “My children, I 
who have been so proud of you both and have 
been used to hold myself second to none of the 



goddesses except Juno alone, begin now to doubt 
whether I am indeed a goddess. I shall be de¬ 
prived of my worship altogether unless you pro¬ 
tect me.” She was proceeding in this strain, but 
Apollo interrupted her. “Say no more,” said he; 
“speech only delays punishment.” So said Diana 
also. Darting through the air, veiled in clouds, 
they alighted on the towers of the city. Spread 
out before the gates was a broad plain, where 
the youth of the city pursued their warlike 
sports. The sons of Niobe were there with the 
rest-some mounted on spirited horses richly 
caparisoned, some driving gay chariots. Ismenos, 
the first-born, as he guided his foaming steeds, 
struck with an arrow from above, cried out, “Ah 
me!”—dropped the reins and fell lifeless. Another, 
hearing the sound of the bow—like a boatman 
who sees the storm gathering and makes all sail 
for the port—gave the rein to his horses and at¬ 
tempted to escape. The inevitable arrow over¬ 
took him as he fled. Two others, younger boys, 
just from their tasks, had gone to the playground 
to have a game of wrestling. As they stood breast 
to breast, one arrow pierced them both. They 
uttered a cry together, together cast a parting 
look around them, and together breathed their 
last. Alphenor, an elder brother, seeing them 
fall, hastened to the spot to render assistance and 
fell stricken in the act of brotherly duty. One 
only was left, Ilioneus. He raised his arms to 
heaven to try whether prayer might not avail. 
“Spare me, ye gods!” he cried, addressing all, in 
his ignorance that all needed not his intercessions; 
and Apollo would have spared him, but the arrow 
had already left the string, and it was too late. 

The terror of the people and grief of the at¬ 
tendants soon made Niobe acquainted with what 
had taken place. She could hardly think it pos¬ 
sible; she was indignant that the gods had dared 
and amazed that they had been able to do it. Her 
husband, Amphion, overwhelmed with the blow, 
destroyed himself. Alas! how different was this 
Niobe from her who had so lately driven away 
the people from the sacred rites, and held her 
stately course through the city, the envy of her 
friends, now the pity even of her foes! She knelt 
over the lifeless bodies, and kissed, now one, now 
another of her dead sons. Raising her pallid arms 
to heaven, “Cruel Latona,” said she, “feed full 
your rage with my anguish! Satiate your hard 
heart, while I follow to the grave my seven sons. 
Yet where is your triumph? Bereaved as I am, I 
am still richer than you, my conqueror.” Scarce 
had she spoken, when the bow sounded and struck 
terror into all hearts except Niobe’s alone. She 
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was brave from excess of grief. The sisters stood 
in garments of mourning over the biers of their 
dead brothers. One fell, struck by an arrow, and 
died on the corpse she was bewailing. Another, 
attempting to console her mother, suddenly 
ceased to speak, and sank lifeless to the earth. A 
third tried to escape by flight, a fourth by con¬ 
cealment, another stood trembling, uncertain 
what course to take. Six were now dead, and 
only one remained, whom the mother held 
clasped in her arms, and covered as it were with 
her whole body. “Spare me one, and that the 
youngest! Oh, spare me one of so many!” she 
cried; and while she spoke, that one fell dead. 
Desolate she sat, among sons, daughters, husband, 
all dead, and seemed torpid with grief. The 
breeze moved not her hair, no color was on her 
cheek, her eyes glared fixed and immovable, there 
was no sign of life about her. Her very tongue 
cleaved to the roof of her mouth, and her veins 
ceased to convey the tide of life. Her neck bent 
not, her arms made no gesture, her foot no step. 
She was changed to stone, within and without. 
Yet tears continued to flow; and, borne on a 
whirlwind to her native mountain, she still re¬ 
mains, a mass of rock, from which a trickling 
stream flows, the tribute of her never-ending 
grief. 

The story of Niobe has furnished Byron with 
a fine illustration of the fallen condition of 
modern Rome: 

The Niobe of nations! there she stands, 
Childless and crownless in her voiceless woe; 
An empty urn within her withered hands, 
Whose holy dust was scattered long ago; 
The Scipios’ tomb contains no ashes now: 
The very sepulchres lie tenantless 
Of their heroic dwellers, dost thou flow, 
Old Tiber! through a marble wilderness? 

Rise with thy yellow waves, and mantle her distress. 
Childe Harold, IV, 79 

Our illustration of this story is a copy of a 
celebrated statue in the imperial gallery of 
Florence. It is the principal figure of a group 
supposed to have been originally arranged in the 
pediment of a temple. The figure of the mother 
clasped by the arm of her terrified child is one 
of the most admired of the ancient statues. It 
ranks with the Laocoon and the Apollo among 
the masterpieces of art. The following is a trans¬ 
lation of a Greek epigram supposed to relate to 
this statue: 



To stone the gods have changed her, but in vain; 
The sculptor’s art has made her breathe again. 

Tragic as is the story of Niobe, we cannot 
forbear to smile at the use Moore has made of it 
in Rhymes on the Road: 

’Twas in his carriage the sublime 
Sir Richard Blackmore used to rhyme, 

And, if the wits don’t do him wrong, 
’Twixt death and epics passed his time, 

Scribbling and killing all day long; 
Like Phoebus in his car at ease, 

Now warbling forth a lofty song, 
Now murdering the young Niobes. 

Sir Richard Blackmore was a physician and at 
the same time a very prolific and very tasteless 
poet whose works are now forgotten, unless 
when recalled to mind by some wit like Moore 

for the sake of a joke. 

Eros (Cupid). Greek. (Museum of Fine Arts, Boston.) 
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CHAPTER XV 

THE GRAEAE OR GRAY-MAIDS—PERSEUS-MEDUSA 
-ATLAS-ANDROMEDA 

THE GRAEAE AND GORGONS 

The Graeae were three sisters who were gray¬ 
haired from their birth, whence their name. The 
Gorgons were monstrous females with huge 
teeth like those of swine, brazen claws, and 
snaky hair. None of these beings make much 
figure in mythology except Medusa, the Gorgon, 
whose story we shall next advert to. We mention 
them chiefly to introduce an ingenious theory of 
some modern writers, namely, that the Gorgons 
and Graeae were only personifications of the 
terrors of the sea, the former denoting the strong 
billows of the wide-open main, and the latter the 
white-crested waves that dash against the rocks 
of the coast. Their names in Greek signify the 
above epithets. 

PERSEUS AND MEDUSA 

Perseus was the son of Jupiter and Danae. His 
grandfather Acrisius, alarmed by an oracle which 
had told him that his daughter’s child would be 
the instrument of his death, caused the mother 
and child to be shut up in a chest and set adrift 
on the sea. The chest floated towards Seriphus, 
where it was found by a fisherman who con¬ 
veyed the mother and infant to Polydectes, king 
of the country, by whom they were treated with 
kindness. When Perseus was grown up, Poly¬ 
dectes sent him to attempt the conquest of 
Medusa, a terrible monster who had laid waste 
the country. She was once a beautiful maiden 
whose hair was her chief glory, but as she dared 
to vie in beauty with Minerva, the goddess de¬ 
prived her of her charms and changed her beauti¬ 
ful ringlets into hissing serpents. She became a 
cruel monster of so frightful an aspect that no 
living thing could behold her without being 
turned into stone. All around the cavern where 
she dwelt might be seen the stony figures of men 
and animals which had chanced to catch a glimpse 
of her and had been petrified with the sight. 
Perseus, favored by Minerva and Mercury, the 
former of whom lent him her shield and the 
latter his winged shoes, approached Medusa 
while she slept, and taking care not to look 
directly at her, but guided by her image reflected 
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in the bright shield which he bore, he cut off her 
head, and gave it to Minerva, who fixed it in the 
middle of her Aegis. 

Milton in his “Comus” thus alludes to the 
Aegis: 

What was that snaky-headed Gorgon-shield 
That wise Minerva wore, unconquered virgin, 
Wherewith she freezed her foes to congealed stone, 
But rigid looks of chaste austerity, 
And noble grace that dashed brute violence 
With sudden adoration and blank awe! 

Armstrong, the poet of The Art of Preserving 
Health, thus describes the effect of frost upon 
the waters: 

Now blows the surly North and chills throughout 
The stiffening regions, while by stronger charms 
Than Circe e’er or fell Medea brewed. 
Each brook that wont to prattle to its banks 
Lies all bestilled and wedged betwixt its banks 
Nor moves the withered reeds. 
The surges baited by the fierce North-east, 
Tossing with fretful spleen their angry heads, 
E’en in the foam of all their madness struck 
To the monumental ice. 
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Such execution, 
So stern, so sudden, wrought the grisly aspect 
Of terrible Medusa, 
When wandering through the woods she turned to 

stone 
Their savage tenants; just as the foaming Lion 
Sprang furious on his prey, her speedier power 
Outran his haste, 
And fixed in that fierce attitude he stands 
Like Rage in marble! 

Imitations of Shakespeare 

PERSEUS AND ATLAS 

After the slaughter of Medusa, Perseus, bearing 
with him the head of the Gorgon, flew far and 
wide, over land and sea. As night came on, he 
reached the western limit of the earth, where the 
sun goes down. Here he would gladly have rested 
till morning. It was the realm of King Atlas, 
whose bulk surpassed that of all other men. He 
was rich in flocks and herds and had no neigh- 
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Left: Perseus and the Graeae. Edward Burne- 
Jones. (Staatsgalerie, Stuttgart.) 

Above: Medusa Asleep. Fernand Khnopff. (Col¬ 
lection Felix Labisse, Brussels.) 
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Medusa. Caravaggio. (Uffizi Gallery, Florence.) 

bor or rival to dispute his state. But his chief 
pride was in his gardens, whose fruit was of gold, 
hanging from golden branches, half hid with 
golden leaves. Perseus said to him, “I come as a 
guest. If you honor illustrious descent, I claim 
Jupiter for my father; if mighty deeds, I plead 
the conquest of the Gorgon. I seek rest and 
food.” But Atlas remembered that an ancient 
prophecy had warned him that a son of Jove 
should one day rob him of his golden apples. So 
he answered, “Begone! or neither your false 
claims of glory or parentage shall protect you”; 
ana he attempted to thrust him out. Perseus, find¬ 

ing the giant too strong for him, said, “Since 
you value my friendship so little, deign to accept 
a present”; and turning his face away, he held up 
the Gorgon’s head. Atlas, with all his bulk, was 
changed into stone. His beard and hair became 
forests, his arms and shoulders cliffs, his head a 
summit, and his bones rocks. Each part increased 
in bulk till he became a mountain, and (such was 
the pleasure of the gods) heaven with all its stars 
rests upon his shoulders. 

Opposite: Perseus with the Head of Medusa. Ben¬ 
venuto Cellini. (Piazza della Signoria, Florence.) 





THE SEA-MONSTER 

Perseus, continuing his flight, arrived at the coun¬ 
try of the Ethiopians, of which Cepheus was 
king. Cassiopeia, his queen, proud of her beauty, 
had dared to compare herself to the sea-nymphs, 
which roused their indignation to such a degree 
that they sent a prodigious sea-monster to ravage 
the coast. To appease the deities, Cepheus was 
directed by the oracle to expose his daughter 
Andromeda to be devoured by the monster. As 
Perseus looked down from his aerial height he 
beheld the virgin chained to a rock, waiting the 
approach of the serpent. She was so pale and 
motionless that if it had not been for her flow¬ 
ing tears and her hair that moved in the breeze, 
he would have taken her for a marble statue. He 
was so startled at the sight that he almost forgot 
to wave his wings. As he hovered over her he 
said, “Oh, virgin, undeserving of those chains, 
but rather of such as bind fond lovers together, 
tell me, I beseech you, your name, and the name 
of your country, and why you are thus bound.” 
At first she was silent from modesty, and, if she 
could, would have hid her face with her hands; 
but when he repeated his questions, for fear she 
might be thought guilty of some fault which she 
dared not tell, she disclosed her name and that of 
her country, and her mother’s pride of beauty. 
Before she had done speaking, a sound was heard 
off upon the water, and the sea-monster appeared, 
with his head raised above the surface, cleaving 
the waves with his broad breast. The virgin 
shrieked, the father and mother who had now 
arrived at the scene, wretched both, but the 
mother more justly so, stood by, not able to 
afford protection, but only to pour forth lamen¬ 
tation and to embrace the victim. Then spoke 
Perseus: “There will be time enough for tears; 
this hour is all we have for rescue. My rank as 
the son of Jove and my renown as the slayer of 
the Gorgon might make me acceptable as a suitor; 
but I will try to win her by services rendered, if 
the gods will only be propitious. If she be res¬ 
cued by my valor, I demand that she be my re¬ 
ward.” The parents consent (how could they 
hesitate?) and promise a royal dowry with her. 

And now the monster was within the range of 
a stone thrown by a skilful slinger, when with a 
sudden bound the youth soared into the air. As 
an eagle, when from his lofty flight he sees a ser¬ 
pent basking in the sun, pounces upon him and 
seizes him by the neck to prevent him from turn¬ 
ing his head round and using his fangs, so the 
youth darted down upon the back of the monster 

and plunged his sword into its shoulder. Irri¬ 
tated by the tvound, the monster raised himself 
into the air, then plunged into the depth; then, 
like a wild boar surrounded by a pack of barking 
dogs, turned swiftly from side to side, while the 



Perseus Delivering Andromeda from the Sea-Monster. 
Piero di Cosimo. (Uffizi Gallery, Florence.) 

youth eluded its attacks by means of his wings. 
Wherever he can find a passage for his sword 
between the scales he makes a wound, piercing 
now the side, now the flank, as it slopes towards 
the tail. The brute spouts from his nostrils water 

mixed with blood. The wings of the hero are wet 
with it, and he dares no longer trust to them. 
Alighting on a rock which rose above the waves, 
and holding on by a projecting fragment, as the 
monster floated near he gave him a death stroke. 
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The people who had gathered on the shore 
shouted so that the hills reechoed the sound. The 
parents, transported with joy, embraced their 
future son-in-law, calling him their deliverer and 
the savior of their house, and the virgin, both 
cause and reward of the contest, descended from 

the rock. 
Cassiopeia was an Ethiopian, and conse¬ 

quently, in spite of her boasted beauty, black; 
at least so Milton seems to have thought, who 
alludes to this story in his “II Penseroso,” where 
he addresses Melancholy as the 

. . . goddess, sage and holy, 
Whose saintly visage is too bright 
To hit the sense of human sight, 
And, therefore, to our weaker view 
O’erlaid with black, staid Wisdom’s hue. 
Black, but such as in esteem 
Prince Memnon’s sister might beseem, 
Or that starred Aethiop queen that strove 
To set her beauty’s praise above 
The sea-nymphs, and their powers offended. 

Cassiopeia is called “the starred Aethiop queen” 
because after her death she was placed among 
the stars, forming the constellation of that name. 
Though she attained this honor, yet the sea- 
nymphs, her old enemies, prevailed so far as to 
cause her to be placed in that part of the heaven 
near the pole, where every night she is half the 
time held with her head downward, to give her 
a lesson of humility. 

Memnon was an Ethiopian prince, of whom 
we shall tell in a future chapter. 

THE WEDDING FEAST 

The joyful parents, with Perseus and Andromeda, 
repaired to the palace, where a banquet was 
spread for them, and all was joy and festivity. 

But suddenly a noise was heard of warlike 
clamor, and Phineus, the betrothed of the virgin, 
with a party of his adherents, burst in, demand¬ 
ing the maiden as his own. It was in vain that 
Cepheus remonstrated—“You should have claimed 
her when she lay bound to the rock, the monster’s 
victim. The sentence of the gods dooming her 
to such a fate dissolved all engagements, as death 
itself would have done.” Phineus made no reply, 
but hurled his javelin at Perseus, but it missed its 
mark and fell harmless. Perseus would have 
thrown his in turn, but the cowardly assailant 
ran and took shelter behind the altar. But his act 
was a signal for an onset by his band upon the 
guests of Cepheus. They defended themselves 

and a general conflict ensued, the old king re¬ 
treating from the scene after fruitless expostula¬ 
tions, calling the gods to witness that he was 
guiltless of this outrage on the rights of hospi¬ 

tality. 
Perseus and his friends maintained for some 

time the unequal contest; but the numbers of the 
assailants were too great for them, and destruc¬ 
tion seemed inevitable, when a sudden thought 
struck Perseus—“I will make my enemy defend 
me.” Then with a loud voice he exclaimed, “If I 
have any friend here let him turn away his eyes!” 
and held aloft the Gorgon’s head. “Seek not to 
frighten us with your jugglery,” said Thescelus, 
and raised his javelin in act to throw, and became 
stone in the very attitude. Ampyx was about to 
plunge his sword into the body of a prostrate 
foe, but his arm stiffened and he could neither 
thrust forward nor withdraw it. Another, in the 
midst of a vociferous challenge, stopped, his 
mouth open, but no sound issuing. One of Per¬ 
seus’s friends, Aconteus, caught sight of the 
Gorgon and stiffened like the rest. Astyages 
struck him with his sword, but instead of wound¬ 
ing, it recoiled with a ringing noise. 

Phineus beheld this dreadful result of his un¬ 
just aggression and felt confounded. He called 
aloud to his friends but got no answer; he touched 
them and found them stone. Falling on his knees 
and stretching out his hand to Perseus, but turn¬ 
ing his head away, he begged for mercy. “Take 
all,” said he, “give me but my life.” “Base 
coward,” said Perseus, “thus much I will grant 
you; no weapon shall touch you; moreover, you 
shall be preserved in my house as a memorial of 
these events.” So saying, he held the Gorgon’s 
head to the side where Phineus was looking, and 
in the very form in which he knelt, with his 
hands outstretched and face averted, he became 
fixed immovably, a mass of stone! 

The following allusion to Perseus is from Mil- 
man’s “Samor”: 

As ’mid the fabled Libyan bridal stood 
Perseus in stern tranquillity of wrath, 
Half stood, half floated on his ankle-plumes 
Out-swelling, while the bright face on his shield 
Looked into stone the raging fray; so rose, 
But with no magic arms, wearing alone 
Th’ appalling and control of his firm look, 
The Briton Samor; at his rising awe 
Went abroad^ and the riotous hall was mute. 

Combat of Perseus and Phineus over Androm¬ 
eda. Pablo Picasso. (Museum of Modern Art, 
New York.) 







CHAPTER XVI 

MONSTERS, GIANTS, SPHINX, PEGASUS AND 
CHIMAERA, CENTAURS, GRIFFIN, AND PYGMIES 

Monsters, in the language of mythology, were 
beings of unnatural proportions or parts, usually 
regarded with terror, as possessing immense 
strength and ferocity, which they employed for 
the injury and annoyance of men. Some of them 
were supposed to combine the members of dif¬ 
ferent animals; such were the Sphinx and 
Chimaera; and to these all the terrible qualities of 
wild beasts were attributed, together with hu¬ 
man sagacity and faculties. Others, as the giants, 
differed from men chiefly in their size; and in 
this particular we must recognize a wide distinc¬ 
tion among them. The human giants, if so they 
may be called, such as the Cyclopes, Antaeus, 
Orion, and others, must be supposed not to be 
altogether disproportioned to human beings, for 
they mingled in love and strife with them. But 
the superhuman giants, who warred with the 
gods, were of vastly larger dimensions. Tityus, 
we are told, when stretched on the plain, covered 
nine acres, and Enceladus required the whole of 
Mount Aetna to be laid upon him to keep him 
down. 

We have already spoken of the war which the 
giants waged against the gods, and of its result. 
While this war lasted the giants proved a for¬ 
midable enemy. Some of them, like Briareus, had 
a hundred arms; others, likeTyphon, breathed out 
fire. At one time they put the gods to such fear 
that they fled into Egypt and hid themselves 
under various forms. Jupiter took the form of a 
ram, whence he was afterwards worshipped in 
Egypt as the god Ammon, with curved horns. 
Apollo became a crow, Bacchus a goat, Diana a 
cat, Juno a cow, Venus a fish, Mercury a bird. 
At another time the giants attempted to climb up 
into heaven, and for that purpose took up the 
mountain Ossa and piled it on Pelion. They 
were at last subdued by thunderbolts, which 
Minerva invented and taught Vulcan and his 
Cyclopes to make for Jupiter. 

Opposite: Giant. Goya. (Metropolitan Museum 
of Art, New York.) 

THE SPHINX 

Laius, King of Thebes, was warned by an oracle 
that there was danger to his throne and life if 
his newborn son should be suffered to grow up. 
He therefore committed the child to the care of 
a herdsman with orders to destroy him; but the 
herdsman, moved with pity, yet not daring en¬ 
tirely to disobey, tied up the child by the feet, 
and left him hanging to the branch of a tree. In 
this condition the infant was found by a peasant, 
who carried him to his master and mistress, by 
whom he was adopted and called Oedipus, or 
Swollen-foot. 

Many years afterwards Laius, being on his way 
to Delphi, accompanied only by one attendant, 
met in a narrow road a young man also driving 
in a chariot. On his refusal to leave the way at 
their command, the attendant killed one of his 
horses, and the stranger, filled with rage, slew 
both Laius and his attendant. The young man 
was Oedipus, who thus unknowingly became the 
slayer of his own father. 

Oedipus and the Sphinx. (From The Studio mag¬ 
azine.) 

Shortly after this event, the city of Thebes 
was afflicted with a monster which infested the 
high-road. It was called the Sphinx. It had the 
body of a lion, and the upper part of a woman. 
It lay crouched on the top of a rock and arrested 
all travellers who came that way, proposing to 
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The Sphinx and the Gods. Raoul du Gardier. 
(.Museum of Fine Arts, Orleans.) 

them a riddle, with the condition that those 
who could solve it should pass safe, but those 
who failed should be killed. Not one had yet 
succeeded in solving it, and all had been slain. 
Oedipus was not daunted by these alarming ac¬ 
counts, but boldly advanced to the trial. The 
Sphinx asked him, “What animal is that which in 
the morning goes on four feet, at noon on two, 
and in the evening upon three?” Oedipus replied, 
“Man, who in childhood creeps on hands and 
knees, in manhood walks erect, and in old age 
with the aid of a staff.” The Sphinx was so mor¬ 
tified at the solving of her riddle that she cast 
herself down from the rock and perished. 

The gratitude of the people for their deliver¬ 
ance was so great that they made Oedipus their 
king, giving him in marriage their queen Jocasta. 
Oedipus, ignorant of his parentage, had already 
become the slayer of his father; in marrying the 
queen he became the husband of his mother. 
These horrors remained undiscovered, till at 
length Thebes was afflicted with famine and 
pestilence, and the oracle being consulted, the 
double crime of Oedipus came to light. Jocasta 

put an end to her own life, and Oedipus, seized 
with madness, tore out his eyes, and wandered 
away from Thebes, dreaded and abandoned by 
all, except his daughters, who faithfully adhered 
to him; till after a tedious period of miserable 
wandering, he found the termination of his 
wretched life. 

PEGASUS AND THE CHIMAERA 

When Perseus cut off Medusa’s head, the blood 
sinking into the earth produced the winged horse 
Pegasus. Minerva caught and tamed him and pre¬ 
sented him to the Muses. The fountain Hippo- 
crene, on the Muses’ mountain Helicon, was 
opened by a kick from his hoof. 

The Chimaera was a fearful monster, breath¬ 
ing fire. The forepart of its body was a com¬ 
pound of the lion and the goat, and the hind part 
a dragon’s. It made great havoc in Lycia, so that 

V 

Opposite: Kiss of the Sphinx. Franz von Stuck. 
(.Museum of Fine Arts, Budapest.) 





The Chimera (of the Island of 
Sarah Bernhardt). George Cla- 
rin. (Galleria del Levante, Mi¬ 

lan.) 

the king Iobates sought for some hero to destroy 
it. At that time there arrived at his court a gallant 
young warrior whose name was Bellerophon. He 
brought letters from Proetus, the son-in-law of 
Iobates, recommending Bellerophon in the warm¬ 
est terms as an unconquerable hero, but added at 
the close a request to his father-in-law to put 
him to death. The reason was that Proetus was 
jealous of him, suspecting that his wife Antea 

looked with too much admiration on the young 
warrior. From this instance of Bellerophon being 
unconsciously the bearer of his own death-war¬ 
rant, the expression “Bellerophontic letters” arose, 
to describe any species of communication which 
a person is made-the bearer of, containing matter 

prejudicial to himself. 
Iobates, on perusing the letters, was puzzled 

what to do, not willing to violate the claims of 
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hospitality, yet wishing to oblige his son-in-law. 
A lucky thought occurred to him, to send 
Bellerophon to combat with the Chimaera. Bel- 
lerophon accepted the proposal, but before pro¬ 
ceeding to the combat consulted the soothsayer 
Polyidus, who advised him to procure if possible 
the horse Pegasus for the conflict. For this pur¬ 
pose he directed him to pass the night in the 
temple of Minerva. He did so, and as he slept 
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Minerva came to him and gave him a golden 
bridle. When he awoke the bridle remained in 
his hand. Minerva also showed him Pegasus drink¬ 
ing at the well of Pirene, and at sight of the 
bridle, the winged steed came willingly and suf¬ 
fered himself to be taken. Bellerophon mounted 
him, rose with him into the air, soon found the 
Chimaera, and gained an easy victory over the 
monster. 





Abov e'MeWtrophon Slays the Chimera. Walter Crane. 
('Courtesy Houghton Mifflin Co.) 

Opposite: Bellerophon on Pegasus. Walter Crane. 
(Courtesy Houghton Mifflin Co.) 
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After the conquest of the Chimaera, Beller- 
ophon was exposed to further trials and labors by 
his unfriendly host, but by the aid of Pegasus he 
triumphed in them all; till at length Iobates, see¬ 
ing that the hero was a special favorite of the 
gods, gave him his daughter in marriage and 
made him his successor on the throne. At last 
Bellerophon by his pride and presumption drew 
upon himself the anger of the gods; it is said he 
even attempted to fly up into heaven on his 
winged steed; but Jupiter sent a gadfly which 
stung Pegasus and made him throw his rider, 
who became lame and blind in consequence. 
After this Bellerophon wandered lonely through 

An earthly guest, and drawn empyreal air, 
(Thy tempering) with like safety guided down 
Return me to my native element; 
Lest from this flying steed unreined (as once 
Bellerophon, though from a lower sphere) 
Dismounted on the Aleian field I fall, 
Erroneous there to wander and forlorn. 

Young, in his Night Thoughts, speaking of the 

sceptic, says— 

He whose blind thought futurity denies, 
Unconscious bears, Bellerophon, like thee 
His own indictment; he condemns himself. 
Who reads his bosom reads immortal life, 

the Aleian fields, avoiding the paths of men, and 
died miserably. 

Milton alludes to Bellerophon in the beginning 
of the seventh book of Paradise Lost: 

Descend from Heaven, Urania, by that name 
If rightly thou art called, whose voice divine 
Following above the Olympian hill I soar, 
Above the flight of Pegasean wing. 

Upled by thee, 
Into the Heaven of Heavens I have presumed, 

Or nature there, imposing on her sons, 
Has written fables; man was made a lie. 

Vol. II, p. 12 

Pegasus, being the horse of the Muses, has al¬ 
ways been at the service of the poets. Schiller 
tells a pretty story of his having been sold by a 
needy poet and put to the cart and the plough. 
He was not fit for such service, and his clownish 
master could make nothing of him. But a youth 
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stepped forth and asked leave to try him. As 
soon as he was seated on his back, the horse, 
which had appeared at first vicious, and after¬ 
wards spirit-broken, rose kingly, a spirit, a god; 
unfolded the splendor of his wings and soared 
towards heaven. Our own poet Longfellow also 
records an adventure of this famous steed in his 
“Pegasus in Pound.” 

Shakespeare alludes to Pegasus in Henry IV, 
where Vernon describes Prince Henry: 

I saw young Harry, with his beaver on, 
His cuishes on his thighs, gallantly armed, 
Rise from the ground like feathered Mercury, 

ture with man’s as forming a very degraded com¬ 
pound, and accordingly the centaur is the only 
one of the fancied monsters of antiquity to which 
any good traits are assigned. The centaurs were 
admitted to the companionship of man, and at 
the marriage of Pirithous with Hippodamia, they 
were among the guests. At the feast, Eurytion, 
one of the centaurs, becoming intoxicated with 
the wine, atempted to offer violence to the bride; 
the other centaurs followed his example, and a 
dreadful conflict arose in which several of them 
were slain. This is the celebrated battle of the 
lapithae and centaurs, a favorite subject with the 
sculptors and poets of antiquity. 

And vaulted with such ease into his seat, 
As if an angel dropped down from the clouds, 
To turn and wind a fiery Pegasus, 
And witch the world with noble horsemanship. 

THE CENTAURS 

These monsters were represented as men from 
the head to the loins, while the remainder of the 
body was that of a horse. The ancients were too 
fond of a horse to consider the union of his na- 

Battle Between the Lapiths and Centaurs. 
Piero di Cosimo. (National Gallery, London.) 

But not all the centaurs were like the rude 
guests of Pirithous. Chiron was instructed by 
Apollo and Diana, and was renowned for his skill 
in hunting, medicine, music, and the art of 
prophecy. The most distinguished heroes of Gre¬ 
cian story were his pupils. Among the rest 
the infant Aesculapius was intrusted to his 



charge, by Apollo, his father. When the sage re¬ 
turned to his home bearing the infant, his daugh¬ 
ter Ocyroe came forth to meet him, and at sight 
of the child burst forth into a prophetic strain 
(for she was a prophetess), foretelling the glory 
that he was to achieve. Aesculapius when grown 
up became a renowned physician, and even in 
one instance succeeded in restoring the dead to 
life. Pluto resented this, and Jupiter, at his re¬ 
quest, struck the bold physician with lightning 
and killed him, but after his death received him 
into the number of the gods. 

Chiron was the wisest and justest of all the 
centaurs, and at his death Jupiter placed him 
among the stars as the constellation Sagittarius. 

THE PYGMIES 

The Pygmies were a nation of dwarfs, so called 
from a Greek word which means the cubit or 
measure of about thirteen inches, which was said 
to be the height of these people. They lived near 
the sources of the Nile, or according to others, 
in India. Homer tells us that the cranes used to 
migrate every winter to the Pygmies’ country, 
and their appearance was the signal of bloody 
warfare to the puny inhabitants, who had to take 
up arms to defend their cornfields against the 
rapacious strangers. The Pygmies and their en¬ 
emies the cranes form the subject of several 

works of art. 
Later writers tell of an army of Pygmies 

which, finding Hercules asleep, made prepara¬ 
tions to attack him, as if they were about to at¬ 
tack a city. But the hero, awaking, laughed at 
the little warriors, wrapped some of them up in 
his lion’s-skin, and carried them to Eurystheus. 

Milton uses the Pygmies for a simile, P.L. 
Book I: 

. . . like that Pygmaean race 
Beyond the Indian mount, or fairy elves 
Whose midnight revels by a forest side, 
Or fountain, some belated peasant sees, 
(Or dreams he sees) while overhead the moon 
Sits arbitress, and nearer to the earth 
Wheels her pale course; they on their mirth and 

dance 
Intent, with jocund music charm his ear. 
At once with joy and fear his heart rebounds. 

THE GRIFFIN, OR GRYPHON 

The griffin is a monster with the body of a lion, 
the head and wings of an eagle, and back covered 
with feathers. Like birds it builds its nest, and 

Apollo Riding a Griffin. Greek vase. (Museum 
of Fine Arts, Boston.) 

instead of an egg lays an agate therein. It has 
long claws and talons of such a size that the 
people of that country make them into drinking- 
cups. India was assigned as the native country 
of the griffins. They found gold in the moun¬ 
tains and built their nests of it, for which reason 
their nests were very tempting to the hunters 
and they were forced to keep vigilant guard over 
them. Their instinct led them to know where 
buried treasures lay, and they did their best to 
keep plunderers at a distance. The Arimaspians, 
among whom the griffins flourished, were a one- 
eyed people of Scythia. 

Milton borrows a simile from the griffins, P.L. 
Book II: 

As when a Gryphon through the wilderness, 
With winged course, o’er hill and moory dale, 
Pursues the Arimaspian who by stealth 
Hath from his wakeful custody purloined 
His guarded gold, 
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CHAPTER XVII 

THE GOLDEN FLEECE-MEDEA 

THE GOLDEN FLEECE 

In very ancient times there lived in Thessaly a 
king and queen named Athamas and Nephele. 
They had two children, a boy and a girl. After 
a time Athamas grew indifferent to his wife, put 
her away, and took another. Nephele suspected 
danger to her children from the influence of the 
stepmother and took measures to send them out 
of her reach. Mercury assisted her and gave her 
a ram, with a golden fleece, on which she set the 
two children, trusting that the ram would con¬ 
vey them to a place of safety. The ram vaulted 
into the air with the children on his back, taking 
his course to the east, till when crossing the strait 
that divides Europe and Asia, the girl, whose 
name was Helle, fell from his back into the sea, 
which from her was called the Hellespont— 
now the Dardanelles. The ram continued his 
career till he reached the kingdom of Colchis, on 
the eastern shore of the Black Sea, where he 
safely landed the boy Phryxus, who was hos¬ 
pitably received by Aeetes, the king of the coun¬ 
try. Phryxus sacrified the ram to Jupiter, and 
gave the golden fleece to Aeetes, who placed it in 
a consecrated grov£, under the care of a sleepless 
dragon. 

There was another kingdom in Thessaly near 
to that of Athamas and ruled over by a relative 
of his. The King Aeson, being tired of the cares 
of government, surrendered his crown to his 
brother Pelias, on condition that he should hold 
it only during the minority of Jason, the son of 
Aeson. When Jason was grown up and came to 
demand the crown from his uncle, Pelias pre¬ 
tended to be willing to yield it, but at the same 
time suggested to the young man the glorious 
adventure of going in quest of the golden fleece, 
which it was well known was in the kingdom of 
Colchis and was, as Pelias pretended, the rightful 
property of their family. Jason was pleased with 
the thought and forthwith made preparations for 
the expedition. At that time the only species of 
navigation known to the Greeks consisted of 
small boats or canoes hollowed out from trunks 
of trees, so that when Jason employed Argus to 
build him a vessel capable of containing fifty 
men, it was considered a gigantic undertaking. 

It was accomplished, however, and the vessel 
named Argo, from the name of the builder. Jason 
sent his invitation to all the adventurous young 
men of Greece and soon found himself at the 
head of a band of bold youths, many of whom 
afterwards were renowned among the heroes and 
demigods of Greece. Hercules, Theseus, Or¬ 
pheus, and Nestor were among them. They are 
called the Argonauts, from the name of their 
vessel. 

The Argo with her crew of heroes left the 
shores of Thessaly and, having touched at the 
Island of Lemnos, thence crossed to Mysia and 
thence to Thrace. Here they found the sage 
Phineus, and from him received instruction as to 
their future course. It seems the entrance of the 
Euxine Sea was impeded by two small rocky is¬ 
lands which floated on the surface and, in their 
tossings and heavings, occasionally came together, 
crushing and grinding to atoms any object that 
might be caught between them. They were called 
the Symplegades, or Clashing Islands. Phineus 
instructed the Argonauts how to pass this dan¬ 
gerous strait. When they reached the islands they 
let go a dove, which took her way between the 
rocks and passed in safety, only losing some 
feathers of her tail. Jason and his men seized the 
favorable moment of the rebound, plied their 
oars with vigor, and passed safe through, though 
the islands closed behind them and actually 
grazed their stern. They now rowed along the 
shore till they arrived at the eastern end of the 
sea, and landed at the kingdom of Colchis. 

Jason made known his message to the Colchian 
king, Aeetes, who consented to give up the 
golden fleece if Jason would yoke to the plough 
two fire-breathing bulls with brazen feet, and 
sow the teeth of the dragon, which Cadmus had 
slain, and from which it was well known that a 
crop of armed men-would spring up, who would 
turn their weapons against their producer. Jason 
accepted the conditions, and a time was set for 
making the experiment. Previously, however, he 
found means to plead his cause to Medea, daugh¬ 
ter of the king. He promised her marriage, and 
as they stood before the altar of Hecate, called 
the goddess to witness his oath. Medea yielded— 
and by her aid, for she was a potent sorceress, he 
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was furnished with a charm, by which he could 
encounter safely the breath of the fire-breathing 
bulls and the weapons of the armed men. 

At the time appointed, the people assembled at 
the grove of Mars, and the king assumed his 
royal seat, while the multitude covered the hill¬ 
sides. The brazen-footed bulls rushed in, breath¬ 
ing fire from their nostrils, that burned up the 
herbage as they passed. The sound was like the 
roar of a furnace, and the smoke like that of 

water upon quicklime. Jason advanced boldly to 
meet them. His friends, the chosen heroes of 
Greece, trembled to behold him. Regardless of 
the burning breath, he soothed their rage with 
his voice, patted their necks with fearless hand, 
and adroitly slipped over them the yoke, and 
compelled them to drag the plough. The Col- 
chians were amazed; the Greeks shouted for joy. 
Jason next proceeded to sow the dragon s teeth 
and plough them in. And soon the crop of armed 
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Scenes from the Stories of the Argonauts. Biagio di Antonio. 
(.Metropolitan Museum of Art, New York.) 

men sprang up, and wonderful to relate! no 
sooner had they reached the surface than they 
began to brandish their weapons and rush upon 
Jason. The Greeks trembled for their hero, and 
even she who had provided him a way of safety 
and taught him how to use it, Medea herself, 
grew pale with fear. Jason for a time kept his 
assailants at bay with his sword and shield, till 
finding their numbers overwhelming, he resorted 
to the charm which Medea had taught him, 

seized a stone, and threw it in the midst of his 
foes. They immediately turned their arms against 
one another, and soon there was not one of the 
dragon’s brood left alive. The Greeks embraced 
their hero, and Medea, if she dared, would have 
embraced him, too. 

It remained to lull to sleep the dragon that 
guarded the fleece, and this was done by scatter¬ 
ing over him a few drops of a preparation, which 
Medea had supplied. At the smell he relaxed his 
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The Landing of the Argo. Parentino. (Museo Civico, Padua.) 
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The Argonauts. Greek vase. (Louvre, Paris.) 

y 

Jason Takes the Golden Fleece. From a Greek 
vase. (Metropolitan Museum of Art, New York.) 
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rage, stood for a moment motionless, then shut 
those great round eyes, that had never been 
known to shut before, and turned over on his 
side, fast asleep. Jason seized the fleece and, with 
his friends and Medea accompanying, hastened to 
their vessel, before Aeetes, the king, could arrest 
their departure, and made the best of their way 
back to Thessaly, where they arrived safe, and 
Jason delivered the fleece to Pelias, and dedicated 
the Argo to Neptune. What became of the fleece 
afterwards we do not know, but perhaps it was 
found after all, like many other golden prizes, 
not worth the trouble it had cost to procure it. 

Hylas and the Water Nymphs. John Gibson. 
(Tate Gallery, London.) 

This is one of those mythological tales, says a 
late writer, in which there is reason to believe 
that a substratum of truth exists, though over¬ 
laid by a mass of fiction. It probably was the 
first important maritime expedition, and like the 
first attempts of the kind of all nations, as we 
know from history, was probably of a half- 
piratical character. If rich spoils were the result, 
it was enough to give rise to the idea of the 

golden fleece. 
Another suggestion of a learned mythologist, 

Bryant, is that it is a corrupt tradition of the 
story of Noah and the ark. The name Argo seems 
to countenance this, and the incident of the dove 
is another confirmation. 

Pope, in his “Ode on St. Cecilia’s Day,” thus 
celebrates the launching of the ship Argo and the 
power of the music of Orpheus, whom he calls 
the Thracian: 

So when the first bold vessel dared the seas, 
High on the stern the Thracian raised his strain, 

While Argo saw her kindred trees 
Descend from Pelion to the main. 

Transported demigods stood round, 
And men grew heroes at the sound. 

In Dyer’s poem of “The Fleece” there is an 
account of the ship Argo and her crew, which 
gives a good picture of this primitive maritime 
adventure: 

From every region of Aegea’s shore 
The brave assembled; those illustrious twins 
Castor and Pollux; Orpheus, tuneful bard; 
Zetes and Calais, as the wind in speed; 
Strong Hercules and many a chief renowned. 
On deep Iolcos’ sandy shore they thronged, 
Gleaming in armor, ardent of exploits; 
And soon, the laurel cord and the huge stone 
Uplifting to the deck unmoored the bark; 
Whose keel of wondrous length the skilful hand 
Of Argus fashioned for the proud attempt; 
And in the extended keel a lofty mast 
Upraised, and sails full swelling; to the chiefs 
Unwonted objects. Now first, now they learned 
Their bolder steerage over ocean wave, 
Led by the golden stars, as Chiron’s art 
Had marked the sphere celestial, 

&c. 

Hercules left the expedition at Mysia, for 
Hylas, a youth beloved by him, having gone for 
water, was laid hold of and kept by the nymphs 

Opposite: Medea. Frederick Satidys. (Birming¬ 
ham, City Museum and Art Gallery.) 





of the spring, who were fascinated by his beauty. 
Hercules went in quest of the lad, and while he 
was absent the Argo put to sea and left him. 
Moore, in one of his songs, makes a beautiful al¬ 

lusion to this incident: 

When Hylas was sent with his urn to the fount, 
Through fields full of light and with heart full of 

play, 
Light rambled the boy over meadow and mount, 

And neglected his task for the flowers in the way. 

Thus many like me, who in youth should have tasted 
The fountain that runs by Philosophy’s shrine, 

Their time with the flowers on the margin have 
wasted, 

And left their light urns all as empty as mine. 

MEDEA AND AESON 

Amid the rejoicings for the recovery of the 
Golden Fleece, Jason felt that one thing was 
wanting, the presence of Aeson, his father, who 
was prevented by his age and infirmities from 
taking part in them. Jason said to Medea, uMy 
spouse, would that your arts, whose power I 
have seen so mighty for my aid, could do me 
one further service, take some years from my life 
and add them to my father’s.” Medea replied, 
“Not at such a cost shall it be done, but if my art 
avails me, his life shall be lengthened without 
abridging yours.” The next full moon she issued 
forth alone, while all creatures slept; not a breath 
stirred the foliage, and all was still. To the stars 
she addressed her incantations, and to the moon; 
to Hecate,* the goddess of the underworld, and 
to Tellus the goddess of the earth, by whose 
power plants potent for enchantments are pro¬ 
duced. She invoked the gods of the woods and 
caverns, of mountains and valleys, of lakes and 
rivers, of winds and vapors. While she spoke the 
stars shone brighter, and presently a chariot de¬ 
scended through the air, drawn by flying ser¬ 
pents. She ascended it and, borne aloft, made 
her way to distant regions, where potent plants 
grew which she knew how to select for her pur¬ 
pose. Nine nights she employed in her search, 
and during that time came not within the doors 

* Hecate was a mysterious divinity sometimes 
identified with Diana and sometimes with Pro¬ 
serpine. As Diana represents the moonlight splendor 
of night, so Hecate represents its darkness and ter¬ 
rors. She was the goddess of sorcery and witchcraft, 
and was believed to wander by night along the 
earth seen only by the dogs, whose barking told her 
approach. 

of her palace nor under any roof, and shunned 
all intercourse with mortals. 

She next erected two altars, the one to Hecate, 
the other to Hebe, the goddess of youth, and sac¬ 
rificed a black sheep, pouring libations of milk 
and wine. She implored Pluto and his stolen 
bride that they would not hasten to take the old 
man’s life. Then she directed that Aeson should 
be led forth, and having thrown him into a deep 
sleep by a charm, had him laid on a bed of herbs, 
like one dead. Jason and all others were kept 
away from the place, that no profane eyes might 
look upon her mysteries. Then, with streaming 
hair, she thrice moved round the altars, dipped 
flaming twigs in the blood, and laid them thereon 
to burn. Meanwhile the caldron with its contents 
was got ready. In it she put magic herbs, with 
seeds and flowers of acrid juice, stones from the 
distant east, and sand from the shore of all-sur¬ 
rounding ocean; hoar frost, gathered by moon¬ 
light, a screech owl’s head and wings, and the 
entrails of a wolf. She added fragments of the 
shells of tortoises, and the liver of stags—animals 
tenacious of life—and the head and beak of a 
crow, that outlives nine generations of men. 
These, with many other things “without a 
name,” she boiled together for her purposed 
work, stirring them up with a dry olive branch; 
and behold! the branch when taken out instantly 
became green, and before long was covered with 
leaves and a plentiful growth of young olives*, 
and as the liquor boiled and bubbled, and some¬ 
times ran over, the grass wherever the sprinklings 
fell shot forth with a verdure like that of spring. 

Seeing that all was ready, Medea cut the throat 
of the old man and let out all his blood, and 
poured into his mouth and into his wound the 
juices of her caldron. As soon as he had com-’ 
pletely imbibed them, his hair and beard laid by 
their whiteness and assumed the blackness of 
youth; his paleness and emaciation were gone; 
his veins were full of blood, his limbs of vigor 
and robustness. Aeson is amazed at himself, and 
remembers that such as he now is, he was in his 
youthful days, forty years before. 

Medea used her arts here for a good purpose, 
but not so in another instance where she made 
them the instruments of revenge. Pelias, our read¬ 
ers will recollect, was the usurping uncle of 
Jason, and had kept him out of his kingdom. Yet 
he must have had some good qualities, for his 
daughters loved him, and when they saw what 
Medea had done for Aeson, they wished her to 
do the same for their father. Medea pretended to 
consent and prepared her caldron as before. At 



her request an old sheep was brought and 
plunged into the caldron. Very soon a bleating 
was heard in the kettle, and when the cover was 
removed, a lamb jumped forth and ran frisking 
away into the meadow. The daughters of Pelias 
saw the experiment with delight, and appointed 
a time for their father to undergo the same op¬ 
eration. But Medea prepared her caldron for him 
in a very different way. She put in only water 
and a few simple herbs. In the night she with the 
sisters entered the bed chamber of the old king, 
while he and his guards slept soundly under the 
influence of a spell cast upon them by Medea. 
The daughters stood by the bedside with their 
weapons drawn, but hesitated to strike, till 
Medea chid their irresolution. Then, turning 
away their faces, and giving random blows, they 
smote him with their weapons. He, starting from 
his sleep, cried out, “My daughters, what are you 
doing? Will you kill your father?” Their hearts 
failed them, and the weapons fell from their 
hands, but Medea struck him a fatal blow and 
prevented his saying more. 

Then they placed him in the caldron, and 
Medea hastened to depart in her serpent-drawn 
chariot before they discovered her treachery, or 
their vengeance would have been terrible. She 
escaped, however, but had little enjoyment of the 
fruits of her crime. Jason, for whom she had 
done so much, wishing to marry Creusa, Princess 
of Corinth, put away Medea. She, enraged at his 
ingratitude, called on the gods for vengeance, 
sent a poisoned robe as a gift to the bride, and 
then killing her own children and setting fire to 
the palace, mounted her serpent-drawn chariot 
and fled to Athens, where she married King 
Aegeus, the father of Theseus, and we shall meet 
her again when we come to the adventures of 
that hero. 

The incantations of Medea will remind the 
reader of those of the witches in Macbeth. The 
following lines are those which seem most strik¬ 
ingly to recall the ancient model: 

Round about the caldron go; 
In the poisoned entrails throw. 

####### 

Fillet of a fenny snake 
In the caldron boil and bake; 
Eye of newt and toe of frog, 
Wool of bat and tongue of dog. 
Adder’s fork and blind-worm’s sting, 
Lizard’s leg and howlet’s wing: 

Medea. From a Greek vase. (Louvre, Paris.) 

Maw of ravening salt-sea shark, 
Root of hemlock digged in the dark, 

&c. Macbeth, Act IV, Scene I 

And again: 

Macbeth—What is’t you do? 
Witches— A deed without a name. 

There is another story of Medea almost too re¬ 
volting for record even of a sorceress, a class of 
persons to whom both ancient and modern poets 
have been accustomed to attribute every degree 
of atrocity. In her flight from Colchis she had 
taken her young brother Absyrtus with her. 
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Finding the pursuing vessels of Aeetes gaining 
upon the Argonauts, she caused the lad to be 
killed and his limbs to be strewn over the sea. 
Aeetes on reaching the place found these sorrow¬ 
ful traces of his murdered son; but while he 
tarried to collect the scattered fragments and be¬ 
stow upon them an honorable interment, the Ar¬ 
gonauts escaped. 

In the poems of Campbell will be found a 

translation of one of the choruses of the tragedy 
of Medea, where the poet Euripides has taken 
advantage of the occasion to pay a glowing trib¬ 
ute to Athens, his native city. It begins thus: 

O haggard queen! to Athens dost thou guide 
Thy glowing chariot, steeped in kindred gore; 

Or seek to hide thy damned parricide 
Where Peace and Justice dwell for evermore? 

Medea Fleeing in a Snake-draw n Chariot. 
From a Greek vase. (.Antiquarium, Policoro.) 



CHAPTER XVIII 

MELEAGER AND ATALANTA 

One of the heroes of the Argonautic expedition 
was Meleager, son of Oeneus and Althea, King 
and Queen of Calydon. Althea, when her son was 
born, beheld the three Destinies, who, as they 
spun their fatal thread, foretold that the life of 
the child should last no longer than a brand then 
burning upon the hearth. Althea seized and 
quenched the brand and carefully preserved it 
for years, while Meleager grew to boyhood, 
youth, and manhood. It chanced, then, that 
Oeneus, as he offered sacrifices to the gods, 
omitted to pay due honors to Diana; and she, in¬ 
dignant at the neglect, sent a wild boar of enor¬ 
mous size to lay waste the fields of Calydon. Its 
eyes shone with blood and fire, its bristles stood 
like threatening spears, its tusks were like those 
of Indian elephants. The growing corn was 
trampled, the vines and olive trees laid waste, the 
flocks and herds were driven in wild confusion 
by the slaughtering foe. All common aid seemed 
vain; but Meleager called on the heroes of Greece 
to join in a bold hunt for the ravenous monster. 
Theseus and his friend Pirithous, Jason, Peleus 
afterwards the father of Achilles, Telamon the 
father of Ajax, Nestor, then a youth, but who in 
his age bore arms with Achilles and Ajax in the 
Trojan war—these and many more joined in the 
enterprise. WithThem came Atalanta, the daugh¬ 
ter of Iasius, King of Arcadia. A buckle of pol¬ 
ished gold confined her vest, an ivory quiver 
hung on her left shoulder, and her left hand bore 
the bow. Her face blent feminine beauty with 
the best graces of martial youth. Meleager saw 
and loved. 

But now already they were near the monster’s 
lair. They stretched strong nets from tree to 
tree; they uncoupled their dogs, they tried to 
find the footprints of their quarry in the grass. 
From the wood was a descent to marshy ground. 
Here the boar, as he lay among the reeds, heard 
the shouts of his pursuers and rushed forth 
against them. One and another is thrown down 
and slain. Jason throws his spear, with a prayer to 
Diana for success; and the favoring goddess al¬ 
lows the weapon to touch, but not to wound, re¬ 
moving the steel point of the spear even in its 
flight. Nestor, assailed, seeks and finds safety in 
the branches of a tree. Telamon rushes on, but 
stumbling at a projecting root, falls prone. But an 
arrow from Atalanta at length for the first time 

tastes the monster’s blood. It is a slight wound, 
but Meleager sees and joyfully proclaims it. An- 
ceus, excited to envy by the praise given to a 
female, loudly proclaims his own valor and defies 
alike the boar and the goddess who had sent it; 
but as he rushes on, the infuriated beast lays him 
low with a mortal wound. Theseus throws his 
lance, but it is turned aside by a projecting 
bough. The dart of Jason misses its object and 
kills instead one of their own dogs. But Meleager, 
after one unsuccessful stroke, drives his spear 
into the monster’s side, then rushes on and des¬ 
patches him with repeated blows. 

Then rose a shout from those around; they 
congratulated the conqueror, crowding to touch 
his hand. He, placing his foot upon the head of 
the slain boar, turned to Atalanta, and bestowed 
on her the head and the rough hide which were 
the trophies of his success. But at this, envy ex¬ 
cited the rest to strife. Plexippus and Toxeus, the 
brothers of Meleager’s mother, beyond the rest 
opposed the gift and snatched from the maiden 
the trophy she had received. Meleager, kindling 
with rage at the wrong done to himself, and still 
more at the insult offered to her whom he loved, 
forgot the claims of kindred and plunged his 
sword into the offenders’ hearts. 

As Althea bore gifts of thankfulness to the 
temples for the victory of her son, the bodies of 
her murdered brothers met her sight. She shrieks, 
and beats her breast, and hastens to change the 
garments of rejoicing for those of mourning. But 
when the author of the deed is known, grief 
gives way to the stern desire of vengeance on her 
son. The fatal brand, which once she rescued 
from the flames, the brand which the Destinies 
had linked with Meleager’s life, she brings forth 
and commands a fire to be prepared. Then four 
times she essays to place the brand upon the pile; 
four times draws back, shuddering at the thought 
of bringing destruction on her son. The feelings 
of the mother and the sister contend within her. 
Now she is pale at the thought of the purposed 
deed, now flushed again with anger at the act of 
her son. As a vessel, driven in one direction by 
the wind and in the opposite by the tide, the 
mind of Althea hangs suspended in uncertainty. 
But now the sister prevails above the mother, and 
she begins as she holds the fatal wood: “Turn, ye 
Furies, goddesses of punishment! Turn to behold 



the sacrifice I bring! Crime must atone for crime. 
Shall Oeneus rejoice in his victor son, while the 
house of Thestius is desolate? But, alas! to what 

Meleager. (National Archaeological Museum, 

Athens.) 

deed am I borne along? Brothers, forgive a 
mother’s weakness! My hand fails me. He de¬ 
serves death, but not that I should destroy him. 
But shall he then live, and triumph, and reign 
over Calydon, while you, my brothers, wander 
unavenged among the shades? No! Thou hast 
lived by my gift; die, now, for thine own crime. 
Return the life which twice I gave thee, first at 
thy birth, again when I snatched this brand from 
the flames. Oh, that thou hadst then died! Alas! 
Evil is the conquest; but, brothers, ye have con¬ 
quered.” And, turning away her face, she threw 
the fatal wood upon the burning pile. 

It gave, or seemed to give, a deadly groan. Me¬ 
leager, absent and unknowing of the cause, felt a 
sudden pang. He burns, and only by courageous 
pride conquers the pain which destroys him. He 
mourns only that he perishes by a bloodless and 
unhonored death. With his last breath he calls 
upon his aged father, his brother, and his fond 
sisters, upon his beloved Atalanta, and upon his 
mother, the unknown cause of his fate. The 
flames increase, and with them the pain of the 
hero. Now both subside; now both are quenched. 
The brand is ashes, and the life of Meleager is 
breathed forth to the wandering winds. 

Althea, when the deed was done, laid violent 
hands upon herself. The sisters of Meleager 

mourned their brother with uncontrollable grief; 
till Diana, pitying the sorrows of the house that 
once had aroused her anger, turned them into 

birds. 

ATALANTA 
* \ > s ' \ 

The innocent cause of so much sorrow was a 
maiden whose face you might truly say was boy¬ 
ish for a girl, yet too girlish for a boy. Her for¬ 
tune had been told, and it was to this effect: 
“Atalanta, do not marry; marriage will be your 
ruin.” Terrified by this oracle, she fled the so¬ 
ciety of men and devoted herself to the sports of 
the chase. To all suitors (for she had many) she 
imposed a condition which was generally effec¬ 
tual in relieving her of their persecutions—“I will 
be the prize of him who shall conquer me in the 
race; but death must be the penalty of all who 
try and fail.” In spite of this hard condition some 
would try. Hippomenes was to be judge of the 
race. “Can it be possible that any will be so rash 
as to risk so much for a wife?” said he. But when 
he saw her lay aside her robe for the race, he 
changed his mind, and said, “Pardon me, youths, 
I knew not the prize you were competing for.” 
As he surveyed them he wished them all to be 
beaten, and swelled with envy of any one that 
seemed at all likely to win. While such were his 
thoughts, the virgin darted forward. As she ran 
she looked more beautiful than ever. The breezes 
seemed to give wings to her feet; her hair flew 
over her shoulders, and the gay fringe of her 
garment fluttered behind her. A ruddy hue 
tinged the whiteness of her skin, such as a crim¬ 
son curtain casts on a marble wall. All her com¬ 
petitors were distanced, and were put to death 
without mercy. Hippomenes, not daunted by this 
result, fixing his eyes on the virgin, said, “Why 
boast of beating those laggards? I offer myself 
for the contest.” Atalanta looked at him with a 
pitying countenance, and hardly knew whether 
she would rather conquer him or not. “What god 
can tempt one so young and handsome to throw 
himself away? I pity him, not for his beauty (yet 
he is beautiful), but for his youth. I wish he 
would give up the race, or if he will be so mad, 
I hope he may outrun me.” While she hesitates, 
revolving these thoughts, the spectators grow 
impatient for the race, and her father prompts 
her to prepare. Then Hippomenes addressed a 
prayer to Venus: “Help me, Venus, for you have 

Opposite: The Boar Hunt: Jason Throws His 
Spear. N. C. Wyeth. (Courtesy Houghton Mif¬ 
flin Co.) 
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led me on.” Venus heard, and was propitious. 
In the garden of her temple, in her own island 

of Cyprus, is a tree with yellow leaves and yel¬ 
low branches, and golden fruit. Hence she 
gathered three golden apples, and, unseen by any 
one else, gave them to Hippomenes and told him 
how to use them. The signal is given; each starts 
from the goal and skims over the sand. So light 
their tread, you would almost have thought they 
might run over the river surface or over the wav¬ 
ing grain without sinking. The cries of the spec¬ 
tators cheered Hippomenes—“Now, now do your 
best! Haste, haste! You gain on her! Relax not! 
One more effort!” It was doubtful whether the 
youth or the maiden heard these cries with the 
greater pleasure. But his breath began to fail him, 
his throat was dry, the goal yet far off. At that 
moment he threw down one of the golden ap¬ 
ples. The virgin was all amazement. She stopped 
to pick it up. Hippomenes shot ahead. Shouts 
burst forth from all sides. She redoubled her ef¬ 
forts and soon overtook him. Again he threw an 
apple. She stopped again, but again came up with 
him. The goal was near; one chance only re¬ 
mained. “Now, goddess,” said he, “prosper your 
gift!” and threw the last apple off at one side. 
She looked at it and hesitated; Venus impelled 
her to turn aside for it. She did so, and was van¬ 
quished. The youth carried off his prize. 

But the lovers were so full of their own happi¬ 
ness that they forgot to pay due honor to Venus; 
and the goddess was provoked at their ingrati¬ 
tude. She caused them to give offence to Cybele. 
That powerful goddess was not to be insulted 
with impunity. She took from them their human 

form and turned them into animals of characters 
resembling their own: of the huntress-heroine, 
triumphing in the blood of her lovers, she made 
a lioness, and of her lord and master a lion, and 
yoked them to her car, where they are still to be 
seen in all representations, in statuary or painting, 

of the goddess Cybele. 
Cybele is the Latin name of the goddess called 

by the Greeks Rhea and Ops. She was the wife of 
Cronos and mother of Zeus. In works of art, she 
exhibits the matronly air which distinguishes 
Juno and Ceres. Sometimes she is veiled and 
seated on a throne with lions at her side, at other 
times riding in a chariot drawn by lions. She 
wears a mural crown, that is, a crown whose rim 
is carved in the form of towers and battlements. 
Her priests were called Corybantes. 

Byron, in describing the city of Venice, which 
is built on a low island in the Adriatic Sea, bor¬ 
rows an illustration from Cybele: 

She looks a sea-Cybele fresh from ocean, 
Rising with her tiara of proud towers 
At airy distance, with majestic motion, 
A ruler of the waters and their powers. 

Childe Harold, IV 

In Moore’s Rhymes on the Road, the poet, 
speaking of Alpine scenery, alludes to the story 
of Atalanta and Hippomenes, thus: 

Even here, in his region of wonders, I find 
That light-footed Fancy leaves Truth far behind, 
Or at least, like Hippomenes, turns her astray 
By the golden illusions he flings in her way. 
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CHAPTER XIX 

HERCULES-HEBE AND GANYMEDE 

Hercules and Pallas Athene. From a Greek vase. 
(Antikens ammlwi gen, Munich.) 

HERCULES 
< 

Hercules was the son of Jupiter and Alcmena. As 
Juno was always hostile to the offspring of her 
husband by mortal mothers, she declared war 
against Hercules from his birth. She sent two 
serpents to destroy him as he lay in his cradle, 
but the precocious infant strangled them with 
his own hands. He was, however, by the arts of 
Juno rendered subject to Eurystheus and com¬ 
pelled to perform all his commands. Eurystheus 
enjoined upon him a succession of desperate ad¬ 
ventures, which are called the twelve “Labors of 

Hercules.” The first was the fight with the Ne- 
mean lion. The valley of Nemea was infested by 
a terrible lion. Eurystheus ordered Hercules to 
bring him the skin of this monster. After using 
in vain his club and arrows against the lion, Her¬ 
cules strangled the animal with his hands. He re¬ 
turned carrying the dead lion on his shoulders; 
but Eurystheus was so frightened at the sight of 
it and at this proof of the prodigious strength of 
of the hero, that he ordered him to deliver the 
account of his exploits in future outside the town. 

His next labor was the slaughter of the Hydra. 
This monster ravaged the country of Argos, and 





dwelt in a swamp near the well of Amymone. 
This well had been discovered by Amymone 
when the country was suffering from drought, 
and the story was that Neptune, who loved her, 
had permitted her to touch the rock with his 
trident, and a spring of three outlets burst forth. 
Here the Hydra took up his position, and Her¬ 
cules was sent to destroy him. The Hydra had 
nine heads, of which the middle one was immor¬ 
tal. Hercules struck off its heads with his club, 
but in the place of the head knocked off, two 
new ones grew forth each time. At length with 
the asistance of his faithful servant Iolaus, he 
burned away the heads of the Hydra and buried 
the ninth or immortal one under a huge rock. 

Another labor was the cleaning of the Augean 
stables. Augeas, King of Elis, had a herd of 
three thousand oxen, whose stalls had not been 
cleansed for thirty years. Hercules brought the 
rivers Alpheus and Peneus through them and 
cleansed them thoroughly in one day. 

His next labor was of a more delicate kind. 
Admeta, the daughter of Eurystheus, longed to 
obtain the girdle of the queen of the Amazons, 
and Eurystheus ordered Hercules to go and get 
it. The Amazons were a nation of women. They 
were very warlike and held several flourishing 
cities. It was their custom to bring up only the 
female children; the boys were either sent away 
to the neighboring nations or put to death. Her¬ 
cules was accompanied by a number of volun¬ 
teers, and after various adventures at last reached 
the country of the Amazons. Hippolyta, the 
queen, received him kindly, and consented to 
yield him her girdle, but Juno, taking the form 
of an Amazon, went and persuaded the rest that 
the strangers were carrying off their queen. They 
instantly armed and came in great numbers down 
to the ship. Hercules, thinking that Hippolyta 
had acted treacherously, slew her and, taking 
her girdle, made sail homewards. 

Another task enjoined him was to bring to 
Eurystheus the oxen of Geryon, a monster with 
three bodies, who dwelt in the island Erytheia 
(the red), so called because it lay at the west, 
under the rays of the setting sun. This descrip¬ 
tion is thought to apply to Spain, of which 
Geryon was king. After traversing various coun¬ 
tries, Hercules reached at length the frontiers of 
Libya and Europe, where he raised the two 
mountains of Calpe and Abyla, as monuments of 
his progress, or according to another account 

Opposite: Hercules and the Hydra. Gustave Mo¬ 
reau. (Private collection.) 
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rent one mountain into two and left half on each 
side, forming the Strait of Gibraltar, the two 
mountains being called the Pillars of Hercules. 
The oxen were guarded by the giant Eurytion 
and his two-headed dog, but Hercules killed the 
giant and his dog and brought away the oxen in 
safety to Eurystheus. 

The most difficult labor of all was getting the 
golden apples of the Hesperides, for Hercules did 
not know where to find them. These were the 
apples which Juno had received at her wedding 
from the goddess of the Earth, and which she 
had intrusted to the keeping of the daughters of 

Hercules and the Hydra. Antonio Pollaiuolo. 
(Uffizi Gallery, Florence.) 

Overleaf: In the Garden of the Hesperides: The 
Goddess of Discord Choosing the Apple of Con¬ 
tention. J. M. W. Turner. (Tate Gallery, Lon¬ 
don.) 







Hesperus, assisted by a watchful dragon. After 
various adventures Hercules arrived at Mount 
Atlas in Africa. Atlas was one of the Titans who 
had warred against the gods, and after they were 
subdued, Atlas was condemned to bear on his 
shoulders the weight of the heavens. He was the 
father of the Hesperides and, Hercules thought, 
might, if anyone could, find the apples and 
bring them to him. But how to send Atlas away 
from his post, or bear up the heavens while he 
was gone? Hercules took the burden on his own 
shoulders and sent Atlas to seek the apples. He 
returned with them and, though somewhat re¬ 
luctantly, took his burden upon his shoulders 
again and let Hercules return with the apples to 

Eurystheus. 

Hercules Overcoming the Amazon. Greek. (Na¬ 
tional Museum, Palermo.) 

Milton in his Comus makes the Hesperides the 
daughters of Hesperus and nieces of Atlas: 

. . . amidst the gardens fair 
Of Hesperus and his daughters three, 
That sing about the golden tree. 

The poets, led by the analogy of the lovely ap¬ 
pearance of the western sky at sunset, viewed the 

west as a region of brightness and glory. Hence 
they placed in it the Isles of the blest, the ruddy 
isle Erytheia, on which the bright oxen of Ger- 
yon were pastured, and the isle of the Hesperides. 
The apples are supposed by some to be the 
oranges of Spain, of which the Greeks had heard 

some obscure accounts. 
A celebrated exploit of Hercules was his vic¬ 

tory over Antaeus. Antaeus, the son of Terra, 
the Earth, was a mighty giant and wrestler whose 
strength was invincible so long as he remained in 
contact with his mother Earth. He compelled all 
strangers who came to his country to wrestle 
with him, on condition that if conquered (as 
they all were) they should be put to death. Her¬ 
cules encountered him, and finding that it was of 
no avail to throw him, for he always rose with 
renewed strength from every fall, he lifted him 
up from the earth and strangled him in the air. 

Cacus was a huge giant who inhabited a cave 
on Mount Aventine and plundered the surround¬ 
ing country. When Hercules was driving home 
the oxen of Geryon, Cacus stole part of the cat¬ 
tle while the hero slept. That their footprints 
might not serve to show where they had been 
driven, he dragged them backward by their tails 
to his cave; so their tracks all seemed to show 
that they had gone in the opposite direction. Her¬ 
cules was deceived by this stratagem, and would 
have failed to find his oxen if it had not hap¬ 
pened that in driving the remainder of the herd 
past the cave where the stolen ones were con¬ 
cealed, those within began to low, and were thus 
discovered. Cacus was slain by Hercules. 

The last exploit we shall record was bringing 
Cerberus from the lower world. Hercules de¬ 
scended into Hades, accompanied by Mercury 
and Minerva. He obtained permission from Pluto 
to carry Cerberus to the upper air provided he 
could do it without the use of weapons; and in 
spite of the monster’s struggling, he seized him, 
held him fast, and carried him to Eurystheus, and 
afterwards brought him back again. When he 
was in Hades he obtained the liberty of Theseus, 
his admirer and imitator, who had been detained 
a prisoner there for an unsuccessful attempt to 
carry off Proserpine. 

Hercules in a fit of madness killed his friend 
Iphitus, and was condemned for this offence to 

Opposite: Hercules and Antaeus. Tintoretto. 
(Wadsvoorth'Atheneum, Hartford.) 

Overleaf: Cerberus. William Blake. (Tate Gal¬ 
lery, London.) 
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become the slave of Queen Omphale for three 
years. While in this service the hero’s nature 
seemed changed. He lived effeminately, wearing 
at times the dress of a woman, and spinning wool 
with the handmaidens of Omphale, while the 
queen wore his lion’s skin. Wken this service was 
ended he married Dejanira and lived in peace 
with her three years. On one occasion as he was 
travelling with his wife, they came to a river, 
across which the Centaur Nessus carried travel¬ 
lers for a stated fee. Hercules himself forded the 
river, but gave Dejanira to Nessus to be carried 
across. Nessus attempted to run away with her, 
but Hercules heard her cries and shot an arrow 
into the heart of Nessus. The dying Centaur told 
Dejanira to take a portion of his blood and keep 
it, as it might be used as a charm to preserve the 
love of her husband. 

Dejanira did so and before long fancied she 
had occasion to use it. Hercules in one of his 
conquests had taken prisoner a fair maiden, 
named Iole, of whom he seemed more fond than 
Dejanira approved. When Hercules was about to 
offer sacrifices to the gods in honor of his vic¬ 
tory, he sent to his wife for a white robe to use 
on the occasion. Dejanira, thinking it a good op¬ 
portunity to try her love-spell, steeped the gar¬ 
ment in the blood of Nessus. We are to sup¬ 
pose she took care to wash out all traces of it, but 
the magic power remained, and as soon as the 
garment became warm on the body of Hercules, 
the poison penetrated into all his limbs and 
caused him the most intense agony. In his frenzy 
he seized Lichas, who had brought him the fatal 
robe, and hurled him into the sea. He wrenched 
off the garment, but it stuck to his flesh, and with 
it he tore away whole pieces of his body. In this 
state he embarked on board a ship and was con¬ 
veyed home. Dejanira, on seeing what she had 
unwittingly done, hung herself. Hercules, pre¬ 
pared to die, ascended Mount Oeta, where he 
built a funeral pile of trees, gave his bow and 
arrows to Philoctetes, and laid himself down on 
the pile, his head resting on his club, and his lion’s 
skin spread over him. With a countenance as 
serene as if he were taking his place at a festal 
board, he commanded Philoctetes to apply the 
torch. The flames spread apace and soon invested 
the whole mass. 

Milton thus alludes to the frenzy of Hercules: 

As when Alcides,* from Oechalia crowned 
With conquest, felt the envenomed robe, and tore, 

* Alcides, a name of Hercules. 
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Hercules and Nessus: The Rape of Dejanira. 
Antonio Pollaiuolo. (Yale University, New Haven.) 
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Through pain, up by the roots Thessalian pines 
And Lichas from the top of Oeta threw 
Into the Euboic Sea. 

The gods themselves felt troubled at seeing the 
champion of the earth so brought to his end. But 
Jupiter with cheerful countenance thus addressed 
them: “I am pleased to see your concern, my 
princes, and am gratified to perceive that I am 
the ruler of a loyal people and that my son en¬ 
joys your favor. For although your interest in 
him arises from his noble deeds, yet it is not the 
less gratifying to me. But now I say to you, Fear 
not. Fie who conquered all else is not to be con¬ 
quered by those flames which you see blazing 
on Mount Oeta. Only his mother’s share in him 
can perish; what he derived from me is immortal. 
I shall take him, dead to earth, to the heavenly 
shores, and I require of you all to receive him 
kindly. If any of you feel grieved at his attaining 
this honor, yet no one can deny that he has de¬ 
served it.” The gods all gave their assent; Juno 
only heard the closing words with some dis¬ 
pleasure that she should be so particularly pointed 
at, yet not enough to make her regret the de¬ 
termination of her husband. So when the flames 
had consumed the mother’s share of Hercules, 
the diviner part, instead of being injured thereby, 
seemed to start forth with new vigor, to assume 
a more lofty port and a more awful dignity. Ju¬ 
piter enveloped him in a cloud and took him up 
in a four-horse chariot to dwell among the stars. 
As he took his place in heaven, Atlas felt the 
added weight. 

Juno, now reconciled to him, gave him her 
daughter Hebe in marriage. 

The poet Schiller, in one of his pieces called 
The Ideal and the Life, illustrates the contrast be¬ 
tween the practical and the imaginative in some 
beautiful stanzas, of which the last two may be 
thus translated: 

Deep degraded to a coward’s slave, 
Endless contests bore Alcides brave, 
Through the thorny path of suffering led; 
Slew the Hydra, crushed the lion’s might, 
Threw himself, to bring his friend to light, 
Eiving, in the skiff that bears the dead. 
All the torments, every toil of earth 
Juno’s hatred on him could impose, 
Well he bore them, from his fated birth 
To life’s grandly mournful close. 

The Coronation of Hebe, Cup-Bearer to the 
Gods. Studio of Veronese. (Isabella Stewart 
Gardner Museum, Boston.) 
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Till the god, the earthly part forsaken, 
From the man in flames asunder taken, 
Drank the heavenly ether’s purer breath. 
Joyous in the new unwonted lightness, 
Soared he upwards to celestial brightness, 
Earth’s dark heavy burden lost in death. 

High Olympus gives harmonious greeting 
To the hall where reigns his sire adored; 
Youth’s bright goddess, with a blush at meeting, 
Gives the nectar to her lord. 

S.G.B. 

HEBE AND GANYMEDE 

Hebe, the daughter of Juno and goddess of 
youth, was cup-bearer to the gods. The usual 
story is that she resigned her office on becoming 
the wife of Hercules. But there is another state¬ 
ment which our countryman Crawford, the 
sculptor, has adopted in his group of Hebe and 
Ganymede, now in the Athenaeum gallery. Ac¬ 
cording to this, Hebe was dismissed from her 
office in consequence of a fall which she met 

with one day when in attendance on the gods. 
Her successor was Ganymede, a Trojan boy 
whom Jupiter, in the disguise of an eagle, seized 
and carried off from the midst of his playfellows 
on Mount Ida, bore up to heaven, and installed 

in the vacant place. 
Tennyson, in his “The Palace of Art,” describes 

among the decorations on the walls a picture 
representing this legend: 

There, too, flushed Ganymede, his rosy thigh 
Half buried in the eagle’s down, 

Sole as a flying star shot through the sky 
Above the pillared town. 

And in Shelley’s “Prometheus,” Jupiter calls 

to his cup-bearer thus: 

Pour forth heaven’s wine, Idaean Ganymede, 
And let it fill the Daedal cups like fire. 

The beautiful legend of the Choice of Hercules 
may be found in The Tatler, No. 97. 

Aethra and Theseus. 
(From The Studio magazine.) 



CHAPTER XX 

THESEUS-DAEDALUS-CASTOR AND POLLUX 

THESEUS 

Theseus was the son of Aegeus, King of Athens, 
and of Aethra, daughter of the king of Troezen. 
He was brought up at Troezen, and when arrived 
at manhood, was to proceed to Athens and pre¬ 
sent himself to his father. Aegeus, on parting 
from Aethra, before the birth of his son, placed 
his sword and shoes under a large stone and di¬ 
rected her to send his son to him when he be¬ 
came strong enough to roll away the stone and 
take them from under it. When she thought the 
time had come, his mother led Theseus to the 
stone, and he removed it with ease and took the 
sword and shoes. As the roads were infested 
with robbers, his grandfather pressed him ear¬ 
nestly to take the shorter and safer way to his 
father’s country, by sea; but the youth, feeling in 
himself the spirit and the soul of a hero, and 
eager to signalize himself like Hercules, with 
whose fame all Greece then rang, by destroying 
the evildoers and monsters that oppressed the 
country, determined on the more perilous and 
adventurous journey by land. 

His first day’s journey brought him to Epi- 
daurus, where dwelt a man named Periphetes, a 
son of Vulcan. This ferocious savage always went 
armed with a club of iron, and all travellers stood 
in terror of his violence. When he saw Theseus 
approach, he assailed him, but speedily fell be¬ 
neath the blows of the young hero, who took 
possession of his club and bore it ever afterwards 
as a memorial of his first victory. 

Several similar contests with the petty tyrants 
and marauders of the country followed, in all of 
which Theseus was victorious. One of these evil¬ 
doers was called Procrustes, or the Stretcher. He 
had an iron bedstead, on which he used to tie all 
travellers who fell into his hands. If they were 
shorter than the bed, he stretched their limbs to 
make them fit; if they were longer than the bed, 
he lopped off a portion. Theseus served him as 
he had served others. 

Having overcome all the perils of the road, 
Theseus at length reached Athens, where new 
dangers awaited him. Medea, the sorceress, who 
had fled from Corinth after her separation from 
Jason, had become the wife of Aegeus, the father 
of Theseus. Knowing by her arts who he was, 
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and fearing the loss of her influence with her 
husband if Theseus should be acknowledged as 
his son, she filled the mind of Aegeus with sus¬ 
picions of the young stranger and induced him 
to present him a cup of poison; but at the mo¬ 
ment when Theseus stepped forward to take it, 
the sight of the sword which he wore discovered 
to his father who he was and prevented the fatal 
draught. Medea, detected in her arts, fled once 
more from deserved punishment and arrived in 
Asia, where the country afterwards called Media 
received its name from her. Theseus was ac¬ 
knowledged by his father and declared his suc¬ 
cessor. 

The Athenians were at that time in deep 
affliction, on account of the tribute which they 
were forced to pay to Minos, King of Crete. This 
tribute consisted of seven youths and seven 
maidens, who were sent every year to be de¬ 
voured by the Minotaur, a monster with a bull’s 
body and a human head. It was exceedingly 
strong and fierce and was kept in a labyrinth 
constructed by Daedalus, so artfully contrived 
that whoever was enclosed in it could by no 
means find his way out unassisted. Here the 
Minotaur roamed, and was fed with human 
victims. 

Theseus resolved to deliver his countrymen 
from this calamity, or to die in the attempt. Ac¬ 
cordingly, when the time of sending off the 
tribute came, and the youths and maidens were, 
according to custom, drawn by lot to be sent, 
he offered himself as one of the victims, in spite 
of the entreaties of his father. The ship departed 
under black sails, as usual, which Theseus prom¬ 
ised his father to change for white, in case of his 
returning victorious. When they arrived in Crete, 
the youths and maidens were exhibited before 
Minos; and Ariadne, the daughter of the king, 
being present, became deeply enamored of The¬ 
seus, by whom her love was readily returned. 
She furnished him with a sword, with which to 
encounter the Minotaur, and with a clew of 
thread by which he might find his way out of the 
labyrinth. He was successful, slew the Minotaur, 
escaped from the labyrinth, and taking Ariadne 
as the companion of his way, with his rescued 
companions sailed for Athens. On their way they 
stopped at the island of Naxos, where Theseus 



The Minotaur. George Frederic Watts. 
{Tate Gallery, London.) 

abandoned Ariadne, leaving her asleep.* His ex¬ 
cuse for this ungrateful treatment of his bene¬ 
factress was that Minerva appeared to him in a 
dream and commanded him to do so. 

On approaching the coast of Attica, Theseus 
forgot the signal appointed by his father and 

* One of the finest pieces of sculpture in Italy, the 
recumbent Ariadne of the Vatican, represents this in¬ 
cident. A copy is in the Athenaeum gallery, Boston. 

neglected to raise the white sails, and the old 
king, thinking his son had perished, put an end 
to his own life. Theseus thus became king of 

Athens. 
One of the most celebrated of the adventures 

of Theseus is his expedition against the Amazons. 
He assailed them before they had recovered from 
the attack of Hercules, and carried off their 
queen Antiope. The Amazons in their turn in¬ 
vaded the country of Athens and penetrated into 



the city itself; and the final battle in which 
Theseus overcame them was fought in the very 
midst of the city. This battle was one of the 
favorite subjects of the ancient sculptors, and is 
commemorated in several works of art that are 
still extant. 

The friendship between Theseus and Pirithous 
was of a most intimate nature, yet it originated 
in the midst of arms. Pirithous had made an 
irruption into the plain of Marathon and carried 
off the herds of the king of Athens. Theseus 
went to repel the plunderers. The moment Piri¬ 
thous beheld him, he was seized with admiration; 
he stretched out his hand as a token of peace and 
cried, “Be judge thyself—what satisfaction dost 
thou require?” “Thy friendship,” replied the 
Athenian, and they swore inviolable fidelity. 
Their deeds corresponded to their professions, 
and they ever continued true brothers in arms. 
Each of them aspired to espouse a daughter of 
Jupiter. Theseus fixed his choice on Helen, then 
but a child, afterwards so celebrated as the cause 
of the Trojan war, and with the aid of his friend 
he carried her off. Pirithous aspired to the wife 
of the monarch of Erebus; and Theseus, though 
aware of the danger, accompanied the ambitious 
lover in his descent to the underworld. But Pluto 
seized and set them on an enchanted rock at his 

palace gate, where they remained till Hercules 
arrived and liberated Theseus, leaving Pirithous 
to his fate. 

After the death of Antiope, Theseus married 
Phaedra, daughter of Minos, King of Crete. 
Phaedra saw in Hippolytus, the son of Theseus, 
a youth endowed with all the graces and virtues 
of his father, and of an age corresponding to her 
own. She loved him, but he repulsed her ad¬ 
vances, and her love was changed to hate. She 
used her influence over her infatuated husband 
to cause him to be jealous of his son, and he 
imprecated the vengeance of Neptune upon him. 
As Hippolytus was one day driving his chariot 
along the shore, a sea-monster raised himself 
above the waters and frightened the horses so 
that they ran away and dashed the chariot to 
pieces. Hippolytus was killed, but by Diana’s 
assistance Aesculapius restored him to life. Diana 
removed Hippolytus from the power of his de¬ 
luded father and false step-mother, and placed 
him in Italy under the protection of the nymph 
Egeria. 

Theseus at length lost the favor of his people 
and retired to the court of Lycomedes, King of 
Scyros, who at first received him kindly, but 
afterwards treacherously slew him. In a later age 
the Athenian general Cimon discovered the place 







Ariadne. Kauffman. (European Picture Service.) 
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where his remains were laid, and caused them to 
be removed to Athens, where they were de¬ 
posited in a temple called the Theseum, erected 
in honor of the hero. 

The queen of the Amazons whom Theseus 
espoused is by some called Hippolyta. That is 
the name she bears in Shakespeare’s Midsummer 
Night's Dream-the subject of which is the fes¬ 
tivities attending the nuptials of Theseus and 
Hippolyta. 

Mrs. Hemans has a poem on the ancient Greek 
tradition that the “Shade of Theseus” appeared 
strengthening his countrymen at the battle of 
Marathon. 

Theseus is a semi-historical personage. It is 
recorded of him that he united the several tribes 
by whom the territory of Attica was then 
possessed into one state, of which Athens was the 
capital. In commemoration of this important 
event, he instituted the festival of Panathenaea, in 
honor of Minerva, the patron deity of Athens. 
This festival differed from the other Grecian 
games chiefly in two particulars. It was peculiar 
to the Athenians, and its chief feature was a 
solemn procession in which the Peplus, or sacred 
robe of Minerva, was carried to the Parthenon 
and suspended before the statue of the goddess. 
The Peplus was covered with embroidery worked 
by select virgins of the noblest families in Athens. 
The procession consisted of persons of all ages 
and both sexes. The old men carried olive 
branches in their hands, and the young men bore 
arms. The young women carried baskets on their 
heads containing the sacred utensils, cakes, and 
all things necessary for the sacrifices. The proces¬ 
sion formed the subject of the bas-reliefs which 
embellished the outside of the temple of the 
Parthenon. A considerable portion of these 
sculptors is now in the British Museum among 
those known as the “Elgin marbles.” 

OLYMPIC AND OTHER GAMES 

It seems not inappropriate to mention here the 
other celebrated national games of the Greeks. 
The first and most distinguished were the Olym¬ 
pic, founded it was said by Jupiter himself. They 
were celebrated at Olympia in Elis. Vast num¬ 
bers of spectators flocked to them from every 
part of Greece, and from Asia, Africa, and Sicily. 
They were repeated every fifth year in midsum¬ 
mer, and continued five days. They gave rise to 
the custom of reckoning time and dating events 
by Olympiads. The first Olympiad is generally 
considered as corresponding with the year 
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776 b.c. The Pythian games were celebrated in 
the vicinity of Delphi, the Isthmian on the 
Corinthian isthmus, the Nemean at Nemea, a city 
of Argolis. 

The exercises in these games were of five sorts: 
running, leaping, wrestling, throwing the quoit, 
and hurling the javelin, or boxing. Besides these 
exercises of bodily strength and agility, there were 
contests in music, poetry, and eloquence. Thus 
these games furnished poets, musicians, and 
authors the best opportunities to present their 
productions to the public, and the fame of the 
victors was diffused far and wide. 

DAEDALUS 

1 he labyrinth from which Theseus escaped by 
means of the clew of Ariadne was built by 
Daedalus, a most skilful artificer. It was an edifice 
with numberless winding passages and turnings 
opening into one another, and seeming to have 
neither beginning nor end, like the river Mae- 
ander, which returns on itself, and flows now 
onward, now backward, in its course to the sea. 
Daedalus built the labyrinth for King Minos, but 
afterwards lost the favor of the king, and was 
shut up in a tower. He contrived to make his 
escape from his prison, but could not leave the 
island by sea, as the king kept strict watch on 
all the vessels and permitted none to sail without 
being carefully searched. “Minos may control 
the land and sea,” said Daedalus, “but not the 
regions of the air. I will try that way.” So he set 
to work to fabricate wings for himself and his 
young son Icarus. He wrought feathers together, 
beginning with the smallest and adding larger, 
so as to form an increasing surface. The larger 
ones he secured with thread and the smaller with 
wax, and gave the whole a gentle curvature like 
the wings of a bird. Icarus, the boy, stood and 
looked on, sometimes running to gather up the 
feathers which the wind had blown away, and 
then handling the wax and working it over with 
his fingers, by his play impeding his father in 
his labors. When at Lst the work was done, the 
artist, waving his wings, found himself buoyed 
upwards and hung suspended, poising himself on 
the beaten air. He next equipped his son in the 
same manner and taught him how to fly, as a 
bird tempts her young ones from the lofty nest 
into the air. When all was prepared for flight he 
said, “Icarus, my son, I charge you to keep at a 
moderate height, for if you fly too low the damp 
will clog your wings, and if too high the heat 
will melt them. Keep near me and you will be 



safe.” While he gave him these instructions and 
fitted the wings to his shoulders, the face of the 
father was wet with tears, and his hands trembled. 
He kissed the boy, not knowing that it was for 
the last time. Then rising on his wings he flew 
off, encouraging him to follow, and looked back 
from his own flight to see how his son manage 
his wings. As they flew the ploughman stopped 
his work to gaze, and the shepherd leaned on his 
staff and watched them, astonished at the sight, 
and thinking they were gods who could thus 

cleave the air. 
They passed Samos and Delos on the left and 

Lebynthos on the right, when the boy, exulting 
in his career, began to leave the guidance of his 
companion and soar upward as if to reach heaven. 
The nearness of the blazing sun softened the wax 
which held the feathers together, and they came 
off. He fluttered with his arms, but no feathers 
remained to hold the air. While his mouth uttered 
cries to his father it was submerged in the blue 
waters of the sea, which thenceforth was called 
by his name. His father cried, Icarus, Icarus, 
where are you?” At last he saw the feathers float¬ 
ing on the water, and bitterly lamenting his own 
arts, he buried the body and called the land Icaria 
in memory of his child. Daedalus arrived safe in 
Sicily, where he built a temple to Apollo and 
hung up his wings, an offering to the god. 

Daedalus was so proud of his achievements that 
he could not bear the idea of a rival. His sister 
had placed her son Perdix under his charge to be 
taught the mechanical arts. He was an apt scholar 
and gave striking evidences of ingenuity. Walk¬ 
ing on the seashore he picked up the spine of a 
fish. Imitating it, he took a piece of iron and 
notched it on the edge, and thus invented the 
saw. He put two pieces of iron together, con¬ 
necting them at one end with a rivet and sharpen¬ 
ing the other ends, and made a petty of cowpctsses. 
Daedalus was so envious of his nephew s per¬ 
formances that he took an opportunity, when 
they were together one day on the top of a high 
tower, to push him off. But Minerva, who favors 
ingenuity, saw him falling, and arrested his fate 
by changing him into a bird called after his name, 
the Partridge. This bird does not build his nest 
in the trees, nor take lofty flights, but nestles in 
the hedges, and mindful of his fall, avoids high 

places. 
The death of Icarus is told in the following 

lines by Darwin: 

. . . with melting wax and loosened strings 
Sunk hapless Icarus on unfaithful wings; 

Headlong he rushed through the affrighted air, 
With limbs distorted and dishevelled hair; 
His scattered plumage danced upon the wave, 
And sorrowing Nereids decked his watery grave; 
O’er his pale corse their pearly sea-flowers shed, 
And strewed with crimson moss his marble bed; 
Struck in their coral towers the passing bell, 
And wide in ocean tolled his echoing knell. 

CASTOR AND POLLUX 

Castor and Pollux were the offspring of Leda and 
and the swan, under which disguise Jupiter had 
concealed himself. Leda gave birth to an egg, 
from which sprang the twins. Helen, so famous 
afterwards as the cause of the Trojan war, was 

their sister. 
When Theseus and his friend Pirithous had 

carried off Helen from Sparta, the youthful 
heroes Castor and Pollux, with their followers, 
hastened to her rescue. Theseus was absent from 
Attica and the brothers were successful in re¬ 

covering their sister. 
Castor was famous for taming and managing 

horses, and Pollux for skill in boxing. They were 
united by the warmest affection and inseparable 
in all their enterprises. They accompanied the 
Argonautic expedition. During the voyage a 
storm arose, and Orpheus prayed to the Samo- 
thracian gods and played on his harp, whereupon 
the storm ceased and stars appeared on the heads 
of the brothers. From this incident, Castor and 
Pollux came afterwards to be considered the 
patron deities of seamen and voyagers, and the 
lambent flames, which in certain states of the 
atmosphere play round the sails and masts of 

vessels, were called by their names. 
After the Argonautic expedition, we find 

Castor and Pollux engaged in a war with Idas and 
Lynceus. Castor was slain, and Pollux, inconsol¬ 
able for the loss of his brother, besought Jupiter 
to be permitted to give his own life as a ransom 
for him. Jupiter so far consented as to allow the 
two brothers to enjoy the boon of life alternately, 
passing one day under the earth and the next in 
the heavenly abodes. According to another form 
of the story Jupiter rewarded the attachment of 
the brothers by placing them among the stars as 

Gemini, the Twins. 
They received divine honors under the name 

of Dioscuri (sons of Jove). They were believed 
to have appeared occasionally in later times, 

Opposite: Daedalus and Icarus. Charles-Paul Lan- 

don. (Musee d’Alenpon.) 
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The Fall of Icarus. Pieter 
Brueghel. (Royal Museum of 
Fine Arts, Brussels.) 



taking part with one side or the other, in hard 
fought fields, and were said on such occasions to 
be mounted on magnificent white steeds. Thus 
in the early history of Rome they are said to have 
assisted the Romans at the battle of Lake Regillus, 
and after the victory a temple was erected in 
their honor on the spot where they appeared. 

Macaulay in his Lays of Ancient Rome thus al¬ 

ludes to the legend: 

So like they were, no mortal 
Might one from other know; 

White as snow their armor was, 

Their steeds were white as snow. 
Never on earthly anvil 

Did such rare armor gleam, 
And never did such gallant steeds 

Drink of an earthly stream. 

******* 
Back comes the chief in triumph 

Who in the hour of fight 
Hath seen the great Twin Brethren 

In harness on his right. 
Safe comes the ship to haven, 

Through billows and through gales 
If once the great Twin Brethren 

Sit shining on the sails. 

Castor and Pollux Capturing the Giant Tallus. 
From a Greek vase. 
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Opposite: Lament for Icarus. Herbert f. Draper 

(Tate Gallery, London.) 







CHAPTER XXI 

BACCHUS—ARIADNE 

Jupiter and Semele. Attributed to Tintoretto. 
(National Gallery, Londo?i.) 

BACCHUS 

Bacchus was the son of Jupiter and Semele. Juno, 
to gratify her resentment against Semele, con¬ 
trived a plan for her destruction. Assuming the 
form of Beroe, her aged nurse, she insinuated 
doubts whether it was indeed Jove himself who 
came as a lover. Heaving a sigh, she said, “I hope 
it will turn out so, but I can’t help being afraid. 
People are not always what they pretend to be. 
If he is indeed Jove, make him give some proof 
of it. Ask him to come arrayed in all his splen¬ 
dors, such as he wears in heaven. That will put 
the matter beyond a doubt.” Semele was per¬ 
suaded to try the experiment. She asks a favor, 
without naming what it is: Jove gives his promise, 
and confirms it with the irrevocable oath, at¬ 
testing the River Styx, terrible to the gods them¬ 
selves. Then she made known her request. The 
god would have stopped her as she spake, but 

Opposite: Hermes (Mercury) with the Infant 
Dionysus (Bacchus). Praxiteles. (Olympia Mu¬ 
seum. ) 

she was too quick for him. The words escaped, 
and he could neither unsay his promise nor her 
request. In deep distress he left her and returned 
to the upper regions. There he clothed himself 
in his splendors, not putting on all his terrors, as 
when he overthrew the giants, but what is 
known among the gods as his lesser panoply. 
Arrayed in this he entered the chamber of 
Semele. Her mortal frame could not endure the 
splendors of the immortal radiance. She was con¬ 
sumed to ashes. 

Jove took the infant Bacchus and gave him in 
charge to the Nysaean nymphs, who nourished 
his infancy and childhood, and for their care were 
rewarded by Jupiter by being placed, as the 
Hyades, among the stars. When Bacchus grew 
up he discovered the culture of the vine and the 
mode of extracting its precious juice; but Juno 
struck him with madness and drove him forth a 
wanderer through various parts of the earth. In 
Phrygia the goddess Rhea cured him and taught 
him her religious rites, and he set out on a prog¬ 
ress through Asia teaching the people the culti¬ 
vation of the vine. The most famous part of his 
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wanderings is his expedition to India, which is 
said to have lasted several years. Returning in 
triumph, he undertook to introduce his worship 
into Greece, but was opposed by some princes 
who dreaded its introduction on account of the 
disorders and madness it brought with it. 

As he approached his native city Thebes, Pen- 
theus the king, who had no respect for the new 
worship, forbade its rites to be performed. But 
when it was known that Bacchus was advancing, 
men and women, but chiefly the latter, young 
and old poured forth to meet him and to join his 

triumphal march. 

Bacchus and Ariadne Escorted by Eros (Cupid). 
Greek cup. (British Museum, London.) 

Mr. Longfellow, in his “Drinking Song,” thus 
describes the march of Bacchus: 

Fauns with youthful Bacchus follow; 
Ivy crowns that brow, supernal 

As the forehead of Apollo, 
And possessing youth eternal. 

renounce his counterfeit worship. It was in vain 
his nearest friends and wisest counsellors remon¬ 
strated and begged him not to oppose the god. 
Their remonstrances only made him more vio¬ 

lent. 
But now the attendants returned whom he had 

despatched to seize Bacchus. They had been 
driven away by the Bacchanals, but had suc¬ 
ceeded in taking one of them prisoner, whom, 
with his hands tied behind him, they brought be¬ 
fore the king. Pentheus, beholding him with 
wrathful countenance, said, “Fellow! You shall 
speedily be put to death, that your fate may be 
a warning to others; but though I grudge the de¬ 
lay of your punishment, speak, tell us who you 
are, and what are these new rites you presume 

to celebrate.” 
The prisoner unterrified responded, “My name 

is Acetes; my country is Maeonia; my parents 
were poor people, who had no fields or flocks to 
leave me, but they left me their fishing rods and 
nets and their fisherman’s trade. This I followed 
for some time, till growing weary of remaining 
in one place, I learned the pilot’s art and how to 
guide my course by the stars. It happened, as I 
was sailing for Delos, we touched at the island 
of Dia and went ashore. Next morning I sent the 
men for fresh water and myself mounted the hill 
to observe the wind; when my men returned 
bringing with them a prize, as they thought, a 
boy of delicate appearance, whom they had 
found asleep. They judged he was a noble youth, 
perhaps a king’s son, and they might get a liberal 
ransom for him. I observed his dress, his walk, his 
face. There was something in them which I felt 
sure was more than mortal. I said to my men, 
‘What god there is concealed in that form I know 
not, but some one there certainly is. Pardon us, 
gentle deity, for the violence we have done you, 
and give success to our undertakings.’ Dictys, 
one of my best hands for climbing the mast and 
coming down by the ropes, and Melanthus my 
steersman, and Epopeus the leader of the sailors’ 
cry, one and all exclaimed, ‘Spare your prayers 
for us.’ So blind is the lust of gain! When they 

Round about him fair Bacchantes, 
Bearing cymbals, flutes and thyrses, 

Wild from Naxian groves or Zante’s 
Vineyards, sing delirious verses. 

It was in vain Pentheus remonstrated, com¬ 
manded, and threatened. “Go,” said he to his at¬ 
tendants, “seize this vagabond leader of the rout 
and bring him to me. I will soon make him con¬ 
fess his false claim of heavenly parentage and 

proceeded to put him on board I resisted them. 
‘This ship shall not be profaned by such impiety,’ 
said I. ‘I have a greater share in her than any of 
you.’ But Lycabas, a turbulent fellow, seized me 
by the throat and attempted to throw me over¬ 
board, and I SQarcely saved myself by clinging to 
the ropes. The rest approved the deed. 

“Then Bacchus (for it was indeed he) as if 
shaking off his drowsiness exclaimed. ‘What are 
you doing with me? What is this fighting about? 



Bacchus with Venus. Noel Nicolas Coy pel. 
(.Museum of Art and History, Geneva.) 

Who brought me here? Where are you going to 
carry me?’ One of them replied, ‘Fear nothing; 
tell us where you wish to go and we will take 
you there.’ ‘Naxos is my home,’ said Bacchus; 
‘take me there and you shall be well rewarded.’ 
They promised so to do and told me to pilot the 
ship to Naxos. Naxos lay to the right, and I was 
trimming the sails to carry us there, when some 
by signs and others by whispers signified to me 
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their will that I should sail in the opposite direc¬ 
tion, and take the boy to Egypt to sell him for a 
slave. I was confounded and said, ‘Let some one 
else pilot the ship,’ withdrawing myself from 
any further agency in their wickedness. They 
cursed me, and one of them, exclaiming, ‘Don’t 
flatter yourself that we depend on you for our 
safety,’ took my place as pilot, and bore away 
from Naxos. 



“Then the god, pretending that he had just be¬ 
come aware of their treachery, looked out over 
the sea and said in a voice of weeping, ‘Sailors, 
these are not the shores you promised to take me 
to; yonder island is not my home. What have I 
done that you should treat me so? It is small 
glory you will gain by cheating a poor boy.’ I 
wept to hear him, but the crew laughed at both 
of us and sped the vessel fast over the sea. All at 
once—strange as it may seem, it is true—the vessel 
stopped, in the mid sea, as fast as if it was fixed 
on the ground. The men, astonished, pulled at 
their oars, and spread more sail, trying to make 
progress by the aid of both, but all in vain. Ivy 
twined round the oars and hindered their motion, 
and clung to the sails, with heavy clusters of 
berries. A vine, laden with grapes, ran up the 
mast and along the sides of the vessel. The sound 
of flutes was heard, and the odor of fragrant 
wine spread all around. The god himself had a 
chaplet of vine leaves and bore in his hand a 
spear wreathed with ivy. Tigers crouched at his 
feet, and forms of lynxes and spotted panthers 
played around him. The men were seized with 
terror or madness; some leaped overboard; others 
preparing to do the same beheld their compan¬ 
ions in the water undergoing a change, their 
bodies becoming flattened and ending in a 
crooked tail. One exclaimed, ‘What miracle is 
this!’ and as he spoke his mouth widened, his 
nostrils expanded, and scales covered all his body. 
Another, endeavoring to pull the oar, felt his 
hands shrink up and presently to be no longer 
hands but fins; another, trying to raise his arms 
to a rope, found he had no arms, and curving his 
mutilated body, jumped into the sea. What had 
been his legs became the two ends of a crescent¬ 
shaped tail. The whole crew became dolphins 
and swam about the ship, now upon the surface, 
now under it, scattering the spray and spouting 
the water from their broad nostrils. Of twenty 
men I alone was left. Trembling with fear, the 
god cheered me. ‘Fear not,’ said he; ‘steer to¬ 
wards Naxos.’ I obeyed, and when we arrived 
there, I kindled the altars and celebrated the 
sacred rites of Bacchus.” 

Pentheus here exclaimed, “We have wasted 
time enough on this silly story. Take him away 
and have him executed without delay.” Acetes 
was led away by the attendants and shut up fast 
in prison; but while they were getting ready the 
instruments of execution, the prison doors came 
open of their own accord and the chains fell 
from his limbs, and when they looked for him 
he was nowhere to be found. 

Pentheus would take no warning, but instead 
of sending others, determined to go himself to 
the scene of the solemnities. The mountain 
Citheron was all alive with worshippers, and the 
cries of the Bacchanals resounded on every side. 
The noise' roused the anger of Pentheus as the 
sound of a trumpet does the fire of a war-horse. 
He penetrated through the wood and reached an 
open space where the chief scene of the orgies 
met his eyes. At the same moment the women 
saw him; and first among them his own mother, 
Agave, blinded by the god, cried out, “See there 
the wild boar, the hugest monster that prowls in 
these woods! Come on, sisters! I will be the first 
to strike the wild boar.” The whole band rushed 
upon him, and while he now talks less arrogantly, 
now excuses himself, and now confesses his 
crime and implores pardon, they press upon and 
wound him. In vain he cries to his aunts to pro¬ 
tect him from his mother. Autonoe seized one 
arm, Ino the other, and between them he was 
torn to pieces, while his mother shouted, “Vic¬ 
tory! Victory! We have done it; the glory is 
ours!” 

So the worship of Bacchus was established in 
Greece. 

There is an allusion to the story of Bacchus and 
the mariners in Milton’s Comus, at line 46. The 
story of Circe will be found in Chapter XXIX. 

.v 

Bacchus that first from out the purple grape 
Crushed the sweet poison of misused wine, 
After the Tuscan mariners transformed, 
Coasting the Tyrrhene shore as the winds listed 
On Circe’s island fell; (who knows not Circe, 
The daughter of the Sun? whose charmed cup 
Whoever tasted lost his upright shape, 
And downward fell into a grovelling swine.) 

ARIADNE 

We have seen in the storv of Theseus how 
Ariadne, the daughter of King Minos, after help¬ 
ing Theseus to escape from the labyrinth, was 
carried by him to the island of Naxos and was 
left there asleep, while the ungrateful Theseus 
pursued his way home without her. Ariadne, on 
waking and finding herself deserted, abandoned 
herself to grief. But Venus took pity on her and 
consoled her with the promise that she should 
have an immortal lover, instead of the mortal one 
she had lost. 

The island where Ariadne was left was the 
favorite island of Bacchus, the same that he 
wished the Tyrrhenian mariners to carry him to, 



Dionysus (Bacchus). From the cup by Exekias. 
(Cleveland Museum of Art.) 

when they so treacherously attempted to make 
prize of him. As Ariadne sat lamenting her fate, 
Bacchus found her, consoled her, and made her 
his wife. As a marriage present he gave her a 
golden crown, enriched with gems, and when 
she died, he took her crown and threw it up into 
the sky. As it mounted the gems grew brighter 
and were turned into stars, and preserving its 
form Ariadne’s crown remains fixed in the 
heavens as a constellation, between the kneeling 
Hercules and the man who holds the serpent. 

Spenser alludes to Ariadne’s crown, though he 

has made some mistakes in his mythology. It was 
at the wedding of Pirithous, and not Theseus, that 
the centaurs and lapithae quarrelled. 

Look how the crown which Ariadne wore 
Upon her ivory forehead that same day 
That Theseus her unto his bridal bore, 
When the bold Centaurs made that bloody fray 
With the fierce Lapiths which did them dismay; 
Being now placed in the firmament, 
Through the bright heaven doth her beams display 
And is unto the stars an ornament, 

Which round about her move in order excellent. 



, 
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Bacchus and Ariadne. Titian. (National Gallery, London.) 

opposite: Bacchanale. Titian. (Prado, Madrid.) 
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Bacchanalian Revel before a 
Herm of Pan. Nicolas Poussin. 
(.National Gallery, Lo?idon.) 





CHAPTER XXII 

THE RURAL DEITIES-ERISICHTHON-RHOECUS- 
THE WATER DEITIES—CAMENAE—WINDS 

THE RURAL DEITIES 

Pan, the god of woods and fields, of flocks and 
shepherds, dwelt in grottos, wandered on the 
mountains and in valleys, and amused himself 
with the chase or in leading the dances of the 
nymphs. He was fond of music, and, as we have 
seen, the inventor of the syrinx, or shepherd’s 
pipe, which he himself played in a masterly man¬ 
ner. Pan, like other gods who dwelt in forests, 
was dreaded by those whose occupations caused 
them to pass through the woods by night, for the 
gloom and loneliness of such scenes dispose the 
mind to superstitious fears. Hence sudden fright 
without any visible cause was ascribed to Pan 
and called a Panic terror. 

As the name of the god signifies all, Pan came 
to be considered a symbol of the universe and 
personification of Nature; and later still to be re¬ 
garded as a representative of all the gods and of 
heathenism itself. 

Sylvanus and Faunus were Latin divinities 
whose characteristics are so nearly the same as 
those of Pan that we may safely consider them 
as the same personage under different names. 

The wood-nymphs, Pan’s partners in the dance, 
were but one class of nymphs. There were beside 
them the Naiads, who presided over brooks and 
fountains, the Oreads, nymphs of mountains and 
grottos, and the Nereids, sea-nymphs. The three 
last named were immortal but the wood-nymphs, 
called Dryads or Hamadryads, were believed to 
perish with the trees which had been their abode, 
and with which they had come into existence. It 
was therefore an impious act wantonly to destroy 
a tree, and in some aggravated cases was severely 
punished, as in the instance of Erisichthon, which 
we are about to record. 

Milton, in his glowing description of the early 
creation, thus alludes to Pan as the personification 
of Nature: 

Universal Pan, 
Knit with the Graces and the Hours in dance, 
Led on the eternal spring. 

And describing Eve’s abode: 

In shadier bower, 
More sacred or sequestered, though but feigned, 
Pan or Sylvanus never slept, nor Nymph 
Nor Faunus haunted. 

Paradise Lost, B. IV. 

Nymphs and Faun (detail). Camille Corot. 
(Knoedler Gallery, New York.) 

It was a pleasing trait in the old paganism that 
it loved to trace in every operation of nature the 
agency of deity. The imagination of the Greeks 

Opposite: Aphrodite (Venus), Pan, and Cupid. peopled all the regions of earth and sea with 
(Natiotial Archaeological Museum, Athens.) divinities, to whose agency it attributed those 
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phenomena which our philosophy ascribes co the 
operation of the laws of nature. Sometimes in our 
poetical moods we feel disposed to regret the 
change and to think that the heart has lost as 
much as the head has gained by the substitution. 
The poet Wordsworth thus strongly expresses 
this sentiment: 

Great God, I’d rather be 
A Pagan, suckled in a creed outworn, 
So might I, standing on this pleasant lea, 
Have glimpses that would make me less forlorn; 
Have sight of Proteus rising from the sea, 
And hear old Triton blow his wreathed horn. 

Schiller, in his poem “Die Gotter Griechen- 
lands,” expresses his regret for the overthrow of 
the beautiful mythology of ancient times in a 
way which has called forth an answer from a 
Christian poet, Mrs. E. Barrett Browning, in her 
poem called “The Dead Pan.” The two following 
verses are a specimen: 

By your beauty which confesses 
Some chief Beauty conquering you, 
By our grand heroic guesses 
Through your falsehood at the True, 
We will weep not! earth shall roll 
Heir to each god’s aureole, 

And Pan is dead. 

Earth outgrows the mythic fancies 
Sung beside her in her youth; 
And those debonaire romances 
Sound but dull beside the truth. 
Phoebus’ chariot course is run! 
Look up, poets, to the sun! 

Pan, Pan is dead. 

These lines are founded on an early Christian 
tradition that when the heavenly host told the 
shepherds at Bethlehem of the birth of Christ, a 
deep groan, heard through all the isles of Greece, 
told that the great Pan was dead, and that all the 
royalty of Olympus was dethroned, and the 
several deities were sent wandering in cold and 
darkness. So Milton in his “Hymn to the Na¬ 
tivity”: 

The lonely mountains o’er, 
And the resounding shore, 

A voice of weeping heard and loud lament; 
From haunted spring and dale, 
Edged with poplar pale, 

The parting Genius is with sighing sent; 
With flower-enwoven tresses torn, 
The nymphs in twilight shade of tangled thickets 

mourn. 

ERISICHTHON 

Erisichthon was a profane person and a despiser 
of the gods. On one occasion he presumed to 
violate with the axe a grove sacred to Ceres. 
There stood in this grove a venerable oak, so 
large that it seemed a wood in itself, its ancient 
trunk towering aloft, whereon votive garlands 
were often hung and inscriptions carved express¬ 
ing the gratitude of suppliants to the nymph of 
the tree. Often had the Dryads danced round it 
hand in hand. Its trunk measured fifteen cubits 
round, and it overtopped the other trees as they 
overtopped the shrubbery. But for all that, 
Erisichthon saw no reason why he should spare 
it, and he ordered his servants to cut it down. 
When he saw them hesitate, he snatched an axe 
from one and thus impiously exclaimed: “I care 
not whether it be a tree beloved of the goddess 
or not; were it the goddess herself it should come 
down, if it stood in my way.” So saying he lifted 
the axe, and the oak seemed to shudder and utter 
a groan. When the first blow fell upon the trunk, 
blood flowed from the wound. All the bystanders 
were horror-struck, and one of them ventured 
to remonstrate and hold back the fatal axe. 
Erisichthon, with a scornful look, said to him, 
“Receive the reward of your piety”; and turned 
against him the weapon which he had held aside 
from the tree, gashed his body with many 
wounds, and cut off his head. Then from the 
midst of the oak came a voice, “I who dwell in 
this tree am a nymph beloved of Ceres, and 
dying by your hands, forewarn you that punish¬ 
ment awaits you.” He desisted not from his crime, 
and at last the tree, sundered by repeated blows 
and drawn by ropes, fell with a crash and pros¬ 
trated a great part of the grove in its fall. 

The Dryads, in dismay at the loss of their com¬ 
panion and at seeing the pride of the forest laid 
low, went in a body to Ceres, all clad in gar¬ 
ments of mourning, and invoked punishment 
upon Erisichthon. She nodded her assent, and as 
she bowed her head the grain ripe for harvest in 
the laden fields bowed also. She planned a punish¬ 
ment so dire that one would pity him, if such a 
culprit as he could be pitied—to deliver him over 
to Famine. As Ceres herself could not approach 
Famine, for the Fates have ordained that these 
two goddesses shall never come together, she 
called an Oread from her mountain and spoke to 
her in these words: “There is a place in the 
farthest part of ice-clad Scythia, a sad and sterile 
region without trees and without crops. Cold 
dwells there, and Fear, and Shuddering, and 
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The Education of Pan. Luca Signorelli. 
(National Museum, 'Berlin.') 

Famine. Go and tell the last to take possession of 
the bowels of Erisichthon. Let not abundance 
subdue her, nor the power of my gifts drive her 
away. Be not alarmed at the distance [for Famine 
dwells very far from Ceres] but take my chariot. 
The dragons are fleet and obey the rein, and will 
take you through the air in a short time.” So she 
gave her the reins, and she drove away and soon 
reached Scythia. On arriving at Mount Caucasus 
she stopped the dragons and found Famine in a 
stony field, pulling up with teeth and claws the 
scanty herbage. Her hair was rough, her eyes 
sunk, her face pale, her lips blanched, her jaws 
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covered with dust, and her skin drawn tight, so 
as to show all her bones. As the Oread saw her 
afar off (for she did not dare to come near), she 
delivered the commands of Ceres; and, though 
she stopped as short a time as possible, and kept 
her distance as well as she could, yet she began 
to feel hungry and turned the dragons’ heads 
and drove back to Thessaly. 

Famine obeyed the commands of Ceres and 
sped through the air to the dwelling of Erisich¬ 
thon, entered the bedchamber of the guilty man, 
and found him asleep. She enfolded him with her 
wings and breathed herself into him, infusing her 



poison into his veins. Having discharged her task, 
she hastened to leave the land of plenty and re¬ 
turned to her accustomed haunts. Erisichthon 
still slept, and in his dreams craved food and 
moved his jaws as if eating. When he awoke his 
hunger was raging. Without a moment’s delay he 
would have food set before him, of whatever 
kind earth, sea, or air produces; and complained 
of hunger even while he ate. What would have 
sufficed for a city or a nation was not enough for 
him. The more he ate the more he craved. His 
hunger was like the sea, which receives all the 
rivers, yet is never filled; or like fire that burns 
all the fuel that is heaped upon it, yet is still 
voracious for more. 

His property rapidly diminished under the un¬ 
ceasing demands of his appetite, but his hunger 
continued unabated. At length he had spent all, 
and had only his daughter left, a daughter worthy 
of a better parent. Her too he sold. She scorned 
to be the slave of a purchaser, and as she stood 
by the seaside, raised her hands in prayer to Nep¬ 
tune. He heard her prayer, and, though her new 
master was not far off and had his eye upon her a 
moment before, Neptune changed her form and 
made her assume that of a fisherman busy at his 
occupation. Her master, looking for her and see¬ 
ing her in her altered form, addressed her and 
said, “Good fisherman, whither went the maiden 
whom I saw just now, with hair dishevelled and 
in humble garb, standing about where you stand? 
Tell me truly; so may your luck be good, and 
not a fish nibble at your hook and get away.” 
She perceived that her prayer was answered, and 
rejoiced inwardly at hearing herself inquired of 
about herself. She replied, “Pardon me, stranger, 
but I have been so intent upon my line that I have 
seen nothing else; but I wish I may never catch 
another fish if I believe any woman or other 
person except myself to have been hereabouts 
for some time.” He was deceived and went his 
way, thinking his slave had escaped. Then she 
resumed her own form. Her father was well 
pleased to find her still with him, and the money 
too that he got by the sale of her; so he sold her 
again. But she was changed by the favor of Nep¬ 
tune as often as she was sold, now into a horse, 
now a bird, now an ox, and now a stag—got away 
from her purchasers and came home. By this base 
method the starving father procured food; but 
not enough for his wants, and at last hunger 
compelled him to devour his limbs, and he strove 
to nourish his body by eating his body, till 
death relieved him from the vengeance of Ceres. 

RHOECUS 

The Hamadryads could appreciate services as 
well as punish injuries. The story of Rhoecus 
proves this. Rhoecus, happening to see an oak j ust 
ready to fall, ordered his servants to prop it up. 
The nymph, who had been on the point of perish¬ 
ing with the tree, came and expressed her grati¬ 
tude to him for having saved her life and bade 
him ask what reward he would. Rhoecus boldly 
asked her love, and the nymph yielded to his de¬ 
sire. She at the same time charged him to be 
constant, and told him that a bee should be her 
messenger and let him know when she would ad¬ 
mit his society. One time the bee came to Rhoe¬ 
cus when he was playing at draughts, and he 
carelessly brushed it away. This so incensed the 
nymph that she deprived him of sight. 

Our countryman J. R. Lowell has taken this 
story for the subject of one of his shorter poems. 

He introduces it thus: 

Hear now this fairy legend of old Greece, 
As full of freedom, youth and beauty still, 
As the immortal freshness of that grace 
Carved for all ages on some Attic frieze. 

THE WATER DEITIES 

Oceanus and Tethys were the Titans who ruled 
over the watery element. When Jove and his 
brothers overthrew the Titans and assumed their 
power, Neptune and Amphitrite succeeded to the 
dominion of the waters in place of Oceanus and 

Tethys. 

NEPTUNE 

Neptune was the chief of the water deities. The 
symbol of his power was the trident, or spear 
with three points, with which he used to shatter 
rocks, to call forth or subdue storms, to shake the 
shores, and the like. He created the horse and was 
the patron of horse races. His own horses had 
brazen hoofs and golden manes. They drew his 
chariot over the sea, which became smooth be¬ 
fore him, while the monsters of the deep gam¬ 
bolled about his path. 

AMPHITRITE 

Amphitrite was the wife of Neptune. She was the 
daughter of Nereus and Doris and the mother of 
Triton. Neptune, to pay his court to Amphitrite, 



Nereus, Doris, and the Nereids. 
Duris Vase. 

came riding on a dolphin. Having won her, he 
rewarded the dolphin by placing him among the 
stars. 

NEREUS AND DORIS 

Nereus and Doris were the parents of the 
Nereids, the most celebrated of whom were Am- 
phitrite, Thetis, the mother of Achilles, and Gala- 
tea, who was loved by the Cyclops Polyphemus. 
Nereus was distinguished for his knowledge and 
his love of truth and justice, whence he was 
termed an elder; the gift of prophecy was also 
assigned to him. 

TRITON AND PROTEUS 

Triton was the son of Neptune and Amphitrite, 
and the poets make him his father’s trumpeter. 
Proteus was also a son of Neptune. He, like 
Nereus, is styled a sea-elder for his wisdom and 
knowledge of future events. His peculiar power 
was that of changing his shape at will. 

THETIS 

Thetis, the daughter of Nereus and Doris, was so 
beautiful that Jupiter himself sought her in mar¬ 
riage; but having learned from Prometheus the 
Titan that Thetis should bear a son who should 
be greater than his father, Jupiter desisted from 

(Louvre, Paris.) 

his suit and decreed that Thetis should be the 
wife of a mortal. By the aid of Chiron the Cen¬ 
taur, Peleus succeeded in winning the goddess 
for his bride, and their son was the renowned 
Achilles. In our chapter on the Trojan war it will 
appear that Thetis was a faithful mother to him, 
aiding him in all difficulties and watching over 
his interests from the first to the last. 

LEUCOTHEA AND PALAEMON 

Ino, the daughter of Cadmus and wife of 
Athamas, flying from her frantic husband with 
her little son Melicertes in her arms, sprang from 
a cliff into the sea. The gods, out of compassion, 
made her a goddess of the sea, under the name 
of Leucothea, and him a god under that of 
Palaemon. Both were held powerful to save from 
shipwreck and were invoked by sailors. Palaemon 
was usually represented riding on a dolphin. The 
Isthmian games were celebrated in his honor. He 
was called Portunus by the Romans and believed 
to have jurisdiction of the ports and shores. 

Milton alludes to all these deities in the song at 
the conclusion of Comus. 

Sabrina fair, 
Listen and appear to us, 
In name of great Oceanus; 
By the earth-shaking Neptune’s mace, 
And Tethys’ grave, majestic pace, 



By hoary Nereus’ wrinkled look, 
And the Carpathian wizard’s hook,* 
By scaly Triton’s winding shell, 
And old soothsaying Glaucus’ spell, 
By Leucothea’s lovely hands, 
And her son who rules the strands 
By Thetis’ tinsel-slippered feet, 
And the songs of Sirens sweet; 

&c. 

Armstrong, the poet of The Art of Preserving 
Health, under the inspiration of Hygeia, the god¬ 

dess of health, thus celebrates the Naiads. Paeon 
is a name both of Apollo and Aesculapius: 

Come, ye Naiads! to the fountains lead! 
Propitious maids! the task remains to sing 
Your gifts, (so Paeon, so the powers of Health 
Command,) to praise your crystal element. 
O comfortable streams! with eager lips 
And trembling hands the languid thirsty quaff 
New life in you; fresh vigor fills their veins. 
No warmer cups the rural ages knew, 
None warmer sought the sires of humankind; 
Happy in temperate peace their equal days 
Felt not the alternate fits of feverish mirth * Proteus. 
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The Horses of Neptune. Walter Crane. (Bayer Staatsgewaldesammlungen, Munich.) 

And sick dejection; still serene and pleased, 
Blessed with divine immunity from ills, 
Long centuries they lived; their only fate 
Was ripe old age, and rather sleep than death. 

THE CAMENAE 

By this name the Latins designated the Muses, 
but included under it also some other deities, 
principally nymphs of fountains. Egeria was one 
of them, whose fountain and grotto are still 
shown. It was said that Numa, the second king 
of Rome, was favored by this nymph with secret 
interviews, in which she taught him those les¬ 

sons of wisdom and of law which he embodied 
in the institutions of his rising nation. After the 
death of Numa the nymph pined away and was 
changed into a fountain. 

Byron in Childe Harold, Canto IV, thus al¬ 
ludes to Egeria and her grotto: 

Here didst thou dwell, in this enchanted cover, 
Egeria! all thy heavenly bosom beating 
For the far footsteps of thy mortal lover; 
The purple midnight veiled that mystic meeting 
With her most starry canopy; 

&c. 
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Tennyson, also, in “The Palace of Art,” gives 
us a glimpse of the royal lover expecting the 

interview. 

Holding one hand against his ear, 
To list a footfall ere he saw 

The wood-nymph, stayed the Tuscan king to hear 
Of wisdom and of law. 

Boreas Abducting Orithyia. From a Greek vase. 
(European Picture Service.) 

Hygeia. Roman. (Archaeological Museum, 

Rhodes.) 

THE WINDS 

When so many less active agencies were personi¬ 
fied, it is not to be supposed that the winds failed 
to be so. They were Boreas or Aquilo, the north 
wind, Zephyrus or Favonius, the west, Notus or 
Auster, the south, and Eurus, the east. The first 
two have been chiefly celebrated by the poets, 
the former as the type of rudeness, the latter of 
gentleness. Boreas loved the nymph Orithyia and 
tried to play the lover’s part, but met with poor 
success. It was hard for him to breathe gently, 
and sighing was out of the question. Weary at 
last of fruitless endeavors, he acted out his true 
character, seized the maiden, and carried her off. 
Their children were Zetes and Calais, winged 
warriors, who accompanied the Argonautic ex¬ 
pedition and did good service in an encounter 
with those monstrous birds the Harpies. 

Zephyrus was the lover of Flora. Milton al¬ 
ludes to them in Paradise Lost, where he de¬ 
scribes Adam waking and contemplating Eve 

still asleep: 

He on his side 
Leaning half raised, with looks of cordial love, 
Hung over her enamored, and beheld 
Beauty which, whether waking or asleep, 
Shot forth peculiar graces; then with voice, 
Mild as when Zephyrus on Flora breathes, 
Her hand soft touching, whispered thus: “Awake! 
My fairest, my espoused, my latest found, 
Heaven’s last, best gift, my ever-new delight.” 

Dr. Young, the poet of the Night Thoughts, 
addressing the idle and luxurious, says, 

Ye delicate! who nothing can support, 
(Yourselves most insupportable,) for whom 
The winter rose must blow,. 
.and silky soft 
Favonius breathe still softer or be chid! 
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CHAPTER XXIII 

ACHELOUS AND HERCULES-ADMETUS AND 
ALCESTIS—ANTIGONE—PENELOPE 

ACHELOUS AND HERCULES 

The river god Achelous told the story of Erisich- 
thon to Theseus and his companions, whom he 
was entertaining at his hospitable board, while 
they were delayed on their journey by the over¬ 
flow of his waters. Having finished his story he 
added, “But why should I tell of other persons’ 
transformations, when I myself am an instance of 
the possession of this power? Sometimes I be¬ 
come a serpent, and sometimes a bull, with horns 
on my head. Or I should say, I once could do so; 
but now I have but one horn, having lost one.” 
And here he groaned and was silent. 

Theseus asked him the cause of his grief and 
how he lost his horn. To which question the 
river god replied as follows: “Who likes to tell 
of his defeats? Yet I will not hesitate to relate 
mine, comforting myself with the thought of the 
greatness of my conqueror, for it was Hercules. 
Perhaps you have heard of the fame of Dejanira, 
the fairest of maidens, whom a host of suitors 
strove to win. Hercules and myself were of the 
number, and the rest yielded to us two. He urged 
in his behalf his descent from Jove and his labors, 
by which he had exceeded the exactions of Juno, 
his stepmother. I, on the other hand, said to the 
father of the maiden, ‘Behold me, the king of the 
waters that flow through your land. I am no 
stranger from a foreign shore, but belong to the 
country, a part of your realm. Let it not stand 
in my way that royal Juno owes me no enmity, 
nor punishes me with heavy tasks. As for this 
man, who boasts himself the son of Jove, it is 
either a false pretence, or disgraceful to him if 
true, for it cannot be true except by his mother’s 
shame.’ As I said this, Hercules scowled upon me 
and, with difficulty, restrained his rage. ‘My 
hand will answer better than my tongue,’ said he. 
‘I yield you the victory in words, but trust my 
cause to the strife of deeds.’ With that he ad¬ 
vanced towards me, and I was ashamed, after 
what I had said, to yield. I threw off my green 
vesture and presented myself for the struggle. 
He tried to throw me, now attacking my head, 
now my body. My bulk was my protection, and 
he assailed me in vain. For a time we stopped, 
then returned to the conflict. We each kept our 

position, determined not to yield, foot to foot, I 
bending over him, clinching his hands in mine, 
with my forehead almost touching his. Thrice 
Hercules tried to throw me off, and the fourth 
time he succeeded, brought me to the ground 
and himself upon my back. I tell you the truth, 
it was as if a mountain had fallen on me. I 
struggled to get my arms at liberty, panting and 
reeking with perspiration. He gave me no chance 
to recover, but seized my throat. My knees were 
on the earth and my mouth in the dust. 

“Finding that I was no match for him in the 
warrior’s art, I resorted to others, and glided 
away in the form of a serpent. I curled my body 
in a coil and hissed at him with my forked 
tongue. He smiled scornfully at this and said, ‘It 
was the labor of my infancy to conquer snakes.’ 
So saying he clasped my neck with his hands. I 
was almost choked, and struggled to get my neck 
out of his grasp. Vanquished in this form, I tried 
what alone remained to me, and assumed the 
form of a bull. He grasped my neck with his arm 
and, dragging my head down to the ground, 
overthrew me on the sand. Nor was this enough. 
His ruthless hand rent my horn from my head. 
The Naiads took it, consecrated it, and filled it 
with fragrant flowers. Plenty adopted my horn 
and made it her own, and called it cornucopia.” 

The ancients were fond of finding a hidden 
meaning in their mythological tales. They explain 
this fight of Achelous with Hercules by saying, 
Achelous was a river that in seasons of rain over¬ 
flowed its banks. When the fable says that 
Achelous loved Dejanira and sought a union with 
her, the meaning is that the river in its windings 
flowed through part of Dejanira’s kingdom. It 
was said to take the form of a snake because of 
its winding, and of a bull because it made a 
brawling or roaring in its course. When the river 
swelled, it made itself another channel. Thus its 
head was horned. Hercules prevented the return 
of these periodical overflows by embankments 
and canals; and therefore he was said to have 
vanquished the river god and cut off his horn. 
Finally, the lands formerly subject to overflow, 
but now redeemed, became very fertile, and this 
is meant by the horn of plenty. 

There is another account of the origin of the 
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cornucopia. Jupiter at his birth was committed 
by his mother Rhea to the care of the daughters 
of Melisseus, a Cretan king. They fed the infant 
deity with the milk of the goat Amalthea. Jupiter 
broke off one of the horns of the goat and gave 
it to his nurses, and endowed it with the wonder¬ 
ful power of becoming filled with whatever the 

possessor might wish. 
The name of Amalthea is also given by some 

writers to the mother of Bacchus. It is thus used 
by Milton, P.L., Book IV: 

. . . That Nyseian isle, 
Girt with the river Triton, where old Cham, 
Whom Gentiles Ammon call, and Libyan Jove, 
Hid Amalthea and her florid son, 
Young Bacchus, from his stepdame Rhea’s eye. 

ADMETUS AND ALCESTIS 

Aesculapius, the son of Apollo, was endowed by 
his father with such skill in the healing art that 
he even restored the dead to life. At this, Pluto 
took alarm and prevailed on Jupiter to launch a 
thunderbolt at Aesculapius. Apollo was indignant 
at the destruction of his son and wreaked his 
vengeance on the innocent workmen who had 
made the thunderbolt. These were the Cyclopes, 
who have their workshop under Mount Aetna, 
from which the smoke and flames of their fur¬ 
naces are constantly issuing. Apollo shot his 
arrows at the Cyclopes, which so incensed Jupi¬ 
ter that he condemned him as a punishment to 
become the servant of a mortal for the space of 
one year. Accordingly Apollo went into the 
service of Admetus, King of Thessaly, and 
pastured his flocks for him on the verdant banks 
of the river Amphrysos. 

Admetus was a suitor, with others, for the 
hand of Alcestis, the daughter of Pelias, who 
promised her to him who should come for her in 
a chariot drawn by lions and boars. This task 
Admetus performed by the assistance of his 
divine herdsman, and was made happy in the pos¬ 
session of Alcestis. But Admetus fell ill, and 
being near to death, Apollo prevailed on the 
Fates to spare him on condition that some one 
would consent to die in his stead. Admetus, in 
his joy at this reprieve, thought little of the 
ransom, and perhaps remembering the declara¬ 
tions of attachment which he had often heard 
from his courtiers and dependents, fancied that it 
would be easy to find a substitute. But it was not 
so. Brave warriors, who would willingly have 
perilled their lives for their prince, shrunk from 

the thought of dying for him on the bed of sick¬ 
ness; and old servants who had experienced his 
bounty and that of his house from their child¬ 
hood up were not willing to lay down the scanty 
remnant of their days to show their gratitude. 
Men asked, “Why does not one of his parents do 
it? They cannot in the course of nature live 
much longer, and who can feel like them the call 
to rescue the life they gave, from an untimely 
end?” But the parents, distressed though they 
were at the thought of losing him, shrunk from 
the call. Then Alcestis, with a generous self-de¬ 
votion, proffered herself as the substitute. Ad¬ 
metus, fond as he was of life, would not have 
submitted to receive it at such a cost; but there 
was no remedy. The condition imposed by the 
Fates had been met, and the decree was irrevoc¬ 
able. Alcestis sickened as Admetus revived, and 
she was rapidly sinking to the grave. 

Just at this time Hercules arrived at the palace 
of Admetus and found all the inmates in great 
distress for the impending loss of the devoted 
wife and beloved mistress. Hercules, to whom no 
labor was too arduous, resolved to attempt her 
rescue. He went and lay in wait at the door of 
the chamber of the dying queen, and when 
Death came for his prey, he seized him and 
forced him to resign his victim. Alcestis re¬ 
covered, and was restored to her husband. 

Milton alludes to the story of Alcestis in his 
sonnet on his deceased wife. 

Methought I saw my late espoused saint 
Brought to me like Alcestis from the grave, 
Whom Jove’s great son to her glad husband gave, 

Rescued from death by force, though pale and faint. 

J. R. Lowell has chosen “The Shepherd of 
King Admetus” for the subject of a short poem. 
He makes that event the first introduction of 

poetry to men. 

Men called him but a shiftless youth, 
In whom no good they saw, 

And yet unwittingly, in truth, 
They made his careless words their law. 

And day by day more holy grew 
Each spot where he had trod, 

Till after-poets only knew 
Their first-born brother was a god. 

ANTIGONE 

A large proportion, both of the interesting per¬ 
sons and of the exalted acts of legendary Greece, 
belongs to the female sex. Antigone was as bright 
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an example of filial and sisterly fidelity as was 
Alcestis of connubial devotion. She was the 
daughter of Oedipus and Jocasta, who with all 
their descendants were the victims of an unre¬ 
lenting fate, dooming them to destruction. Oedi¬ 
pus in his madness had torn out his eyes, and was 
driven forth from his kingdom Thebes, dreaded 
and abandoned by all men, as an object of divine 
vengeance. Antigone, his daughter, alone shared 
his wanderings and remained with him till he 
died, and then returned to Thebes. 

Her brothers, Eteocles and Polynices, had 
agreed to share the kingdom between them and 
reign alternately year by year. The first year 
fell to the lot of Eteocles, who, when his time 
expired, refused to surrender the kingdom to his 
brother. Polynices fled to Adrastus, king of 
Argos, who gave him his daughter in marriage, 
and aided him with an army to enforce his claim 
to the kingdom. This led to the celebrated expe¬ 
dition of the “Seven against Thebes,” which 
furnished ample materials for the epic and tragic 
poets of Greece. 

Amphiaraus, the brother-in-law of Adrastus, 
opposed the enterprise, for he was a soothsayer 
and knew by his art that no one of the leaders 
except Adrastus would live to return. But 
Amphiaraus, on his marriage to Eriphyle, the 
king’s sister, had agreed that whenever he and 
Adrastus should differ in opinion, the decision 
should be left to Eriphyle. Polynices, knowing 
this, gave Eriphyle the collar of Harmonia and 
thereby gained her to his interest. This collar or 
necklace was aT present which Vulcan had given 
to Harmonia on her marriage with Cadmus, and 
Polynices had taken it with him on his flight 
from Thebes. Eriphyle could not resist so tempt¬ 
ing a bribe, and by her decision the war was re¬ 
solved on, and Amphiaraus went to his certain 
fate. He bore his part bravely in the contest, but 
could not avert his destiny. Pursued by the 
enemy, he fled along the river, when a thunder¬ 
bolt launched by Jupiter opened the ground, and 
he, his chariot and his charioteer were swallowed 
up. 

It would not be in place here to detail all the 
acts of heroism or atrocity which marked the 
contest; but we must not omit to record the 
fidelity of Evadne as an offset to the weakness 
of Eriphyle. Capaneus, the husband of Evadne, 
in the ardor of the fight declared that he would 
force his way into the city in spite of Jove 
himself. Placing a ladder against the wall, he 
mounted, but Jupiter, offended at his impious 
language, struck him with a thunderbolt. When 
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his obsequies were celebrated, Evadne cast her¬ 
self on his funeral pile and perished. 

Early in the contest Eteocles consulted the 
soothsayer Tiresias as to the issue. Tiresias in 
his youth had by chance seen Minerva bathing. 
The goddess in her wrath deprived him of his 
sight, but afterwards relenting, gave him in com¬ 
pensation the knowledge of future events. When 
consulted by Eteocles, he declared that victory 
should fall to Thebes if Minoeceus, the son of 
Creon, gave himself, a voluntary victim. The 
heroic youth, learning the response, threw away 
his life in the first encounter. 

The siege continued long, with various success. 
At length both hosts agreed that the brothers 
should decide their quarrel by single combat. 
They fought and fell by each other’s hands. The 
armies then renewed the fight, and at last the in¬ 
vaders were forced to yield, and fled, leaving 
their dead unburied. Creon, the uncle of the 
fallen princes, now become king, caused Eteocles 
to be buried with distinguished honor, but suf¬ 
fered the body of Polynices to lie where it fell, 
forbidding every one on pain of death to give it 
burial. 

Antigone, the sister of Polynices, heard with 
indignation the revolting edict which consigned 
her brother’s body to the dogs and vultures, de¬ 
priving it of those rites which were considered 
essential to the repose of the dead. Unmoved by 
the dissuading counsel of an affectionate but 
timid sister, and unable to procure assistance, she 
determined to brave the hazard and to bury the 
body with her own hands. She was detected in 
the act, and Creon gave orders that she should 
be buried alive, as having deliberately set at 
nought the solemn edict of the city. Her lover, 
Haemon, the son of Creon, unable to avert her 
fate, would not survive her, and fell by his own 
hand. 

Antigone forms the subject of two fine trage¬ 
dies of the Grecian poet Sophocles. Mrs. Jame¬ 
son, in her Characteristics of Women, has 
compared her character with that of Cordelia, in 
Shakespeare’s King Lear. The perusal of her re¬ 
marks cannot fail to gratify our readers. 

The following is the lamentation of Antigone 
over Oedipus, when death has at last relieved 
him from his sufferings: 

Alas! I only wished I might have died 
With my poor father: wherefore should I ask 
For longer life? 
O, I was fond of misery with him; 
E’en what was most unlovely grew beloved 



When he was with me. O my dearest father, 
Beneath the earth now in deep darkness hid, 
Worn as thou wert with age, to me thou still 
Wast dear, and shalt be ever. 

Francklin’s Sophocles. 

PENELOPE 

Penelope is another of those mythic heroines 
whose beauties were rather those of character 
and conduct than of person. She was the daughter 
of Icarius, a Spartan prince. Ulysses, King of 
Ithaca, sought her in marriage, and won her over 
all competitors. When the moment came for the 
bride to leave her father’s house, Icarius, unable 
to bear the thought of parting with his daughter, 
tried to persuade her to remain with him and not 
accompany her husband to Ithaca. Ulysses gave 
Penelope her choice, to stay or go with him. 
Penelope made no reply, but dropped her veil 
over her face. Icarius urged her no further, but 
when she was gone, erected a statue to Modesty 
on the spot where they parted. 

Ulysses and Penelope had not enjoyed their 
union more than a year when it was interrupted 
by the events which called Ulysses to the Trojan 
war. During his long absence, and when it was 
doubtful whether he still lived, and highly im¬ 
probable that he would ever return, Penelope 
was importuned by numerous suitors, from 
whom there seemed no refuge but in choosing 
one of them for her husband. Penelope, however, 
employed every art to gain time, still hoping for 
Ulysses’ return. One of her arts of delay was en¬ 
gaging in the preparation of a robe for the 
funeral canopy of Laertes, her husband’s father. 
She pledged herself to make her choice among 
the suitors when the robe was finished. During 
the day she worked at the robe, but in the night 
she undid the work of the day. This is the famous 
Penelope’s web, which is used as a proverbial ex¬ 
pression for any thing which is perpetually doing 
but never done. The rest of Penelope’s history 
will be told when we give an account of her 
husband’s adventures. 

The Return of Ulysses. Pintoricchio. (National 
Gallery, London.') 
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CHAPTER XXIV 

ORPHEUS AND EURYDICE—ARISTAEUS—AMPHION 
-LINUS-TH AM YRIS-M ARSY AS- 

MEL AMPUS-MUS AEUS 

ORPHEUS AND EURYDICE 

Orpheus was the son of Apollo and j;hg_AUise- 
Ualliope. He was presented Tiy his father with a 
lyre and taught to play upon it, which he did to 
such perfection that nothing could withstand the 
charm of his music. Not only his fellow-mortals 
but wild beasts were softened by his strains, and 
gathering round him laid by their fierceness, and 
stood entranced with his lay. Nay, the very trees 

ions, was seen by the shepherd Aristaeus, who 
was struck with her beauty, and made advances 
-to her. She fled, and in flying trod upon a snake 
in the grass, was bitten in the foot, and died. 
Orpheus sang his grief to all who breathed the 
upper air, both gods and men, and finding it all 
unavailing, resolved to seek his wife in the re¬ 
gions of the dead. He descended by a cave situ¬ 
ated on the side of the promontory of Taenarus 
and arrived at the Stygian realm. He passed 

Orpheus Singing. From a Greek vase. (Antikenmuseum, Berlin.) 

and rocks were sensible to the charm. The former 
crowded round him and the latter relaxed some¬ 
what of their hardness, softened by his notes. 

Hymen had been called to bless with his pres¬ 
ence the nuptials of Orpheus with Eurydice; but 
though he attended, he brought no happy omens 
with him. His very torch smoked and brought 
tears into their eyes. In coincidence with such 
prognostics Eurydice, shortly after her marriage, 
while wandering with the nymphs, her compan¬ 

through crowds of ghosts and presented himself 
before the throne of Pluto and Proserpine. Ac¬ 
companying the words with the lyre, he sang, 
“O deities of the underworld, to whom all we 
who live must come, hear my words, for they 
are true. I come not to spy out the secrets of 

Opposite: Orpheus at the Tomb of Eurydice. 
Gustave Moreau. (Gustave Moreau Museum, 

Paris.) 
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Tartarus, nor to try my strength against the 
three-headed dog with snaky hair who guards 
the entrance. I come to seek my wife, whose 
opening years the poisonous viper’s fang has 
brought to an untimely end. Love has led me 
here, Love, a god all powerful with us who dwell 
on the earth, and, if old traditions say true, not 
less so here. I implore you by these abodes full of 
terror, these realms of silence and uncreated 
things, unite again the thread of Eurydice’s life. 
We all are destined to you, and sooner or later 
must pass to your domain. She, too, when she 
shall have filled her term of life, will rightly be 
yours. But till then grant her to me, I beseech 
you. If you deny me, I cannot return alone; you 
shall triumph in the death of us both.” 

As he sang these tender strains, the very ghosts 
shed tears. Tantalus, in spite of his thirst, stopped 
for a moment his efforts for water, Ixion’s wheel 
stood still, the vulture ceased to tear the giant’s 
liver, the daughters of Danaiis rested from their 
task of drawing water in a sieve, and Sisyphus 
sat on his rock to listen. Then for the first time, 
it is said, the cheeks of the Furies were wet with 
tears. Proserpine could not resist, and Pluto him¬ 
self gave way. Eurydice was called. She came 
from among the new-arrived ghosts, limping 
with her wounded foot. Orpheus was permitted 
to take her away with him on one condition, 
that he should not turn round to look at her till 
they should have reached the upper air. Under 
this condition they proceeded on their way, he 
leading, she following, through passages dark and 
steep, in total silence, till they had nearly reached 
the outlet into the cheerful upper world, when 
Orpheus, in a moment of forgetfulness, to as¬ 
sure himself that she was still following, cast a 
glance behind him, when instantly she was borne 
away. Stretching out their arms to embrace one 
another, they grasped only the air! Dying now a 
second time she yet cannot reproach her husband, 
for how can she blame his impatience to behold 
her! “Farewell,” she said, “a last farewell,” and 
was hurried away so fast that the sound hardly 

reached his ears. 
Orpheus endeavored to follow her and be¬ 

sought permission to return and try once more 
for her release; but the stern ferryman repulsed 
him and refused passage. Seven days he lingered 
about the brink, without food or sleep; then 
bitterly accusing of cruelty the powers of Erebus, 
he sang his complaints to the rocks and moun¬ 
tains, melting the hearts of tigers and moving the 
oaks from their stations. He held himself aloof 
from womankind, dwelling constantly on the 

recollection of his sad mischance. The Thracian 
maidens tried their best to captivate him, but he 
repulsed their advances. They bore with him as 
long as they could; but finding him insensible, 
one day, excited by the rites of Bacchus, one of 
them exclaimed, “See yonder our despiser!” and 
threw at him her javelin. The weapon, as soon 
as it came within the sound of his lyre, fell harm¬ 
less at his feet. So did also the stones that they 
threw at him. But the women raised a scream 
and drowned the voice of the music, and then 
the missiles reached him and soon were stained 
with his blood. The maniacs tore him limb from 
limb, and threw his head and his lyre into the 
river Hebrus, down which they floated, murmur¬ 
ing sad music, to which the shores responded a 
plaintive symphony. The Muses gathered up the 
fragments of his body and buried them at 
Libethra, where the nightingale is said to sing 
over his grave more sweetly than in any other 
part of Greece. His lyre was placed by Jupiter 
among the stars. His shade passed a second time 
to Tartarus, where he sought out his Eurydice 
and embraced her, with eager arms. They roam 
the happy fields together now, sometimes he 
leading, sometimes she; and Orpheus gazes as 
much as he will upon her, no longer incurring a 
penalty for a thoughtless glance. 

The story of Orpheus has furnished Pope with 
an illustration of the power of music, for his 
“Ode for Music on St. Cecilia’s Day.” The fol¬ 
lowing stanza relates the conclusion of the Story: 

But soon, too soon the lover turns his eyes; 
Again she falls, again she dies, she dies! 
How wilt thou now the fatal sisters move? 
No crime was thine, if ’tis no crime to love. 

Now under hanging mountains, 
Beside the falls of fountains, 
Or where Hebrus wanders, 
Rolling in meanders, 

All alone, 
He makes his moan, 
And calls her ghost, 

Forever, ever, ever lost! 
Now with furies surrounded, 
Despairing, confounded, 
He trembles, he glows, 
Amidst Rhodope’s snows. 

See, wild as the winds o’er the desert he flies; 
Hark! Haemus resounds with the Bacchanals’ cries. 

Ah, see, he dies! 

Opposite: Orpheus. Odilon Redon. (Cleveland 

Museum of Art.) 
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Yet even in death Eurydice he sung, 
Eurydice still trembled on his tongue: 
Eurydice the woods 
Eurydice the floods 
Eurydice the rocks and hollow mountains rung. 

The superior melody of the nightingale s song 
over the grave of Orpheus is alluded to by 

Southey in his “Thalaba”: 

Then on his ear what sounds 
Of harmony arose! 

Far music and the distance-mellowed song 
From bowers of merriment; 

The waterfall remote; 
The murmuring of the leafy groves; 

The single nightingale 
Perched in the rosier by, so richly toned, 
That never from that most melodious bird 
Singing a love song to his brooding mate, 

Did Thracian shepherd by the grave 
Of Orpheus hear a sweeter melody, 

Though there the spirit of the sepulchre 
All his own power infuse, to swell 

The incense that he loves. 

ARISTAEUS, THE BEE-KEEPER 

Man avails himself of the instincts of the inferior 
animals for his own advantages. Hence sprang 
the art of keeping bees. Honey must first have 
been known as a wild product, the bees building 
their structures in hollow trees, or holes in the 
rocks, or any similar cavity that chance offered. 
Thus’occasionally the carcass of a dead animal 
would be occupied by the bees for that purpose. 
It was no doubt from some such incident that the 
superstition arose that the bees were engendered 
by the decaying flesh of the animal; and Virgil, 
in the following story, shows how this supposed 
fact may be turned to account for renewing the 
swarm when it has been lost by disease or acci¬ 

dent. 
Aristaeus, who first taught the management of 

bees, was the son of the water-nymph Cyrene. 
His bees had perished, and he resorted for aid to 
his mother. He stood at the riverside and thus 
addressed her: “Oh, Mother, the pride of my life 
is taken from me! I have lost my precious bees. 
My care and skill have availed me nothing, and 
you my mother have not warded off from me 
the blow of misfortune.” His mother heard these 
complaints as she sat in her palace at the bottom 

The Story of Aristaeus. Niccolo dell Abbate. 

(.National Gallery, London.) 
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of the river with her attendant nymphs around 
her. They were engaged in female occupations, 
spinning and weaving, while one told stories to 
amuse the rest. The sad voice of Aristaeus inter¬ 
rupting their occupation, one of them put her 
head above the water, and seeing him, returned 
and gave information to his mother, who ordered 
that he should be brought into her presence. 
The river at her command opened itself and let 
him pass in, while it stood curled like a moun¬ 
tain on either side. He descended to the region 
where the fountains of the great rivers lie; he 
saw the enormous receptacles of waters and was 
almost deafened with the roar, while he surveyed 
them hurrying off in various directions to 
water the face of the earth. Arriving at his 
mother’s apartments he was hospitably received 
by Cyrene and her nymphs, who spread their 
table with the richest dainties. They first poured 
out libations to Neptune, then regaled themselves 
with the feast, and after that Cyrene thus ad¬ 
dressed him: “There is an old prophet named 
Proteus, who dwells in the sea and is a favorite 
of Neptune whose herd of sea-calves he pastures. 
We nymphs hold him in great respect, for he is 
a learned sage and knows all things, past, present, 
and to come. He can tell you, my son, the cause 
of the mortality among your bees and how you 
may remedy it. But he will not do it voluntarily, 
however you may entreat him. You must compel 
him by force. If you seize him and chain him, 
he will answer your questions in order to get 
released, for he cannot by all his arts get away 
if you hold fast the chains. I will carry you to 
his cave, where he comes at noon to take his 
midday repose. Then you may easily secure him. 
But when he finds himself captured, his resort is 
to a power he possesses of changing himself into 
various forms. He will become a wild boar or a 
fierce tiger, a scaly dragon or lion with yellow 
mane. Or he will make a noise like the crackling 
of flames or the rush of water, so as to tempt you 
to let go the chain, when he will make his escape. 
But you have only to keep him fast bound, and 
at last when he finds all his arts unavailing, he 
will return to his own figure and obey your 
commands.’’ So saying she sprinkled her son with 
fragrant nectar, the beverage of the gods, and 
immediately an unusual vigor filled his frame 
and courage his heart, while perfume breathed 

all around him. 
The nymph led her son to the prophet’s cave 

and concealed him among the recesses of the 
rocks, while she herself took her place behind 
the clouds. When noon came and the hour when 

men and herds retreat from the glaring sun to 
indulge in quiet slumber, Proteus issued from the 
water, followed by his herd of sea-calves, which 
spread themselves along the shore. He sat on the 
rock and counted his herd; then stretched him¬ 
self on the floor of the cave and went to sleep. 
Aristaeus hardly allowed him to get fairly asleep 
before he fixed the fetters on him and shouted 
aloud. Proteus, waking and finding himself cap¬ 
tured, immediately resorted to his arts, becoming 
first a fire, then a flood, then a horrible wild beast, 
in rapid succession. But finding all would not do, 
he at last resumed his own form and addressed 
the youth in angry accents: “Who are you, bold 
youth, who thus invade my abode, and what do 
you want with me?” Aristaeus replied, Proteus, 
you know already, for it is needless for any one 
to attempt to deceive you. And do you also cease 
your efforts to elude me. I am led hither by 
divine assistance, to know from you the cause 
of my misfortune and how to remedy it. ’ At 
these words the prophet, fixing on him his pray 
eyes, with a piercing look, thus spoke: “You 
receive the merited reward of your deeds, by 
which Eurydice met her death, for in flying 
from you she trod upon a serpent, of whose bite 
she died. To avenge her death, the nymphs her 
companions have sent this destruction to your 
bees. You have to appease their anger, and thus 
it must be done: Select four bulls, of perfect 
form and size, and four cows of equal beauty, 
build four altars to the nymphs, and sacrifice the 
animals, leaving their carcasses in the leafy grove. 
To Orpheus and Eurydice you shall pay such 
funeral honors as may allay their resentment. Re¬ 
turning after nine days you will examine the 
bodies of the cattle slain and see what will befall.” 
Aristaeus faithfully obeyed these directions. He 
sacrificed the cattle, he left their bodies in the 
grove, he offered funeral honors to the shades of 
Orpheus and Eurydice; then, returning on the 
ninth day, he examined the bodies of the animals, 
and, wonderful to relate! a swarm of bees had 
taken possession of one of the carcasses and were 
pursuing their labors there as in a hive. 

In The Task, Cowper alludes to the story of 
Aristaeus, when speaking of the ice-palace built 
by the Empress Anne of Russia. He has been de¬ 
scribing the fantastic forms which ice assumes 
in connection with waterfalls, &c. 

Less worthy of applause though more admired 
Because a novelty, the work of man, 
Imperial mistress of the fur-clad Russ, 
Thy most magnificent and mighty freak, 
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The wonder of the north. No forest fell 
When thou wouldst build, no quarry sent its stores 
T’enrich thy walls; but thou didst hew the floods 
And make thy marble of the glassy wave. 
In such a palace Aristaeus found 
Gyrene, when he bore the plaintive tale 
Of his lost bees to her maternal ear. 

Milton also appears to have had Cyrene and 
her domestic scene in his mind when he describes 
to us Sabrina, the nymph of the river Severn, in 
the guardian-spirit’s song in Comus: 

Sabrina fair! 
Listen where thou art sitting 

Under the glassy, cool, translucent wave 
In twisted braids of lilies knitting 

The loose train of thy amber-dropping hair; 
Listen for dear honor’s sake, 
Goddess of the silver lake! 

Listen and save. 

The following are other celebrated mythical 
poets and musicians, some of whom were hardly 
inferior to Orpheus himself: 

AMPHION 

Amphion was the son of Jupiter and Antiope, 
Queen of Thebes. With his twin brother Zethus 
he was exposed at birth on Mount Cithaeron, 
where they grew up among the shepherds, not 
knowing their parentage. Mercury gave Am¬ 
phion a lyre and taught him to play upon it, 
and his brother occupied himself in hunting and 
tending the flocks. Meanwhile Antiope, their 
mother, who had been treated with great cruelty 
by Lycus, the usurping king of Thebes, and by 
Dirce, his wife, found means to inform her chil¬ 
dren of their rights and to summon them to her 
assistance. With a band of their fellow-herdsmen 
they attacked and slew Lycus, and tying Dirce 
by the hair of her head to a bull, let him drag her 
till she was dead.* Amphion, having become king 
of Thebes, fortified the city with a wall. It is 
said that when he played on his lyre, the stones 
moved of their own accord and took their places 
in the wall. 

See Tennyson’s poem of “Amphion” for an 
amusing use made of this story. 

LINUS 

Linus was the instructor of Hercules in music, 
but having one day reproved his pupil rather 
harshly, he roused the anger of Hercules, who 
struck him with his lyre and killed him. 

THAMYRIS 

An ancient Thracian bard, who in his presump¬ 
tion challenged the Muses to a trial of skill, and 
being overcome in the contest, was deprived by 
them of his sight. Milton alludes to him, with 
other blind bards, when speaking of his own 
blindness, P. L., Book III, 35. 

MARSYAS 

Minerva invented the flute and played upon it to 
the delight of all the celestial auditors; but the 
mischievous urchin Cupid having dared to laugh 
at the queer face which the goddess made while 

* The punishment of Dirce is the subject of a 
celebrated group of statuary now in the Musaeum 
Naples. 



playing, Minerva threw the instrument indig¬ 
nantly away, and it fell down to earth, and was 
found by Marsyas. He blew upon it and drew 
from it such ravishing sounds that he was tempted 
to challenge Apollo himself to a musical contest. 
The god, of course, triumphed and punished 

Marsyas by flaying him alive. 

MELAMPUS 

heard the wood-worms in the timbers talking 
together and found out by what they said that 
the timbers were nearly eaten through and the 
roof would soon fall in. He told his captors and 
demanded to be let out, warning them also. They 
took his warning, and thus escaped destruction, 
and rewarded Melampus and held him in high 

honor. 

MUSAEUS 

Melampus was the first mortal endowed with 
prophetic powers. Before his house there stood 
an oak tree containing a serpent’s nest. The old 
serpents were killed by the servants, but Me¬ 
lampus took care of the young ones and fed 
them carefully. One day when he was asleep 
under the oak, the serpents licked his ears with 
their tongues. On awaking, he was astonished to 
find that he now understood the language of 
birds and creeping things. This knowledge en¬ 
abled him to foretell future events, and he be¬ 
came a renowned soothsayer. At one time his 
enemies took him captive and kept him strictly 
imprisoned. Melampus in the silence of the night 

A semi-mythological personage who was repre¬ 
sented by one tradition to be the son of Orpheus. 
He is said to have written sacred poems and 
oracles. Milton couples his name with that of 

Orpheus in his II Penseroso: 

But O, sad virgin, that thy power 
Might raise Musaeus from his bower, 
Or bid the soul of Orpheus sing 
Such notes as warbled to the string, 
Drew iron tears down Pluto’s cheek, 
And made Hell grant what love did seek. 

Apollo. Greek. (British Museum, London.) 

Opposite: Orpheus, Eurydice and Mercury. 
Greek. (National Museum, Naples.) 
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CHAPTER XXV 

ARION—IBYCUS—SIMONIDES—SAPPHO 

The poets whose adventures compose this chap¬ 
ter were real persons, some of whose works yet 
remain, and their influence on poets who suc¬ 
ceeded them is yet more important than their 
poetical remains. The adventures recorded of 
them in the following stories rest on the same 
authority as other narratives of the Age of Fable, 
that is, of the poets who have told them. In their 
present form, the first two are translated from 
the German, Arion from Schlegel and Ibycus 

from Schiller. 

ARION 

Arion was a famous musician and dwelt at the 
court of Periander, King of Corinth, with whom 
he was a great favorite. There was to be a musi¬ 
cal contest in Sicily, and Arion longed to com¬ 
pete for the prize. He told his wish to Periander, 
who besought him like a brother to give up the 
thought. “Pray stay with me,” he said, “and be 
contented. He who strives to win may lose. 
Arion answered, “A wandering life best suits the 
free heart of a poet. The talent which a god 
bestowed on me I would fain make a source of 
pleasure to others. And if I win the prize, how 
will the enjoyment of it be increased by the con¬ 
sciousness of my widespread fame!” He went, 
won the prize, and embarked with his wealth in 
a Corinthian ship for home. On the second morn¬ 
ing after setting sail, the wind breathed mild and 
fair. “Oh, Periander,” he exclaimed, “dismiss your 
fears! Soon shall you forget them in my embrace. 
With what lavish offerings will we display our 
gratitude to the gods, and how merry will we 
be at the festal board!” The wind and sea con¬ 
tinued propitious. Not a cloud dimmed the firma¬ 
ment. He had not trusted too much to the 
ocean—but he had to man. He overheard the 
seamen exchanging hints with one another, and 
found they were plotting to possess themselves 
of his treasure. Presently they surrounded him, 
loud and mutinous, and said, “Arion, you must 
die! If you would have a grave on shore, yield 
yourself to die on this spot; but if otherwise, cast 
yourself into the sea.” “Will nothing satisfy you 
but my life?” said he. “Take my gold, and wel¬ 
come. I willingly buy my life at that price.” “No, 
no; we cannot spare you. Your life would be 

too dangerous to us. Where could we go to 
escape from Periander, if he should know that 
you had been robbed by us? Your gold would be 
of little use to us, if, on returning home, we 
could never more be free from fear.” “Grant me, 
then,” said he, “a last request, since nought will 
avail to save my life-that I may die as I have 
lived, as becomes a bard. When I shall have sung 
my death song, and my harp-strings shall have 
ceased to vibrate, then I will bid farewell to life 
and yield uncomplaining to my fate.” This 
prayer, like the others, would have been unheeded 
—they thought only of their booty—but to hear 
so famous a musician, that moved their rude 
hearts. “Suffer me,” he added, “to arrange my 
dress. Apollo will not favor me unless I be clad 

in my minstrel garb.” 
He clothed his well-proportioned limbs in gold 

and purple fair to see, his tunic fell around him 
in graceful folds, jewels adorned his arms, his 
brow was crowned with a golden wreath, and 
over his neck and shoulders flowed his hair per¬ 
fumed with odors. His left hand held the lyre, 
his right the ivory wand with which he struck 
its chords. Like one inspired, he seemed to drink 
the morning air and glitter in the morning ray. 
The seamen gazed with admiration. He strode 
forward to the vessel’s side and looked down 
into the blue sea. Addressing his lyre, he sang, 
“Companion of my voice, come with me to the 
realm of shades. Though Cerberus may growl, 
we know the power of song can tame his rage. 
Ye heroes of Elysium, who have passed the 
darkling flood—ye happy souls, soon shall I join 
your band. Yet can ye relieve my grief? Alas, I 
leave my friend behind me. Thou, who didst find 
thy Eurydice and lose her again as soon as found; 
when she had vanished like a dream, how didst 
thou hate the cheerful light! I must away, but I 
will not fear. The gods look down upon us. Ye 
who slay me unoffending, when I am no more, 
your time of trembling shall come. Ye Nereids, re¬ 
ceive your guest, who throws himself upon your 
mercy!” So saying, he sprang into the deep sea. 
The waves covered him, and the seamen held on 
their way, fancying themselves safe from all 

danger of detection. 
But the strains of his music had drawn round 

him the inhabitants of the deep to listen, and 



dolphins followed the ship as if chained by a 
spell. While he struggled in the waves, a dolphin 
offered him his back and carried him mounted 
thereon safe to shore. At the spot where he 
landed, a monument of brass was afterwards 
erected upon the rocky shore, to preserve the 
memory of the event. 

When Arion and the dolphin parted, each to 
his own element, Arion thus poured forth his 
thanks. Farewell, thou faithful, friendly fish! 
Would that I could reward thee; but thou canst 
not wend with me, nor I with thee. Companion- 
snip we may not have. May Galatea, queen of 
the deep, accord thee her favor, and thou, proud 
of the burden, draw her chariot over the smooth 
mirror of the deep.” 

Arion hastened from the shore and soon saw 
before him the towers of Corinth. He journeyed 
on, harp in hand, singing as he went, full of love 
and happiness, forgetting his losses and mindful 
only of what remained, his friend and his lyre. 
He entered the hospitable halls, and was soon 
clasped in the embrace of Periander. “I come 
back to thee, my friend,” he said. “The talent 
which a god bestowed has been the delight of 
thousands, but false knaves have stripped me of 
my well-earned treasure; yet I retain the con¬ 
sciousness of widespread fame.” Then he told 
Periander all the wonderful events that had be¬ 
fallen him, who heard him with amazement. 
“Shall such wickedness triumph?” said he. “Then 
in vain is power lodged in my hands. That we 
may discover the criminals, you must remain 
here in concealment, and so they will approach 
without suspicion.” When the ship arrived in the 
harbor, he summoned the mariners before him. 
“Have you heard any thing of Arion?” he in¬ 
quired. “I anxiously look for his return.” They 
replied, “We left him well and prosperous in 
Tarentum.” As they said these words, Arion 
stepped forth and faced them. His well-propor¬ 
tioned limbs were arrayed in gold and purple 
fair to see, his tunic fell around him in graceful 
folds, jewels adorned his arms, his brow was 
crowned with a golden wreath, and over his neck 
and shoulders flowed his hair perfumed with 
odors; his left hand held the lyre, his right the 
ivory wand with which he struck its chords. 
They fell prostrate at his feet, as if a lightning- 
bolt had struck them. “We meant to murder 
him, and he has become a god. O Earth, open 
and receive us!” Then Periander spoke. “He lives, 
the master of the lay! Kind Heaven protects the 
poet’s life. As for you, I invoke not the spirit of 
vengeance; Arion wishes not your blood. Ye 

22i 

slaves of avarice, begone! Seek some barbarous 
land, and never may aught beautiful delight vour 
souls!” 

Spenser represents Arion, mounted on his dol¬ 
phin, accompanying the train of Neptune and 
Amphitrite: 

Then was there heard a most celestial sound 
Of dainty music which did next ensue, 
And, on the floating waters as enthroned, 
Arion with his harp unto him drew 
The ears and hearts of all that goodly crew; 
Even when as yet the dolphin which him bore 
Through the Aegean Seas from pirates’ view, 
Stood still, by him astonished at his lore, 

And all the raging seas for joy forgot to roar. 

Byron, in his Childe Harold, Canto II, alludes 
to the story of Arion when, describing his 
voyage, he represents one of the seamen making 
music to entertain the rest: 

The moon is up; by Heaven a lovely eve! 
Long streams of light o’er dancing waves expand; 
Now lads on shore may sign and maids believe; 
Such be our fate when we return to land! 
Meantime some rude Arion’s restless hand 
Wakes the brisk harmony that sailors love; 
A circle there of merry listeners stand, 
Or to some well-known measure featly move 

Thoughtless, as if on shore they still were free to 
rove. 

IBYCUS 

In order to understand the story of Ibycus which 
follows it is necessary to remember, first, that 
the theatres of the ancients were immense fabrics 
capable of containing from ten to thirty thou¬ 
sand spectators, and as they were used only on 
festal occasions, and admission was free to all, 
they were usually filled. They were without 
roofs and open to the sky, and the performances 
were in the daytime. Secondly, the appalling rep¬ 
resentation of the Furies is not exaggerated in the 
story. It is recorded that Aeschylus, the tragic 
poet, having on one occasion represented the 
Furies in a chorus of fifty performers, the terror 
of the spectators was such that many fainted and 
were thrown into convulsions, and the magis¬ 
trates forbade a like representation for the fu¬ 
ture. 

Ibycus, the pious poet, was on his way to the 
chariot races and musical competitions held at 
the Isthmus of Corinth, which attracted all of 
Grecian lineage. Apollo had bestowed on him 
the gift of song, the honeyed lips of the poet, 



and he pursued his way with lightsome step, full 
of the god. Already the towers of Corinth crown¬ 
ing the height appeared in view, and he had 
entered with pious awe the sacred grove of Nep¬ 
tune. No living object was in sight, only a flock 
of cranes flew overhead taking the same course 
as himself in their migration to a southern clime. 
“Good luck to you, ye friendly squadrons,” he 
exclaimed, “my companions from across the sea. 
I take your company for a good omen. We come 
from far and fly in search of hospitality. May 
both of us meet that kind reception which shields 
the stranger guest from harm! ” 

He paced briskly on, and soon was in the 
middle of the wood. There suddenly, at a nar¬ 
row pass, two robbers stepped forth and barred 
his way. He must yield or fight. But his hand, 
accustomed to the lyre and not to the strife of 
arms, sank powerless. He called for help on men 
and gods, but his cry reached no defender’s ear. 
“Then here must I die,” said he, “in a strange 
land, unlamented, cut off by the hand of outlaws, 
and see none to avenge my cause.” Sore wounded 
he sank to the earth, when hoarse screamed the 
cranes overhead, “Take up my cause, ye cranes, 
he said, “since no voice but yours answered to 
my cry.” So saying he closed his eyes in death. 

The body, despoiled and mangled, was found, 
and though disfigured with wounds, was recog¬ 
nized by the friend in Corinth who had expected 
him as a guest. “Is it thus I find you restored to 
me?” he exclaimed; “I who hoped to entwine 
your temples with the wreath of triumph in the 

strife of song!” 
The guests assembled at the festival heard the 

tidings with dismay. All Greece felt the wound, 
every heart owned its loss. They crowded round 
the tribunal of the magistrates and demanded 
vengeance on the murderers and expiation with 

their blood. 
But what trace or mark shall point out the per¬ 

petrator from amidst the vast multitude attracted 
by the splendor of the feast? Did he fall by the 
hands of robbers, or did some private enemy 
slay him? The all-discerning sun alone can tell, 
for no other eye beheld it. Yet not improbably 
the murderer even now walks in the midst of the 
throng, and enjoys the fruits of his crime, while 
vengeance seeks for him in vain. Perhaps in their 
own temple’s enclosure he defies the gods, min¬ 
gling freely in this throng of men that now presses 

into the amphitheatre. 
For now crowded together, row on row, the 

multitude fill the seats till it seems as if the very 
fabric would give way. The murmur of voices 

sounds like the roar of the sea, while the circles 
widening in their ascent rise, tier on tier, as if 

they would reach the sky. 
And now the vast assemblage listens to the 

awful voice of the chorus personating the Furies, 
which in solemn guise advances with measured 
step and moves around the circuit of the theatre. 
Can they be mortal women who compose that 
awful group, and can that vast concourse of 

silent forms be living beings! 
The choristers, clad in black, bore in their 

fleshless hands torches blazing with a pitchy 
flame. Their cheeks were bloodless, and in place 
of hair, writhing and swelling serpents curled 
around their brows. Forming a circle, these awful 
beings sang their hymn, rending the hearts of the 
guilty and enchaining all their faculties. It rose 
and swelled, overpowering the sound of the 
instruments, stealing the judgment, palsying the 

heart, curdling the blood. 
“Happy the man who keeps his heart pure 

from guilt and crime! Him we avengers touch not; 
he treads the path of life secure from us. But woe! 
woe! to him who has done the deed of secret 
murder. We the fearful family of Night fasten 
ourselves upon his whole being. Thinks he by 
flight to escape us? We fly still faster in pursuit, 
twine our snakes around his feet and bring him 
to the ground. Unwearied we pursue; no pity 
checks our course; still on and on to the end of 
life, we give him no peace nor rest.” Thus the 
Eumenides sang, and moved in solemn cadence, 
while stillness like the stillness of death sat over 
the whole assembly as if in the presence of super¬ 
human beings; and then in solemn march com¬ 
pleting the circuit of the theatre, they passed out 

at the back of the stage. 
Every heart fluttered between illusion and 

reality, and every breast panted with undefined 
terror, quailing before the awful power that 
watches secret crimes and winds unseen the skein 
of destiny. At that moment a cry burst forth 
from one of the uppermost benches—“Look! 
look! comrade, yonder are the cranes of Ibycus!” 
And suddenly there appeared sailing across the 
sky a dark object which a moment’s inspection 
showed to be a flock of cranes flying directly 
over the theatre. “Of Ibycus! did he say?” The 
beloved name revived the sorrow in every breast. 
As wave follows wave over the face of the sea, so 
ran from mouth to mouth the words, “Of Iby¬ 
cus! Him whom? we all lament, whom some mur¬ 
derer’s hand laid low! What have the cranes to 
do with him?” And louder grew the swell of 
voices, while like a lightning’s flash the thought 
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sped through every heart, “Observe the power of 
the Eumenides! The pious poet shall be avenged! 
The murderer has informed against himself. 
Seize the man who uttered that cry and the other 
to whom he spoke!” 

The culprit would gladly have recalled his 
words, but it was too late. The faces of the 
murderers pale with terror betrayed their guilt. 
The people took them before the judge, they 
confessed their crime and suffered the punish¬ 
ment they deserved. 

SIMONIDES 

Simonides was one of the most prolific of the 
early poets of Greece, but only a few fragments 
of his compositions have descended to us. He 
wrote hymns, triumphal odes, and elegies. In the 
last species of composition he particularly ex¬ 
celled. His genius was inclined to the pathetic, 
and none could touch with truer effect the chords 
of human sympathy. “The Lamentation of 
Danae,” the most important of the fragments 
which remain of his poetry, is based upon the tra¬ 
dition that Danae and her infant son were con¬ 
fined by order of her father Acrisius in a chest 
and set adrift on the sea. The chest floated towards 
the island of Seriphus, where both were rescued 
by Dictys, a fisherman, and carried to Polydectes, 
king of the country, who received and protected 
them. The child Perseus, when grown up, be¬ 
came a famous hero whose adventures have been 
recorded in a previous chapter. 

Simonides passed much of his life at the courts 
of princes and often employed his talents in 
panegyric and festal odes, receiving his reward 
from the munificence of those whose exploits he 
celebrated. This employment was not derogatory, 
but closely resembles that of the earliest bards, 
such as Demodocus, described by Homer, or of 
Homer himself as recorded by tradition. 

On one occasion when residing at the court of 
Scopas, King of Thessaly, the prince desired him 
to prepare a poem in celebration of his exploits, 
to be recited at a banquet. In order to diversify 
his theme, Simonides, who was celebrated for his 
piety, introduced into his poem the exploits of 
Castor and Pollux. Such digressions were not un¬ 
usual with the poets on similar occasions, and one 
might suppose an ordinary mortal might have 
been content to share the praises of the sons of 
Leda. But vanity is exacting; and as Scopas sat at 
his festal board among his courtiers and syco¬ 
phants, he grudged every verse that did not 
rehearse his own praises. When Simonides ap- 
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proached to receive the promised reward Scopas 
bestowed but half the expected sum, saying, 
“Here is payment for my portion of thy per¬ 
formance, Castor and Pollux will doubtless com¬ 
pensate thee for so much as relates to them.” 
The disconcerted poet returned to his seat amidst 
the laughter which followed the great man’s jest. 
In a little time he received a message that two 
young men on horseback were waiting without 
and anxious to see him. Simonides hastened to the 
door, but looked in vain for the visitors. Scarcely 
however had he left the banqueting hall when 
the roof fell in with a loud crash, burying Scopas 
and all his guests beneath the ruins. On inquiring 
as to the appearance of the young men who had 
sent for him, Simonides was satisfied that they 
were no other than Castor and Pollux themselves. 

SAPPHO 

Sappho was a poetess who flourished in a very 
early age of Greek literature. Of her works few 
fragments remain, but they are enough to estab¬ 
lish her claim to eminent poetical genius. The 
story of Sappho commonly alluded to is that she 
was passionately in love with a beautiful youth 
named Phaon, and failing to obtain a return of 
affection she threw herself from the promontory 
of Leucadia into the sea, under a superstition that 
those who should take that “Lover’s-leap” would, 
if not destroyed, be cured of their love. 

Byron alludes to the story of Sappho in Childe 
Harold, Canto II: 

Childe Harold sailed and passed the barren spot 
Where sad Penelope o’erlooked the wave, 
And onward viewed the mount, not yet forgot, 
The lover’s refuge and the Lesbian’s grave. 
Dark Sappho! could not verse immortal save 
That breast imbued with such immortal fire? 
’Twas on a Grecian autumn’s gentle eve 
Childe Harold hailed Leucadia’s cape afar; 

&c. 

Those who wish to know more of Sappho and 
her “leap” are referred to The Spectator, Nos. 
223 and 229. See also Moore’s Evenings in 
Greece. 



Sappho and Phaon with Cupid. Jacques Louis David. 
(State Hermitage Museum, Leningrad.') 

Right: Sappho at Leucadia. Antoine Jean Gros. 
(Baron-Gerard Museum, Bayeux.) 
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CHAPTER XXVI 

ENDYMION—ORION—AURORA AND TITHONUS- 
ACIS AND GALATEA 

DIANA AND ENDYMION 

Endymion was a beautiful youth who fed his 
flock on Mount Latmos. One calm, clear night, 
Diana, the Moon, looked down and saw him 
sleeping. The cold heart of the virgin goddess 
was warmed by his surpassing beauty, and she 
came down to him, kissed him, and watched 
over him while he slept. 

Another story was that Jupiter bestowed on 
him the gift of perpetual youth united with per¬ 
petual sleep. Of one so gifted we can have but 
few adventures to record. Diana, it was said, took 
care that his fortunes should not suffer by his 
inactive life, for she made his flock increase and 
guarded his sheep and lambs from the wild beasts. 

The story of Endymion has a peculiar charm 
from the human meaning which it so thinly veils. 
We see in Endymion the young poet, his fancy 
and his heart seeking in vain for that which can 
satisfy them, finding his favorite hour in the 
quiet moonlight, and nursing there beneath the 
beams of the bright and silent witness the melan¬ 
choly and the ardor which consume him. The 
story suggests aspiring and poetic love, a life 
spent more in dreams than in reality, and an early 
and welcome death.—S.G.B. 

The Endymion of Keats is a wild and fanciful 
poem, containing some exquisite poetry, as this, 
to the moon: 

The sleeping kine 
Couched in thy brightness dream of fields divine. 
Innumerable mountains rise, and rise, 
Ambitious for the hallowing of thine eyes, 
And yet thy benediction passeth not 
One obscure hiding-place, one little spot 
Where pleasure may be sent; the nested wren 
Has thy fair face within its tranquil ken; 

<' &c., &c. 

Dr. Young in the Night Thoughts alludes to 
Endymion thus: 

These thoughts, O Night, are thine; 
From thee they came like lovers’ secret sighs, 
While others slept. So Cynthia, poets feign, 
In shadows veiled, soft, sliding from her sphere, 
Her shepherd cheered, of her enamoured less 
Than I of thee. 

Fletcher, in “The Faithful Shepherdess,” tells, 

How the pale Phoebe, hunting in a grove, 
First saw the boy Endymion, from whose eyes 
She took eternal fire that never dies, 
How she conveyed him softly in a sleep, 
His temples bound with poppy, to the steep 
Head of old Latmos, where she stoops each night, 
Gilding the mountain with her brother’s light, 
To kiss her sweetest. 

Diana. Jean-Antoine Houdon. (Frick Collection, 
New York.) 

Opposite: The Triumph of Venus. Tiepolo. Overleaf: Selene (Diana) and Endymion. Nico- 
(Prado, Madrid.) lets Poussin. (Detroit Institute of Art.) 
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ORION 

Orion was the son of Neptune. He was a hand¬ 
some giant and a mighty hunter. His father gave 
him the power of wading through the depths of 
the sea, or as others say, of walking on its sur¬ 

face. 
Orion loved Merope, the daughter of Oeno- 

pion, King of Chios, and sought her in marriage. 
He cleared the island of wild beasts and brought 
the spoils of the chase as presents to his beloved; 
but as Oenopion constantly deferred his consent, 
Orion attempted to gain possession of the maiden 
by violence. Her father, incensed at this conduct, 
having made Orion drunk, deprived him of his 
sight and cast him out on the seashore. The 
blinded hero followed the sound of a Cyclops’ 
hammer till he reached Lemnos, and came to the 
forge of Vulcan, who, taking pity on him, gave 
him Kedalion, one of his men, to be his guide to 
the abode of the sun. Placing Kedalion on his 
shoulders, Orion proceeded to the east, and there, 
meeting the sun-god, was restored to sight by his 

beam. 
After this he dwelt as a hunter with Diana, 

with whom he was a favorite, and it is even said 
she was about to marry him. Her brother was 
highly displeased and often chid her, but to no 
purpose. One day, observing Orion wading 
through the sea with his head just above the 
water, Apollo pointed it out to his sister and 
maintained that she could not hit that black 
thing on the sea. The archer-goddess discharged 
a shaft with fatal aim. The waves rolled the dead 
body of Orion to the land, and bewailing her 
fatal error with many tears, Diana placed him 
among the stars, where he appears as a giant, 
with a girdle, sword, lion’s skin, and club. Sirius, 
his dog, follows him, and the Pleiads fly before 

him. 
The Pleiads were daughters of Atlas and 

nymphs of Diana’s train. One day Orion saw 
them and became enamored and pursued them. 
In their distress they prayed to the gods to 
change their form, and Jupiter in pity turned 
them into pigeons and then made them a con¬ 
stellation in the sky. Though their number was 
seven, only six stars are visible, for Electra, one 
of them, it is said left her place that she might 
not behold the ruin of Troy, for that city was 
founded by her son Dardanus. The sight had 
such an effect on her sisters that they have 
looked pale ever since. 

Mr. Longfellow has a poem on the occultation 
of Orion. The following lines are those in which 

he alludes to the mythic story. We must premise 
that on the celestial globe Orion is represented as 
robed in a lion’s skin, and wielding a club. At the 
moment the stars of the constellation one by one 
were quenched in the light of the moon, the poet 

tells us- 

Down fell the red skin of the lion 
Into the river at his feet. 
His mighty club no longer beat 
The forehead of the bull; but he 
Reeled as of yore beside the sea, 
When blinded by Oenopion 

He sought the blacksmith at his forge, 
And climbing up the narrow gorge, 

Fixed his blank eyes upon the sun. 

Tennyson has a different theory of the Pleiads. 

Many a night I saw the Pleiads, rising through the 
mellow shade, 

Glitter like a swarm of fire-flies tangled in a silver 
braid. 

Locksley Hail 

Byron alludes to the lost Pleiad. 

Like the lost Pleiad seen no more below. 

See also Mrs. Hemans’ versus on the same sub¬ 

ject. 

AURORA AND TITHONUS 

The goddess of the dawn, like her sister the 
Moon, was at times inspired with the love of 
mortals. Her greatest favorite was Tithonus, son 
of Laomedon, King of Troy. She stole him away 
and prevailed on Jupiter to grant him immor¬ 
tality; but forgetting to have youth joined in the 
gift, after some time she began to discern, to her 
great mortification, that he was growing old. 
When his hair was quite white she left his 
society; but he still had the range of her palace, 
lived on ambrosial food, and was clad in celestial 
raiment. At length he lost the power of using 
his limbs, and then she shut him up in his cham¬ 
ber, whence his feeble voice might at times be 
heard. Finally she turned him into a grasshopper. 

Memnon was the son of Aurora and Tithonus. 
He was king of the Ethiopians and dwelt in the 
extreme east, on the shore of Ocean. He came 
with his warriors to assist the kindred of his 
father in the war of Troy. King Priam received 
him with great honors and listened with ad¬ 
miration to his narrative of the wonders of the 

ocean shore. 
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The very day after his arrival, Memnon, im¬ 
patient of repose, led his troops to the field. 
Antilochus, the brave son of Nestor, fell by his 
hand, and the Greeks were put to flight, when 
Achilles appeared and restored the battle. A long 
and doubtful contest ensued between him and 
the son of Aurora; at length, victory declared 
for Achilles, Memnon fell, and the Trojans fled 
in dismay. 

Aurora, who from her station in the sky had 
viewed with apprehension the danger of her son, 
when she saw him fall directed his brothers the 
Winds to convey his body to the banks of the 
river Esepus in Paphlagonia. In the evening, 
Aurora came, accompanied by the Hours and the 
Pleiads, and wept and lamented over her son. 
Night, in sympathy with her grief, spread the 
heaven with clouds; all nature mourned for the 
offspring of the Dawn. The Ethiopians raised his 
tomb on the banks of the stream in the grove of 
the nymphs, and Jupiter caused the sparks and 
cinders of his funeral pile to be turned into birds, 
which, dividing into two flocks, fought over the 
pile till they fell into the flame. Every year at 
the anniversary of his death they return and cele¬ 
brate his obsequies in like manner. Aurora re¬ 
mains inconsolable for the loss of her son. Her 
tears still flow and may be seen at early morning 
in the form of dewdrops on the grass. 

Unlike most of the marvels of ancient myth¬ 
ology, there still exist some memorials of this. On 
the banks of the River Nile, in Egypt, are two 
colossal statues, one of which is said to be the 
statue of Memnon. Ancient writers record that 
when the first rays of the rising sun fall upon 
this statue, a sound is heard to issue from it which 
they compare to the snapping of a harpstring. 
There is some doubt about the identification of 
the existing statue with the one described by the 
ancients, and the mysterious sounds are still more 
doubtful. Yet there are not wanting some modern 
testimonies to their being still audible. It has been 
suggested that sounds produced by confined air 
making its escape from crevices or caverns in 
the rocks may have given some ground for the 
story. Sir Gardner Wilkinson, a late traveller, of 
the highest authority, examined the statue itself, 
and discovered that it was hollow and that “in 
the lap of the statue is a stone, which on being- 
struck emits a metallic sound, that might still be 
made use of to deceive a visitor who was pre¬ 
disposed to believe its powers.” 

The vocal statue of Memnon is a favorite sub¬ 
ject of allusion with the poets. Darwin in his 
Botanic Garden says— 

So to the sacred Sun in Memnon’s fane 
Spontaneous concords choired the matin strain; 
Touched by his orient beam responsive rings 
The living lyre and vibrates all its strings; 
Accordant aisles the tender tones prolong, 
And holy echoes swell the adoring song. 

B. I, i. 182 

ACIS AND GALATEA 

Scylla was a fair virgin of Sicily, a favorite of the 
sea-nymphs. She had many suitors, but repelled 
them all, and would go to the grotto of Galatea 
and tell her how she was persecuted. One day the 
goddess, while Scylla dressed her hair, listened 
to the story and then replied, “Yet, maiden, your 
persecutors are of the not ungentle race of men, 
whom if you will you can repel; but I, the 
daughter of Nereus, and protected by such a 
band of sisters, found no escape from the passion 
of the Cyclops but in the depths of the sea”; and 
tears stopped her utterance, which when the 
pitying maiden had wiped away with her deli¬ 
cate finger, and soothed the goddess, “Tell me, 
dearest,” said she, “the cause of your grief.” 
Galatea then said, “Acis was the son of Faunus 
and a Naiad. His father and mother loved him 
dearly, but their love was not equal to mine. For 
the beautiful youth attached himself to me alone, 
and he was just sixteen years old, the down just 
beginning to darken his cheeks. As much as I 
sought his society, so much did the Cyclops 
seek mine; and if you ask me whether my love 
for Acis or my hatred of Polyphemus was the 
stronger, I cannot tell you; they were in equal 
measure. O Venus, how great is thy power! This 
fierce giant, the terror of the woods, whom no 
hapless stranger escaped unharmed, who defied 
even Jove himself, learned to feel what love was 
and, touched with a passion for me, forgot his 
flocks and his well-stored caverns. Then for the 
first time he began to take some care of his ap¬ 
pearance and to try to make himself agreeable; 
he harrowed those coarse locks of his with a 
comb, and mowed his beard with a sickle, looked 
at his harsh features in the water and composed 
his countenance. His love of slaughter, his fierce¬ 
ness and thirst of blood, prevailed no more, and 
ships that touched at his island went away in 
safety. He paced up and down the seashore, im¬ 
printing huge tracks with his heavy tread, and, 
when weary, lay tranquilly in his cave. 

Overleaf: Aurora (detail). Gnercino. (Casino 
Ludovisi, Rome.) 
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“There is a cliff which projects into the sea, 
which washes it on either side. Thither one day 
the huge Cyclops ascended and sat down while 
his flocks spread themselves around. Laying down 
his staff, which would have served for a mast to 
hold a vessel’s sail, and taking his instrument 
compacted of numerous pipes, he made the hills 
and the waters echo the music of his song. I lay 
hid under a rock by the side of my beloved Acis 
and listened to the distant strain. It was full of 
extravagant praises of my beauty, mingled with 
passionate reproaches of my coldness and cruelty. 

“When he had finished, he rose up and, like a 
raging bull that cannot stand still, wandered off 
into the woods. Acis and I thought no more of 
him, till on a sudden he came to a spot which 
gave him a view of us as we sat. I see you, he 
exclaimed, ‘and I will make this the last of your 
love-meetings.’ His voice was a roar such as an 
angry Cyclops alone could utter. Aetna trembled 
at the sound. I, overcome with terror, plunged 
into the water. Acis turned and fled, crying, 
‘Save me, Galatea, save me, my parents!’ The 
Cyclops pursued him, and tearing a rock from the 
side of the mountain, hurled it at him. Though 

only a corner of it touched him, it overwhelmed 

“All that Fate left in my power I did for Acis. 
I endowed him with the honors of his grand¬ 
father the river-god. The purple blood flowed 
out from under the rock, but by degrees grew 
paler and looked like the stream of a river ren¬ 
dered turbid by rains, and in time it became 
clear. The rock cleaved open, and the water, as 
it gushed from the chasm, uttered a pleasing 

murmur.” 
Thus Acis was changed into a river, and the 

river retains the name of Acis. 
Dryden, in his “Cymon and Iphigenia, has 

told the story of a clown converted into a gentle¬ 
man by the power of love, in a way that shows 
traces of kindred to the old story of Galatea and 

the Cyclops. 

What not his father’s care nor tutor’s art 
Could plant with pains in his unpolished heart, 
The best instructor, Love, at once inspired, 
As barren grounds to fruitfulness are fired. 
Love taught him shame, and shame with love at strife 
Soon taught the sweet civilities of life. 

Opposite: Galatea. Gustave Moreau. (Private 
collection.) 





CHAPTER XXVII 

THE TROJAN WAR 

Minerva was the goddess of wisdom, but on one 
occasion she did a very foolish thing; she entered 
into competition with Juno and Venus for the 
prize of beauty. It happened thus: At the nuptials 
of Peleus and Thetis all the gods were invited 
with the exception of Eris, or Discord. Enraged 
at her exclusion, the goddess threw a golden 
apple among the guests, with the inscription, 
“For the fairest.” Thereupon Juno, Venus, and 
Minerva each claimed the apple. Jupiter, not 
willing to decide in so delicate a matter, sent the 
goddesses to Mount Ida, where the beautiful 
shepherd Paris was tending his flocks, and to 
him was committed the decision. The goddesses 
accordingly appeared before him. Juno promised 
him power and riches, Minerva glory and re¬ 
nown in war, and Venus the fairest of women 
for his wife, each attempting to bias his decision in 
her own favor. Paris decided in favor of Venus 
and gave her the golden apple, thus making the 
two other goddesses his enemies. Under the pro¬ 
tection of Venus, Paris sailed to Greece, and was 
hospitably received by Menelaus, king of Sparta. 
Now Helen, the wife of Menelaus, was the very 
woman whom Venus had destined for Paris, the 
fairest of her sex. She had been sought as a bride 
by numerous suitors, and before her decision was 
made known, they all, at the suggestion of Ulys¬ 
ses, one of their number, took an oath that they 
would defend her from all injury and avenge 
her cause if necessary. She chose Menelaus, and 
was living with him happily when Paris became 
their guest. Paris, aided by Venus, persuaded her 
to elope with him and carried her to Troy, 
whence arose the famous Trojan war, the theme 
of the greatest poems of antiquity, those of 

Homer and Virgil. 
Menelaus called upon his brother chieftains of 

Greece to fulfil their pledge and join him in his 
efforts to recover his wife. They generally came 
forward, but Ulysses, who had married Penelope 
and was very happy in his wife and child, had 
no disposition to embark in such a troublesome 
affair. He therefore hung back and Palamedes 
was sent to urge him. When Palamedes arrived 
at Ithaca, Ulysses pretended to be mad. He yoked 
an ass and an ox together to the plough and be¬ 
gan to sow salt. Palamedes, to try him, placed 
the infant Telemachus before the plough, where¬ 

upon the father turned the plough aside, showing 
plainly that he was no madman, and after that 
could no longer refuse to fulfil his promise. 
Being now himself gained for the undertaking, he 
lent his aid to bring in other reluctant chiefs, 
especially Achilles. This hero was the son of that 
Thetis at whose marriage the apple of Discord 
had been thrown among the goddesses. Thetis 
was herself one of the immortals, a sea-nymph, 
and knowing that her son was fated to perish be¬ 
fore Troy if he went on the expedition, she 
endeavored to prevent his going. She sent him 
away to the court of King Lycomedes, and in¬ 
duced him to conceal himself in the disguise of 
a maiden among the daughters of the king. 
Ulysses, hearing he was there, went disguised as 
a merchant to the palace and offered for sale fe¬ 
male ornaments, among which he had placed 
some arms. While the king’s daughters were 
engrossed with the other contents of the mer¬ 
chant’s pack, Achilles handled the weapons and 
thereby betrayed himself to the keen eye of 
Ulysses, who found no great difficulty in per¬ 
suading him to disregard his mother s prudent 
counsels and join his countrymen in the war. 

Priam was king of Troy, and Paris, the shep¬ 
herd and seducer of Helen, was his son. Paris had 
been brought up in obscurity, because there were 
certain ominous forebodings connected with him 
from his infancy that he would be the ruin of 
the state. These forebodings seemed at length 
likely to be realized, for the Grecian armament 
now in preparation was the greatest that had ever 
been fitted out. Agamemnon, king of Mycenae, 
and brother of the injured Menelaus, was chosen 
commander-in-chief. Achilles was their most 
illustrious warrior. After him ranked Ajax, gi¬ 
gantic in size and of great courage, but dull of 
intellect; Diomede, second only to Achilles in all 
the qualities of a hero; Ulysses, famous for his 
sagacity; and Nestor, the oldest of the Grecian 
chiefs, and one to whom they all looked up for 
counsel. But Troy was no feeble enemy. Priam, 
the king, was now old, but he had been a wise 
prince and had strengthened his state by good 
government at home and numerous alliances with 

Opposite: Minerva (Pallas Athene) and Centaur. 
Sandro Botticelli. (Uffizi Gallery, Florence.) 
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The Judgment of Paris. Joachim Wtewael. 
(National Gallery, London.) 
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The Rape of Helen. Benozzo Gozzoli. 
(National Gallery, London.) 
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his neighbors. But the principal stay and support 
of his throne was his son Hector, one of the 
noblest characters painted by heathen antiquity. 
He felt, from the first, a presentiment of the fall 
of his country, but still persevered in his heroic 
resistance, yet by no means justified the wrong 
which brought this danger upon her. He was 
united in marriage with Andromache, and as a 
husband and father his character was not less 
admirable than as a warrior. The principal 
leaders on the side of the Trojans, besides Hector, 
were Aeneas and Deiphobus, Glaucus and Sar- 
pedon. 

After two years of preparation the Greek 
fleet and army assembled in the port of Aulis in 
Baeotia. Here Agamemnon in hunting killed a 
stag which was sacred to Diana, and the goddess 
in return visited the army with pestilence and 
produced a calm which prevented the ships from 
leaving the port. Calchas the soothsayer there¬ 
upon announced that the wrath of the virgin 
goddess could only be appeased by the sacrifice 
of a virgin on her altar, and that none other but 
the daughter of the offender would be accept¬ 
able. Agamemnon, however reluctant, yielded 
his consent, and the maiden Iphigenia was sent 
for under the pretence that she was to be mar¬ 
ried to Achilles. When she was about to be 
sacrificed the goddess relented and snatched her 
away, leaving a hind in her place, and Iphigenia 
enveloped in a cloud was carried to Tauris, 
where Diana made her priestess of her temple. 

Tennyson, in his A Dream of Fair Women, 
makes Iphigenia thus describe her feelings at the 
moment of sacrifice; the moment represented in 
many paintings. 

I was cut off from hope in that sad place, 
Which yet to name my spirit loathes and fears; 

My father held his hand upon his face; 
I, blinded by my tears, 

Still strove to speak; my voice was thick with sighs, 
As in a dream. Dimly I could descry 

The stern black-bearded kings, with wolfish eyes, 
Waiting to see me die. 

The tall masts quivered as they lay afloat, 
The temples and the people and the shore; 

One drew a sharp knife through my tender throat 
Slowly,—and—nothing more. 

The wind now proving fair, the fleet made 
sail and brought the forces to the coast of Troy. 
The Trojans came to oppose their landing, and 
at the first onset Protesilaus fell by the hand of 

Hector. Protesilaus had left at home his wife 
Laodamia, who was most tenderly attached to 
him. When the news of his death reached her, 
she implored the gods to be allowed to converse 
with him only three hours. The request was 
granted. Mercury led Protesilaus back to the 
upper world, and when he died a second time, 
Laodamia died with him. There was a story that 
the nymphs planted elm trees round his grave 
which grew very well till they were high enough 
to command a view of Troy, and then withered 
away, while fresh branches sprang from the roots. 

Wordsworth has taken the story of Protesilaus 
and Laodamia for the subject of a poem. It seems 
the oracle had declared that victory should be 
the lot of that party from which should fall the 
first victim to the war. The poet represents Pro¬ 
tesilaus, on his brief return to earth, as relating 
to Laodamia the story of his fate: 

The wished-for wind was given; I then revolved 
The oracle, upon the silent sea; 

And if no worthier led the way, resolved 
That of a thousand vessels mine should be 

The foremost prow impressing to the strand,— 
Mine the first blood that tinged the Trojan sand. 
Yet bitter, ofttimes bitter was the pang 

When of thy loss I thought, beloved wife! 
On thee too fondly did my memory hang, 

And on the joys we shared in mortal life, 
The paths which we had trod,—these fountains, 

flowers; 
My new planned cities and unfinished towers. 

But should suspense permit the foe to cry, 
“Behold they tremble! haughty their array, 

Yet of their number no one dares to die?” 
In soul I swept the indignity away: 

Old frailties then recurred: but lofty thought 
In act imbodied my deliverance wrought. 

####### 

. . . upon the side 
Of Hellespont (such faith was entertained) 

A knot of spiry trees for ages grew 
From out the tomb of him for whom she died; 
And ever when such stature they had gained 

That Ilium’s walls were subject to their view, 
The trees’ tall summits withered at the sight, 
A constant interchange of growth and blight! 

THE ILIAD 

The war continued without decisive results for 
nine years. Then an event occurred which seemed 
likely to be fatal to the cause of the Greeks, and 
that was a quarrel between Achilles and Aga¬ 
memnon. It is at this point that the great poem 
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The Sacrifice of Iphigenia. From a Pompeiian wall painting. 
(National Museum, Naples.) 

of Homer, The Iliad, begins. The Greeks, though 
unsuccessful against Troy, had taken the neigh¬ 
boring and allied cities, and in the division of the 
spoil a female captive, by name Chryseis, daugh¬ 
ter of Chryses, priest of Apollo, had fallen to the 
share of Agamemnon. Chryses came bearing the 
sacred emblems of his office and begged the re¬ 
lease of his daughter. Agamemnon refused. 

Thereupon Chryses implored Apollo to afflict 
the Greeks till they should be forced to yield 
their prey. Apollo granted the prayer of his 
priest and sent pestilence into the Grecian camp. 
Then a council was called to deliberate how to 

Opposite: Ulysses Returns Chryseis to Her Father 
(detail). Claude Lorrain. (Louvre, Paris.) 





allay the wrath of the gods and avert the plague. 
Achilles boldly charged their misfortunes upon 
Agamemnon as caused by his withholding Chry- 
seis. Agamemnon, enraged, consented to relin¬ 
quish his captive, but demanded that Achilles 
should yield to him in her stead Briseis, a maiden 
who had fallen to Achilles’ share in the division 
of the spoil. Achilles submitted but forthwith de¬ 
clared that he would take no further part in the 
war. He withdrew his forces from the general 
camp and openly avowed his intention of return¬ 

ing home to Greece. 
The gods and goddesses interested themselves 

as much in this famous war as the parties them¬ 
selves. It was well known to them that fate had 
decreed that Troy should fall, at last, if her 
enemies should persevere and not voluntarily 
abandon the enterprise. Yet there was room 
enough left for chance to excite by turns the 
hopes and fears of the powers above who took 
part with either side. Juno and Minerva, in con¬ 
sequence of the slight put upon their charms by 
Paris, were hostile to the Trojans; Venus for the 
opposite cause favored them. Venus enlisted her 
admirer Mars on the same side, but Neptune 
favored the Greeks. Apollo was neutral, some¬ 
times taking one side, sometimes the other, and 
Jove himself, though he loved the good King 
Priam, yet exercised a degree of impartiality; 
not, however, without exceptions. 

Thetis, the mother of Achilles, warmly re¬ 
sented the injury done to her son. She repaired 
immediately to Jove’s palace and besought him 
to make the Greeks repent of their injustice to 
Achilles by granting success to the Trojan arms. 
Jupiter consented; and in the battle which en¬ 
sued the Trojans were completely successful. 
The Greeks were driven from the field and took 

refuge in their ships. 
Then Agamemnon called a council of his 

wisest and bravest chiefs. Nestor advised that an 
embassy should be sent to Achilles to persuade 
him to return to the field; that Agamemnon 
should yield the maiden, the cause of the dispute, 
with ample gifts to atone for the wrong he had 
done. Agamemnon consented, and Ulysses, Ajax, 
and Phoenix were sent to carry to Achilles the 
penitent message. They performed that duty, but 
Achilles was deaf to their entreaties. He posi¬ 
tively refused to return to the field and persisted 
in his resolution to embark for Greece without 

delay. 
The Greeks had constructed a rampart around 

their ships, and now, instead of besieging Troy, 
they were in a manner besieged themselves, 

Ajax and Achilles. From a Greek vase. (Vatican 
Museum, Rome.) 

within their rampart. The next day after the un¬ 
successful embassy to Achilles, a battle was 
fought, and the Trojans, favored by Jove, were 
successful, and succeeded in forcing a passage 
through the Grecian rampart, and were about to 
set fire to the ships. Neptune, seeing the Greeks 
so pressed, came to their rescue. He appeared in 
the form of Calchas the prophet, encouraged the 
warriors with his shouts, and appealed to each 
individually till he raised their ardor to such a 
pitch that they forced the Trojans to give way. 
Ajax performed prodigies of valor and at length 
encountered Hector. Ajax shouted defiance, to 
which Hector replied, and hurled his lance at the 
huge warrior. It was well aimed, and struck Ajax 
where the belts that bore his sword and shield 



crossed each other on the breast. The double 
guard prevented its penetrating, and it fell harm¬ 
less. Then Ajax, seizing a huge stone, one of those 
that served to prop the ships, hurled it at Hector. 
It struck him in the neck and stretched him on 
the plain. His followers instantly seized him and 
bore him off stunned and wounded. 

While Neptune was thus aiding the Greeks 
and driving back the Trojans, Jupiter saw noth¬ 
ing of what was going on, for his attention had 
been drawn from the field by the wiles of Juno. 
That goddess had arrayed herself in all her 
charms, and to crown all had borrowed of Venus 
her girdle called Cestus, which had the effect to 
heighten the wearer’s charms to such a degree 
that they were quite irresistible. So prepared, 
Juno went to join her husband, who sat on 
Olympus watching the battle. When he beheld 
her she looked so charming that the fondness of 
his early love revived, and, forgetting the con- 
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tending armies and all other affairs of state, he 
thought only of her and let the battle go as it 
would. 

But this absorption did not continue long, and 
when, upon turning his eyes downward, he be¬ 
held Hector stretched on the plain almost lifeless 
from pain and bruises, he dismissed Juno in a 
rage, commanding her to send Iris and Apollo to 
him. When Iris came he sent her with a stern 
message to Neptune, ordering him instantly to 
quit the field. Apollo was despatched to heal 
Hector’s bruises and to inspirit his heart. These 
orders were obeyed with such speed that while 
that battle still raged, Hector returned to the 
field and Neptune betook himself to his own 
dominions. 

An arrow from Paris’s bow wounded Machaon, 
son of Aesculapius, who inherited his father’s art 
of healing, and was therefore of great value to 
the Greeks as their surgeon, besides being one of 
their bravest warriors. Nestor took Machaon in 
his chariot and conveyed him from the field. As 
they passed the ships of Achilles, that hero, look¬ 
ing out over the field, saw the chariot of Nestor 
and recognized the old chief, but could not dis¬ 
cern who the wounded chief was. So calling 
Patroclus, his companion and dearest friend, he 
sent him to Nestor’s tent to inquire. 

Patroclus, arriving at Nestor’s tent, saw 
Machaon wounded, and having told the cause of 
his coming, would have hastened away, but Nes¬ 
tor detained him, to tell him the extent of the 
Grecian calamities. He reminded him also how, 
at the time of departing for Troy, Achilles and 
himself had been charged by their respective 
fathers with different advice; Achilles to aspire 
to the highest pitch of glory, Patroclus, as the 
elder, to keep watch over his friend, and to guide 
his inexperience. “Now,” said Nestor, “is the 
time for such influence. If the gods so please, 
thou mayest win him back to the common cause; 
but if not, let him at least send his soldiers to the 
field, and come thou Patroclus clad in his armor, 
and perhaps the very sight of it may drive back 
the Trojans.” 

Patroclus was strongly moved with this ad¬ 
dress, and hastened back to Achilles, revolving in 
his mind all he had seen and heard. He told the 
prince the sad condition of affairs at the camps of 
their late associates; Diomede, Ulysses, Agamem¬ 
non, Machaon, all wounded, the rampart broken 
down, the enemy among the ships preparing to 
burn them, and thus to cut off all means of return 
to Greece. While they spoke, the flames burst 
forth from one of the ships. Achilles, at the sight, 



relented so far as to grant Patroclus his request to 
lead the Myrmidons (for so were Achilles’ sol¬ 
diers called) to the field, and to lend him his 
armor that he might thereby strike more terror 
into the minds of the Trojans. Without delay the 
soldiers were marshalled; Patroclus put on the 
radiant armor, and mounted the chariot of Achil¬ 
les, and led forth the men ardent for battle. But 
before he went, Achilles strictly charged him that 
he should be content with repelling the foe. “Seek 
not,” he said, “to press the Trojans without me, 
lest thou add still more to the disgrace already 
mine.” Then, exhorting the troops to do their 
best, he dismissed them full of ardor to the fight. 

Patroclus and his Myrmidons at once plunged 
into the contest where it raged hottest; at the 
sight of which the joyful Grecians shouted and 
the ships reechoed the acclaim. The Trojans, at 
the sight of the well-known armor, struck with 
terror, looked everywhere for refuge. First, those 
who had got possession of the ship and set it on 
fire left and allowed the Grecians to retake it and 
extinguish the flames. Then the rest of the Tro- 

Achilles. From a Pompeiian wall painting. (Na¬ 
tional Museum, Naples.) 

jans fled in dismay. Ajax, Menelaus, and the two 
sons of Nestor performed prodigies of valor. 
Hector was forced to turn his horses heads and 
retire from the enclosure, leaving his men en¬ 
tangled in the fosse to escape as they could. Pa¬ 
troclus drove them before him, slaying many, 
none daring to make a stand against him. 

At last Sarpedon, son of Jove, ventured to op¬ 
pose himself in fight to Patroclus. Jupiter looked 
down upon him and would have snatched him 
from the fate which awaited him, but Juno hinted 
that if he did so it would induce all others of the 
inhabitants of heaven to interpose in like manner 
whenever any of their offspring were endan¬ 
gered; to which reason Jove yielded. Sarpedon 
threw his spear but missed Patroclus, but Patro¬ 
clus threw his with better success. It pierced 
Sarpedon’s breast, and he fell and, calling to his 
friends to save his body from the foe, expired. 
Then a furious contest arose for the possession of 
the corpse. The Greeks succeeded and stripped 
Sarpedon of his armor; but Jove would not allow 
the remains of his son to be dishonored, and by 
his command Apollo snatched from the midst of 
the combatants the body of Sarpedon and com¬ 
mitted it to the care of the twin brothers Death 
and Sleep, by whom it was transported to Lyeia, 
the native land of Sarpedon, where it received 

due funeral rites. 
Tfius far Patroclus had succeeded to his utmost 

wish in repelling the Trojans and relieving his 
countrymen, but now came a change of fortune. 
Hector, borne in his chariot, confronted him. 
Patroclus threw a vast stone at Hector, which 
missed its aim, but smote Cebriones, the chario¬ 
teer, and knocked him from the car. Hector 
leaped from the chariot to rescue his friend, and 
Patroclus also descended to complete his victory. 
Thus the two heroes met face to face. At this 
decisive moment the poet, as if reluctant to give 
Hector the glory, records that Phoebus took part 
against Patroclus. He struck the helmet from his 
head and the lance from his hand. At the same 
moment an obscure Trojan wounded him in the 
back, and Hector pressing forward pierced him 
with his spear. He fell mortally wounded. 

Then arose a tremendous conflict for the body 
of Patroclus, but his armor was at once taken 
possession of by Hector, who, retiring a short dis¬ 
tance, divested himself of his own armor and put 
on that of Achilles, then returned to the fight. 
Ajax and Menelaus defended the body, and Hec¬ 
tor and his bravest warriors struggled to capture 
it. The battle raged with equal fortunes, when 
Jove enveloped the whole face of heaven with a 
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dark cloud. The lightning flashed, the thunder 
roared, and Ajax, looking round for some one 
whom he might despatch to Achilles to tell him 
of the death of his friend and of the imminent 
danger that his remains would fall into the hands 
of the enemy, could see no suitable messenger. 
It was then that he exclaimed in those famous 
lines so often quoted— 

Father of heaven and earth! deliver thou 
Achaia’s host from darkness; clear the skies; 
Give day; and, since thy sovereign will is such, 
Destruction with it: but, O, give us day. 

Cowper 

Or, as rendered by Pope- 

Lord of earth and air! 
O king! O father! hear my humble prayer! 
Dispel this cloud, the light of heaven restore; 
Give me to see and Ajax asks no more; 
If Greece must perish we thy will obey. 
But let us perish in the face of day. 

Jupiter heard the prayer and dispersed the 
clouds. Then Ajax sent Antilochus to Achilles 
with the intelligence of Patroclus’s death and of 
the conflict raging for his remains. The Greeks at 
last succeeded in bearing off the body to the 
ships, closely pursued by Hector and Aeneas and 
the rest of the Trojans. 

Achilles heard the fate of his friend with such 
distress that Antilochus feared for a while that 
he would destroy himself. His groans reached 
the ears of his mother Thetis, far down in the 
deeps of ocean where she abode, and she has¬ 
tened to him to inquire the cause. She found him 
overwhelmed with self-reproach that he had in¬ 
dulged his resentment so far and suffered his 
friend to fall a victim to it. But his only consola¬ 
tion was the hope of revenge. He would fly in¬ 
stantly in search of Hector. But his mother re¬ 
minded him that he was now without armor and 
promised him, if he would but wait till the mor¬ 
row, she would procure for him a suit of armor 
from Vulcan more than equal to that he had lost. 
He consented, and Thetis immediately repaired 
to Vulcan’s palace. She found him busy at his 
forge making tripods for his own use, so artfully 
constructed that they moved forward of their 
own accord when wanted, and retired again 
when dismissed. On hearing the request of Thetis, 
Vulcan immediately laid aside his work and has¬ 
tened to comply with her wishes. He fabricated 
a splendid suit of armor for Achilles, first a 
shield adorned with elaborate devices, then a 
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Menelaus with the Body of Patroclus. Roman 
copy. (Loggia dei Lanzi, Florence.) 

helmet crested with gold, then a corselet and 
greaves of impenetrable temper, all perfectly 
adapted to his form and of consummate work¬ 
manship. It was all done in one night, and Thetis, 
receiving it, descended with it to earth and laid 
it down at Achilles’ feet at the dawn of day. 

The first glow of pleasure that Achilles had 
felt since the death of Patroclus was at the sight 
of this splendid armor. And now arrayed in it, he 
went forth into the camp calling all the chiefs to 
council. When they were all assembled he ad¬ 
dressed them. Renouncing his displeasure against 
Agamemnon and bitterly lamenting the miseries 
that had resulted from it, he called on them to 
proceed at once to the field. Agamemnon made a 
suitable reply, laying all the blame on Ate, the 
goddess of discord, and thereupon complete rec¬ 
oncilement took place between the heroes. 

Then Achilles went forth to battle inspired 
with a rage and thirst for vengeance that made 
him irresistible. The bravest warriors fled before 
him or fell by his lance. Hector, cautioned by 
Apollo, kept aloof; but the god, assuming the 
form of one of Priam’s sons, Lycaon, urged 
Aeneas to encounter the terrible warrior. Aeneas, 
though he felt himself unequal, did not decline 



the combat. He hurled his spear with all his force 
against the shield the work of Vulcan. It was 
formed of five metal plates; two were of brass, two 
of tin, and one of gold. The spear pierced two 
thicknesses, but was stopped in the third. Achilles 
threw his with better success. It pierced through 
the shield of Aeneas, but glanced near his shoul¬ 
der and made no wound. Then Aeneas seized a 
stone, such as two men of modern times could 
hardly lift, and was about to throw it, and 
Achilles, with sword drawn, was about to rush 
upon him, when Neptune, who looked out upon 
the contest, moved with pity for Aeneas, who he 
saw would surely fall a victim if not speedily res¬ 
cued, spread a cloud between the combatants, 
and lifting Aeneas from the ground, bore him 
over the heads of warriors and steeds to the rear 
of the battle. Achilles, when the mist cleared 
away, looked round in vain for his adversary, 
and acknowledging the prodigy, turned his arms 
against other champions. But none dared stand 
before him, and Priam, looking down from his 
city walls, beheld his whole army in full flight to¬ 
wards the city. He gave command to open wide 
the gates to receive the fugitives and to shut them 
as soon as the Trojans should have passed, lest 
the enemy should enter likewise. But Achilles 
was so close in pursuit that that would have been 
impossible if Apollo had not, in the form of 
Agenor, Priam’s son, encountered Achilles for a 
while, then turned to fly, and taken the way apart 
from the city. Achilles pursued and had chased 
his supposed victim far from the walls, when 
Apollo disclosed himself, and Achilles, perceiving 
how he had been deluded, gave up the chase. 

But when the rest had escaped into the town, 
Hector stood without, determined to await the 
combat. His old father called to him from the 
walls and begged him to retire nor tempt the 
encounter. His mother, Hecuba, also besought 
him to the same effect, but all in vain. “How 
can I,” said he to himself, “by whose command 
the people went to this day’s contest, where so 
many have fallen, seek safety for myself against 
a single foe? But what if I offer him to yield up 
Helen and all her treasures and ample of our own 
beside? Ah no! it is too late. He would not even 
hear me through, but slay me while I spoke.” 
While he thus ruminated, Achilles approached, 
terrible as Mars, his armor flashing lightning as 
he moved. At that sight Hector’s heart failed him 
and he fled. Achilles swiftly pursued. They ran, 
still keeping near the walls, till they had thrice 
encircled the city. As often as Hector ap¬ 
proached the walls Achilles intercepted him and 

forced him to keep out in a wider circle. But 
Apollo sustained Hector’s strength and would 
not let him sink in weariness. Then Pallas, assum¬ 
ing the form of Deiphobus, Hector’s bravest 
brother, appeared suddenly at his side. Hector 
saw him with delight and, thus strengthened, 
stopped his flight and turned to meet Achilles. 
Hector threw his spear, which struck the shield 
of Achilles and bounded back. He turned to re¬ 
ceive another from the hand of Deiphobus, but 
Deiphobus was gone. Then Hector understood 
his doom and said, “Alas! it is plain this is my 
hour to die! I thought Deiphobus at hand, but 
Pallas deceived me, and he is still in Troy. But I 
will not fall inglorious.” So saying he drew his 
falchion from his side and rushed at once to 
combat. Achilles, secured behind his shield, 
waited the approach of Hector. When he came 
within reach of his spear, Achilles, choosing with 
his eye a vulnerable part where the armor leaves 
the neck uncovered, aimed his spear at that part, 
and Hector fell, death-wounded, and feebly said, 
“Spare my body! Let my parents ransom it, and 
let me receive funeral rites from the sons and 
daughters of Troy.” To which Achilles replied, 
“Dog, name not ransom nor pity to me, on whom 
you have brought such dire distress. No! Trust 
me, nought shall save thy carcass from the dogs. 
Though twenty ransoms and thy weight in gold 
were offered, I would refuse it all.” 

So saying he stripped the body of its armor 
and, fastening cords to the feet, tied them behind 
his chariot, leaving the body to trail along the 
ground. Then, mounting the chariot, he lashed 
the steeds and so dragged the body to and fro 
before the city. What words can tell the grief of 
King Priam and Queen Hecuba at this sight! His 
people could scarce restrain the old king from 
rushing forth. He threw himself in the dust and 
besought them each by name to give him way. 
Hecuba’s distress was not less violent. The citi¬ 
zens stood round them weeping. The sound of 
the mourning reached the ears of Andromache, 
the wife of Hector, as she sat among her maidens 
at work, and anticipating evil she went forth to 
the wall. When she saw the sight there presented, 
she would have thrown herself headlong from 
the wall, but fainted and fell into the arms of her 
maidens. Recovering, she bewailed her fate, pic¬ 
turing to herself her country ruined, herself a 
captive and her son dependent for his bread on 
the charity of Strangers. 

When Achilles and the Greeks had taken their 
revenge on the killer of Patroclus, they busied 
themselves in paying due funeral rites to their 

256 



friend. A pile was erected, and the body burned 
with due solemnity; and then ensued games of 
strength and skill, chariot races, wrestling, box¬ 
ing, and archery. Then the chiefs sat down to the 
funeral banquet and after that retired to rest. 
But Achilles neither partook of the feast nor of 
sleep. The recollection of his lost friend kept him 
awake, remembering their companionship in toil 
and dangers, in battle or on the perilous deep. 
Before the earliest dawn he left his tent, and join¬ 
ing to his chariot his swift steeds, he fastened 
Hector’s body to be dragged behind. Twice he 
dragged him round the tomb of Patroclus, leav¬ 
ing him at length stretched in the dust. But 
Apollo would not permit the body to be torn or 
disfigured with all this abuse, but preserved it 
free from all taint or defilement. 

While Achilles indulged his wrath in thus dis¬ 
gracing brave Hector, Jupiter in pity summoned 
Thetis to his presence. He told her to go to her 
son and prevail on him to restore the body of 
Hector to his friends. Then Jupiter sent Iris to 
King Priam to encourage him to go to Achilles 
and beg the body of his son. Iris delivered her 
message, and Priam immediately prepared to 
obey. He opened his treasuries and took out rich 
garments and cloths, with ten talents in gold and 
two splendid tripods and a golden cup of match¬ 
less workmanship. Then he called to his sons and 
bade them draw forth his litter and place in it the 
various articles designed for a ransom to Achilles. 
When all was ready, the old king, with a single 
companion as aged as himself, the herald Idaeus, 
drove forth from the gates, parting there with 
Hecuba his queen and all his friends, who la¬ 
mented him as going to certain death. 

But Jupiter, beholding with compassion the 
venerable king, sent Mercury to be his guide and 
protector. Mercury, assuming the form of a 
young warrior, presented himself to the aged 
couple, and while at the sight of him they hesi¬ 
tated whether to fly or yield, the god approached 
and, grasping Priam’s hand, offered to be their 
guide to Achilles’ tent. Priam gladly accepted his 
offered service, and he, mounting the carriage, as¬ 
sumed the reins and soon conveyed them to the 
tent of Achilles. Mercury’s wand put to sleep all 
the guards, and without hindrance he introduced 
Priam into the tent where Achilles sat, attended 
by two of his warriors. The old king threw him¬ 
self at the feet of Achilles and kissed those ter¬ 
rible hands which had destroyed so many of his 
sons. “Think, oh, Achilles,” he said, “of thy own 
father, full of days like me, and trembling on the 
gloomy verge of life. Perhaps even now some 

257 

neighbor chief oppresses him and there is none 
at hand to succor him in his distress. Yet, doubt¬ 
less knowing that Achilles lives, he still rejoices, 
hoping that one day he shall see thy face again. 
But no comfort cheers me, whose bravest sons, 
so late the flower of Ilium, all have fallen. Yet 
one I had, one more than all the rest the strength 
of my age, whom, fighting for his country, thou 
hast slain. I come to redeem his body, bringing 
inestimable ransom with me. Achilles! Reverence 
the gods! Recollect thy father! For his sake show 
compassion to me!” These words moved Achilles 
and he wept; remembering by turns his absent 
father and his lost friend. Moved with pity of 
Priam’s silver locks and beard, he raised him from 
the earth and thus spake: “Priam, I know that 
thou hast reached this place conducted by some 
god, for without aid divine no mortal even in his 
prime of youth had dared the attempt. I grant 
thy request; moved thereto by the evident will of 
Jove.” So saying he arose, and went forth with 
his two friends, and unloaded of its charge the 
litter, leaving two mantles and a robe for the cov¬ 
ering of the body, which they placed on the lit¬ 
ter, and spread the garments over it, that not 
unveiled it should be borne back to Troy. Then 
Achilles dismissed the old king with his atten¬ 
dants, having first pledged himself to allow a 
truce of twelve days for the funeral solemnities. 

As the litter approached the city and was de¬ 
scried from the walls, the people poured forth to 
gaze once more on the face of their hero. Fore¬ 
most of all, the mother and the wife of Hector 
came and, at the sight of the lifeless body, re¬ 
newed their lamentations. The people all wept 
with them, and to the going down of the sun 
there was no pause or abatement of their grief. 

The next day, preparations were made for the 
funeral solemnities. For nine days the people 
brought wood and built the pile, and on the tenth 
they placed the body on the summit and applied 
the torch; while all Troy thronging forth en¬ 
compassed the pile. When it had completely 
burned, they quenched the cinders with wine, 
collected the bones, and placed them in a golden 
urn, which they buried in the earth, and reared a 
pile of stones over the spot. 

Such honors Ilium to her hero paid, 
And peaceful slept the mighty Hector’s shade. 

Pope 

Overleaf: The Death of Hector. From a Greek 
vase. (British Museum, London.) 



■ ■ 





CHAPTER XXVIII 

THE FALL OF TROY—RETURN OF THE GREEKS 
-ORESTES AND ELECTRA 

THE FALL OF TROY 

The story of The Iliad ends with the death of 
Hector, and it is from The Odyssey and later 
poems that we learn the fate of the other heroes. 
After the death of Hector, Troy did not imme¬ 
diately fall, but receiving aid from new allies still 
continued its resistance. One of these allies was 
Memnon, the Ethiopian prince, whose story we 
have already told. Another was Penthesilea, 
queen of the Amazons, who came with a band of 
female warriors. All the authorities attest their 
valor and the fearful effect of their war cry. 
Penthesilea slew many of the bravest warriors, 
but was at last slain by Achilles. But when the 
hero bent over his fallen foe and contemplated 
her beauty, youth, and valor, he bitterly re¬ 
gretted his victory. Thersites, an insolent brawler 
and demagogue, ridiculed his grief, and was in 
consequence slain by the hero. 

Achilles by chance had seen Polyxena, daugh¬ 
ter of King Priam, perhaps on occasion of the 
truce which was allowed the Trojans for the 
burial of Hector. He was captivated with her 
charms, and to win her in marriage agreed to use 
his influence with the Greeks to grant peace to 
Troy. While in the temple of Apollo, negotiating 
the marriage, Paris discharged at him a poisoned 
arrow, which, guided by Apollo, wounded 
Achilles in the heel, the only vulnerable part 
about him. For Thetis his mother had dipped 
him when an infant in the River Styx, which 
made every part of him invulnerable except the 
heel by which she held him.* 

The body of Achilles so treacherously slain 
was rescued by Ajax and Ulysses. Thetis directed 
the Greeks to bestow her son’s armor on the hero 
who of all the survivors should be judged most 
deserving of it. Ajax and Ulysses were the only 
claimants; a select number of the other chiefs 
were appointed to award the prize. It was 
awarded to Ulysses, thus placing wisdom before 
valor; whereupon Ajax slew himself. On the spot 

* The story of the invulnerability of Achilles is 
not found in Homer and is inconsistent with his ac¬ 
count. For how could Achilles require the aid of 
celestial armor if he were invulnerable? 

where his blood sank into the earth a flower 
sprang up, called the hyacinth, bearing on its 
leaves the first two letters of the name of Ajax, 
Ai, the Greek for “woe.” Thus Ajax is a claimant 
with the boy Hyacinthus for the honor of giving 
birth to this flower. There is a species of Larks¬ 
pur which represents the hyacinth of the poets 
in preserving the memory of this event, the Del¬ 
phinium Ajacis—Ajax’s Larkspur. 

It was now discovered that Troy could not be 
taken but by the aid of the arrows of Hercules. 
They were in possession of Philoctetes, the friend 
who had been with Hercules at the last and 
lighted his funeral pyre. Philoctetes had joined 
the Grecian expedition against Troy, but had 
accidentally wounded his foot with one of the 
poisoned arrows, and the smell from his wound 
proved so offensive that his companions carried 
him to the isle of Lemnos and left him there. 
Diomede was now sent to induce him to rejoin the 
army. He succeeded. Philoctetes was cured of his 
wound by Machaon, and Paris was the first vic¬ 
tim of the fatal arrows. In his distress Paris be¬ 
thought him of one whom in his prosperity he 
had forgotten. This was the nymph Oenone, 
whom he had married when a youth and had 
abandoned for the fatal beauty Helen. Oenone, 
remembering the wrongs she had suffered, re¬ 
fused to heal the wound, and Paris went back to 
Troy and died. Oenone quickly repented and 
hastened after him with remedies, but came too 

late, and in her grief hung herself.* 
There was in Troy a celebrated statue of 

Minerva called the Palladium. It was said to have 
fallen from heaven, and the belief was that the 
city could not be taken so long as this statue re¬ 
mained within it. Ulysses and Diomede entered 
the city in disguise and succeeded in obtaining 
the Palladium, which they carried off to the 

Grecian camp. 
But Troy still held out, and the Greeks began 

to despair of even subduing it by force, and by 
advice of Ulysses resolved to resort to stratagem. 

___V.___ ____ 

* Tennyson has chosen Oenone as the subject of a 
short poem; but he has omitted the most poetical part 
of the story, the return of Paris wounded, her 
cruelty and subsequent repentance. 



Achilles Slaying Penthesilea. Greek vase. (British Museum, London.) 

They pretended to be making preparations to 
abandon the siege, and a portion of the ships 
were withdrawn and lay hid behind a neighbor¬ 
ing island. The Greeks then constructed an im¬ 
mense wooden horse, which they gave out was 
intended as a propitiatory offering to Minerva, 
but in fact was filled with armed men. The re¬ 
maining Greeks then betook themselves to their 
ships and sailed away, as if for a final departure. 
The Trojans, seeing the encampment broken up 
and the fleet gone, concluded the enemy to have 
abandoned the siege. The gates were thrown 

261 

open, and the whole population issued forth, re¬ 
joicing at the long-prohibited liberty of passing 
freely over the scene of the late encampment. 
The great horse was the chief object of curiosity. 
All wondered what it could be for. Some recom¬ 
mended to take it into the city as a trophy; 
others felt afraid of it. 

While they hesitate, Laocoon, the priest of 
Neptune, exclaims, “What madness, citizens, is 
this! Have you not learned enough of Grecian 
fraud to be on your guard against it? For my 
part I fear the Greeks even when they offer 



gifts.” So saying he threw his lance at the horse’s 
side. It struck, and a hollow sound reverberated 
like a groan. Then perhaps the people might 
have taken his advice and destroyed the fatal 
horse and all its contents; but just at the moment 
a group of people appeared, dragging forward 
one who seemed a prisoner and a Greek. Stupefied 
with terror, he was brought before the chiefs, 
who reassured him, promising that his life should 
be spared on condition of his returning true an¬ 
swers to the questions asked him. He informed 
them that he was a Greek, Sinon by name, and 
that in consequence of the malice of Ulysses he 
had been left behind by his countrymen at their 
departure. With regard to the wooden horse, he 
told them that it was a propitiatory offering to 
Minerva, and made so huge for the express pur¬ 
pose of preventing its being carried within the 
city; for Calchas the prophet had told them that 
if the Trojans took possession of it, they would 
assuredly triumph over the Greeks. This lan¬ 
guage turned the tide of the people’s feelings, 
and they began to think how they might best 
secure the monstrous horse and the favorable 
auguries connected with it, when suddenly a 
prodigy occurred which left no room to doubt. 
There appeared advancing over the sea two im¬ 
mense serpents. They came upon the land, and 
the crowd fled in all directions. The serpents ad¬ 
vanced directly to the spot where Laocoon stood 
with his two sons. They first attacked the chil¬ 
dren, winding round their bodies and breathing 
their pestilential breath in their faces. The father 
attempting to rescue them is next seized and in¬ 
volved in the serpents’ coils. He struggles to tear 
them away, but they overpower all his efforts 
and strangle him and the children in their poison¬ 
ous folds. This event was regarded as a clear in¬ 
dication of the displeasure of the gods at Lao- 
coon’s irreverent treatment of the wooden horse, 
which they no longer hesitated to regard as a 
sacred object and prepared to introduce with due 
solemnity into the city. This was done with 
songs and triumphal acclamations and the day 
closed with festivity. In the night the armed men 
who were enclosed in the body of the horse, be¬ 
ing let out by the traitor Sinon, opened the gates 
of the city to their friends who had returned 
under cover of the night. The city was set on 
fire, the people, overcome with feasting and sleep, 
put to the sword, and Troy completely subdued. 

One of the most celebrated groups of statuary 
in existence is that of Laocoon and his children 
in the embrace of the serpents. There is a cast of 
it in the Boston Athenaeum; the original is in the 

Vatican at Rome. The following lines are from 

the Childe Harold of Byron: 

Now turning to the Vatican go see 
Laocoon’s torture dignifying pain; 
A father’s love and mortal’s agony 
With an immortal’s patience blending;—vain 
The struggle! vain against the coiling strain 
And gripe and deepening of the dragon s grasp 
The old man’s clinch; the long envenomed chain 
Rivets the living links; the enormous asp 

Enforces pang on pang and stifles gasp on gasp. 

The comic poets will also occasionally borrow 
a classical allusion. The following is from Swift’s 
“Description of a City Shower”: 

Boxed in a chair the beau impatient sits, 
While spouts run clattering o’er the roof by fits, 
And ever and anon with frightful din 
The leather sounds; he trembles from within. 
So when Troy chairmen bore the wooden steed 
Pregnant with Greeks impafieht to be freed, 
(Those bully Greeks, who, as the moderns do, 
Instead of paying chairmen, run them through;) 
Laocoon struck the outside with a spear, 
And each imprisoned champion quaked with fear. 

King Priam lived to see the downfall of his 
kingdom, and was slain at last on the fatal night 
when the Greeks took the city. He had armed 

Laocoon. Roman copy. (Vatican Museum, 
Rome.) 



himself and was about to mingle with the com- 

batants. but was prevailed on by Hecuba, his 

aged queen, to take refuge with herself and his 

daughters as a suppliant at the altar of Jupiter. 

While there, his youngest son Polites, pursued by 
Pyrrhus, the son of Achilles, rushed in, wounded, 

and expired at the feet of his father; whereupon 

Priam, overcome with indignation, hurled his 

spear with feeble hand against Pyrrhus, and was 
forthwith slain by him. 

Queen Hecuba and her daughter Cassandra. 

were carried captives to Greece. Cassandra had 

been loved by Apollo, and he gave her the gift 

of prophecy; but afterwards, offended with her, 

he rendered the gift unavailing by ordaining 

that her predictions should never be believed. 

Polyxena, another daughter, who had been loved 

bv Achilles, was demanded bv the ghost of that 

warrior, and was sacrificed by the Greeks upon his 
tomb. 

MENELAUS AND HELEN 

Our readers will be anxious to know the fate of 

Helen, the fair but guilt}* occasion of so much 

slaughter. On the fall of Trov Menelaus recov- 
W- , 

ered possession of his wife, who had not ceased 
to love him. though she had yielded to the might 

of Venus and deserted him for another. After the 

death of Paris she aided the Greeks secretly on 

several occasions, and in particular when Ulysses 

and Diomede entered the city in disguise to carry 

off the Palladium. She saw and recognized Ulvs- 
C- r 

ses. but kept the secret and even assisted them in 

obtaining the image. Thus she became reconciled 
W w- 

to her husband, and thev were among the first 

to leave the shores of Troy for their native land. 

But having incurred the displeasure of the gods 

they were driven by storms from shore to shore 

of the Mediterranean, visiting Cyprus, Phoenicia 

and Egypt. In Egypt they were kindly treated 

and presented with rich gifts, of which Helen's 

share was a golden spindle and a basket on 

wheels. The basket was to hold the wool and 

spools for the queen's work. 

Dyer, in his poem of “The Fleece" thus alludes 

to the incident: 

, . . many yet adhere 
To the ancient distaff, at the bosom fixed 
Casting the whirling spindle as they walk. 

***#*## 

This was of old. in no inglorious days. 
The mode of spinning, when the Egyptian prince 
A golden distaff gave that beauteous nymph. 
Too beauteous Helen; no uncourtly gift. 

Milton also alludes to a famous recipe for an 
invigorating draught, called Nepenthe, which the 
Egyptian queen gave to Helen: 

Not that Nepenthes which the wife of Thone 
In Egypt gave to Jove-born Helena, 
Is of such power to stir up joy as this, 
To life so friendly or so cool to thirst. 

Cornu s 

Menelaus and Helen at length arrived in safety 

at Sparta, resumed their royal dignity, and lived 

and reigned in splendor; and when Telemachus, 

Orestes Killing Aegisthus. Lrom a Greek vase. 
(British Museum, London.) 

the son of Ulysses, in search of his father, arrived 

at Sparta, he found Menelaus and Helen cele¬ 

brating the marriage of their daughter Hermione 

to Xeoptolemus, son of Achilles. 

AGAMEMNON, ORESTES, 

AND ELECTRA 

Agamemnon. the general-in-chief of the Greeks, 

the brother of Menelaus, and who had been 

drawn into the quarrel to avenge his brother’s 

wrongs, not his own, was not so fortunate in the 

issue. During his absence his wife Clvtemnestra 

had been false to him, and when his return was 

expected, she, with her paramour, Aegisthus, laid 



a plan for his destruction and, at the banquet 

given to celebrate his return, murdered him. 
It was intended by the conspirators to slay his 

son Orestes also, a lad not yet old enough to be 

an object of apprehension, but from whom, if he 

should be suffered to grow up, there might be 

danger. Electra, the sister of Orestes, saved her 

brother’s life by sending him secretly away to his 

Uncle Strophius, King of Phocis. In the palace 

of Strophius Orestes grew up with the king’s son, 

Pylades, and formed with him that ardent friend¬ 

ship which has become proverbial. Electra fre¬ 

quently reminded her brother by messengers of 

the duty of avenging his father’s death, and when 

grown up he consulted the oracle of Delphi, 

which confirmed him in his design. He therefore 

repaired in disguise to Argos, pretending to be a 

messenger from Strophius, who had come to an¬ 

nounce the death of Orestes and brought the 

ashes of the deceased in a funeral urn. After visit¬ 

ing his father’s tomb and sacrificing upon it, ac¬ 

cording to the rites of the ancients, he made him¬ 

self known to his sister Electra, and soon after 

slew both Aegisthus and Clytemnestra. 
This revolting act, the slaughter of a mother 

by her son, though alleviated by the guilt of the 

victim and the express command of the gods, did 

not fail to awaken in the breasts of the ancients 

the same abhorrence that it does in ours. The 

Eumenides, avenging deities, seized upon Orestes 

and drove him frantic from land to land. Pylades 

accompanied him in his wanderings and watched 

over him. At length, in answer to a second appeal 

to the oracle, he was directed to go to Tauris in 

Scythia, and to bring thence a statue of Diana 

which was believed to have fallen from heaven. 

Accordingly Orestes and Pylades went to Tauris, 

where the barbarous people were accustomed to 

sacrifice to the goddess all strangers who fell into 

their hands. The two friends were seized and 

carried bound to the temple to be made victims. 

But the priestess of Diana was no other than Iphi- 

genia, the sister of Orestes, who, our readers will 

remember, was snatched away by Diana, at the 

moment when she was about to be sacrificed. 

Ascertaining from the prisoners who they were, 

Iphigenia disclosed herself to them, and the three 

made their escape with the statue of the goddess, 

and returned to Mycenae. 
But Orestes was not yet relieved from the ven¬ 

geance of the Erinnyes. At length he took refuge 

with Minerva at Athens. The goddess afforded 

him protection, and appointed the court of 

Areopagus to decide his fate. The Erinnyes 

brought forward their accusation, and Orestes 

made the command of the Delphic oracle his ex¬ 

cuse. When the court voted and the voices were 

equally divided, Orestes was acquitted by the 

command of Minerva. 
Byron, in Childe Harold, Canto IV, alludes to 

the story of Orestes: 

O thou who never yet of human wrong 
Left the Unbalanced scale, great Nemesis! 
Thou who didst call the Furies from the abyss, 
And round Orestes bade them howl and hiss, 
For that unnatural retribution,—just, 
Had it but been from hands less near,—in this, 
Thy former realm, I call thee from the dust! 

One of the most pathetic scenes in the ancient 

drama is that in which Sophocles represents the 

meeting of Orestes and Electra, on his return 

from Phocis. Orestes, mistaking Electra for one 

of the domestics and desirous of keeping his ar¬ 

rival a secret till the hour of vengeance should 

arrive, produces the urn in which his ashes are 

supposed to rest. Electra, believing him to be 

really dead, takes the urn and, embracing it, 

pours forth her grief in language full of tender¬ 

ness and despair. 
Milton, in one of his sonnets, says— 

The repeated air 
Of sad Electra’s poet had the power 
To save the Athenian walls from ruin bare. 

This alludes to the story that when, on one oc¬ 

casion, the city of Athens was at the mercy of 

her Spartan foes, and it was proposed to destroy 

it, the thought was rejected upon the accidental 

quotation, by some one, of a chorus of Euripides. 

TROY 

After hearing so much about the city of Troy 

and its heroes, the reader will perhaps be sur¬ 

prised to learn that the exact site of that famous 

city is still a matter of dispute. There are some 

vestiges of tombs on the plain which most nearly 

answers to the description given by Homer and 

the ancient geographers, but no other evidence of 

the former existence of a great city. Byron thus 

describes the present appearance of the scene: 

The winds are high, and Helle’s tide 
Rolls darkly heaving to the main; 

And night’s descending shadows hide 
That field with blood bedewed in vain, 

The desert of old Priam’s pride, 
The tombs, sole relics of his reign, 

All—save immortal dreams that could beguile 
The blind old man of Scio’s rocky isle. 

The Bride of Abydos 



Laocoon. El Greco. (National Gallery, Washington, D.C.) 
See text, page 262. 
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The Trojan Horse. Tiepolo. (National Gallery, London.) 
See text, page 261. 
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CHAPTER XXIX 

ADVENTURES OF ULYSSES-THE LOTUS-EATERS 
-CYCLOPES-CIRCE-SIRENS-SCYLLA AND 

CHARYBDIS-CALYPSO 

RETURN OF ULYSSES 

The romantic poem of the Odyssey is now to en¬ 
gage our attention. It narrates the wanderings of 
Ulysses (Odysseus in the Greek language) in his 
return from Troy to his own kingdom, Ithaca. 

From Troy the vessels first made land at Is- 
marus, city of the Ciconians, where, in a skirmish 
with the inhabitants, Ulysses lost six men from 
each ship. Sailing thence they were overtaken by 
a storm which drove them for nine days along 
the sea till they reached the country of the 
Lotus-eaters. Here, after watering, Ulysses sent 
three of his men to discover who the inhabitants 
were. These men, on coming among the Lotus- 
eaters, were kindly entertained by them and 
were given some of their own food, the lotus- 
plant, to eat. The effect of this food was such 
that those who partook of it lost all thoughts of 
home and wished to remain in that country. It 
was by main force that Ulysses dragged these 
men away, and he was even obligated to tie them 
under the benches of his ship.* 

* Tennyson in “The Lotus-Eaters” has charmingly 
expressed the dreamy, languid feeling which the 
lotus-food is said to have produced: 

How sweet it were, hearing the downward stream 
With half-shut eyes ever to seem 
Falling asleep in a half-dream! 
To dream and dream, like yonder amber light 
Which will not leave the myrrh-bush on the height, 
To hear each other’s whispered speech; 
Eating the Lotos, day by day, 
To watch the crisping ripples on the beach, 
And tender curving lines of creamy spray: 
To lend our hearts and spirits wholly 
To the influence of mild -minded melancholy; 
To muse and brood and live again in memory, 
With those old faces of our infancy 
Heaped over with a mound of grass, 
Two handfuls of white dust, shut in an urn of brass. 

Cyclops. Odilon Redon. (Rijksmuseum, Kroller- 
Miiller, Otterlo.) 

They next arrived at the country of the Cy¬ 
clopes. The Cyclopes were giants, who inhabited 
an island of which they were the only possessors. 
The name means “round eye,” and these giants 
were so called because they had but one eye, and 
that placed in the middle of the forehead. They 
dwelt in caves and fed on the wild productions 
of the island and on what their flocks yielded, for 
they were shepherds. Ulysses left the main body 
of his ships at anchor and, with one vessel, went 
to the Cyclopes’ island to explore for supplies. 
He landed with his companions, carrying with 
them a jar of wine for a present; and coming to a 
large cave, they entered it; and finding no one 
within, examined its contents. They found it 
stored with the riches of the flock, quantities of 
cheese, pails and bowls of milk, lambs and kids in 
their pens, all in nice order. Presently arrived the 
master of the cave, Polyphemus, bearing an im¬ 
mense bundle of firewood, which he threw down 
before the cavern’s mouth. He then drove into 
the cave the sheep and goats to be milked, and, 
entering, rolled to the cave’s mouth an enormous 
rock, that twenty oxen could not draw. Next he 
sat down and milked his ewes, preparing a part 
for cheese and setting the rest aside for his cus¬ 
tomary drink. Then turning round his great eye, 
he discerned the strangers and growled out to 
them, demanding who they were and where 
from. Ulysses replied most humbly, stating that 
they were Greeks, from the great expedition that 
had lately won so much glory in the conquest of 
Troy; that they were now on their way home, 
and finished by imploring his hospitality in the 
name of the gods. Polyphemus deigned no an¬ 
swer, but reaching out his hand seized two of the 
Greeks, whom he hurled against the side of the 
cave and dashed out their brains. He proceeded 
to devour them with great relish and, having 
made a hearty meal, stretched himself out on the 
floor to sleep. Ulysses was tempted to seize the 
opportunity and plunge his sword into him as he 
slept, but recollected that it would only expose 
them all to certain destruction, as the rock with 
which the giant had closed up the door was far 



beyond their power to remove, and they would 
therefore be in hopeless imprisonment. Next 
morning the giant seized two more of the Greeks 
and despatched them in the same manner as their 
companions, feasting on their flesh till no frag¬ 
ment was left. He then moved away the rock 
from the door, drove out his flocks, and went 
out, carefully replacing the barrier after him. 
When he was gone, Ulysses planned how he 
might take vengeance for his murdered friends 
and effect his escape with his surviving com¬ 
panions. He made his men prepare a massive bar 
of wood cut by the Cyclops for a staff, which 
they found in the cave. They sharpened the end 
of it, and seasoned it in the fire, and hid it under 
the straw on the cavern floor. Then four of the 
boldest were selected, with whom Ulysses joined 
himself as a fifth. The Cyclops came home at even¬ 
ing, rolled away the stone, and drove in his flocks 
as usual. After milking them and making his ar¬ 
rangements as before, he seized two more of 
Ulysses’ companions, and dashed their brains out, 
and made his evening meal upon them as he had 
on the others. After he had supped, Ulysses, ap¬ 
proaching him, handed him a bowl of wine, say¬ 
ing, “Cyclops, this is wine; taste and drink after 
thy meal of man’s flesh.” He took and drank it, 
and was hugely delighted with it, and called for 
more. Ulysses supplied him once and again, 
which pleased the giant so much that he promised 
him as a favor that he should be the last of the 
party devoured. He asked his name, to which 
Ulysses replied, “My name is Noman.” 

After his supper the giant lay down to repose, 
and was soon sound asleep. Then Ulysses with his 
four select friends thrust the end of the stake into 
the fire till it was all one burning coal, then pois¬ 
ing it exactly above the giant’s only eye, they 
buried it deeply into the socket, twirling it round 
as a carpenter does his auger. The howling mon¬ 
ster with his outcry filled the cavern, and Ulysses 
with his aids nimbly got out of his way and con¬ 
cealed themselves in the cave. He, bellowing, 
called aloud on all the Cyclopes dwelling in the 
caves around him, far and near. They on his cry 
flocked round the den and inquired what 
grievous hurt had caused him to sound such an 
alarm and break their slumbers. He replied, “Oh, 
friends, I die, and Noman gives the blow.” They 
answered, “If no man hurts thee, it is the stroke 
of Jove, and thou must bear it.” So saying, they 
left him groaning. 

Next morning the Cyclops rolled away the 
stone to let his flock out to pasture, but planted 
himself in the door of the cave to feel of all as 

they went out, that Ulysses and his men should 
not escape with them. But Ulysses had made his 
men harness the rams of the flock three abreast, 
with osiers which they found on the floor of the 
cave. To the middle ram of the three one of the 
Greeks suspended himself, so protected by the ex¬ 
terior rams on either side. As they passed, the 
giant felt of the animals’ backs and sides, but 
never thought of their bellies; so the men all 
passed safe, Ulysses himself being on the last one 
that passed. When they had got a few paces from 
the cavern, Ulysses and his friends released them¬ 
selves from their rams, and drove a good part of 
the flock down to the shore to their boat. They 
put them aboard with all haste, then pushed off 
from the shore, and when at a safe distance 
Ulysses shouted out, “Cyclops, the gods have 
well requited thee for thy atrocious deeds. Know 
it is Ulysses to whom thou owest thy shameful 
loss of sight.” The Cyclops, hearing this, seized 
a rock that projected from the side of the moun¬ 
tain, and rending it from its bed, he lifted it high 
in the air, then exerting all his force, hurled it in 
the direction of the voice. Down came the mass, 
just clearing the vessel’s stern. The ocean, at the 
plunge of the huge rock, heaved the ship towards 
the land, so that it barely escaped being swamped 
by the waves. When they had with the utmost 
difficulty pulled off shore, Ulysses was about to 
hail the giant again, but his friends besought him 
not to do so. He could not forbear, however, let¬ 
ting the giant know that they had escaped his 
missile, but waited till they had reached a safer 
distance than before. The giant answered them 
with curses, but Ulysses and his friends plied 
their oars vigorously and soon regained their 
companions. 

Ulysses next arrived at the island of Aeolus. To 
this monarch Jupiter had intrusted the govern¬ 
ment of the winds, to send them forth or retain 
them at his will. He treated Ulysses hospitably, 
and at his departure gave him, tied up in a leathern 
bag with a silver string, such winds as might be 
hurtful and dangerous, commanding fair winds 
to blow the barks towards their country. Nine 
days they spend before the wind, and all that 
time Ulysses had stood at the helm, without sleep. 
At last, quite exhausted, he lay down to sleep. 
While he slept, the crew conferred together 
about the mysterious bag and concluded it must 
contain treasures given by the hospitable King 
Aeolus to their commander. Tempted to secure 
some portion for themselves, they loosed the 
string, when immediately the winds rushed forth. 
The ships were driven far from their course and 
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Ulysses in the Land of the Laestrygonians. Roman mural. 
(Vatican Museum, Rome.) 

back again to the island they had just left. Aeolus 
was so indignant at their folly that he refused to 
assist them further, and they were obliged to 
labor over their course once more by means of 
their oars. 

THE LAESTRYGONIANS 

Their next adventure was with the barbarous 
tribe of Laestrygonians. The vessels all pushed 
into the harbor, tempted by the secure appear- 
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ance of the cove, completely land-locked; only 
Ulysses moored his vessel without. As soon as the 
Laestrygonians found the ships completely in 
their power, they attacked them, heaving huge 
stones which broke and overturned them, and 
with their spears despatched the seamen as they 
struggled in the water. All the vessels with their 
crews were destroyed, except Ulysses’ own ship 
which had remained outside, and finding no 
safety but in flight, he exhorted his men to ply 
their oars vigorously, and they escaped. 



Circe and Her 
Lovers. Dosso Dossi. 
(National Gallery, 
Washington, D.C.) 





With grief for their slain companions mixed 
with joy at their own escape, they pursued their 
way till they arrived at the Aeaean isle, where 
Circe dwelt, the daughter of the sun. Landing 
here, Ulysses climbed a hill and, gazing round, 
saw no signs of habitation except in one spot at 
the centre of the island, where he perceived a 
palace embowered with trees. He sent forward 
one half of his crew, under the command of 
Eurylochus, to see what prospect of hospitality 
they might find. As they approached the palace, 
they found themselves surrounded by lions, 
tigers, and wolves, not fierce, but tamed by 
Circe’s art, for she was a powerful magician. All 
these animals had once been men, but had been 
changed by Circe’s enchantments into the forms 
of beasts. The sounds of soft music were heard 
from within, and a sweet female voice singing. 
Eurylochus called aloud, and the goddess came 
forth and invited them in; they all gladly en¬ 
tered, except Eurylochus, who suspected danger. 
The goddess conducted her guests to a seat and 
had them served with wine and other delicacies. 
When they had feasted heartily, she touched 
them one by one with her wand, and they be¬ 
came immediately changed into swme, in “head, 
body, voice, and bristles,” yet with their intel¬ 
lects as before. She shut them in her sties and 
supplied them with acorns and such other things 
as swine love. 

Eurylochus hurried back to the ship and told 
the tale. Ulysses thereupon determined to go him¬ 
self and try if by any means he might deliver his 
companions. As he strode onward alone, he met 
a youth who addressed him familiarly, appearing 
to be acquainted with his adventures. He an¬ 
nounced himself as Mercury, and informed Ulys¬ 
ses of the arts of Circe and of the danger of ap¬ 
proaching her. As Ulysses was not to be dissuaded 
from his attempt, Mercury provided him with a 
sprig of the plant moly, of wonderful power to 
resist sorceries, and instructed him how to act. 
Ulysses proceeded, and reaching the palace was 
courteously received by Circe, who entertained 
him as she had done his companions, and after 
he had eaten and drunk, touched him with her 
wand, saying, “Hence, seek the sty and wallow 
with thy friends.” But he, instead of obeying, 
drew his sword and rushed upon her with fury 
in his countenance. She fell on her knees and 
begged for mercy. He dictated a solemn oath 
that she would release his companions and prac¬ 
tise no further harm against him or them; and 
she repeated it, at the same time promising to dis¬ 
miss them all in safety after hospitably entertain¬ 

ing them. She was as good as her word. The men 
were restored to their shapes, the rest of the 
crew summoned from the shore, and the whole 
magnificently entertained day after day, till 
Ulysses seemed to have forgotten his native land 
and to have reconciled himself to an inglorious 
life of ease and pleasure. 

At length, his companions recalled him to 
nobler sentiments, and he received their admoni¬ 
tion gratefully. Circe aided their departure and 
instructed them how to pass safely by the coast 
of the Sirens. The Sirens were sea-nymphs who 
had the power of charming by their song all who 
heard them, so that the unhappy mariners were 
irresistibly impelled to cast themselves into the 
sea to their destruction. Circe directed Ulysses to 
fill the ears of his seamen with wax, so that they 
should not hear the strain; and to cause himself 
to be bound to the mast, and his people to be 
strictly enjoined, whatever he might say or do, 
by no means to release him till they should have 
passed the Sirens’ island. Ulysses obeyed these 
directions. He filled the ears of his people with 
wax and suffered them to bind him with cords 
firmly to the mast. As they approached the Sirens’ 
island, the sea was calm, and over the waters 
came the notes of music so ravishing and attrac¬ 
tive that Ulysses struggled to get loose and, by 
cries and signs to his people, begged to be released; 
but they, obedient to his previous orders, sprang 
forward and bound him still faster. They held on 
their course, and the music grew fainter till it 
ceased to be heard, when with joy Ulysses gave 
his companions the signal to unseal their ears, and 
they relieved him from his bonds. 

The imagination of a modern poet, Keats, has 
discovered for us the thoughts that passed 
through the brains of the victims of Circe after 
their transformation. In his Endymion he repre¬ 
sents one of them, a monarch in the guise of an 
elephant, addressing the sorceress in human lan¬ 
guage thus: 

I sue not for my happy crown again; 
I sue not for my phalanx on the plain; 
I sue not for my lone, my widowed wife; 
I sue not for my ruddy drops of life, 
My children fair, my lovely girls and boys; 
I will forget them; I will pass these joys, 
Ask nought so heavenward; so too—too high; 
Only I pray, as fairest boon, to die; 
To be delivered from this cumbrous flesh, 
From this gross, detestable, filthy mesh, 
And merely given to the cold, bleak air. 
Have mercy, goddess! Circe, feel my prayer! 



Ulysses and the Sirens. From a Greek vase. 
(British Museum, London.) 

SCYLLA AND CHARYBDIS 

Ulysses had been warned by Circe of the two 
monsters Scylla and Charybdis. We have already 
met with Scylla, in the story of Glaucus, and re¬ 
member that she was once a beautiful maiden 
and was changed into a snaky monster by Circe. 
She dwelt in a cave high up on the cliff, from 
whence she was accustomed to thrust forth her 
long necks (for she had six heads), and in each 
of her mouths to seize one of the crew of every 
vessel passing within reach. The other terror, 
Charybdis, was a gulf, nearly on a level with the 
water. Thrice each day the water rushed into a 
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frightful chasm, and thrice was disgorged. Any 
vessel coming near the whirlpool when the tide 
was rushing in must inevitably be engulfed; not 
Neptune himself could save it. 

On approaching the haunt of the dread mon¬ 
sters, Ulysses kept strict watch to discover them. 
The roar of the waters as Charybdis engulfed 
them gave warning at a distance, but Scylla could 
nowhere be discerned. While Ulysses and his men 
watched with anxious eyes the dreadful whirl¬ 
pool, they were not equally on their guard from 
the attack of Scylla, and the monster, darting 
forth her snaky heads, caught six of his men and 
bore them away shrieking to her den. It was the 
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saddest sight Ulysses had yet seen: to behold his 
friends thus sacrified and hear their cries, unable 
to afford them any assistance. 

Circe had warned him of another danger. After 
passing Scylla and Charybdis the next land he 
would make was Thrinakia, an island whereon 
were pastured the cattle of Hyperion, the sun, 
tended by his daughters Lampetia and Phaethusa. 
These flocks must not be violated, whatever the 
wants of the voyagers might be. If this injunc¬ 
tion were transgressed, destruction was sure to 
fall on the offenders. 

Ulysses would willingly have passed the island 
of the sun without stopping, but his companions 
so urgently pleaded for the rest and refreshment 
that would be derived from anchoring and pass¬ 
ing the night on shore that Ulysses yielded. He 
bound them, however, with an oath that they 
would not touch one of the animals of the sacred 
flocks and herds, but content themselves with 
what provision they yet had left of the supply 
which Circe had put on board. So long as this 
supply lasted the people kept their oath, but con¬ 
trary winds detained them at the island for a 
month, and after consuming all their stock of 
provisions, they were forced to rely upon the 
birds and fishes they could catch. Famine pressed 
them, and at length one day, in the absence of 
Ulysses, they slew some of the cattle, vainly at¬ 
tempting to make amends for the deed by offer¬ 
ing from them a portion to the offended powers. 
Ulysses, on his return to the shore, was horror- 
struck at perceiving what they had done, and the 
more so on account of the portentous signs which 
followed. The skins crept on the ground, and the 
joints of meat lowed on the spits while roasting. 

The wind becoming fair, they sailed from the 
island. They had not gone far when the weather 
changed, and a storm of thunder and lightning 
ensued. A stroke of lightning shattered their 
mast, which in its fall killed the pilot. At last the 
vessel itself came to pieces. The keel and mast 
floating side by side, Ulysses formed of them a 
raft, to which he clung, and, the wind changing, 
the waves bore him to Calypso’s island. All the 
rest of the crew perished. 

The following allusion to the topics we have 
just been considering is from Milton’s Comus, 
line 252. 

Ulysses and the Sirens. Herbert J. Draper. (Fer- 
ens Art Gallery, Hull.) 



I have often heard 
My mother Circe and the Sirens three, 
Amidst the flowery-kirtled Naiades, 
Culling their potent herbs and baneful drugs, 
Who as they sung would take the prisoned soul 
And lap it in Elysium. Scylla wept, 
And chid her barking waves into attention, 
And fell Charybdis murmured soft applause. 

Scylla and Charybdis have become proverbial, 
to denote opposite dangers which beset one’s 

course. 

CALYPSO 

Calypso was a sea-nymph, which name denotes a 
numerous class of female divinities of lower 
rank, yet sharing many of the attributes of the 
gods. Calypso received Ulysses hospitably, enter¬ 
tained him magnificently, became enamored of 
him, and wished to retain him forever, confer¬ 
ring on him immortality. But he persisted in his 
resolution to return to his country and his wife 
and son. Calypso at last received the command of 
Jove to dismiss him. Mercury brought the mes¬ 
sage to her and found her in her grotto, which 
is thus described by Homer: 

A garden vine, luxuriant on all sides, 
Mantled the spacious cavern, cluster-hung 
Profuse; four fountains of serenest lymph, 
Their sinuous course pursuing side by side, 
Strayed all around, and every where appeared 
Meadows of softest verdure, purpled o’er 
With violets; it was a scene to fill 
A god from heaven with wonder and delight. 

Calypso with much reluctance proceeded to 
obey the commands of Jupiter. She supplied 

Ulysses with the means of constructing a raft, 
provisioned it well for him, and gave him a fa¬ 
voring gale. He sped on his course prosperously 
for many days, till at length, when in sight of 
land, a storm arose that broke his mast and 
threatened to rend the raft asunder. In this crisis 
he was seen by a compassionate sea-nymph, who 
in the form of a cormorant alighted on the raft 
and presented him a girdle, directing him to bind 
it beneath his breast, and if he should be com¬ 
pelled to trust himself to the waves, it would 
buoy him up and enable him by swimming to 

reach the land. 
Fenelon, in his romance of Telemachus, has 

given us the adventures of the son of Ulysses in 
search of his father. Among other places at 
which he arrived, following on his father’s foot¬ 
steps, was Calypso’s isle, and, as in the former 
case, the goddess tried every art to keep him 
with her and offered to share her immortality 
with him. But Minerva, who in the shape of 
Mentor accompanied him and governed all his 
movements, made him repel her allurements, and 
when no other means of escape could be found, 
the two friends leaped from a cliff into the sea 
and swam to a vessel which lay becalmed off 
shore. Byron alludes to this leap of Telemachus 
and Mentor in the following stanza: 

But not in silence pass Calypso’s isles, 
The sister tenants of the middle deep; 
There for the weary still a haven smiles, 
Though the fair goddess long has ceased to weep, 
And o’er her cliffs a fruitless watch to keep 
For him who dared prefer a mortal bride. 
Here too his boy essayed the dreadful leap, 
Stern Mentor urged from high to yonder tide; 

While thus of both bereft the nymph-queen doubly 
sighed. 
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CHAPTER XXX 

THE PHAEACIANS—FATE OF THE SUITORS 

THE PHAEACIANS 

Ulysses clung to the raft while any of its timbers 
kept together, and when it no longer yielded Jiinr 
support, binding the girdle around him, he swam. 
Minerva smoothed the billows before him and 
sent him a wind that rolled the waves towards 
the shore. The surf beat high on the rocks and 
seemed to forbid approach; but at length finding 
calm water at the mouth of a gentle stream, he 
landed, spent with toil, breathless and speechless 
and almost dead. After some time reviving he 
kissed the soil, rejoicing, yet at a loss what course 
to take. At a short distance he perceived a wood, 
to which he turned his steps. There finding a 
covert sheltered by intermingling branches alike 
from the sun and the rain, he collected a pile of 
leaves and formed a bed on which he stretched 
himself and, heaping the leaves over him, fell 
asleep. 

The land where he was thrown was Scheria, 
the country of the Phaecians. These people 
dwelt originally near the Cyclopes; but being 
oppressed by that savage race, they migrated to 
the isle of Scheria, under the conduct of Nausi- 
thoiis their king. They were, the poet tells us, a 
people akin to the gods, who appeared manifestly 
and feasted among them when they offered sacri¬ 
fices and did not conceal themselves from soli¬ 
tary wayfarers when they met them. They had 
abundance of wealth and lived in the enjoyment 
of it undisturbed by the alarms of war, for as 
they dwelt remote from gain-seeking man, no 
enemy ever approached their shores, and they 
did not even require to make use of bows and 
quivers. Their chief employment was navigation. 
Their ships, which went with the velocity of 
birds, were endued with intelligence; they knew 
every port and needed no pilot. Alcinoiis, the son 
of Nausi.thoi.is, was now their king, a wise and 
just sovereign, beloved by his people. 

Now it happened that the very night on which 
Ulysses was cast ashore on the Phaeacian island, 
and while he lay sleeping on his bed of leaves, 
Nausicaa, the daughter of the king, had a dream 
sent by Minerva, reminding her that her wedding 
day was not far distant and that it would be but 
a prudent preparation for that event to have a 
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general washing of the clothes of the family. 
This was no slight affair, for the fountains were 
at some distance and the garments must be car¬ 
ried thither. On awaking, the princess hastened 
to her parents to tell them what was on her 
mind; not alluding to her weding day, but find¬ 
ing other reasons equally good. Her father read¬ 
ily assented and ordered the grooms to furnish 
forth a wagon for the purpose. The clothes were 
put therein, and the queen mother placed in the 
wagon likewise an abundant supply of food and 
wine. The princess took her seat and plied the 
lash, her attendant virgins following her on foot. 
Arrived at the riverside, they turned out the 
mules to graze, and unlading the carriage, bore 
the garments down to the water, and working 
with cheerfulness and alacrity, soon despatched 
their labor. Then, having spread the garments on 
the shore to dry, and having themselves bathed, 
they sat down to enjoy their meal; after which 
they rose and amused themselves with a game of 
ball, the princess singing to them while they 
played. But when they had refolded the apparel 
and were about to resume their way to the town, 
Minerva caused the ball thrown by the princess 
to fall into the water, whereat they all screamed 
and Ulysses awaked at the sound. 

Now we must picture to ourselves Ulysses, a 
ship-wrecked mariner, but a few hours escaped 
from the waves and utterly destitute of clothing, 
awaking and discovering that only a few bushes 
were interposed between him and a group of 
young maidens whom by their deportment and 
attire he discovered to be not mere peasant girls, 
but of a higher class. Sadly needing help, how 
could he yet venture naked as he was to discover 
himself and make his wants known? It certainly 
was a case worthy of the interposition of his 
patron goddess Minerva, who never failed him 
at a crisis. Breaking off a leafy branch from a 
tree he held it before him and stepped out from 
the thicket. The virgins at sight of him fled in 
all directions, Nausicaa alone excepted, for her 
Minerva aided and endowed with courage and 
discernment. Ulysses, standing respectfully aloof, 
told his sad case and besought the fair object 
(whether queen or goddess he professed he knew 
not) for food and clothing. The princess replied 
courteously, promising present relief and her 



father’s hospitality when he should become ac¬ 
quainted with the facts. She called back her scat¬ 
tered maidens, chiding their alarm and remind¬ 
ing them that the Phaeacians had no enemies to 
fear. This man, she told them, was an unhappy 
wanderer, whom it was a duty to cherish, for the 
poor and stranger are from Jove. She bade them 
bring food and clothing, for some of her 
brothers’ garments were among the contents of 
the wagon. When this was done, and Ulysses, 
retiring to a sheltered place, had washed his 
body free from the sea-foam, clothed and re¬ 
freshed himself with food, Pallas dilated his form 
and diffused grace over his ample chest and 

manly brows. 
The princess, seeing him, was filled with ad¬ 

miration, and scrupled not to say to her damsels 
that she wished the gods would send her such a 
husband. To Ulysses she recommended that he 
should repair to the city, following herself and 
train so far as the way lay through the fields; but 
when they should approach the city she desired 
that he would no longer be seen in her com¬ 
pany, for she feared the remarks which rude and 
vulgar people might make on seeing her return 
accompanied by such a gallant stranger. To 
avoid which she directed him to stop at a grove 
adjoining the city, in which were a farm and 
garden belonging to the king. After allowing 
time for the princess and her companions to 
reach the city, he was then to pursue his way 
thither, and would be easily guided by any he 
might meet to the royal abode. 

Ulysses obeyed the directions and in due time 
proceeded to the city, on approaching which he 
met a young woman bearing a pitcher forth for 
water. It was Minerva, who had assumed that 
form. Ulysses accosted her and desired to be 
directed to the palace of Alcinoiis the king. The 
maiden replied respectfully, offering to be his 
guide; for the palace she informed him stood near 
her father’s dwelling. Under the guidance of the 
goddess and by her power enveloped in a cloud 
which shielded him from observation, Ulysses 
passed among the busy crowd, and with wonder 
observed their harbor, their ships, their forum 
(the resort of heroes), and their battlements, till 
they came to the palace, where the goddess, hav¬ 
ing first given him some information of the coun¬ 
try, king, and people he was about to meet, left 
him. Ulysses, before entering the court-yard of 
the palace, stood and surveyed the scene. Its 
splendor astonished him. Brazen walls stretched 
from the entrance to the interior house, of which 
the doors were gold, the doorposts silver, the 

lintels silver ornamented with gold. On either 
side were figures of mastiffs wrought in gold and 
silver, standing in rows as if to guard the ap¬ 
proach. Along the walls were seats spread 
through all their length with mantles of finest 
texture, the work of Phaeacian maidens. On these 
seats the princes sat and feasted, while golden 
statues of graceful youths held in their hands 
lighted torches which shed radiance over the 
scene. Full fifty female menials served in house¬ 
hold offices, some employed to grind the corn, 
others to wind off the purple wool or ply the 
loom. For the Phaeacian women as far exceeded 
all other women in household arts as the mariners 
of that country did the rest of mankind in the 
management of ships. Without the court a spa¬ 
cious garden lay, four acres in extent. In it grew 
many a lofty tree, pomegranate, pear, apple, fig, 
and olive. Neither winter’s cold nor summer’s 
drought arrested their growth, but they flour¬ 
ished in constant succession, some budding while 
others were maturing. The vineyard was equally 
prolific. In one quarter, you might see the vines, 
some in blossom, some loaded with ripe grapes, 
and in another observe the vintagers treading the 
wine press. On the garden’s borders, flowers of 
all hues bloomed all the year round, arranged 
with the neatest art. In the midst, two fountains 
poured forth their waters, one flowing by arti¬ 
ficial channels over all the garden, the other con¬ 
ducted through the courtyard of the palace, 
whence every citizen might draw his supplies. 

Ulysses stood gazing in admiration, unob¬ 
served himself, for the cloud which Minerva 
spread around him still shielded him. At length, 
having sufficiently observed the scene, he ad¬ 
vanced with rapid step into the hall where the 
chiefs and senators were assembled, pouring liba¬ 
tion to Mercury, whose worship followed the 
evening meal. Just then Minerva dissolved the 
cloud and disclosed him to the assembled chiefs. 
Advancing to the place where the queen sat, he 
knelt at her feet and implored her favor and as¬ 
sistance to enable him to return to his native 
country. Then withdrawing, he seated himself 
in the manner of suppliants, at the hearthside. 

For a time none spoke. At last an aged states¬ 
man, addressing the king, said, “It is not fit that 
a stranger who asks our hospitality should be kept 
waiting in suppliant guise, none welcoming him. 
Let him therefore be led to a seat among us and 
supplied with food and wine.” At these words 
the king, rising, gave his hand to Ulysses and 
led him to a seat, displacing thence his own son 
to make room for the stranger. Food and wine 
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were set before him and he ate and refreshed 
himself. 

The king then dismissed his guests, notifying 
them that the next day he would call them to 
council to consider what had best be done for 
the stranger. 

When the guests had departed and Ulysses was 
left alone with the king and queen, the queen 
asked him who he was and whence he came, and 
(recognizing the clothes which he wore as those 
which her maidens and herself had made) from 
whom he received those garments. He told them 
of his residence in Calypso’s isle and his depar¬ 
ture thence; of the wreck of his raft, his escape 
by swimming, and of the relief afforded by the 
princess. The parents heard approvingly, and the 
king promised to furnish a ship in which his guest 
might return to his own land. 

The next day the assembled chiefs confirmed 
the promise of the king. A bark was prepared 
and a crew of stout rowers selected, and all be¬ 
took themselves to the palace, where a bounteous 
repast was provided. After the feast the king 
proposed that the young men should show their 
guest their proficiency in many sports, and all 
went forth to the arena for games of running, 
wrestling, and other exercises. After all had done 
their best, Ulysses, being challenged to show 
what he could do, at first declined, but being 
taunted by one of the youths, seized a quoit of 
weight far heavier than any the Phaeacians had 
thrown and sent it farther than the utmost throw 
of theirs. All were astonished, and viewed their 
guest with greatly increased respect. 

After the games they returned to the hall, and 
the herald led in Demodocus, the blind bard— 

Dear to the Muse, 
Who yet appointed him both good and ill, 
Took from him sight, but gave him strains divine. 

He took for his theme the wooden horse, by 
means of which the Greeks found entrance into 
Troy. Apollo inspired him, and he sang so feel¬ 
ingly the terrors and the exploits of that eventful 
time that all were delighted, but Ulysses was 
moved to tears. Observing which, Alcinous, 
when the song was done, demanded of him why 
at the mention of Troy his sorrows awaked. Had 
he lost there a father, or brother, or any dear 
friend? Ulysses replied by announcing himself 
by his true name, and at their request, recounted 
the adventures which had befallen him since his 
departure from Troy. This narrative raised the 
sympathy and admiration of the Phaeacians for 
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their guest to the highest pitch. The king pro¬ 
posed that all the chiefs should present him with 
a gift, himself setting the example. They obeyed 
and vied with one another in loading the illus¬ 
trious stranger with costly gifts. 

The next day Ulysses set sail in the Phaeacian 
vessel and in a short time arrived safe at Ithaca, 
his own island. When the vessel touched the 
strand, he was asleep. The mariners, without 
waking him, carried him on shore and landed 
with him the chest containing his presents, and 
then sailed away. 

Neptune was so displeased at the conduct of 
the Phaeacians in thus rescuing Ulysses from his 
hands that on the return of the vessel to port he 
transformed it into a rock, right opposite the 
mouth of the harbor. 

Homer’s description of the ships of the Phaea¬ 
cians has been thought to look like an anticipa¬ 
tion of the wonders of modern steam navigation. 
Alcinous says to Ulysses— 

Say from what city, from what regions tossed, 
And what inhabitants those regions boast? 
So shalt thou quickly reach the realm assigned, 
In wondrous ships, self-moved, instinct with mind; 
No helm secures their course, no pilot guides; 
Like man intelligent they plough the tides, 
Conscious of every coast and every bay 
That lies beneath the sun’s all-seeing ray. 

Odyssey, Book VIII 

Lord Carlisle, in his Diary in the Turkish and 
Greek Waters, thus speaks of Corfu, which he 
considers to be the ancient Phaeacian island: 

The sites explain the Odyssey. The temple of the 
sea-god could not have been more fitly placed, upon 
a grassy platform of the most elastic turf, on the 
brow of a crag commanding harbor, and channel, 
and ocean. Just at the entrance of the inner harbor 
there is a picturesque rock with a small convent 
perched upon it, which by one legend is the trans¬ 
formed pinnace of Ulysses. 

Almost the only river in the island is just at the 
proper distance from the probable site of the city and 
palace of the king, to justify the princess Nausicaa 
having had resort to her chariot and to luncheon 
when she went with the maidens of the court to 
wash their garments. 

FATE OF THE SUITORS 

Ulysses had now been away from Ithaca for 
twenty years, and when he awoke, he did not 
recognize his native land. Minerva appeared to 
him in the form of a young shepherd, informed 



him where he was, and told him the state of 
things at his palace. More than a hundred nobles 
of Ithaca and of the neighboring islands had been 
for years suing for the hand of Penelope, his 
wife, imagining him dead, and lording it over 
his palace and people, as if they were owners of 
both. That he might be able to take vengeance 
upon them, it was important that he should not 
be recognized. Minerva accordingly metamor¬ 
phosed him into an unsightly beggar, and as such 
he was kindly received by Eumaeus, the swine¬ 
herd, a faithful servant of his house. 

Telemachus, his son, was absent in quest of his 
father. He had gone to the courts of the other 
kings, who had returned from the Trojan expedi¬ 
tion. While on the search, he received counsel 
from Minerva to return home. He arrived and 
sought Eumaeus to learn something of the state 
of affairs at the palace before presenting himself 
among the suitors. Finding a stranger with 
Eumaeus, he treated him courteously, though in 
the garb of a beggar, and promised him assistance. 
Eumaeus was sent to the palace to inform Penel¬ 
ope privately of her son’s arrival, for caution 
was necessary with regard to the suitors, who, as 
Telemachus had learned, were plotting to inter¬ 
cept and kill him. When Eumaeus was gone, 
Minerva presented herself to Ulysses and directed 
him to make himself known to his son. At the 
same time she touched him, removed at once 
from him the appearance of age and penury, and 
gave him the aspect of vigorous manhood that be¬ 
longed to him. Telemachus viewed him with as¬ 
tonishment and at first thought he must be more 
than mortal. But Ulysses announced himself as 
his father and accounted for the change of ap¬ 
pearance by explaining that it was Minerva’s 

doing. 

Then threw Telemachus 
His arms around his father’s neck and wept. 
Desire intense of lamentation seized 
On both; soft murmurs uttering, each indulged 
His grief. 

The father and son took counsel together how 
they should get the better of the suitors and 
punish them for their outrages. It was arranged 
that Telemachus should proceed to the palace 
and mingle with the suitors as formerly; that 
Ulysses should also go as a beggar, a character 
which in the rude old times had different privi¬ 
leges from what we concede to it now. As 
traveller and storyteller, the beggar was admitted 
in the halls of chieftains and often treated like a 

guest; though sometimes also, no doubt, with 
contumely. Ulysses charged his son not to be¬ 
tray, by any display of unusual interest in him, 
that'he knew him to be other than he seemed, 
and even if he saw him insulted, or beaten, not 
to interpose otherwise than he might do for any 
stranger. At the palace they found the usual scene 
of feasting and riot going on. The suitors pre¬ 
tended to receive Telemachus with joy at his re¬ 
turn, though secretly mortified at the failure of 
their plots to take his life. The old beggar was 
permitted to enter and provided with a portion 
from the table. A touching.incident occurred as 
Ulysses entered the courtyard of the palace. An 
old dog lay in the yard almost dead with age 
and, seeing a stranger enter, raised his head, with 
ears erect. It was Argus, Ulysses’ own dog, that 
he had in other days often led to the chase. 

Soon as he perceived 
Long-lost Ulysses nigh, down fell his ears 
Clapped close, and with his tail glad sign he gave 
Of gratulation, impotent to rise, 
And to approach his master as of old. 
Ulysses, noting him, wiped off a tear 
Unmarked. 

. . . Then his destiny released 
Old Argus, soon as he had lived to see 
Ulysses in the twentieth year restored. 

As Ulysses sat eating his portion in the hall, 
the suitors soon began to exhibit their insolence 
to him. When he mildly remonstrated, one of 
them raised a stool and with it gave him a blow. 
Telemachus had hard work to restrain his in- 
digation at seeing his father so treated in his own 
hall, but remembering his father’s injunctions, 
said no more than what became him as master of 
the house, though young, and protector of his 

guests. 
Penelope had protracted her decision in favor 

of either of her suitors so long that there seemed 
to be no further pretence for delay. The con¬ 
tinued absence of her husband seemed to prove 
that his return was no longer to be expected. 
Meanwhile her son had grown up, and was able 
to manage his own affairs. She therefore con¬ 
sented to submit the question of her choice to a 
trial of skill among the suitors. The test selected 
was shooting with the bow. Twelve rings were 
arranged in a line, and he whose arrow was sent 
through the whole twelve was to have the queen 
for his prize. A bow that one of his brother 
heroes had given to Ulysses in former times was 
brought from the armory and, with its quiver 
full of arrows, was laid in the hall. Telemachus 



The Return of Ulysses. Honore Daumier. 
(Cooper Union Museum, New York.) 

had taken care that all other weapons should be 
removed, under pretence that in the heat of com¬ 
petition, there was danger, in some rash moment, 
of putting them to an improper use. 

All things being prepared for the trial, the first 
thing to be done was to bend the bow in order 
to attach the string. Telemachus endeavored to 
do it, but found all his efforts fruitless; and 

modestly confessing that he had attempted a 
task beyond his strength, he yielded the bow to 
another. He tried it with no better success, and, 
amidst the laughter and jeers of his companions, 
gave it up. Another tried it and another; they 
rubbed the bow with tallow, but all to no pur¬ 
pose; it would not bend. Then spoke Ulysses, 
humbly suggesting that he should be permitted 



to try; for, said he, “beggar as I am, I was once 
a soldier, and there is still some strength in these 
old limbs of mine.” The suitors hooted with 
derision and commanded to turn him out of the 
hall for his insolence. But Telemachus spoke up 
for him and, merely to gratify the old man, bade 
him try. Ulysses took the bow and handled it 
with the hand of a master. With ease he adjusted 
the cord to its notch, then fitting an arrow to the 
bow, he drew the string and sped the arrow 
unerring through the rings. 

Without allowing them time to express their 
astonishment, he said, “Now for another mark! 
and aimed direct at the most insolent one of the 
suitors. The arrow pierced through his throat 
and he fell dead. Telemachus, Eumaeus and an¬ 
other faithful follower, well armed, now sprang 
to the side of Ulysses. The suitors, in amazement, 
looked round for arms, but found none, neither 
was there any way of escape, for Eumaeus had 
secured the door. Ulysses left them not long in 
uncertainty; he announced himself as the long- 

lost chief, whose house they had invaded, whose 
substance they had squandered, whose wife and 
son they had persecuted for ten long years; and 
told them he meant to have ample vengeance. 
All were slain, and Ulysses was left master of his 
palace and possessor of his kingdom and his wife. 

Tennyson’s poem of “Ulysses represents the 
old hero, after his dangers past and nothing left 
but to stay at home and be happy, growing tired 
of inaction and resolving to set forth again in 

quest of new adventures. 

Come, my friends, 
’Tis not too late to seek a newer world. 
Push off, and sitting well in order smite 
The sounding furrows; for my purpose holds 
To sail beyond the sunset, and the baths 
Of all the western stars, until I die. 
It may be that the gulfs will wash us down; 
It may be we shall touch the Happy Isles, 
And see the great Achilles whom we knew; 

&c. 

Odysseus (Ulysses) and the Suitors. From a Greek vase. 
(National Museum, Berlin.) 
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CHAPTER XXXI 

ADVENTURES OF AENEAS-THE HARPIES-DIDO 
—PALINURUS 

ADVENTURES OF AENEAS 

We have followed one of the Grecian heroes, 
Ulysses, in his wanderings on his return home 
from Troy, and now we propose to share the 
fortunes of the remnant of the conquered people, 
under their chief Aeneas, in their search for a 
new home, after the ruin of their native city. On 

! that fatal night when the wooden horse dis¬ 
gorged its contents of armed men, and the cap- 

i ture and conflagration of the city were the 
I result, Aeneas made his escape from the scene of 

destruction with his father, and his wife, and 
young son. The father, Anchises, was too old to 

j walk with the speed required, and Aeneas took 
him upon his shoulders. Thus burdened, leading 
his son and followed by his wife, he made the 
best of his way out of the burning city; but, in 

I the confusion, his wife was swept away and lost. 
On arriving at the place of rendezvous, nu- 

I merous fugitives of both sexes were found, who 
j put themselves under the guidance of Aeneas. 
I Some months were spent in preparation, and at 

length they embarked. They first landed on the 
i neighboring shores of Thrace, and were prepar- 
i ing to build a city, Tut Aeneas was deterred by 

a prodigy. Preparing to offer sacrifice, he tore 
i some twigs from one of the bushes. To his dis- 
i may the wounded part dropped blood. When 
i he repeated the act, a voice from the ground 

cried out to him, “Spare me, Aeneas; I am your 
kinsman, Polydore, here murdered with many 
arrows, from which a bush has grown, nourished 
with my blood.” These words recalled to the 
recollection of Aeneas that Polydore was a young 
prince of Troy, whom his father had sent with 
ample treasures to the neighboring land of 
Thrace, there to be brought up, at a distance 
from the horrors of war. The king to whom he 
was sent had murdered him and seized his treas¬ 
ures. Aeneas and his companions, considering 
the land accursed by the stain of such a crime, 
hastened away. 

They next landed on the island of Delos, which 
was once a floating island, till Jupiter fastened it 
by adamantine chains to the bottom of the sea. 
Apollo and Diana were born there, and the island 
was sacred to Apollo. Here Aeneas consulted 

the oracle of Apollo and received an answer, 
ambiguous as usual-“Seek your ancient mother; 
there the race of Aeneas shall dwell and reduce 
all other nations to their sway.” The Trojans 
heard with joy and immediately began to ask 
one another, “Where is the spot intended by the 
oracle?” Anchises remembered that there was a 
tradition that their forefathers came from Crete, 
and thither they resolved to steer. They arrived 
at Crete and began to build their city, but sick¬ 
ness broke out among them, and the fields that 
they had planted failed to yield a crop. In this 
gloomy aspect of affairs, Aeneas was warned in 
a dream to leave the country and seek a western 
land, called Hesperia, whence Dardanus, the true 
founder of the Trojan race, had originally mi¬ 
grated. To Hesperia, now called Italy, therefore, 
they directed their future course, and not till 
after many adventures, and the lapse of time 
sufficient to carry a modern navigator several 
times round the world, did they arrive there. 

Their first landing was at the island of the 
Harpies. These were disgusting birds, with the 
heads of maidens, with long claws and faces pale 
with hunger. They were sent by the gods to tor¬ 
ment a certain Phineus, whom Jupiter had de¬ 
prived of his sight in punishment of his cruelty; 
and whenever a meal was placed before him, the 
Harpies darted down from the air and carried it 
off. They were driven away from Phineus by the 
heroes of the Argonautic expedition and took 
refuge in the island where Aeneas now found 
them. 

When they entered the port, the Trojans saw 
herds of cattle roaming over the plain. They slew 
as many as they wished and prepared for a feast. 
But no sooner had they seated themselves at the 
table than a horrible clamor was heard in the air, 
and a flock of these odious harpies came rushing 
down upon them, seizing in their talons the meat 
from the dishes and flying away with it. Aeneas 
and his companions drew their swords and dealt 
vigorous blows among the monsters, but to no 
purpose, for they were so nimble it was almost 
impossible to hit them, and their feathers were 
like armor impenetrable to steel. One of them, 
perched on a neighboring cliff, screamed out, 
“Is it thus, Trojans, you treat us innocent birds, 



The Harpies. From a Greek vase. (From The 
Studio magazine.') 

first slaughter our cattle and then make war on 
ourselves?” She then predicted dire sufferings to 
them in their future course, and having vented 
her wrath flew away. The Trojans made haste 
to leave the country and next found themselves 
coasting along the shore of Epirus. Here they 
landed and, to their astonishment, learned that 
certain Trojan exiles, who had been carried there 
as prisoners, had become rulers of the country. 
Andromache, the widow of Hector, became the 
wife of one of the victorious Grecian chiefs, to 
whom she bore a son. Her husband dying, she 
was left regent of the country, as guardian of her 
son, and had married a fellow-captive, Helenus, 
of the royal race of Troy. Helenus and An¬ 
dromache treated the exiles with the utmost hos¬ 
pitality and dismissed them loaded with gifts. 

From hence Aeneas coasted along the shore of 
Sicily and passed the country of the Cyclopes. 
Here they were hailed from the shore by a 
miserable object, whom by his garments, tattered 
as they were, they perceived to be a Greek. He 
told them he was one of Ulysses’ companions, 
left behind by that chief in his hurried departure. 
He related the story of Ulysses’ adventure with 
Polyphemus and besought them to take him off 
with them, as he had no means of sustaining his 
existence where he was but wild berries and 
roots, and lived in constant fear of the Cyclopes. 
While he spoke, Polyphemus made his appear¬ 
ance; a terrible monster, shapeless, vast, whose 
only eye had been put out. He walked with 
cautious steps, feeling his way with a staff, down 
to the seaside, to wash his eye-socket in the 
waves. When he reached the water, he waded 
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Ulysses Deriding Polyphemus. /. M. W. Turner. (National Gallery, London.) 
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out towards them, and his immense height en¬ 
abled him to advance far into the sea, so that the 
Trojans, in terror, took to their oars to get out 
of his way. Hearing the oars, Polyphemus shouted 
after them, so that the shores resounded, and at 
the noise other Cyclopes came forth from their 
caves and woods and lined the shore, like a row 
of lofty pine trees. The Trojans plied their oars 

and soon left them out of sight. 
Aeneas had been cautioned by Helenus to 

avoid the strait guarded by the monsters Scylla 
and Charybdis. There Ulysses, the reader will 
remember, had lost six of his men, seized by 
Scylla, while the navigators were wholly intent 
upon avoiding Charybdis. Aeneas following the 
advice of Helenus shunned the dangerous pass 
and coasted along the island of Sicily. 

Juno, seeing the Trojans speeding their way 
prosperously towards their destined shore, felt 
her old grudge against them revive, for she could 
not forget the slight that Paris had put upon her, 
in awarding the prize of beauty to another. In 
heavenly minds can such resentments dwell! Ac¬ 
cordingly she hastened to Aeolus, the ruler of the 
winds—the same who supplied Ulysses with 
favoring gales, giving him the contrary ones tied 
up in a bag. iVeolus obeyed the goddess and sent 
forth his sons, Boreas, Typhon, and the other 
winds, to toss the ocean. A terrible storm ensued, 
and the Trojan ships were driven out of their 
course towards the coast of Africa. They were 
in imminent danger of being wrecked and were 
separated, so that Aeneas thought that all were 
lost except his own. 

At this crisis, Neptune, hearing the storm rag¬ 
ing and knowing tnat he had not given orders 
for one, raised his head above the waves and 
saw the fleet of Aeneas driving before the gale. 
Knowing the hostility of Juno, he was at no loss 
to account for it, but his anger was not the less 
at this interference in his province. He called 
the winds and dismissed them with a severe rep¬ 
rimand. He then soothed the waves and brushed 
away the clouds from before the face of the sun. 
Some of the ships which had got on the rocks he 
pried off with his own trident, while Triton and 
a sea-nymph, putting their shoulders under 
others, set them afloat again. The Trojans, when 
the sea became calm, sought the nearest shore, 
which was the coast of Carthage, where Aeneas 
was so happy as to find that one by one the ships 
all arrived safe, though badly shaken. 

Waller, in “A Panegyric to Ady Lord Protec¬ 
tor” (Cromwell), alludes to this stilling of the 
storm by Neptune: 

Above the waves, as Neptune showed his face, 
To chide the winds and save the Trojan race, 
So has your Highness, raised above the rest, 
Storms of ambition tossing us repressed. 

DIDO 

Carthage, where the exiles had now arrived, was 
a spot on the coast of Africa opposite Sicily, 
where at that time a Tyrian colony under Dido, 
their queen, was laying the foundations of a state 
destined in later ages to be the rival of Rome it¬ 
self. Dido was the daughter of Belus, King of 
Tyre, and sister of Pygmalion, who succeeded 
his father on the throne. Her husband was 
Sichaeus, a man of immense wealth, but Pygma¬ 
lion, who coveted his treasures, caused him to be 
put to death. Dido, with a numerous body of 
friends and followers, both men and women, suc¬ 
ceeded in effecting their escape from Tyre, in 



Dido Building Carthage. J.M. W. Turner. (Na¬ 
tional Gallery, London.) 

several vessels, carrying with them the treasures 
of Sichaeus. On arriving at the spot which they 
selected as the seat of their future home, they 
asked of the natives only so much land as they 
could enclose with a bull’s hide. When this was 
readily granted, she caused the hide to be cut 
into strips, and with them enclosed a spot on 
which she built a citadel, and called it Byrsa (a 
hide). Around this fort, the city of Carthage 
rose and soon became a powerful and flourishing 
place. 

Such was the state of affairs when Aeneas with 
his Trojans arrived there. Dido received the il¬ 
lustrious exiles with friendliness and hospitality. 
“Not unacquainted with distress,” she said, “I 
have learned to succor the unfortunate.” The 
queen’s hospitality displayed itself in festivities 

at which games of strength and skill were ex¬ 
hibited. The strangers contended for the palm 
with her own subjects, on equal terms, the queen 
declaring that whether the victor were “Trojan 
or Tyrian should make no difference to her.” At 
the feast which followed the games, Aeneas gave 
at her request a recital of the closing events of 
the Trojan history and his own adventures after 
the fall of the city. Dido was charmed with his 
discourse and filled with admiration of his ex¬ 
ploits. She conceived an ardent passion for him, 
and he for his part seemed well content to accept 
the fortunate chance which appeared to offer 
him at once a happy termination of his wander¬ 
ings, a home, a kingdom, and a bride. Months 
rolled away in the enjoyment of pleasant inter¬ 
course, and it seemed as if Italy and the empire 
destined to be founded on its shores were alike 
forgotten. Seeing which, Jupiter despatched 
Mercury with a message to Aeneas, recalling him 
to a sense of his high destiny and commanding 
him to resume his voyage. 

Aeneas parted from Dido, though she tried 
every allurement and persuasion to detain him. 
The blow to her affection and her pride was too 
much for her to endure, and when she found that 
he was gone, she mounted a funeral pile which 
she had caused to be prepared, and, having 
stabbed herself, was consumed with the pile. The 
flames rising over the city were seen by the de¬ 
parting Trojans, and though the cause was un¬ 
known, gave to Aeneas some intimation of the 
fatal event. 

The following epigram we find in Elegant 
Extracts: 

From the Latin 

Unhappy, Dido, was thy fate 
In first and second married state! 
One husband caused thy flight by dying, 
Thy death the other caused by flying. 

PALINURUS 

After touching at the island of Sicily, where 
Acestes, a prince of Trojan lineage, bore sway, 
who gave them a hospitable reception, the Tro¬ 
jans reembarked and held on their course for 
Italy. Venus now interceded with Neptune to 
allow her son at last to attain the wished-for goal 
and find an end of his perils on the deep. Nep¬ 
tune consented, stipulating only for one life as 
a ransom for the rest. The victim was Palinurus, 
the pilot. As he sat watching the stars, with his 



hand on the helm, Somnus, sent by Neptune, ap¬ 
proached in the guise of Phorbas and said, “Pali- 
nurus, the breeze is fair, the water smooth, and the 
ship sails steadily on her course. Lie down a 
while and take needful rest. I will stand at the 
helm in your place.” Palinurus replied, Tell me 
not of smooth seas or favoring winds-me who 
have seen so much of their treachery. Shall I 
trust Aeneas to the chances of the weather and 
the winds?” And he continued to grasp the helm 
and to keep his eyes fixed on the stars. But Som¬ 
nus waved over him a branch moistened with 
Lethaean dew, and his eyes closed in spite of all 
his efforts. Then Somnus pushed him overboard 
and he fell; but keeping his hold upon the helm, 
it came away with him. Neptune was mindful of 
his promise and kept the ship on her track with¬ 
out helm or pilot, till Aeneas discovered his loss, 
and sorrowing deeply for his faithful steersman 

took charge of the ship himself. 
There is a beautiful allusion to the story of 

Palinurus in Scott’s “Marmion,” Introduction to 
Canto I, where the poet, speaking of the recent 

death of William Pitt, says- 

O, think how, to his latest day, 
When death just hovering claimed his prey, 
With Palinure’s unaltered mood, 
Firm at his dangerous post he stood; 
Each call for needful rest repelled, 
With dying hand the rudder held, 
Till in his fall, with fateful sway, 
The steerage of the realm gave way. 

The ships at last reached the shores of Italy, 
and joyfully did the adventurers leap to land. 
While his people were employed in making their 
encampment Aeneas sought the abode of the 
Sibyl. It was a cave connected with a temple and 
grove, sacred to Apollo and Diana. While Aeneas 
contemplated the scene, the Sibyl accosted him. 
She seemed to know his errand, and under the in¬ 
fluence of the deity of the place, burst forth in 
a prophetic strain, giving dark intimations of 
labors and perils through which he was destined 
to make his way to final success. She closed with 
the encouraging words which have become pro¬ 
verbial: “Yield not to disasters, but press onward 
the more bravely.” Aeneas replied that he had 
prepared himself for whatever might await him. 
He had but one request to make. Having been 
directed in a dream to seek the abode of the dead 
in order to confer with his father Anchises to 
receive from him a revelation of his future for¬ 
tunes and those of his race, he asked her assist¬ 
ance to enable him to accomplish the task. The 

Sibyl replied, “The descent to Avernus is easy; 
the gate of Pluto stands open night and day; but 
to retrace one’s steps and return to the upper air, 
that is the toil^that the difficulty.” She instructed 
him to seek in the forest a tree on which grew a 
golden branch. This branch was to be plucked 
off and borne as a gift to Proserpine, and if fate 
was propitious it would yield to the hand and 
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quit its parent trunk, but otherwise no force 
could rend it away. If torn away, another would 
succeed. 

Aeneas followed the directions of the Sibyl. 
His mother Venus sent two of her doves to fly 
before him and show him the way, and by their 
assistance he found the tree, plucked the branch, 
and hastened back with it to the Sibyl. 

The Union of Dido and Aeneas. Gaspard Dughet 
and Carlo Maratta. (National Gallery, London.) 
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CHAPTER XXXII 

THE INFERNAL REGIONS-THE SIBYL 

THE INFERNAL REGIONS 

As at the commencement of our series we have 
given the pagan account of the creation of the 
world, so as we approach its conclusion we pre¬ 
sent a view of the regions of the dead, depicted 
by one of their most enlightened poets, who 
drew his doctrines from their most esteemed 
philosophers. The region where Virgil locates 
the entrance into this abode is perhaps the most 
strikingly adapted to excite ideas of the terrific 
and preternatural of any on the face of the earth. 
It is the volcanic region near Vesuvius, where 
the whole country is cleft with chasms from 
which sulphurous flames arise, while the ground 
is shaken with pent-up vapors, and mysterious 
sounds issue from the bowels of the earth. The 
lake Avernus is supposed to fill the crater of an 
extinct volcano. It is circular, half a mile wide, 
and very deep, surrounded by high banks which, 
in Virgil’s time, were covered with a gloomy 
forest. Mephitic vapors rise from its waters, so 
that no life is found on its banks and no birds fly 
over it. Here, according to the poet, was the cave 
which afforded access to the infernal regions, and 
here Aeneas offered sacrifices to the infernal 
deities, Proserpine, Hecate, and the Furies. Then 
a roaring was heard in the earth, the woods on 
the hilltops were shaken, and the howling of dogs 
announced the approach of the deities. “Now,” 
said the Sibyl, “summon up your courage, for 
you will need it.” She descended into the cave, 
and Aeneas followed. Before the threshold of 
hell they passed through a group of beings who 
are enumerated as Griefs and avenging Cares, 
pale Diseases and melancholy Age, Fear and Hun¬ 
ger that tempt to crime, Toil, Poverty, and 
Death, forms horrible to view. The Furies spread 
their couches there, and Discord, whose hair was 
of vipers tied up with a bloody fillet. Here also 
were the monsters, Briareus with his hundred 
arms, Hydras hissing and Chimaeras breathing 
fire. Aeneas shuddered at the sight, drew his 
sword and would have struck, but the Sibyl re¬ 
strained him. They then came to the black river 
Cocytus, where they found the ferryman, 
Charon, old and squalid, but strong and vigorous, 
who was receiving passengers of all kinds into his 
boat, magnanimous heroes, boys and unmarried 

girls, as numerous as the leaves that fall at autumn, 
or the flocks that fly southward at the approach 
of winter. They stood pressing for a passage and 
longing to touch the opposite shore. But the stern 
ferryman took in only such as he chose, driving 
the rest back. Aeneas, wondering at the sight, 
asked the Sibyl, “Why this discrimination?” She 
answered, “Those who are taken on board the 
bark are the souls of those who have received 
due burial rites; the host of others who have re¬ 
mained unburied are not permitted to pass the 
flood, but wander a hundred years, and flit to and 
fro about the shore, till at last they are taken 
over.” Aeneas grieved at recollecting some of his 
own companions who had perished in the storm. 
At that moment he beheld Palinurus, his pilot, 
who fell overboard and was drowned. He ad¬ 
dressed him and asked him the cause of his mis¬ 
fortune. Palinurus replied that the rudder was 
carried away and he, clinging to it, was swept 
away with it. He besought Aeneas most urgently 
to extend to him his hand and take him in com¬ 
pany to the opposite shore. But the Sibyl rebuked 
him for the wish thus to transgress the laws of 
Pluto; but consoled him by informing him that 
the people of the shore where his body had been 
wafted by the waves should be stirred up by 
prodigies to give it due burial, and that the 
promontory should bear the name of Cape 
Palinurus, which it does to this day. Leaving 
Palinurus consoled by these words, they ap¬ 
proached the boat. Charon, fixing his eyes sternly 
upon the advancing warrior, demanded by what 
right he, living and armed, approached that shore. 
To which the Sibyl replied that they would 
commit no violence, that Aeneas’s only object 
was to see his father, and finally exhibited the 
golden branch, at sight of which Charon’s wrath 
relaxed, and he made haste to turn his bark to the 
shore and receive them on board. The boat, 
adapted only to the light freight of bodiless 
spirits, groaned under the weight of the hero. 
They were soon conveyed to the opposite shore. 
There they were encountered by the three¬ 
headed dog Cerberus, with his necks bristling 
with snakes. He barked with all his three throats 
till the Sibyl threw him a medicated cake, which 
he eagerly devoured and then stretched himself 
out in his den and fell asleep. Aeneas and the 



Sibyl sprang to land. The first sound that struck 
their ears was the wailing of young children, who 
had died on the threshold of life, and near to 
these were they who had perished under false 
charges. Minos presides over them as judge and 
examines the deeds of each. The next class was 
of those who had died by their own hand, hating 
life and seeking refuge in death. Oh, how will¬ 
ingly would they now endure poverty, labor, 
and any other infliction, if they might but return 
to life! Next were situated the regions of sadness, 
divided off into retired paths, leading through 
groves of myrtle. Here roamed those who had 
fallen victims to unrequited love, not freed from 
pain even by death itself. Among those, Aeneas 
thought he descried the form of Dido, with a 
wound still recent. In the dim light he was for a 
moment uncertain, but approaching, perceived it 
was indeed herself. Tears fell from his eyes, and 
he addressed her in the accents of love. “Un¬ 
happy Dido! was then the rumor true that you 
had perished? And was I, alas! the cause? I call 
the gods to witness that my departure from you 
was reluctant and in obedience to the commands 
of Jove; nor could I believe that my absence 
would have cost you so dear. Stop, I beseech 
you, and refuse me not a last farewell.” She stood 
for a moment, with averted countenance and 
eyes fixed on the ground, and then silently passed 
on, as insensible to his pleadings as a rock. Aeneas 
followed for some distance; then, with a heavy 
heart, rejoined xhis companion and resumed his 
route. 

They next entered the fields where roam the 
heroes who have fallen in battle. Here they saw 
many shades of Grecian and Trojan warriors. 
The Trojans thronged around him and could not 
be satisfied with the sight. They asked the cause 
of his coming and plied him with innumerable 
questions. But the Greeks, at the sight of his 
armor glittering through the murky atmosphere, 
recognized the hero and, filled with terror, turned 
their backs and fled, as they used to do on the 
plains of Troy. 

Aeneas would have lingered long with his Tro¬ 
jan friends, but the Sibyl hurried him away. They 
next came to a place where the road divided, the 
one leading to Elysium, the other to the regions 
of the condemned. Aeneas beheld on one side 
the walls of a mighty city, around which 
Phlegethon rolled its fiery waters. Before him was 
the gate of adamant that neither gods nor men 
can break through. An iron tower stood by the 
gate, on which Tisiphone, the avenging Fury, 
kept guard. From the city were heard groans, 

293 

and the sound of the scourge, the creaking of 
iron and the clanking of chains. Aeneas, horror- 
struck, inquired of his guide what crimes were 
those whose punishments produced the sounds he 
heard? The Sibyl answered, “Here is the judg¬ 
ment hall of Rhadamanthus, who brings to light 
crimes done in life, which the perpetrator vainly 
thought impenetrably hid. Tisiphone applies her 
whip of scorpions and delivers the offender over 
to her sister Furies. At this moment with horrid 
clang the brazen gates unfolded, and Aeneas saw 
within a Hydra with fifty heads, guarding the 
entrance. The Sibyl told him that the gulf of 
Tartarus descended deep, so that its recesses were 
as far beneath their feet as heaven was high above 
their heads. In the bottom of this pit, the Titan 
race, who warred against the gods, lie prostrate; 
Salmoneus, also, who presumed to vie with Jupi¬ 
ter and built a bridge of brass over which he 
drove his chariot that the sound might resemble 
thunder, launching flaming brands at his people 
in imitation of lightning, till Jupiter struck him 
with a real thunderbolt and taught him the dif¬ 
ference between mortal weapons and divine. 
Here, also, is Tityus, the giant, whose form is so 
immense that as he lies, he stretches over nine 
acres, while a vulture preys upon his liver, which 
as fast as it is devoured grows again, so that his 
punishment will have no end. 

Aeneas saw groups seated at tables loaded with 
dainties, while near by stood a Fury who 
snatched away the viands from their lips as fast 
as they prepared to taste them. Others beheld 
suspended over their heads huge rocks, threaten¬ 
ing to fall, keeping them in a state of constant 
alarm. These were they who had hated their 
brothers, or struck their parents, or defrauded 
the friends who trusted them, or who, having 
grown rich, kept their money to themselves and 
gave no share to others; the last being the most 
numerous class. Here also were those who had 
violated the marriage vow, or fought in a bad 
cause, or failed in fidelity to their employers. 
Here was one who had sold his country for gold, 
another who perverted the laws, making them 
say one thing today and another tomorrow. 

Ixion was there, fastened to the circumference 
of a wheel ceaselessly revolving; and Sisyphus, 
whose task was to roll a huge stone up to a hill¬ 
top, but when the steep was well-nigh gained, 
the rock, repulsed by some sudden force, rushed 
again headlong down to the plain. Again he toiled 
at it, while the sweat bathed all his weary limbs, 
but all to no effect. There was Tantalus, who 
stood in a pool, his chin level with the water, yet 



he was parched with thirst and found nothing to 
assuage it; for when he bowed his hoary head, 
eager to quaff, the water fled away, leaving the 
ground at his feet all dry. Tall trees laden with 
fruit stooped their heads to him, pears, pome¬ 
granates, apples, and luscious figs; but when with 
a sudden grasp he tried to seize them, winds 
whirled them high above his reach. 

The Sibyl now warned Aeneas that it was time 
to turn from these melancholy regions and seek 
the city of the blessed. They passed through a 
middle tract of darkness and came upon the 
Elysian fields, the groves where the happy reside. 
They breathed a freer air and saw all objects 
clothed in a purple light. The region has a sun 
and stars of its own. The inhabitants were enjoy¬ 
ing themselves in various ways, some in sports on 
the grassy turf, in games of strength or skill, 
others dancing or singing. Orpheus struck the 
chords of his lyre and called forth ravishing 
sounds. Here Aeneas saw the founders of the 
Trojan state, magnanimous heroes who lived in 
happier times. He gazed with admiration on the 
war chariots and glittering arms now reposing 
in disuse. Spears stood fixed in the ground, and 
the horses, unharnessed, roamed over the plain. 
The same pride in splendid armor and generous 
steeds which the old heroes felt in life accom¬ 
panied them here. He saw another group feasting 
and listening to the strains of music. They were 
in a laurel grove, whence the great river Po has 
its origin and flows out among men. Here dwelt 
those who fell by wounds received in their 
country’s cause, holy priests also, and poets who 
have uttered thoughts worthy of Apollo, and 
others who have contributed to cheer and adorn 
life by their discoveries in the useful arts and 
have made their memory blessed by rendering 
service to mankind. They wore snow-white fil¬ 
lets about their brows. The Sibyl addressed a 
group of these and inquired where Anchises was 
to be found. They were directed where to seek 
him and soon found him in a verdant valley, 
where he was contemplating the ranks of his 
posterity, their destinies and worthy deeds to be 
achieved in coming times. When he recognized 
Aeneas approaching, he stretched out both hands 
to him, while tears flowed freely. “Have you 
come at last,” said he, “long expected, and do I 
behold you after such perils past? Oh, my son, 
how have I trembled for you as I have watched 
your career!” To which Aeneas replied, “Oh, 
Father! your image was always before me to 
guide and guard me.” Then he endeavored to 

enfold his father in his embrace, but his arms en¬ 

closed only an unsubstantial image. 
Aeneas perceived before him a spacious valley, 

with trees gently waving to the wind, a tranquil 
landscape, through which the river Lethe flowed. 
Along the banks of the stream wandered a count¬ 
less multitude, numerous as insects in the summer 
air. Aeneas, with surprise, inquired who were 
these. Anchises answered, “They are souls to 
which bodies are to be given in due time. Mean¬ 
while, they dwell on Lethe’s bank and drink 
oblivion of their former lives.” “Oh, Father!” 
said Aeneas, “is it possible that any can be so in 
love with life as to wish to leave these tranquil 
seats for the upper world?” Anchises replied by 
explaining the plan of creation. The Creator, he 
told him, originally made the material of which 
souls are composed, of the four elements, fire, 
air, earth, and water, all which when united took 
the form of the most excellent part, fire, and 
became flame. This material was scattered like 
seed among the heavenly bodies, the sun, moon, 
and stars. Of this seed the inferior gods created 
man and all other animals, mingling it with 
various proportions of earth, by which its purity 
was alloyed and reduced. Thus the more earth 
predominates in the composition, the less pure is 
the individual; and we see men and women with 
their full-grown bodies have not the purity of 
childhood. So in proportion to the time which 
the union of body and soul has lasted is the im¬ 
purity contracted by the spiritual part. This im¬ 
purity must be purged away after death, which 
is done by ventilating the souls in the current of 
winds, or merging them in water, or burning 
out their impurities by fire. Some few, of whom 
Anchises intimates that he is one, are admitted at 
once to Elysium, there to remain. But the rest, 
after the impurities of earth are purged away, 
are sent back to life endowed with new bodies, 
having had the remembrance of their former 
lives effectually washed away by the waters of 
Lethe. Some, however, there still are, so thor¬ 
oughly corrupted that they are not fit to be in¬ 
trusted with human bodies, and these are made 
into brute animals, lions, tigers, cats, dogs, mon¬ 
keys, &c. This is what the ancients called metem¬ 
psychosis, or the transmigration of souls; a doc¬ 
trine which is still held by the natives of India, 
who scruple to destroy the life, even of the most 
insignificant animal, not knowing but it may be 
one of their relations in an altered form. 

Anchises, having explained so much, pro¬ 
ceeded to point out to Aeneas individuals of his 
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race, who were hereafter to be born, and to re¬ 
late to him the exploits they should perform in 
the world. After this he reverted to the present 
and told his son of the events that remained to 
him to be accomplished before the complete 
establishment of himself and his followers in 
Italy. Wars were to be waged, battles fought, a 
bride to be won, and in the result a Trojan state 
founded, from which should rise the Roman 
power, to be in time the sovereign of the world. 

Aeneas and the Sibyl then took leave of 
Anchises and returned by some short cut, which 
the poet does not explain, to the upper world. 

ELYSIUM 

Virgil, we have seen, places his Elysium under 
the earth and assigns it for a residence to the 
spirits of the blessed. But in Homer Elysium 
forms no part of the realms of the dead. He 
places it on the west of the earth, near Ocean, 
and describes it as a happy land, where there 
is neither snow, nor cold, nor rain, and always 
fanned by the delightful breezes of Zephyrus. 
Hither favored heroes pass without dying and 
live happy under the rule of Rhadamanthus. The 
Elysium of Hesiod and Pindar is in the Isles of 
the Blessed, or Fortunate Islands, in the Western 
Ocean. From these sprang the legend of the happy 
island Atlantis. This blissful region may have 
been wholly imaginary, but possibly may have 
sprung from the reports of some storm-driven 
mariners who had caught a glimpse of the coast 
of America. 

J. R. Lowell, in one of his shorter poems, 
claims for the present age some of the privileges 
of that happy realm. Addressing the past, he 
says— 

Whatever of true life there was in thee, 
Leaps in our age’s veins. 

Here, ’mid the bleak waves of our strife and care, 
Float the green “Fortunate Isles.” 

Where all thy hero-spirits dwell and share 
Our martyrdoms and toils. 

The present moves attended 
With all of brave and excellent and fair 
That made the old time splendid. 

Fortunate fields and groves and flowery vales, 
Thrice happy isles. 

And in Book II he characterizes the rivers of 
Erebus according to the meaning of their names 
in the Greek language: 

Abhorred Styx, the flood of deadly hate, 
Sad Acheron of sorrow black and deep; 
Cocytus named of lamentation loud 
Heard on the rueful stream; fierce Phlegethon 
V hose waves of torrent fire inflame with rage. 
Far off from these a slow and silent stream. 
Lethe, the river of oblivion, rolls 
Her watery labyrinth, whereof who drinks 
Forthwith his former state and being forgets, 
Forgets both joy and grief, pleasure and pain. 

THE SIBYL 

As Aeneas and the Sibyl pursued their way back 
to earth, he said to her, “Whether thou be a 
goddess or a mortal beloved of the gods, by me 
thou shalt always be held in reverence. When I 
reach the upper air, I will cause a temple to be 
built to thy honor, and will myself bring offer¬ 
ings.” “I am no goddess,” said the Sibyl; “I have 
no claim to sacrifice or offering. I am mortal; yet 
if I could have accepted the love of Apollo, I 
might have been immortal. He promised me the 
fulfilment of my wish, if I would consent to be 
his. I took a handful of sand and, holding it forth, 
said, ‘Grant me to see as many birthdays as there 
are sand grains in my hand.’ Unluckily I forgot 
to ask for enduring youth. This also he would 
have granted, could I have accepted his love, but 
offended at my refusal, he allowed me to grow 
old. My youth and youthful strength fled long 
ago. I have lived seven hundred years, and to 
equal the number of the sand grains, I have still 
to see three hundred springs and three hundred 
harvests. My body shrinks up as years increase, 
and in time I shall be lost to sight, but my voice 
will remain, and future ages will respect my say¬ 
ings.” 

These concluding words of the Sibyl alluded 
to her prophetic power. In her cave she was 
accustomed to inscribe on leaves gathered from 
the trees the names and fates of individuals. The 
leaves thus inscribed were arranged in order 
within the cave, and might be consulted by her 

Milton also alludes to the same fable in P. L., 
Book III, i, 568. 

Overleaf: The Bay of Baiae, with Apollo and the 
Like those Hesperian gardens famed of old, Sibyl. /. M. W. Turner. (Tate Gallery, London.) 
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votaries. But if perchance at the opening of the 
door the wind rushed in and dispersed the leaves, 
the Sibyl gave no aid to restoring them again, 
and the oracle was irreparably lost. 

The following legend of the Sibyl is fixed at a 
later date. In the reign of one of the Tarquins 
there appeared before the king a woman who 
offered him nine books for sale. The king refused 
to purchase them, whereupon the woman went 
away and burned three of the books, and return¬ 
ing, offered the remaining books for the same 
price she had asked for the nine. The king again 
rejected them; but when the woman, after burn¬ 
ing three books more, returned and asked for the 
three remaining the same price which she had 
before asked for the nine, his curiosity was ex¬ 
cited, and he purchased the books. They were 
found to contain the destinies of the Roman 
state. They were kept in the temple of Jupiter 
Capitolinus, preserved in a stone chest, and 
allowed to be inspected only by especial officers 

appointed for that duty, who on great occasions 
consulted them and interpreted their oracles to 

the people. 
There were various Sibyls; but the Cumaean 

Sibyl, of whom Ovid and Virgil write, is the 
most celebrated of them. Ovid’s story of her life 
protracted to one thousand years may be in¬ 
tended to represent the various Sibyls as being 
only reappearances of one and the same individ¬ 

ual. 
Young, in the Night Thoughts, alludes to the 

Sibyl. Speaking of Worldly Wisdom, he says: 

If future fate she plans ’tis all in leaves, 
Like Sibyl, unsubstantial, fleeting bliss; 
At the first blast it vanishes in air. 

As worldly schemes resemble Sibyl’s leaves, 
The good man’s days to Sibyl’s books compare, 
The price still rising as in number less. 

Head of Aphrodite (Venus). Greek. {Museum of Fine Arts, Boston.) 
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CHAPTER XXXIII 

CAMILLA-EVANDER-NISUS AND EURYALUS- 
MEZENTIUS—TURNUS 

Aeneas, having parted from the Sibyl and re¬ 
joined his fleet, coasted along the shores of Italy 
and cast anchor in the mouth of the Tiber." The 
poet, having brought his hero to this spot, the 
destined termination of his wanderings, invokes 
his Muse to tell him the situation of things at 
that eventful moment. Latinus, third in descent 
from Saturn, ruled the country. He was now old 
and had no male descendant, but had one charm¬ 
ing daughter, Lavinia, who was sought in mar¬ 
riage by many neighboring chiefs, one of whom, 
Turnus, King of the Rutulians, was favored by 
the wishes of her parents. But Latinus had been 
warned in a dream by his father, Faunus, that the 
destined husband of Lavinia should come from a 
foreign land. From that union should spring a 
race destined to subdue the world. 

Our readers will remember that in the conflict 
with the Harpies, one of those half-human birds 
had threatened the Trojans with dire sufferings. 
In particular she predicted that before their 
wanderings ceased they should be pressed by 
hunger to devour their tables. This portent now 
came true; for as they took their scanty meal, 
seated on the grass, the men placed their hard 
biscuit on their laps and put thereon whatever 
their gleanings in the woods supplied. Having 
despatched the latter, they finished by eating the 
crusts. Seeing which, the boy lulus said play¬ 
fully, “See, we are eating our tables.” Aeneas 
caught the words and accepted the omen. “All 
hail, promised land!” he exclaimed, “this is our 
home, this our country!” He then took measures 
to find out who were the present inhabitants of 
the land, and who their rulers. A hundred chosen 
men were sent to the village of Latinus, bearing 
presents and a request for friendship and alliance. 
They went and were favorably received. Latinus 
immediately concluded that the Trojan hero was 
no other than the promised son-in-law an¬ 
nounced by the oracle. He cheerfully granted 
his alliance and sent back the messengers 
mounted on steeds from his stables and loaded 
with gifts and friendly messages. 

Juno, seeing things go thus prosperously for 
the Trojans, felt her old animosity revive, sum¬ 
moned Alecto from Erebus, and sent her to stir 

2 99 

up discord. The Fury first took possession of the 
queen, Amata, and roused her to oppose in every 
way the new alliance. Alecto then speeded to 
the city of Turnus and, assuming the form of an 
old priestess, informed him of the arrival of the 
foreigners and of the attempts of their prince to 
rob him of his bride. Next she turned her atten¬ 
tion to the camp of the Trojans. There she saw 
the boy lulus and his companions amusing them¬ 
selves with hunting. She sharpened the scent of 
the dogs and led them to rouse up from the 
thicket a tame stag, the favorite of Silvia, the 
daughter of Tyrrheus, the king’s herdsman. A 
javelin from the hand of lulus wounded the ani¬ 
mal, and he had only strength left to run home¬ 
wards, and die at his mistress’s feet. Her cries 
and tears roused her brothers and the herdsmen, 
and they, seizing whatever weapons came to 
hand, furiously assaulted the hunting party. 
These were protected by their friends, and the 
herdsmen were finally driven back with the loss 
of two of their number. 

These things were enough to rouse the storm 
of war, and the queen, Turnus, and the peasants 
all urged the old king to drive the strangers from 
the country. He resisted as long as he could, but 
finding his opposition unavailing, finally gave 
way and retreated to his retirement. 

OPENING THE GATES OF JANUS 

It was the custom of the country, when wTar was 
to be undertaken, for the chief magistrate, clad 
in his robes of office, with solemn pomp to open 
the gates of the temple of Janus, which were 
kept shut as long as peace endured. His people 
now urged the old king to perform that solemn 
office, but he refused to do so. While they con¬ 
tested, Juno herself, descending from the skies, 
smote the doors with irresistible force and burst 
them open. Immediately the whole country was 
in a flame. The people rushed from every side 
breathing nothing but war. 

Turnus was recognized by all as leader; others 
joined as allies, chief of whom was Mezentius, a 
brave and able soldier, but of detestable cruelty. 
He had been the chief of one of the neighboring 



cities, but his people drove him out. With him 
was joined his son Lausus, a generous youth 

worthy of a better sire. 

CAMILLA 

Camilla, the favorite of Diana, a huntress and 
warrior, after the fashion of the Amazons, came 
with her band of mounted followers, including 
a select number of her own sex, and ranged her¬ 
self on the side of Turnus. This maiden had 
never accustomed her fingers to the distaff or the 
loom, but had learned to endure the toils of war 
and in speed to outstrip the wind. It seemed as if 
she might run over the standing corn without 
crushing it, or over the surface of the water 
without dipping her feet. Camilla’s history had 
been singular from the beginning. Her father, 
Metabus, driven from his city by civil discord, 
carried with him in his flight his infant daugh¬ 
ter. As he fled through the woods, his enemies in 
hot pursuit, he reached the bank of the river 
Amazenus, which, swelled by rains, seemed to 
debar a passage. He paused for a moment, then 
decided what to do. He tied the infant to his 
lance with wrappers of bark and, poising the 
weapon in his upraised hand, thus addressed 
Diana: “Goddess of the woods! I consecrate this 
maid to you”; then hurled the weapon with its 
burden to the opposite bank. The spear flew 
across the roaring water. His pursuers were 
already upon him, but he plunged into the river 
and swam across, and found the spear, with the 
infant safe on the other side. Thenceforth he 
lived among the shepherds and brought up his 
daughter in woodland arts. While a child she 
was taught to use the bow and throw the javelin. 
With her sling she could bring down the crane 
or the wild swan. Her dress was a tiger’s skin. 
Many mothers sought her for a daughter-in-law, 
but she continued faithful to Diana and repelled 

the thought of marriage. 

EVANDER 

Such were the formidable allies that ranged them¬ 
selves against Aeneas. It was night, and he lay 
stretched in sleep on the bank of the river, under 
the open heavens. The god of the stream, Father 
Tiber, seemed to raise his head above the willows 
and to say, “O goddess-born, destined possessor 
of the Latin realms, this is the promised land, 
here is to be your home, here shall terminate the 
hostility of the heavenly powers, if only you 
faithfully persevere. There are friends not far 

distant. Prepare your boats and row up my 
stream- I will lead you to Evander the Arcadian 
chief1' He had long been at strife with Turnus 
and the Rutulians, and is prepared to become an 
ally of yours. Rise! Offer your vows to Juno, 
and deprecate her anger. When you have 
achieved your victory then think of me.” Aeneas 
woke and paid immediate obedience to the 
friendly vision. He sacrificed to Juno and in¬ 
voked the god of the river and all his tributary 
fountains to lend their aid. Then for the first 
time a vessel filled with armed warriors floated 
on the stream of the Tiber. The river smoothed 
its waves, and bade its current flow gently, while, 
impelled by the vigorous strokes of the rowers, 
the vessel shot rapidly up the stream. 

About the middle of the day they came in 
sight of the scattered buildings of the infant 
town where in after times the proud city of 
Rome grew, whose glory reached the skies. By 
chance the old king, Evander, was that day cele¬ 
brating annual solemnities in honor of Hercules 
and all the gods. Pallas, his son, and all the chiefs 
of the little commonwealth stood by. When they 
saw the tall ship gliding onward through the 
wood, they were alarmed at the sight, and rose 
from the tables. But Pallas forbade the solem¬ 
nities to be interrupted and, seizing a weapon, 
stepped forward to the river’s bank. He called 
aloud, demanding who they were and what their 
object. Aeneas, holding forth an olive-branch, 
replied, “We are Trojans, friends to you and 
enemies to the Rutulians. We seek Evander and 
offer to join our arms with yours.” Pallas, in 
amaze at the sound of so great a name, invited 
them to land, and when Aeneas touched the 
shore, he seized his hand and held it long in 
friendly grasp. Proceeding through the wood, 
they joined the king and his party, and were 
most favorably received. Seats were provided for 
them at the tables, and the repast proceeded. 

INFANT ROME 

When the solemnities were ended, all moved to¬ 
wards the city. The king, bending with age, 
walked between his son and Aeneas, taking the 
arm of one or the other of them and, with much 
variety of pleasing talk, shortening the way. 
Aeneas with delight looked and listened, obser¬ 
ving all the beauties of the scene and learning 
much of heroes renowned in ancient times. 
Evander said, “These extensive groves were once 
inhabited by fauns and nymphs and a rude race 
of men who sprang from the trees themselves, 



and had neither laws nor social culture. They 
knew not how to yoke the cattle nor raise a har¬ 
vest, nor provide from present abundance for 
future want; but browsed like beasts upon the 
leafy boughs, or fed voraciously on their hunted 
prey. Such were they when Saturn, expelled 
from Olympus by his sons, came among them 
and drew together the fierce savages, formed 
them into society, and gave them laws. Such 
peace and plenty ensued that men ever since 
have called his reign the golden age; but, by'de- 
grees, four other times succeeded, and the thirst 
of gold and the thirst of blood prevailed. The 
land was a prey to successive tyrants, till fortune 
and resistless destiny brought me hither, an exile 
from my native land, Arcadia.” 

Having thus said, he showed him the Tarpeian 
rock, and the rude spot then overgrown with 
bushes where in after times the Capital rose in all 
its magnificence. He next pointed to some dis¬ 
mantled walls and said, “Here stood Janiculum, 
built by Janus, and there Saturnia, the town of 
Saturn.” Such discourse brought them to the 
cottage of poor Evander, whence they saw the 
lowing herds roaming over the plain where now 
the proud and stately Forum stands. They 
entered, and a couch was spread for Aeneas, well 
stuffed with leaves and covered with the skin of 
a Libyan bear. 

Next morning, awakened by the dawn and the 
shrill song of birds beneath the eaves of his low 
mansion, old Evander rose. Clad in a tunic, and 
a panther’s skin thrown over his shoulders, with 
sandals on his feet and his good sword girded to 
his side, he went forth to seek his guest. Two 
mastiffs followed him, his whole retinue and 
body guard. He found the hero attended by his 
faithful Achates, and, Pallas soon joining them, 
the old king spoke thus: 

“Illustrious Trojan, it is but little we can do in 
so great a cause. Our state is feeble, hemmed in 
on one side by the river, on the other by the 
Rutulians. But I propose to ally you with a 
people numerous and rich, to whom fate has 
brought you at the propitious moment. The 
Etruscans hold the country beyond the river. 
Mezentius was their king, a monster of cruelty, 
who invented unheard-of torments to gratify his 
vengeance. He would fasten the dead to the 
living, hand to hand and face to face, and leave 
the wretched victims to die in that dreadful em¬ 
brace. At length the people cast him out, him and 
his house. They burned his palace and slew his 
friends. He escaped and took refuge with Tur- 
nus, who protects him with arms. The Etruscans 

301 

demand that he shall be given up to deserved 
punishment, and would ere now have attempted 
to enfoice their demand; but their priests re¬ 
strain them, telling them that it is the will of 
heaven that no native of the land shall guide them 
to victory and that their destined leader must 
come from across the sea. They have offered the 
crown to me, but I am too old to undertake such 
great affairs, and my son is native-born, which 
precludes him from the choice. You, equally by 
biith and time of life, and fame in arms, pointed 
out by the gods, have but to appear to be hailed 
at once as their leader. With you I will join 
Pallas, my son, my only hope and comfort. 
Under you he shall learn the art of war and strive 
to emulate your great exploits.” 

Then the king ordered horses to be furnished 
for the Trojan chiefs, and Aeneas, with a chosen 
band of followers and Pallas accompanying, 
mounted and took the way to the Etruscan city,* 
having sent back the rest of his party in the ships. 
Aeneas and his band safely arrived at the Etrus¬ 
can camp, and were received with open arms by 
Tarchon and his countrymen. 

NISUS AND EURYALUS 

In the meanwhile Turnus had collected his bands 
and made all necessary preparations for the war. 
Juno sent Iris to him with a message inciting him 
to take advantage of the absence of Aeneas and 
surprise the Trojan camp. Accordingly the at¬ 
tempt was made, but the Trojans were found on 
their guard, and having received strict orders 
from Aeneas not to fight in his absence, they lay 
still in their intrenchments and resisted all the 
effort of the Rutulians to draw them into the 
field. Night coming on the army of Turnus, in 
high spirits at their fancied superiority, feasted 
and enjoyed themselves and finally stretched 
themselves on the field and slept secure. 

In the camp of the Trojans things were far 
otherwise. There all was watchful and anxiety 
and impatience for Aeneas’s return. Nisus stood 
guard at the entrance of the camp, and Euryalus, 
a youth distinguished above all in the army for 
graces of person and fine qualities, was with him. 
These two were friends and brothers in arms. 
Nisus said to his friend, “Do you perceive what 

* The poet here inserts a famous line which is 
thought to imitate in its sound the galloping of 
horses. It may be thus translated: “Then struck the 

hoofs of the steeds on the ground with a four-footed 
trampling.” 



confidence and carelessness the enemy display? 
Their lights are few and dim, and the men seem 
all oppressed with wine or sleep. You know how 
anxiously our chiefs wish to send to Aeneas and 
to get intelligence from him. Now I am strongly 
moved to make my way through the enemy’s 
camp and to go in search of our chief. If I suc¬ 
ceed, the glory of the deed will be reward 
enough for me, and if they judge the service de¬ 
serves any thing more, let them pay it to you.” 

Euryalus, all on fire with the love of adven¬ 
ture, replied, “Would you then, Nisus, refuse 
to share your enterprise with me? And shall I 
let you go into such danger alone? Not so my 
brave father brought me up, nor so have I 
planned for myself when I joined the standard 
of Aeneas and resolved to hold my life cheap 
in comparison with honor.” Nisus replied, “I 
doubt it not, my friend; but you know the un¬ 
certain event of such an undertaking, and what¬ 
ever may happen to me, I wish you to be safe. 
You are younger than I and have more of life 
in prospect. Nor can I be the cause of such grief 
to your mother, who has chosen to be here in 
the camp with you rather than stay and live in 
peace with the other matrons in Acestes’ city.” 
Euryalus replied, “Say no more. In vain you seek 
arguments to dissuade me. I am fixed in the 
resolution to go with you. Let us lose no time.” 
They called the guard and, committing the 
watch to them, sought the general’s tent. They 
found the chief officers in consultation, deliber¬ 
ating how they should send notice to Aeneas of 
their situation. The offer of the two friends was 
gladly accepted, themselves loaded with praises 
and promised the most liberal rewards in case of 
success. lulus especially addressed Euryalus, 
assuring him of his lasting friendship. Euryalus 
replied, “I have but one boon to ask. My aged 
mother is with me in the camp. For me she left 
the Trojan soil, and would not stay behind with 
the other matrons at the city of Acestes. I go 
now without taking leave of her. I could not bear 
her tears nor set at nought her entreaties. But do 
thou, I beseech you, comfort her in her distress. 
Promise me that, and I shall go more boldly into 
whatever dangers may present themselves.” lulus 
and the other chiefs were moved to tears, and 
promised to do all his request. “Your mother 
shall be mine,” said lulus, “and all that I have 
promised to you shall be made good to her, if 
you do not return to receive it.” 

The two friends left the camp and plunged at 
once into the midst of the enemy. They found 
no watch, no sentinels posted, but all about, the 

sleeping soldiers strewn on the grass and among 
the wagons. The laws of war at that early day 
did not forbid a brave man to slay a sleeping foe, 
and the two Trojans slew, as they passed, such of 
the enemy as they could without exciting alarm. 
In one tent Euryalus made prize of a helmet 
brilliant with gold and plumes. They had passed 
through the enemy’s ranks without being dis¬ 
covered, but now suddenly appeared a troop 
directly in front of them, which, under Volscens, 
their leader, were approaching the camp. The 
glittering helmet of Euryalus caught their atten¬ 
tion, and Volscens hailed the two and demanded 
who and whence they were. They made no an¬ 
swer, but plunged into the wood. The horsemen 
scattered in all directions to intercept their flight. 
Nisus had eluded pursuit and was out of danger, 
but Euryalus being missing, he turned back to 
seek him. He again entered the wood and soon 
came within sound of voices. Looking through 
the thicket he saw the whole band surrounding 
Euryalus with noisy questions. What should he 
do! How extricate the youth! Or would it be 
better to die with him? 

Raising his eyes to the moon which now shone 
clear, he said, “Goddess! favor my effort!” and 
aiming his javelin at one of the leaders of the 
troop, struck him in the back and stretched him 
on the plain with a death-blow. In the midst of 
their amazement another Weapon flew and an¬ 
other of the party fell dead. Volscens, the leader, 
ignorant whence the darts came, rushed sword 
in hand upon Euryalus. “You shall pay the 
penalty of both,” he said, and would have 
plunged the sword into his bosom, when Nisus, 
who from his concealment saw the peril of his 
friend, rushed forward exclaiming, “ ’Twas I, 
’twas I; turn your swords against me, Rutulians; 
I did it; he only followed me as a friend.” While 
he spoke the sword fell and pierced the comely 
bosom of Euryalus. His head fell over on his 
shoulder, like a flower cut down by the plough. 
Nisus rushed upon Volscens and plunged his 
sword into his body, and was himself slain on 
the instant by numberless blows. 

MEZENTIUS 

Aeneas, with his Etrurian allies, arrived on the 
scene of action in time to rescue his beleaguered 
camp; and now the two armies being nearly 
equal in strength, the war began in good earnest. 
We cannot find space for all the details, but must 
simply record the fate of the principal characters 
whom we have introduced to our readers. The 



tyrant Mezentius, finding himself engaged against 
his revolted subjects, raged like a wild beast. He 
slew all who dared to withstand him and put the 
multitude to flight wherever he appeared. At last 
he encountered Aeneas, and the armies stood still 
to see the issue. Mezentius threw his spear, 
which, striking Aeneas’s shield, glanced off and 
hit Anthor. He was a Grecian by birth who had 
left Argos, his native city, and followed Evander 
into Italy. The poet says of him with simple 
pathos which has made the words proverbial, 
uHe fell, unhappy, by a wound intended for an¬ 
other, looked up to the skies, and dying remem¬ 
bered sweet Argos.” Aeneas now in turn hurled 
his lance. It pierced the shield of Mezentius and 
wounded him in the thigh. Lausus, his son, could 
not bear the sight, but rushed forward and inter¬ 
posed himself, while the followers pressed round 
Mezentius and bore him away. Aeneas held his 
sword suspended over Lausus and delayed to 
strike, but the furious youth pressed on, and he 
was compelled to deal the fatal blow. Lausus fell, 
and Aeneas bent over him in pity. “Hapless 
youth,” he said, “what can I do for you worthy 
of your praise? Keep those arms in which you 
glory, and fear not but that your body shall be 
restored to your friends and have due funeral 
honors.” So saying, he called the timid followers 
and delivered the body into their hands. 

Mezentius, meanwhile, had been borne to the 
riverside, and washed his wound. Soon the news 
reached him of L^usus’s death, and rage and de¬ 
spair supplied the place of strength. He mounted 
his horse and dashed into the thickest of the 
fight, seeking Aeneas. Having found him, he 
rode him in a circle, throwing one javelin after 
another, while Aeneas stood fenced with his 
shield, turning every way to meet them. At last, 
after Mezentius had three times made the circuit, 
Aeneas threw his lance directly at the horse’s 
head. It pierced his temples and he fell, while a 
shout from both armies rent the skies. Mezentius 
asked no mercy, but only that his body might 
be spared the insults of his revolted subjects and 
be buried in the same grave with his son. He re¬ 
ceived the fatal stroke not unprepared, and 
poured out his life and his blood together. 

PALLAS, CAA4ILLA, TURNUS 

While these things were doing in one part of the 
field, in another Turnus encountered the youth¬ 
ful Pallas. The contest between champions so 
unequally matched could not be doubtful. Pallas 
bore himself bravely, but fell by the lance of 
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Turnus. The victor almost relented when he 
saw the brave youth lying dead at his feet, and 
spared to use the privilege of a conqueror in de¬ 
spoiling him of his arms. The belt only, adorned 
with studs and carvings of gold, he took and 
clasped round his own body. The rest he re¬ 
mitted to the friends of the slain. 

After the battle there was a cessation of arms 
for some days to allow both armies to bury their 
dead. In this interval Aeneas challenged Turnus 
to decide the contest by single combat, but 
Turnus evaded the challenge. Another battle en¬ 
sued, in which Camilla, the virgin warrior, was 
chiefly conspicuous. Her deeds of valor surpassed 
those of the bravest warriors, and many Trojans 
and Etruscans fell pierced with her darts or 
struck down by her battle-axe. At last an Etrus¬ 
can named Aruns, who had watched her long, 
seeking for some advantage, observed her pur¬ 
suing a flying enemy whose splendid armor 
offered a tempting prize. Intent on the chase, 
she observed not her danger, and the javelin of 
Aruns struck her and inflicted a fatal wound. 
She fell and breathed her last in the arms of her 
attendant maidens. But Diana, who beheld her 
fate, suffered not her slaughter to be unavenged. 
Aruns, as he stole away, glad but frightened, was 
struck by a secret arrow, launched by one of the 
nymphs of Diana’s train, and died ignobly and 
unknown. 

At length the final conflict took place between 
Aeneas and Turnus. Turnus had avoided the 
contest as long as he could, but at last impelled 
by the ill success of his arms, and by the mur¬ 
murs of his followers, he braced himself to the 
conflict. It could not be doubtful. On the side of 
Aeneas were the expressed decree of destiny, the 
aid of his goddess-mother at every emergency, 
and impenetrable armor fabricated by Vulcan, at 
her request, for her son. Turnus, on the other 
hand, was deserted by his celestial allies, Juno 
having been expressly forbidden by Jupiter to 
assist him any longer. Turnus threw his lance, 
but it recoiled harmless from the shield of 
Aeneas. The Trojan hero then threw his, which 
penetrated the shield of Turnus and pierced his 
thigh. Then Turnus’s fortitude forsook him and 
he begged for mercy; and Aeneas would have 
given him his life, but at the instant his eye fell 
on the belt of Pallas, which Turnus had taken 
from the slaughtered youth. Instantly his rage 
revived, and exclaiming, “Pallas immolates thee 
with this blow,” he thrust him through with his 
sword. 

Here the poem of The Aeneid closes, and we 



Romulus and Remus. Roman. (Capitoline Museum, Rome.) 

are left to infer that Aeneas, having triumphed 
over his foes, obtained Lavinia for his bride. 
Tradition adds that he founded his city and 
called it after her name, Lavinium. His son lulus 
founded Alba Longa, which was the birthplace 
of Romulus and Remus and the cradle of Rome 
itself. 

There is an allusion to Camilla in those well- 
known lines of Pope, in which, illustrating the 

rule that “the sound should be an echo to the 
sense,” he says— 

When Ajax strives some rock's vast weight to throw, 
The line too labors and the words move slow. 
Not so when swift Camilla scours the plain, 
Flies o’er th’ unbending corn or skims along the main. 

Essay on Criticism 
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THE DESCENT OF THE GODS 

CHAOS = Nox (Night) 
(Darkness) Erebus = Nox (Night) Gaea = Pontus 

.1 

(Light) Aether = Hemera (Day) 
Nereus Thaumas Phorcys = Ceto 

Eros (Amor) (Love) 

GAEA (Earth) Pontus (Sea) 

Neptune = Amphitrite Galatea Thetis Iris Harpies Gorgons Sirens Scylla 

f Achilles 
Proteus Triton 

Uranus == Gaea 

Saturn (Cronos) = Rhea (Cybele or Ops). Coeus — Phoebe Japetus 

Jupiter Ceres Juno Pluto Neptune Vesta 
(Jove or Zeus) (Demeter) (Hera) (Dis) (Poseidon) 

Latona 

Minerva 
(Athene) 

Oceanus = Tethys 

Inachus Oceanids 
and river gods 

Epimetheus Prometheus Atlas 

Dione Maia 

Doris = Nereus 

Nereides 
Clymene 

Jupiter Juno (Hera) Jupiter Latona Jupiter — Dione Jupiter = Maia Jupiter = Semele 

Hebe Mars (Ares) Vulcan (Haephaestos) Phoebus Apollo Diana (Artemis) Venus (Aphrodite) Mercury (Hermes) Bacchus (Dionysus) 

Cupid 

Jupiter — Mnemosyne Jupiter — Eurynome Jupiter = Demeter (Ceres) Jupiter = Alcmena 

Nine Muses Three Graces Proserpine (Persephone) Hercules (Alcides) 

Jupiter = Themis 

The Hours The Fates Astraea 

INDEX 

(Figures in italic indicate illustrations) 

AbsyrAus 161 
AcesAes 289, 302 
AceAes 1 96 
AchaAes 301 
Achelo'us 213 
AchiFles 163, 209, 239, 
244, 249, 250, 252, 233, 

254-260, 261, 263, 284 
AAis 239 , 242 
AconAeus 140 
Acris'sius x33 
Actae'on 62, 64, 66, 67, 
116 

AdmeAa 169 
AdmeAus 214 
AdoAiis 90,91,92 

AdrasAus 215 
Ae'acus 1 16 
AeeAes 153, 162 

AegeAis 161, 181 
AegisAhus 263, 264 

Aene'as 249, 255, 256, 
285-289, 290, 291-295, 
299-304 
Ae'olus 97, 101, 270, 
288 
Aes'cula'pius 151, 183, 

2IA 253 
Ae'son 753, 160 
Ae'thra 180, 181, 186 
Agamem'non 244, 249- 

255, 263 
Aga've 198 
Age'nor 115, 256 
Agla'ia 32 
Ajax 163, 244, 292, 254, 
255, 260, 304 
Alces'tis 214,215 
Alci'des (Hercules) 
176, 179 
Alcin'o-us 279-281 
Alcme'na 167 
Alec'to 34, 299 

Alphe'nor 131 
Alphe'us 84, 85, 169 
Althe'a 163, 164 
Amalthe'a 214 
Ama'ta 299 
Am'azons 169, 172, 182, 
183, 184, 260, 300 

Am'mon 143 

Amphiara'us 215 

Amphi'on 131,225 

Amphitri'te 208, 209 
Ampyx 140 

Am'ymo'ne 169 
An'axar'ete 105 
Ance'us 163 

Anchi'ses 285, 290, 294, 

295 
Andrae'mon 88 

Androm'ache 249, 256, 
286 

Androm'eda 138, 139,140 

Anem'one 91 
Antae'us 143, 172, 173 

Ante'a 146 
An'teros 22, 26 
Anchor 303 
Antig'one 214,215 
AntiFochus 239, 255 
Anti'ope 182, 183, 225 
Aphrodite (Venus) 22, 
204, 298 

Apol'lo (Phoebus) 9, 

21, 22, 29, 43,44, 46, S3, 

67, 69, 74, 94, 96, 106, 
1/8, 119, 120, 122, 130, 

I3I, H3, 15G l52, 214, 
223, 226, 228, 230, 238, 

249-257i 260, 263, 281, 
285, 290, 291, 296 

Aq'uilo (Boreas) 212 
Arach'ne 126, 129, 130 
Arca'dia 34,62,301 
Ar'cas 62 



Areop'agus 264 

A'res (Mars) 22 
Arethu'sa 84, 85 

Ar'go 153, 156, 158 
Ar'gonauts 153, 754, 157, 

162, 163, 188, 285 
Ar'gus 57, 60, 153, 158 

Ariad'ne 181, 182, 186, 

187, 196, 198, 199, 201 

Arimas'pians 152 

Arlon 228, 229 
Aristae'us 218,222,224 

Ar'temis (Diana) 22 

A'runs 303 

Astrae'a 40 
Asty'ages 140 
Atalan'ta 90, 163, 164, 

166 
A'te 255 
Ath'amas 153, 209 
Athe'ne (Pallas Athene or 

Minerva) 20, 26, 106, 

727, 167 

Atlantis 295 
Atlas 133, 136, 172, 

238 
At'ropos 34 

Auge'as 169 
Auro'ra (Dawn or Eos) 

47’ 49, 5l, 8l’ 98’ 238-24° 
Auster (Notus) 212 

Bac'chanals 196, 200, 202 

Bac'chus (Dionysus) 52, 

74, 194, 195, 196-201, 214 

Bau'cis 78, 79 
BellePophon 146, 147, 

148, 149, 150 
Bello'na 34 
Belus 288 

Ber'oe 195 

Bo'na De'a 34 
Bo'reas (Aquila) 2/2, 

288 
Bria'reus 81, 143, 292 

Brise'is 252 

Ca'cus 172 
Cad'mus 62, 115, 116, 

153, 209, 215 
CaPchas 249, 252, 262 

CallPope 32,218 

Callis'to 60, 62 
Calyp'so 261, 277, 278 

Came'nae 211 
Camilla 300, 303, 304 

Cap'ancus 215 

Cassan'dra 263 
Cassiopeia 138,140 

Cas'tor 158, 188, 193, 

231 

Cebrio'nes 254 

Ce'crops 126 

Celeus 81,84 
Cen'taurs 9, 150, 151, 

201, 209, 247 

Ceph'alus 49-51,5 2,116 

Ce'pheus 138, 140 
Cer'berus 112,172,774, 

228, 292 
Ce'res (Demeter) 29, 

81, 84, 85, 108, 166, 206, 

208 
Ce'yx 97-101 

Cha'os 38 
Cha'ron 292 
Charyb'dis 259, 274, 

275, 287, 288 
Chimae'ra 143, 144, 
146, 149, 292 
Chi'ron 151, 152, 158, 

209 
Chryse'is 249, 250, 251 

Chry'ses 249, 250 

Ci'mon 187 
Cir'ce 86,^7,133,198, 

199, 271, 272, 274, 275, 

277 
Cli'o 32 
Clo'tho 34 
Clym'ene 69 
Clytemnes'tra 263, 264 

Cly'tie 12 2 
Cornuco'pia 212,214 

Coryban'tes 166 

Cranes 162 

Cre'on 215 

Creu'sa 161 

Croc'ale 63 
Cronos (Saturn) 21,34, 

166 
Cu'pid (Eros or Love) 
77, 22, 26, 27, 43, 81, 90, 

706, 108, 109, no, 111-113, 
120, 796, 204, 225, 252 

Cyb'e-le (Rhea or Ops) 

36, 166 
Cyclo'ps (pi. Cyclo'pes) 
143, 214, 239, 242, 268, 

269, 286 
Cy'nosure 62 

Cyre'ne 222, 224 

Dae'dalus 181, 187, 188, 

7 89 

Dan'ae 128, 129, 133, 

L31 
Dan'aus (Danaicles) 220 
Daph'ne 43, 46, 53 

Dar'danus 238, 285 

Dawn (Aurora or Eos) 

238, 239 

Day Star (See Hesperus) 

Death (He'la) 292 
Deiph'obus 249, 256 

De'jani'ra 176,213 

Delphi 13., 143, i87’ 2^5 
Deme'ter (Ceres) 29,85 

Demod'ocus 231,281 

Deucalion 41 
Dia'na (Artemis) 22,43, 

56-66, 67, 81, 84, 90, 120, 

130, 143, 151, 160, 163, 
164, 183,235, 236, 238, 

249, 264, 285, 290, 300, 
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Dic'tys 196,231 

Di'do 288-290, 293 
Diome'de 244, 253, 260, 

263 

Dio'ne 22 
Diony'sus (Bacchus) 32, 

194, 199,201 

Dioscu'ri 193 

DiPce 225 
Dis (Pluto) 21 
Dis'cord (Discordia) 292 

Dolls 72, 208, 209 

Dryads (Hamadryads) 

205, 206, 295 
Dry'ope 88,90 

Ech'o 52, 120, 121, 122 

Ege'ria 183,211 

Elec'tra 238, 264 

Eleusinian Mysteries 85 

Elysium 295 

EncePadus 81, 143 

Endymlon 87, 90, 94, 

1 o 1, 235, 236 

Epime'theus 38,42 

Epo'peus 196 
EPato 32 

Erin'nys (pi. Erinnyes) 

34, 264 
E'riph'yle 215 

Eris (Discordia) 244 

Erisich/thon 205, 206, 

207, 208, 213 

E'ros (Cupid or Love) 

16, 22, 26, 132 

Ete'ocles 215 
Eumae'us 282, 284 

Eumenldes (Erinnyes or 

Furies) 34, 230, 264 
Euphros'yne 32 

Euro'pa 114,115,12%-- 

130 

Eu'rus 212 
Eury'alus 301, 302 

Eurydlce 218,279,220, 

224, 227, 228 

EuryPochus 274 

306 

Euryn'ome 16,21 

Eurys'theus 167, 169, 

172 

Eurytlon 151 

EutePpe 32 

Evad'ne 215 
Evan'der 300,301,303 

Famine 206, 207 

Fates 34,84,90,214 

Fauna (Bona) 34 
Fau'nus 34, 67, 205, 239, 

299 
Fauns 34, 60, 102, 104, 

205 

Favo'nius (Zephyrus) 

212 

Fear 292 

Flo'ra 7, 34’ 35, 212 
Fu'ries (Eumenides or 

Erinnyes) 34, 164, 220, 

229, 264, 292, 293, 299 

Galate'a 89, 209, 229, 

239, 242, 243 

Gan'ymede 180 

Gemini 188 

Ge'nius 36 
Ge'ryon 169, 172 

Giants 142, 143 

Glaucus 86, 87, 209, 

249’ 274 
Golden Fleece 153,757, 

160 
Gordian Knot 78 

GoPdius 78 
Gor'gons 133, 136, 138, 

140 
Graces 11,32,33,205 

Grae'ae (Gray Maids) 

H3’ *34 
Griefs 292 
Griffin (Gryphon) 152 

Ha'des 172 

Hae'mon 215 
Halcy'one 97-101 

Hamadry'ads (Dryads) 

102, 205, 208 
Harmo'nia 116,215 
HaPpies 212,285,2^6, 

299 
He'be 160, 178, 179, 180 

Hec'ate 153, 160, 292 

Hec'tor 244, 249, 252- 

257, 258, 260, 286 

Hec'uba 256, 257, 263 

HePen 104, 183, 188, 

244, 248, 256, 260, 263 

HePenus 286, 288 

HelPades 72 



Hericon (Hippocrene) 

72, 144 

HeFlas (Greece) 13 

HeFle 153 

Hephaes'tos (Vulcan) 22 

He'ra (Juno) 21 
Her'cules (Alcides) 152, 

153, 158, 167-176, 179- 

183, 201, 213, 214, 225, 

300 
Her'mes (Mercury) 17, 

29. l94 
Hermi'one 263 

He;ro 725, 124 

Hesper'ides 74, 169, 170, 

172 
Hes'perus 81,97,172 

Hes'tia 34 
Hippocre'ne (Helicon) 

T44 
Hippodami'a 151 

HippoFyta 169, 187 

HippoFytus 183 
Hippom'enes 90, 164, 

166 
Hours 239 
Hun'ger 292 

HyacinFhus 94, 97, 260 

Hy'ades 195 

Hy'ale 63 
Hy'dra 167, 168, 169, 

179, 292, 293 

Hyge'ia 210,212 

Hy'las 178, 160 

Hy'men 218 x 

Hyperboreans 13 

Hyperion 16, 277 

lap'etus 16 

Ia'sius 163 
Ib'ycus 229-231 

Icarius 216 
Ic'arus 187, 188, 189- 

192 

Idae'us 257 

I'das 188 

Il'iad 249 

IFio'neus 13 1 

Fno 116, 209 

I'o 57, 78, 60 

Iob'ates 146 

Iola'us 169 

Foie 88,90,177 

Iphigeni'a 242, 249, 270, 

264 

Fphis 105 

Iph'itus 172 

Fris 21,98,99,100,253, 

257, 301 

Isme'nos 131 

Isth'mian Games 185, 

209 
Iu'lus 299, 302, 304 

IxFon 220,293 

Ja'nus 36, 299, 301 

Ja'son 153-163, 167, 181 

Jocas'ta 144,215 

Jove (Jupiter or Zeus) 

16, 42, 62, 81, 84, 106, 112, 

120, 138, 193, 208, 213, 

239, 252, 254, 257, 263, 

278, 280, 293 
Ju'no (Hera) 21, 22, 57, 

78, 60, 62, 67, 98, 100, 106, 

118, 120, 131, 143, 166, 169, 

179, 180, 195, 213, 214, 244, 

252, 253, 288, 299-303 

Ju'piter (Jove or Zeus) 

16, 21, 22, 26, 28, 29, 32, 

34, 38, 40, 41, 57, 78, 60, 

62, 67, 69, 72, 78, 79, 81, 

84, 112, 115, 116, /18, 119, 

128, 133, 143, 150, 153, 167, 

178, 180, 183, 193, 197, 209, 

214, 215, 220, 225, 235, 238, 

244’ 252i 254. 255’ 257i 27°> 
278, 285, 289, 293, 303 

Lach'esis 34 
Laestrygo'nians 270,271 

La'ius 143 
Lampe'tia 277 
Laoc'oon 131, 261,262, 

262, 267 

Laodami'a 249 

Laom'edon 238 
Lap'iths 9, 170, 201 

Lares 36 
Lark's pur 260 

Larva 36 

Lati'nus 299 

Lat'mos 235 
Lato'na 67, 130, 131 

Lau'sus 299, 303 

Lavin'ia 299, 304 

Lean'der 127, 124 

Le'da 128, 129,188,231 

Leuco'thea 209 

Liber (Bacchus) 36 

Li'chas 176 
Li'nus 225 

Lo'tis 90 
Lotus Eaters 269 
Love (See Cupid or Eros) 

Luci'na 34 

Lyc'abas 196 

Lycaon 255 
Lycome'des 183, 187, 

244 
Ly'cus 225 
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Lyn'ceus 188 

Macha'on 253, 260 

Ma'ia 29 

Mars (Ares) 22,27,27, 

116, 154, 252 

Mar'syas 227, 226 

Mede'a 133,153,154, 

158, 179, 160, 161, 162, 181 

Medu'sa 133, 177, 176, 

r44 
Megae'ra 34 

Mega'ra 119 

MelanFpus 226 

Melan'thus 196 

Melea'ger 163, 164 

MeFicer'tes 209 

Melis'seus 214 

Melpom'ene 32 

Mem'non ,140,239,260 

Menela'us 244, 254, 277, 

263 
Menoe'ceus 215 

Men'tor 278 
Mer'cury (Hermes) 17, 

29, 38, 60, 78, 84, 112, 118, 

03’ H3? I5I> l5h *94, 225’ 
227, 249, 257, 274, 278, 280, 

289 

Mer'ope 238 

Met'abus 300 

Metani'ra 81 
Metemp'sycho'sis 294 

Me'tis 21 
Mezen'tius 299-303 

Mi'das 74, 77, 76 

Miner'va (Athene or Pal¬ 

las Athene) 16, 20, 26, 

78, 81, 126, 127, 129, 133, 

143, 144, 147, 182, 187, 188, 

2I5, 2251 2 44’ 247, 252’ 
260-264, 278-282 

Minoe'ceus 215 

Mi'nos 116, 119, 120, 181, 

183, 187, 199, 293 

Min'otaur 131, 181, 182, 

187 
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16, 32 

Mo'mus 34 

Monsters 143 
Mor'pheus 99, 100 

MuFciber (Vulcan) 36 

Musae'us 226 
Mu'ses 4, 29, 32, 144, 150, 

211, 220, 299 
Myr'midons 116-118, 
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Nai'ads 67,205,210,213, 

239 

Narcis'sus 120, 121, 1 22 

Nausic'aa 279, 282 

Nausith'ous 279 

Neme'an Games 187 

Neme'an Lion 167 

Nem'esis 34’ 2(H 
Neoptol' emus 263 

Nepen'the 263 

Neph'ele ^3’ r53 
Nep'tune : (Poseidon) 21, 
4°, 41, 72 , 126, 127, 208 s 
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Ne'reids 72, 188, 205. ) 
209, 228 

Ne'reus 72, 208, 209, 239 

Nes'sus 176 

Nes'tor U3’ i63’ 239 
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Ni'obe 170, 131, 132 

Ni'sus 119, 120, 191, 301’ 

302 
No'man 270 

No'tus (Auster) 212 

Nu'ma 211 
Nymphs 72, 101, 102, 

104, 122, 178, 195, 207, 206, 

224, 249 

Oce'anus 16, 62, 86, 208, 

209 
Ocyr'oe 151 

Odys'seus (Ulysses) 284 

Od'yssey 260, 269, 281 

Oed'ipus 745,144,215 

Oe'neus 163 
Oeno'ne 260 

Oeno'pion 238 

Olym'pic Games 187 

Olymp'us 13,72,113, 

116, 206 
Om'phale 176 
Ophi'on 16,21 

Ops (Cybele or Rhea) 

166 
Oread 207-207 

Ores'tes 267, 264 

Ori'on 143, 238 

Orithyi'a 212 

Or'pheus 153, 158, 188, 

218-221, 227, 294 

Os'sa 143 

Pacto'lus 74 

Pae'on 210 
Palae'mon (Portunas) 

209 
Palame'des 244 

Pales 34, 36 
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Palladium 260, 263 
Paldas 256, 280, 300-304 
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Pan 34, 57, 60, 74, 
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PandoAa 38,557,47,42 

Pa'phos 88,90 
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Parnas'sus 74,7^,41,43, 
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Patro'clus 253,254,255, 

256, 257 
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Pedeus 163, 209, 244 
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Pedion 143 
Pena'tes 36 
PenePope 104,216,231, 
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PeneAs 43, 46, 169 
Penthesile'a 260,261 

Pen'theus 116, 196, 198 
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Per'dix 188 
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Periphe'tes 181 
PersephAne 29, 89 
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The charm and value of [Bulfinch’s] work 
lie.. . in his skillful and swift retelling of the 
stories of our classical heritage.... They 
are recollected here to the accompaniment of 
gallery of art from Pericles’s time to our 
own—delicious fables for the waking of 
whatever slumbering memories of concord 
may be awaiting them, in this century 
of discord, in our hearts.” 
—From the Introduction 
by Joseph Campbell 

The timeless stories of the gods and 
goddesses of Greece and Rome come 
to life beautifully in this lavishly 
illustrated edition of Thomas Bulfinch’s 
The Age of Fable, compiled by 
Bryan Holme. The profound effect these 
tales have had on the great artists of the 
Western world can be seen in paintings and 
sculpture by masters from Praxiteles to 
Bernini, from Rubens to Picasso. 

“A distinguished new treatment of Bulfinchs 
engaging discussion.. .enormously inviting” 

—Houston Post 

“Mr. Holme has chosen well... .The gods 
of Greece and Rome are still lively and 
handsome company’’ —Atlantic Monthly 
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